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Date:
Qur Reference:

Your Reference:

To.

01.10.2018

GBD 675H/5L/pl

GBG 3385)

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

Pre-Repair Survey {PRS) Acknowledgement
Yehicle For Inspection: GBG 3385)

Insured's Wehicle:

Date Of Accident

GBD 675H

27.09.2018

We acknowledge receipt of your request for PRS an:

28.09.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax

or

Email
nancy.lam@fastechauto.com.sg

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor from

the list below and indicate your selection in the bax marked *,

* e fute (onduthangs 'H’E_ Lg

| AlS Automobile Inspection Services Fte Lid LBS LB.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
FTA, FormTeam Consultiancy Ple Lid LEK LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid
= A5 3 Infiniti Appraisal Service PS Friority Services
IPE 1P Knights Pre Ltd VAL Vicom Lid

Our insured's driver has not reported the accident to us todata.

V' lyour request for inspection does not have your chent's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy.
your request for inspeetion does not have your client's GIA report, kindly forward a copy.

wWe acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will 3ssese & revert soon upon receipt of estimate.

V |others:  OFFICER-IN-CHARGE - STEVE LIM
Prepared by: iz Pei Li GH20 9194 = _
Qé}f S claims@ergo.com.s
Signature: FAX : 6829 9247

Assessor use only:

Assignment Date:
Assignment Time:

Remarks:

Work use only:

or atte
Date:
Time
Inspedtar

work iH

[ vehicle not available at the appeinted date and time.

Kindly acknowledge our Assessor presence for the above job .

Waorkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp.
Nate: Dur Inspection is on a withaut admission to llability bosis.



Shirle: Hiew (LKK Auto) )

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 4:32 PM

To: '‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)

Cc: 'SUR™ ‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; assignments@Ikkauto.com
Subject: RE' GBDE7SH / TP : GBG3385J/LKK / DOA : 27/09/2018

Dear Pei Li,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBG 3385J on 28/09/2018.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Ihank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 1:54 PM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)’ <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBD&75H / TP : GBG3385J/LKK / DOA : 27/09/2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkaute.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent; Monday, 1 October 2018 1:46 PM

To: 'admin-d@Ikkauto.com' <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Ol : GBD675H / TP . GBG3385J/LKK / DOA : 27/09/2018

Dear Catherine/MNivitha,
In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be

the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please conduct this survey request from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 1:46 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’

Cc: SUR (sur@lkkauto.com)

Subject: 0l ' GRD&ETSH / TP : GBG3385J/LKK / DOA : 27/09/2018

Attachments: GBD675H - SAS.pdf: GBG3385) - SAS. pdf;, GBG3385) - PRS FORM. pdf

Dear Cathering/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert"”.

Please conduct this survey request from FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD.

ADDRESS : 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
PERSON TO CONTACT :  LINA @ 6746 5405
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : STEVELIM

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of damages to third party vehicle.
Obtain estimate from workshop and inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey
before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured and TP's SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was provided.

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

-

FrIve

ERGO

ERGO is one of the majar insurance groups in Germany and Europe Warldwide ERGO iz represented in mare than 30 countries and concentrales
& and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), ong of the world' 8 leading riek camers



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Business
Owner ID: 6000B
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBG3385)
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 28 Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: HIACE DX 3.0 MANUAL
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2017

Engine No.: 1KD2719086
Chassis No.: KDH2010224666
Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value: $33,390.00
Original Registration Date: 22 Jul 2017
First Registration Date: 22 Jul 2017
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,670.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 21 Jul 2027

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $31,403.00

COE Rebate Amount: $27.672.00

Total Rebate Amount: $27,672.00

Page | ot |

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Sep 2018

OK

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublic BeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION _ID=F030... 28-Sep-18



Date of Accident

Accident Place

Vehicle. No. (Car Plate No.)
Insurace Company

Owner or Company Name /IC No.
Owner or Company Contact No.
DRIVER’S Name / IC No.
DRIVER'S Date Of Birth
Relationship of Owner & Driver
DRIVER'S Address

DRIVER’S Contact No./ Alt No.
DRIVER'S Occupation

Email Address

Weather & Road Surface

Reporting Type

Number of Passengers (Inciuding Driver):

Was there any video Captured by car
Exact purpose for which vchicle was

Any Injury (If YES, Pls state):

: INDOOR \ DU(I(DG{}R (e.g. working inside or outside office)

3 III : | f - c
Al l—/ ﬁmiﬁeﬂtThﬂE?;.L (24-HR-Format)
exit |1 Towwd ANE G
1
(G RG S5y ST Make/Model: e k]L- bo, il
A TUC Policy No:
; & & ?
: r\ﬁuh'u.lll E.{LL |.='.'¥L..Ir gl[rr\i“llt‘_,_‘- / q_l,ill_f{r_[_l._,L .f‘:.
Owner’s Hp Company Tel
A e Ty f 70 < | I.':~

. | ol
!:Elr "._-i:.

L [ /
& ..'(’ ! [ “ “l Y DRIVER’S License Pass Date vt .

: Spouse \ Parents \ Children \ Sibling \ E@@w Others:

: 5“{‘\ ||;1 .:k.‘-""'kl"'_l -y F;th—&i r'ui-’xl'r"zil.r-f]_ |!'I 04 J-lr"l'l{

¢ lborof

: CLEARL& DRY \ RAINING & WET\ AFTER RAIN & WET

: Reporting Only \ Claim ﬂm@w \ Claim Own Insurance

l T}r .| L,-_'R r’

camera: YES \NO
being used at the time of accident: Private use \ Work purpose

o

Other Party Driver’s Particular (if any)

Wehicle, No:

(b VE1s & L('JJ{_]* )

Wehicle. Mo:

Vehicle Make'Model:

Vehicle Make'\Model:

Name Driver:

MName Driver:

1C MNo. Driver/Contact:

IC No. Driver/Contact:

* NEW - Passenger’s name & gender:



lsed toyota hiace Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page | of 3

EECARMAHT-EW Login  Sign up

Wew Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

FREE VALUATION
Let us tell you how much your car can sell for!

ions and it's FREES

How much is my car worth?

Sapt 2018 Offer, S0 Down-payment/ Can Overloan Up To i L]
Post an Advertisement ¥ et ' ( L HIN LUNG ALTO 30 I
Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just S 18 Offer, S0 Dowr o B -- B
=1 ! (] 0 = Fl r -y .
%58 until it's SOLD! One Stop Car Hub -
Priitlice Grois Pe Finance, Insurance, Warkshop n
G Mew and Used Cars =
Browse by Category | Sart by Date Fosted w20 resuits/page |
19 vehicles toyota higce ndvanced Search M Submit )
Model Price Depreciation g Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type
Search Selection toyota hiac 2017 Available
Toyota Hiace £61, 800 56,750 fyr 21-Now-2017 2,962 cc 250 km Van Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
2018 Latest Agent Unit, No Additional Cost, Beok Now To Sacure This Price, High Trade [n And High Loan Avadable, Call Now Before It's Gone! P FaLasun 1 ]
55 Motor Link Pre LE
01 ] w ) H I r . i i
Tayota Hiac 65,800 £7,400 fyr 18-Aug-2017 2,982 - an Avallable
Fuel Type: Diesal
Brand Mew Bomeo Toyota Hiace. Limited Stock, Comes With 3 Years Or 100000 KM Warranty By Bornen Motors. 100% Loan Available With Low
interest Rate, High Trade In For Your Viehicle. Call Now And Book Y... [ FREmm/aab )
Met Link Partners Ple Lid
Prosted " '\._'I-_L. r L 30T ___':.' Ty f3 Higre, A 17 E wiila Miace ovoits Heace, tovota hiaos, wiota, Higoe, hragx Ji] Towona
Toyota Hiace Commubter $115,000 £13,400 fyr 27-Apr-2017 2,962 oc 10,100 km Bius Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
Look No Further, Superbly Low Mileage. Best Value For Your Money. Beautdul Hiace Commauter GL 3.0 Auto With Brown-Black Leather Upholstery s 0 |
Owned By 1 Private Owner, Selling Due To Upgrading To New Car...
18 Tags Ml pota Hisce, 2017 bavoia | F wota Hia oot hisce, Toyota, Hiaca, hiace
Toyota Hiace Super GL Dark 579,800 €5, 800 fyr 19-5ep-2017 2,581 22,000 km Wan Available
Prime
Fuel Type: Diesel
Likia Mew Candition; Down Payment Fram 103, Bank And In House Loan Avallable, Trade Tn Welcome, Car Avaadable In Showroom For Viewing Now,
Comtact For More Details,
B Hitachi Capital Singapore Pte Ltd [ Aftermarket) - Tyres & Rims
Mare Info about this shop
Toyota Hiace £60,B00 £6,570 fyr 25-Dec-2017 2,883 oc - WEn Available
Fuel Type: Diesel
Mewly Registered Toyota Hiace 5 Doors. 100% Loan, Ready Stock. Handover 3 Days After Loan Approve. Call Fast, e 1 1
Met Link Partners Pte Ltd
Toyota Hiace £57 800 56,670 fyr J-May- 017 2982 cc wan Available

Fuel Type: Duzsel

Best Price In Town! Best Japanese Commercial Brand In The Market! Only 1 Owner, Low Milaage, 100% Accident Free! Borneo Motors Unit, Wasranky
And Free Servicing By Borneg, Free Road Tax, High Loan Ava...

hitp://www.sgearmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?M( )D=toyota+hiace& PRC=0&DEP=0&RGD=2017&... 28-Sep-18
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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD « Supplementary fen ]
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 & subjoct from insurance v | 5 ]
#{}1 '4614&1’50 ACknOwiasqed Dy Repairar 1
SINGAPORE 417883 Signature:
VEHICLE NO: GBG 3385J
aTy PARTICULAR I /
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN Sttty /| $1.25010 _—
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN RUBBER n~=f $299.30
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN WIPER ARM A4 $285.40
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN WIPER MOTOR A $466.10
1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN WIPE BLADE 4 nA $105.30
1PCS TAILGATE 1%+ [0 csf P> $2485.10 —
1PCS TAILGATE REAR LOGO ZLA T $4850 —
1PCS TAILGATE HIACE’ STICKER Al $38.50 ~
1PCS TAILGATE INNER LOCK Yo lf 1 $208.10
1PCS TAILGATE LOCK STRIKER A1 $6650 X
2 PCS TAILGATE DEMPERS @$188.10 41 $3716.20 )/
1PCS TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD mff /1 Tora  $465.10
1SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS et $5000 —
1PCS TAILGATE OUTER HANDLE Garflirt $285.30 —
1PCS TAILGATE WEATHER STRIP A~ $20250 —
1PCS REAR BUMPER DS $485.10 ~
2 PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDRES @$30.50 Led  $61.00—
1 SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS . A $5000 7
1PCS REAR END PANEL Zod PO 862210 —
1PCS REAR END PANEL TOP PLATE T Aoy $23350 —
2 PCS REAR BODY PANELS @$1885.10 M 5,,_:/ D YR $377020 (P
2PCS REAR TAILLAMP HOUSING PANELS @$466.50 wiSHeds D $933.00 (PC
2 PCS REAR TAILLAMP INNER PANELS @3$485.10 2 s97020 VY
2 PCS TAILLAMPS @$305.10 w500 s81020 15
1PCS FUEL TANK A $850.00 5
1PCS REAR END PANEL INNER Fodly o $850.00—
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL /1 $1,480.10 v
1PCS REAR BUMPER BEAM : $205.30
1PCS REAR SPARE TYRE BRACKET Lof 832210
1PCS REAR SPARE TYRE BRACKET HOOK 42 $66.50 X
1PCS REAR EXHAUST A $102230 X
2PCS TAILLAMP LOWER GARNISHS @$105.00 ML Tt $210.00 pc
1PCS TAILGATE 1250 KG ' STICKER A $62.00.—
1PCS REAR STOP PANEL $166.50
1PCS TAILGATE OUTER LOCK COVER rs o §10510
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP CARPET Yaq¢/%en  $665.10—
1PCS BONNET f /1unf $866.10.~
1PCS BONMNET LOCK Lj vl Lev(  $88.90°
1PCS BONNET LOGO |.L C, / A4 85850
e ool

)
v

Bl



2PCS
1PCS
1 PCS
1 PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PC3
2PCSs
2PCs
2PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1 PCS
1 PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1PC3
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1 PCS

1PCS
1BOT
1PCS
1 PCS
1 PCS
1 SET
1S5ET

1SET
2 PCS
1SET

BONNET HINGES @$66.50 A1 $133.00
FRONT CORNER PANEL N/S 7% $366.50 —
FRONT GRILLE TOP Caf{t~ $487.85
FRONT GRILLE CENTRE €nl  $675.10 _~
FRONT BUMPER e $671.10~
FRONT BUMPER TOW COVER A A $25.00
FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE Tosn  $16265 "
FRONT BUMPER TOP BEAM Lol $189.60
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Senf{  $850.10
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT STAYS @$155.00 S 7 $310.00 (7 (-
FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$106.50 nd (¢ $213.00 (o,
HEADLAMP ASSY @$2950.00 Dyl L (Ae $590000_—
FRONT DOOR N/S o b A $1.766:100
FRONT DOOR MIRROR N/S P $620.10
FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Sodf [Vt $TE6.28_—
FRONT WIRE HARNESS N/S rﬁ,{ Cne $580.10_—
AIR CON CONDENSER [ Lenfloun $143190 —
AIR CON DISCHARGE PIPE N A1 $365.20 v
AIR CON SUCTION PIPE > A7 $28965 X
AIR CON LIQUID PIPE A $266.10 x
AIR CON FAN MOTOR AT $681.50
RADIATOR 209110 /A Cf Pe1 s2,11080
RADIATOR FAN MOTOR LCT 44 $BBB10 x
WASHER TANK " Y P $18260,
RADIATOR SUB TANK - A §199.10 o/
S.NETT _
FRONT LICENCE PLATE W/HOL =~ . Lef  $50.00 YO
RADIATOR COOLANT T $50.00 «
FRONT DOOR 'ROC’ STICKER N/S e $50.00 35
REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT A2 $50.00 (£
TAILGATE 70 KM/H STCIKER AlA- $20.00/ o
REAR REVERSE CAMERA sl $400.00 _ )
REAR $280.00 .
REAR ‘ |4 Lo $5000 ¢ 5
REAR WOODEN BOARD Pege $900.00 B o
REAR FENDER TOP INNER BOARD (REPLACED GLASS) 0/f Aec  $450.00 2 o0
REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR . A $300.00 /1o
LABOUR CHRAGES: gl

TOWING CHARGE $120.00 (7
TO CHECK WIRING $80.00 5 0
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE $80.00

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REAR WINDSCREEN $150.00 /17
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM $120.00 4 )
TO CLEAN UP REAR EGGS STAIN,WASH ETCS $380.00 / &)
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING $300.00 /.2 )
TO DISMENTLE & REFIX FUEL TANK A1 $120.00 v

X



TO REFILL AIR CON GAS $150.00 /2

TO TANSFER FRONT DOOR MECHANISM A4 $100.00 -
TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER A7 $380.00 X
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING,CUT,WELD,STRAIGHTENED $3,800.0C
REPLACING PARTS P
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING s 1600
TOTAL
L
o B P
&)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Intarnationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSLURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGI18017652/Usbn2

LIIETRIA

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD

#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 2B8-11-2018
SINGAPCRE 038985
Code : EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBD &75H Veh. Inspected GBG 3285/
Policy Mo. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. GBDETSHISLp! Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  YEE PEILI Assign Date 01/10/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA HIACE DX (M) C.C 2082
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. KDH2010224666 Colour SILVER
Odometer 30081 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
h Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/80 R15 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre [195/80 R15 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |125/80 R15 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/80 R15 DUNLOP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR AND FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  27/09/2018 Inspection Date 28/08/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED OM A'YWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 16 Working Days




x-}e_il

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #041-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 62564313

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 3385J

Page No.1of4

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | E3LTRS Y, {:%
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|REAR WINDSCREEN SHATTERED 1,260.10 1,250.10
1|REAR WINDSCREEN RUBBER MO SUCH PARTS 29930 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN WIFER ARM NOT NECESSARY 285.40 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN WIPER MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 45610 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN WIPER BLADE NOT NECESSARY 105.20 =
1| TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 2,485.10 2.,150.10
1|TAILGATE REAR LOGO HWECESSARY 48.50 48 50
1| TAILGATE "HIACE" STICKER WECESSARY 38.50 38.50
1| TAILGATE INNER LOCK TWISTED / JAMMED 209.10 20810
1|TAILGATE LOCK STRIKER NOT NECESSARY 66.50 -
2| TAILGATE DAMPERS @$188.10 NOT NECESSARY 376.20 -
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD WARPED / TORN 45510 46510
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS MECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|TAILGATE QUTER HANDLE BENT / CRACKED 285.30 285.30
1| TAILGATE WEATHER STRIF TWISTED 29250 292 50
1|REAR EUMPER DISTORTED 485.10 48510
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$30.50 BENT 61.00 51.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED 62210 52210
1|REAR END PANEL TOP PLATE BENT 233.50 23350
?|REAR BODY PAMNELS @%1885.10 NIS BADLY 3.770.20 1,885.10

DENTED /OIS TO

REPAIR SEE

LABOUR
2|REAR TAILLAMP HOUSING PANELS EH466 50 MNIS BADLY 933.00 466.50

DENTED
2|REAR TAILLAMP INNER PANELS @3$4B85.10 TO REPAIR SEE a70.20 -

LABOUR
2| TAILLAMPS @3305 10 M/S CRACKED 610.20 305.10
1|FUEL TANK NOT NECESSARY 850.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL INNER BADLY DENTED 850.00 850.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TO REFAIR SEE 1,480.10 -

LABOUR
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Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | &5 mmp?’s'n til‘.*
1|REAR BUMPER BEAM NO SUCH PARTS 205.30 .
1|REAR SPARE TYRE BRACKET BENT 32210 32210
1|REAR SPARE TYRE BRACKET HOOK NOT NECESSARY 66.50 -
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 1,022.30 ;
2| TAILLAMP LOWER GARNISHS @H105.00 N/S TWISTED 210.00 105.00
1| TAILGATE "1250KG" STICKER NECESSARY 62.00 62.00
1|REAR STOP PANEL BENT 166.50 166.50
1| TAILGATE OUTER LOCK COVER DISTORTED 105.10 10510
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP CARPET DAMAGED { TORN 665.10 66510
1|BONNET DENTED / BENT BEE.10 866.10
1|BOMNNET LOCK TWISTED 88.90 B8.90
1|BONNET LOGO NECESSARY 58 50 58.50
2| BONMET HINGES @366 50 NOT NECESSARY 133.00 -
1|FRONT CORNER PANEL N/S DENTED 366.50 3B6.50
1|FRONT GRILLE TOP TWISTED / CUT 487 65 487 65
1|FRONT GRILLE CENTRE cuT 675.10 675.10
1|FRONT BUMPER DISTORTED 671.10 671.10
1|FRONT BUMPER TOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 25,00 A
1|FRONT BUMPER GENTRE GRILLE TORN 162.65 162 65
1|FRONT BUMPER TOF BEAM BENT 189.60 189 60
1|ERONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 650.10 B50.10
2| FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT STAYS @5155.00 N/S DENTED 310.00 155.00
2| ERONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$106.50 N/S CRACKED 213.00 106.50
2| HEADLAMP ASSY "HID" @$2950.00 CRACKED 5,900.00 5,360.00
1|FRONT DOOR NiS TO REPAIR SEE 1,766.10 -
LABOUR

1|FRONT DOOR MIRROR N/S DAMAGED 620.10 62010
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL BENT / TWISTED 766.28 766.28
1|FRONT WIRE HARNESS N/'S CRACKED 580.10 580.10
1|AIR CON CONDENSER BENT / PUNCTURE 1,431.90 1.431.80
1]AIR CON DISCHARGE PIPE MOT NECESSARY 365.20 -
1|AIR CON SUCTION PIPE NOT NECESSARY 2B9.65 -
1|AIR CON LIQUID PIPE NOT NECESSARY 266.10 :
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= Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rk!hnpi{t;]} tSj}
1|AIR CON FAM MOTOR NOT NECESSARY 681.50 -
1|RADIATOR BENT / PUNCTURE 2 110.60 2,095.10
1|RADIATOR FAN MOTOR NOT MECESSARY 688.10 &
1|WASHER TANK DEFORMED 182.60 182.60
1|RADIATOR SUB TANK NOT NECESSARY 19910 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT : -6,671.80
41,207 83 20,015 38
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FROMNT LICENCE PLATE WHOLDER (SN} BENT 50.00 40.00
1|BOT RADIATOR COOLANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|FRONT DOOR "ROC” STICKER N/S (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 40.00
1|TAILGATE 70KM/H STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 20.00 10.00
1|SET REAR REVERSE CAMERA (SN) SHORTED 400.00 300.00
1|SET REAR VIEW VIDED CAM (SN) SHORTED 280.00 280.00
1|SET REAR LICENCE PLATE WIHOLDER (SN} BENT 50.00 40.00
1|SET REAR WODDEN BOARD (SM) DAMAGED 900.00 300.00
2 HSEhfLR FENDER TOP INNER BOARD (REPLACED GLASS) |O/S NECESSARY 450.00 200.00
(SN)
1|SET REAR FLOOR PAMNEL INSULATOR (SN) MECESSARY 300.00 120.00
2,600.00 1,810.00
LABOUR
TOWING CHARGE. 120.00 50.00
TO CHECK WIRING 80.00 3an.0o
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REVERSE CAMERA BO.0D 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REAR WINDSCREEN. 150.00 120,00
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM, 120.00 60.00
TO CLEAN UP REAR EGGS STAIN WASH ETCS, 380,00 100.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROCFING 300.00 12000
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX FUEL TANK. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO REFILL AIR CON GAS 150.00 100.00
TO TRANSFER FRONT DOOR MECHANISM NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
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LABOUR FOR PANEL 3,800.00 2,200.00
BEATING CUT WELD STRAIGHTENED REPLACING
PARTS INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF /S REAR BODY
PANELS, REAR TAILLAMP INNER PANELS REAR FLOOR
PANEL AND FRONT DOOR N/S
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 3,000.00 1,600.00
8,780.00 4.430.00
GRAND TOTAL 52,587.83 26,355.38
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 21,000.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser
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