Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 December, 2019 4:01 PM

To: Mega Swift Auto

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YourRef: CC4/ASM18017585/GEB3 Our Ref: SJT3909K - LKK REF
CC4/ASM18017585/Ghb3

Attachments: Police Result - SJT3909K.JPEG

Without Prejudice

Dear Alan,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that our principal is prepared to finalize the Cost of Repair @ L/S $6,000.00 with 5 days.
For your acceptance please.

Thank you.

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

i, -

" Save the Larth- Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December, 2019 10:55 AM

To: Mega Swift Auto; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YourRef: CC4/ASM18017585/GEB3 Our Ref: SJT3909K

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
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Hi Vic,

Kindly assist.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Mega Swift Auto <megaswift1105@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 December 2019 10:29 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: Re: YourRef: CC4/ASM18017585/GEB3 Our Ref: SJT3909K

Dear Asher,
We refer to our email to you in 15 January 2019.

More than 10 months has lapsed but till date, we have yet to hear from you.
We attached the police result for your kind attention and we hope to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,
Alan

Mega Swift Auto
97511604

On Tue, Jan 15, 2019 at 1:46 PM Mega Swift Auto <megaswift1105@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,
We refer to the above accident.

A survey has been conducted by your appointed surveyor.

Attached is the repair invoice, LTA search fee, car rental invoice and below are the items our client intend to claim:

1. Repair costs $ 8,700.00
2. Car rental 1,320.00
3. LTA Insurance search fee 7.45

$10,027.45

We hope to settle the claim soon. Thank you!



Best Regards,

Alan
Mega Swift Auto
97511604



