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B Vi Pq LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- -

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

- TEL 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No 109607198R GST Reg No. 19-9507188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref CC4/ASM1B017584/Nubd
S TONERSIGAPORE e ouezrasaos—— | [N
Code : ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHC 54980 Veh. Inspected SHC 4478R
Policy No. Coverage (5) D.00
Claim No. Excess () 000
Assign From Assign Date 27/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RIH Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 22/08/2018 Inspection Date 25/08/2018
Survay held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
B0 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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SMRT Accident Vehicle Repalr Estimates
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2572018 Clmim Portal

LEK AUTO COMNSULTANTS PTE LTD [TP) =

<« Service Request Details

Claim

SEMOOWIN

Relerence

None #*

Loss Date
September 22, 2018
1&5,3-
Request Date
September 25, 2018

Due Date
October 2. 2018

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Agree to perform service

Vehicle Information

Incident Vehicle Registration #
SHC4479R

Make
TRVD TOYOTA

hmeMalmmmwmmmﬂ:WﬂmmmwquumT1135

[



9252018 Claim Portal
: Model
PRIUS TAXI-1.8 (a)

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No.2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63, 569111, Singapore

Claim Handler
WANG Peter

peterwang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Messages Invoices History Documents Aggecement Metrics Notes

hitps./vp.smartclaims axa,com.sg/claim-porta wnwmnmwmm_mmwmmmmnm



121172018 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTE LTD (TP) = M

<« Pls reject TP claim

Type
© Question

Message
Ol vehicle is damaged at the rear portion, while TP is damaged at the front portion. Pls reject TP claim based
on Bola Scenario 27.

Reply

hm;-n-.Wp.nmurt:tllmnm.mJu.fe.lmmmmmmm:ﬂnmmmmmmmmuhhwWManwmm.__ 1M



Hsiao Tnna [Llltlul.utuz

From: Shu Pei (LEKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 9:41 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHC4479R

12/27MB 530 PM WANG Peler —Pls check if Ol agrees to seftle al 50-50 based on Bola |,_5,;. Izanms

—

Scenario 19 —Pls engage Ol driver and present TP video. 92601 AM
| 1111719 12:10 PH WANG Peter—Based on PIR resu Of charged for Inconsiderale dring. | oo | sieiadig
Please check il Ol agrees us 1o seftle at best al 100% ’ A
10/6/2019
1100818 File transferred to Hsiao Tong to handie -Vic WVAS 53806 PM
10/6/2019
| [***0l ENGAGEMENT VAS 53816 PM

19/8/2018
34 AM

]

6/19 3:47 PM FILE REVIEW -PLS ADVISE STATUS-VO LSP

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

—-0Original Message—

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 16 August 2019 3:51 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms

Subject: FW: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHCA479R

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(40B933)

—--Original Messapge-——

From: vale.oh@axa.com.sg <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 16 August, 2019 3:48 PFM

Ta: admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHCA479R

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SBMOOWIN.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

1



22018

«

hitps:!/vp. smariclaims. axa com.sg/claim-porfalMimiindes-vendor-sendce-requasts hMmidservice-requasts/view-message/ TservicaRequesiNumber=71

Claim Portal

<TP - Mandate IA> - SBMOOW&N )[ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHC 5498D(OIl) & SHC 4479R(TP) ON 22/09/2018]

Type
© Question

Message

Liability: 100%. PIR shows that OID was being charged for Inconsiderate Driving. Inform Ol about third party
claim. We seek your mandate at $4,263.00(all-in). TP-Mandate IA had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let
us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 2-5ep-1%

"



C iy Mgiaurmnen Mo VB80T 1R

AU EANE |, B2 IS EAYA LI ISTUSTREAL PARK, SINCGAPTIME SMSA T @ jih® ) A28 FAN  1aE) alSedd) s

Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd Date: 2/9/2019
u Details:
Date of loss 12-5ep-18
Date of appointment 27-5ep-18
Date of survey 25-5ep-18
Location of survey SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
Vehicle Details:
Claim Type: THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Vehicle number SHC 4479R
Make and Model TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI 1.8 A - 1798cc
Date of registration 9-Jul-14
Parf Rebate
Market Value 5
Parf Rebate 5
Mett Loss 5
Repair details:
[initial Estimate | 6,317.78 |
Proposed/Revise ai 5
Parts s 1,719.02
Check items [estimate) 5 .
Labour 5 1,300.00
Total s 3,019.02
Lump Sum(if applicable) | $ 3,000,00
[Number of days for repair | 5 days |




74 7R~

F

BAR reiw Cempany Raginiration He 199507 1MA

1AM AVE L P22 PAYA LB INDUSTRUAL PARK. SINGAPOME #9000 TEL | (065, A256358] FAN ;88 62564018

Remarks:

insured Driver reported he was rear-ended by TP vehicie. TP driver
reported that Insured vehicle cut lane and sudenly stopped, resulting in the
|eccident. A copy of TP video footage was uplooded in 5C for your review,
PIR shows that OID waos being charged for Inconsiderate Driving.

Mandate:
Liability(TP} 100%|TBC
Proposed repair cost 5 3,000.00
Loss of use NIL |no. of days
Loss of rental ** 5 856.00 |(8days x $107.00)
Loss of income ** 5 400.00 |[Bdays x 550.00)
LTA search fees 5 7.00
Others NIL
Proposed Total 5 4,263.00
**Recommended 5 repair days + 15unday + 2PRS = 8days




Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuth

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 9,15 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHC4479R

2272018

[]/SENT LETTER TO OI (100%) CHT I;ﬁﬂ;ﬁﬁ
IMessage Liability 100%. PIR shows that OID was being charged for Inconsiderate Driving.

O Inform Ol about third party claim. We seek your mandate at $4, 263 00(all-in). TP-Mandate OHT 2972019
|4 had baen uploaded in Smardaims. Kindly let us have your approvalfinstruction. Hsiao B8:18:52 AM
Tang —2-Sep-19

5az019
[] (914719 1:20 PM—HI Case under investigation-on hold first, tks-VO LSP 1o 0147 AM

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

-——QOriginal Message—-

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September 2019 1:23 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com:

Subject: FW: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHC4479R

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

-—-0Original Message-—

From: vale.oh{@axa.com.sg <vale oh@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 September, 2019 1:21 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHCA479R

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SEMOOWIN,

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



11/30/2019 Claim Paortal

CCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 5498D(Ol) & SHC

& EE:RE: REe:RE:NRe:-:TP - Mandate |1A> - SSMOOW.JN
79R(TP) ON 22/09/2018

Type
© Question

Message
Hi You may proceed D5, thks-VO

hittps /'vp. smartclaims . axa.com.sgiclam-portalhimiindex-vendor-service-reguests himig/sarvice-requesisiviow-message’TsarviceRequestiumbe... 11



11302078 Claim Porial

Re:RE: Re:RE: Re:<TP - Mandate |IA> - M OOWJN
& L ACCI DEI* NVOLVING SHC 5498D(0Ol) & SHC
79R(TP) ON 22/09/2018

Type
@ Question

Message

Hi, kindly let us have your mandate at $4,263.00(all-in), TP-Mandate |A had been uploaded in Smartclaims.
Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 30 MNov 2019

[ ]

hitps:/ivp. smariclaims.axa.com sglclaim-portalhtmifindex-vendor-service-reguests himi# service-requests/view-message/Psenvice RequesiNumbe... 11



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei [LKXKAuUto)
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 8:51 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHC4479R
16111/2019]
[|16/10418 3:14 PM "CH Vale"Message - Hi Not yel. pis hold on, tks-VO CHT _11 4221
. o i A !
161172018
| MessageHi Kindly asvisa if investigation is cleared and whethar we can proceed DS CHT 114354
Thank you. Hsigo Tang - 16 Nov 2015 AM
3011172018
| 191118 1:20 PM "OH Vale*MessageH| You may proceed DS, iks-VO CHT 114333
AN
' 30112019
| MeassageHi, kindly let us have your mandate at $4 263 00(all-in) TP-KMandale |A had baen CHT 1114350
uplcadad in Smartclalms Thank you. Hsiao Tong — 30 Nov 2019 AN
' e e, T .o 10122019
| '8/12H18 222 PM — Hi Hslao Tong Pis proceed. Iks-V0 LSP §-37-39 AM

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

—0Original Message—

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2019 2:31 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW; New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHC4479R

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

—Q0riginal Message-—

From: vale.oh@axa.com.sg <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 2:30 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 71835, vehicle number SHC4479R

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SSMOOWIN.
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal,



Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims 8 1A/Claims & |A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 27 December 2019 11:12 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4479R & SHC 5498D (AXA's insured} Our

Ref TAX/09/18/2102/1g LKK REF CC4/ASM18017584/Nhb3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We agreed to accept your global offer of $4,200.,00 (all in). Please let us have your DV. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Departmen?

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 SMRT

ALTOMOTIVE

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: 20/12/2019 07:50

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4479R & SHC 5498D (AXA's insured) Our Ref: TAX/09/18/2102/lg
LKK REF CC4/ASM18017584/Nhb3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email,
We are prepared to improve our offer at a global sum of $4,200.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you Is strictly on a3 without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) In respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, sl Happy New Year 2020°

Best Regards,

Hsian Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6742-4197 | email: chewht@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 2:27 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lk .Lom>

Cc: Admin A <admi |kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4479R & SHC 5498D (AXA's insured) Our Ref: TAX/09/18/2102/1g
LKK REF CC4/ASM18017584/Nhb3

Dear Hsiao Tang,

We have notified your principal of PRS on 25/9/19 (Wed) at 12.33am and our taxi was surveyed on 27/9/13 (Fri] at
1.50pm. We attach the proof for your perusal. As such there is a delay of 2 days.

We are only prepared to accept $4,263.00 (LOU = 8 days [5 + 2 days delay + 1 Sunday]). Please reconsider your offer
and let us hear favourably from you soon. Thanks.

Reqgards

Ton Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMET Automotive Services Pte Ltd

& SmRT

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 12/12/201% 09:27

To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A/Taxis)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: LOD Re: Accident on 22/9/2018 Involving SHC 4479R & SHC 5498D (AXA's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/09/18/2102/lg LKK REF CC4/ASM18017584/Nhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,000.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you Is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of llability on our part and/or that of our policyhelder and/or the autharised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed In any other related matter(s] in respect of this accident nor should it be binding In any other related
claims.”

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Hapyy New Year 2020°

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 5:55 PM



To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svecs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & [A/Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD Re: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4479R & SHC 5498D (AXA's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/09/18/2102/1g LKK REF CC4/ASM1B017584/Nhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Lee Gek,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted,

We are currently looking into the matter and will get back to you for an update is due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

224
RSRER =5 Sove the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for {he sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
road this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and afl attachmenis. including any copes theraof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Tan Lee Gek [Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & |1A/Taxis/Claims) [mallto:LeeGek@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 14 December, 2018 3:22 PM

To: Thin Thin [LKKAute); Vic [LKKAuto)

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4479R & SHC 54980 (AXA's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/09/18/2102/1g

REMINDER

Dear Thin Thin f Vic,

We attach the video footage for your perusal, Please |et us have your offer soon, Thanks.
Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)

Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Pre Ltd

&5 SMRT

ALUTOMOTIVE

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]
Sent: 05/11/2018 12:03
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)
Cc: Admin A; CS A Team
3



Subject: FW: LOD Re: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4479R & SHC 5498D (AXA's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/09/18/2102/1g

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your emalil.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -
LKK ref Officer in charge
ECHASMIHD]?SBMNuhE Thin Thin

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane! 6366-0055 | email: shupel@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, B02-25 | S{408933)

From: Tan Lee Gek [Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) <|eeGek@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 5 November 2018 10:40 AM
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4473R £ SHC 5498D (AXA's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/09/18/2102/Ig

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of Repair $3000.00
Loss of Rental $1177.00 | 11 daysx $107.00 |
Loss of Income 5660.00 | 11 daysx 560.00 |
LTA Search Fee 57.00
Total $4844.00

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) police/GIA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTAsearch
6) Hirer's Letter of Authorisation
7) Police investigation result

We have notified AXA of PRS on 25/9/2018 at 12.33pm and our tax| was surveyed on 27/9/2018 at 1.50pm. We attach our
email for your perusal.

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.



Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6B66 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automative Services Pte Ltd



GBHRT Automotive Ssrvices Poe Ltd
m 251 Worth Hridge Road Bingapors 179102

Tal: E5 3311000 Fax: &3 3340247

AUTOMOTIVE P
Tax Invoice
Custamer Code: 3000063 GST Reg No. : MR-8500001-7
CEN : 1990042802
SMAT TAXIS PTE LTD Invoice No. : IV1B1000356
Date : 23.10.2018
Block Unit Vehicle No. : SHC4478R
Your Ref No. : TAX/09/18/2102
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL EFARK Ed Our Ref Ho. : 24098035
SINGAPORE 757705 Terms : 30 Days
Description Qty Unit Add Discount Amount
Cost L) Amount
LUMP SUM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 § 3,000.00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMEMDATION
GRAND TOTAL -] 3,000.00

Remark :

Make /Model : TOYOTA PRIUS
Accident Date : 22.09.2018B

N.R, Payment by cheque should be crossed and
sade paysble to 'SMAT Automotive Services Prs Ltd'. “\Z)((/ f{/{f
¥o secsipt will be Lssued unlmss requestsd. w
-0 /o
S

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Fage 1/1 E. & 0.E




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & LA/Taxis/Claims)
<leeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 5 November, 2018 10:40 AM

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 22/9/2018 involving SHC 4479R & SHC 5498D (AXA's insured)
Our Ref. TAX/09/18/2102/Ig

Attachments: 09 18 2102 - LOD pdf

Dear All,

We guantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of Repair $3000.00
Loss of Rental $1177.00 | 11 daysx $107.00 )
Loss of Income S660.00 | 11 daysx $60.00 )
LTA Search Fee 57.00
Total $4844.00

We enclose the following documents:
1} Repair invoice
2] Proof of rental rate
3] police/GIA reports
4] Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTA search
b) Hirer's Letter of Authorisation
7] Police investigation result

We have notified AXA of PRS on 25/9/2018 at 12.33pm and our taxi was surveyed on 27/9/2018 at 1.50pm. We attach our
email for your perusal,

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Deportment

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

S smrr

AUTOMOTIVE



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198807188R GST Reg. No. 16-8607188-R

CC4/ASM1B01 ?MpﬂBqE

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref :

o TONERBNGAPORE 01 own: oo ||
ATTN:VALE Code . ASM
Insured Veh. SHC 54880 "Jeh lnlptctnd SHC 4478R
Policy No. VPX/P1660520 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SBMOOWIN Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 25/08/2018
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. JTDKN36UB05746946 Colour MAROON
Odometer 471748 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
TR e G oy |
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/85R15 FALKEN & mm
L/H Front Tyre [195/85R15 FALKEN 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 FALKEN
L/H Rear Tyre |185/65 R15 FALKEN

iption of Damages

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.

neral Information

Accident Date 22/0672018

Inspection Date

"Eiﬂﬂﬂﬂﬂ

Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTLL
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705

" Remarks =

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CDEDUCTEQ ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE"™ BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED RFEPAIRS.

Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days

1!




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4115
Reg. No: 189607T198R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607188-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 4479R

1|BUMPER FRT (DISC 25%) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 482.00 361.50
1|BRACKET ,FR BUMPER (DISC 25%) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 110.40 8280
1|BUMPER SUPPORT F/RH (DISC 25%) (CONSISTENT) BENT 76.40 57.30
1|BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (DISC 25%) (CONSISTENT) |BENT 498.40 a7i.seo
1|GRILLE ,RADIATOR (DISC 25%) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 310.60 23295
1|WIPER WASHER JAR (DISC 25%) (CONSISTENT) CENTED 180.10 135.08
1|WIPER WASHER INLET (DISC 25%) (CONSISTENT) DENTED 36.80 2768
1|HEAD LAMP RH (DISC 10%) (CONSISTENT) SCRATCHED 84520 850,68
1|NUMBER PLATE (SN){(CONSISTENT) BENT 15.00 15,00
1|NUMBER PLATE FRAME (SN) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 12.00 12.00
1|BRACKET ,FR BUMPER [CONS|STENT) SERVICEABLE 110.40
1|FENDER FRT/RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 72340
1|FENDER LINER FRT/RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 171.70 -
1|SUPPORT FR BUMPER RH (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 68.76 -
1|BUMPER GRILLE SUB-ASSY (CONSISTENT) SERVICEABLE 311.10 -
1|ADVERTISEMENT STICKER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 148 44 *
1|NAME PLATE (HYBRID) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 51.90 -
1|COVER FR BUMPER HOLE (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 18.50 -
LABOUR
1|HOOD PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 748.10 o
LABOUR
5,018.30 2,148,798
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK.INCLUSIVE OF THE 1,078.00 600.00
REPAIR OF COVER FR BUMPER HOLE AND HOOD
PANEL .
SPRAY PAINT. 1,872.00 680.00
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION . 80.00 20,00
TO REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
3.128.00 1.300.00
GRAND TOTAL B,147.30 3,448.79

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM18017584/Npa3q2




anhlu'!of!

Report Haf Nn CC4/ASM1B8017584/Npa3q2

MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH HO LEONG CHUAN ’

Automotive Assessor Automotive Assossor

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Report i made saisty for the uss snd bensfll of the Clisnt named an (ha front page of this Report.
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