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Company Registration No, 199607 195R

g1 BRI AVE 1, #02-25 PAYA LRI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TE (6S) RISRASHT FAX - (D63 pl5G4315
Your ref: D18007053MESH
Our ref: CE!FCHEGITSGEF Tivd3 Date: 27/11/2018

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO_SKT 5488H

We thank you for your instruction on 27/9/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
26/11/2018 at the premises of M/s CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA PTELTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §51,093.00
Revised Estimate Amount + 5%1,033.00
"Check” Items Amount ;8%
Total 1 5%
Market Value 1 55
LTA Reimbursement Value 155
Mett Value 1 55

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear

ofs wing mirror

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAIL AMSAE-A
Automaobile Assessor



MS ‘ FirstCapital

£ Raffies Quay #21-00 Singzpore B48580
Tel (656222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

MS First Capital Insurance Limited CoReg o, 1550000060 81 Reg Mo M2000L676-

Clalms § Hotor Ungerwriting Dept 36 Robinsan Road #1E-0L City House Singapare 0EBATT

Tet (65] 6507 3048 Fax (65 E507 3645
wwiw. mefirstcapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
26-09-2018 Our Ref No.
25-08-2018 Claim Type.
SHD6857P Third Party Vehicle.

209 PANDAN GARDENS

TAY JIAN YE

656845687/ 0 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18007053MFSH

Third Party

SKT5488H

65651240

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIA

A ion.
PTE LTD ttention
MA, TP Solicitor Fax No.
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is & computer genarated latter, no signature required.




92712018

Claim Workflow System

Job Sheet (/ClaimWS/Surveyor/JobSheet/244512) PRI Documents g' Close g]

PRI Header Details

Claimant
Claim No D18007053MFSH Policy No D-18088936MFSH S.No & 1 & CYCLE & ¢
Name
— ggﬁ_é‘ CARRIAGE KIA f::":";“ 209 PANDAN GARDENS
H“ =hop e 7 e . c“ 't "y | Mobile: 0, Phone: 65684567 , Fax: 65651240
ame (Contact Person : D!"l a Emailld: JIANYE. TAY@CYCLECARRIAGE.COM.SG

JIAN YE) Details

Our LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS Instructions
HO REJUDICE:

Surveyor PTE LTD To Surveyor WLTHRRITE s

COMFORT TP
Insured Insured .
Simiae TRANSPORTATION PTE Vehicle No SHDEBSTP Vehicle SKTE488H

LTD No
PRI Surveyor Surveyor
Recieved 26-09-2018 08:48:09 PM Appointed 27-09-2018 11:25:00 AM | Accept 27-09-2018 1
Date Date Date

Survey Report Upload
Suntayer Surveyor :Fh:':: R
Inspection | s 27-09-2018 i Choose File
Date *: ik, Report Date I:.epnrt — -
vehicle Particulars
Make | FlesseSelectMake v| |Model | [Please SelectModel v | Year | Select Year !
Chasis No Engine No [ Mileage |
Cubic
Col
1or 1_ Capacity 1
Multiple Documents Upload
Upload Multiple Documents I
File Name Action

Surveyor Job Remarks

Remarks

f

| save

hnps;.'.'l]maims.m:QDDHCLaimWSlfSunrmeDatai!s.fEMSu

12



‘Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 2:24 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: JOANN EYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1 BOOTOS3IMFSH/, SKT 5488H
Attachments: SKT 5488H PRELI ADVISED pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKT 5488H
Date of survey: 26/11/2018
Number of days : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 11:50 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007053MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 11:25 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: ESMOTGRCL&IMS@MSFIRSTCAPLT.&L.CDM.SG; JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007053MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team
Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ Auu- This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
[ WWW.avg.com



" Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 1:32 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Songcuan JR Lauro Araos

Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Al Ting; Cheng Jo Jo (jojo.cheng @cyclecarriage.com.sg); Tay
Jian Ye (jianye.tay@cyclecarriage.com.sg); SUR

Subject: RE: SKTSAB8H (KIA) - FINALIZE

Dear Larry,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm finalized amount of § 1,033.00 before Gst @ 2 working days.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 14 December 2018 12:09 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SKT5488H (KIA) - FINALIZE

CSIFCI18017568/T 1vd3

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Songcuan JR Lauro Araos <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 8:31 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a lkkauto.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi Ai Ting <aiting loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Cheng lo

Jo <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Tay lian Ye <jianye.tay@cyclecarriage com.sg>
Subject: SKT5488H (KIA) - FINALIZE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Pls. refer to attached files.



Kinfjlﬁ,r confirm finalized amount of $ 1,033.00 before Gst for SKT5488H.

Thank you so much,

Best regards,

Larry Songcuan
Customer Service

@@ l‘ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609338
T- +65 G568 4658 + F: +65 6565 1240 » www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

*?’ A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you
have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd
and/or any of its related corporations.



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

KIA AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder @ WONG YIN-LEONG, MATHEW Vehicle No. : BKTS488H
Period of Insurance - 58 Feb 2018 To 27 Feb 2020 Palicy No. : 1600019338
Engine No. . G4AFGHHBE0852 Endorcement Mo.

Chassis No. = KNAFZA1IMISTEOSTO lesuad Date + 02 Mar 2018

ABOUT THE COVER

MakaModel : KlA Cerato K3 1.6 SX
Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,581.00 CC Sum Insured ; Market Value First Year of Registration © 2018 [
Driver Restniction : NA Off Peak Car © No Insuring wiln COE/PARF - Yes |

Parson or Classes of Persons Entitied to Drive” [
&1 The Policyhoider |
B Aty iber parsan who i amsng on e Pellcyroler s ore

This Prdcy will ndemnify e Policyholdar or any 3wt

aothed 30 condilien |

Yiou Rave (o pay @ sooitional sum of $3.000 as ¥ oung dndor \haiponeniad Diner Excess” (TYIDR) B 'You @eo o YoLE Bailbaried Driver (namid o unnamed] i under the aga oS4 s s RS |
tham T waars' dring axponencs

Age Condition ; All Age Conditicn |

|
; = |
Limitation as {0 use~” - |
LUs only for social, oomestc and pleasins porposas i for ths Palhicyhokder's business, |
This Falicy does not cover Uss flof ning of hwarnd drivirg fuibon, dtving fest, racng paCe-making rebabdity irtal £ spesd-ashng. the carmage ol goads ather han samplos ir snnnaction wit Ay Tads of |

Bupiness of UBE for any purpass in connection with Nigtor Trade

[
Loss of Use 1500c0c - 1600cc
*  miatcns Fenderad nopenstee by Section & of he Motar Wehices [Thiird-Party Risks and Compensation) At (Can. 983 ard Suction 95 of Ihe Road Teanspan Ac 198 [Mstaysia). & not to DS |
pcluded unnar hese headings
Section 1 |
Fra - 50 Own Damage - $500 Theh- 50 Fioad Cover - = |
Section 2
Progarty Damage - 30 l
windscreen : 5100 l
MNamad Driver and EXCESS (whare applicatiu]
WONG YiN-LECNG, MATHEW - 5800 (Own Damage] |

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/AUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS REL ATED REPAIRS)
1 Cyela & Carmisge Body & Pani Centre fod: 209 Pandan Gartens Singapone 809333 B5AEL501

2 Cyehe & Carriaga Cusiomar Service Canirs (For Wincsonesn Claim anky) Ad; 331 tiaxancrs Rosd Sngapons 150031 SAITESN0

3 Cychs & Carmiage Cusiomar Serice Centre {Far wandacraen aEim onfy] Add 330 Uk Ra 3 Sngapons AGREST GTAE000

For ather Approvad Raponing Contres/fiG Autharsod Reparers, ponss contact our 24-hour peoidel Gmargency hotirng ot =85 B338 G200 Altarmalively. you may rader it AN wnbsilt Wl @G o 89
ar AIG SG Mot App. Simply search and downicad “AiG SG° from Tures or Google Flay

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: HL Bank

.

AOAT 4155 A0 Decal

e arnby carthy Hhat the peilcy i which i Carificatn of Insurancs (sssies (8 ssoucl © WmhmdhmmFﬁrmﬂWlmﬂmim (Cap, 183). Part IV of
nmnﬁmmiwmﬂwwmmmmnﬂm-wi- ;

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

BRCNEY

\a Pacific neurance Pia. L
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22-01-1878 M
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nRic e STBO20701

Hl|\_\l_\l__\}\ TR

Ciphe of indie

12-07-2006

APT BLK 10 ROBIN WALK £#01-02 '
SINGAPORE 258150

MRIC Na:  STBOZ0TON _ Date: 08/04/2015

WONG YIN-LEONG, MATHEW

I

WONG YIN-LEONG, MATHEW
_ [HUANG YINGLIANG, ©
- MATHEW)

meth Core: 22 Jan 1978
fmnm Cae. 03 Mar 2003

&1 mwan’ﬁrﬁwm < )

38257058

| YOU ARE LICENSED TO DRIVE VEHICLES IN THE FOLLOWING CLASSIES|

PASS DATE

Class 3 Maolor Cars and Molor Traciers the weight of 04 Mar 1996
which unkaden does not oxcesd 500 il pgrams



CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIAPTELTD
% @ PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609338 Tel 65684567 Fax: 65651240
Co Reg No : 199405410K ESTIMATE GST Reg Mo : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
Mr Wong Yin Leong Mathew Cust Mo/Mame /Mr Wong Yin Leong Mathew
Reg No/Reg Date SKT5488H*FS1F/ 28/02/201
Blk 10 Robin Walk Date In/Mileage { 0
#QI*UZ % Chassis Mo KNAFZ411MJ5760970
Singapore 200153 Engine No GAFGHHE90852
Contact No Mobile: 97667000 Make/Model KIA/CERATD K3 1.6 A SX SR
Colour/Trim SWP SNOW WHITE PEAR/ WK SATURN BLACK
AccountNo Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
CSM00081 Cash  26/09/2018/ 13:53 465 / Tay Jian Ye 36166
Description of Goods [/ Services Qty  UnitPrice Disc'% Amount
E PNT88000 ~ 225.00
TO RENEW FRT RH VIEW MIRROR i
E PNT98000 ¥V 120.00
PAINT WORK SPRAY FAT RH VIEW MIRROR COVER
A 54900099 " 30.00
CHECK WIRING AMD CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM e
A 10028901 200.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNHOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST an| X
M SUNDRY 20.00
SUNDRIES 5
. b/
M MIRROR ASSY-OUTSIDE RR VIEW.RH oF C .00 498,00 00.00 498,00
|
zb’”\ti Q125
"j)— bj? = LM‘? ra
qu (¥ | (g wsdo- =
LIKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
Confirm & accepted by « To display damage 5 .15.'
Prejudics” bas:s Hett 1,093.00
7% BST on 1093.00 76.51
eyed and
ramch Compay Total Payable 1,169.51
Buthorized signatory and company starp Acknowiedgad by Repaires

Validity of this estimate is 14 days from te sﬁ'ﬂ;‘.ﬁﬁe. This is a computer generated docdment, no signature is required.
Estimated costs quoted are excluding G5ST. wolild mention that the a an our initial inspection and does mot include

any additional parts or labour which may be after repair work has commenced. Occasionally worn or damaged parts are discovered
after work has started and needed for repairs or replacement. However, should this occur, we would advise you. Please be informed that a
deposit of 50% of the above estimate is payable before commencement of the work. Payment for this may be made in cash, credit card or
chegue. You must alsc agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of inadvertent breakage in the course of renewing
the rubber seal or other repair requiring the removal of the windscreen.

Page 1 of 1
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE

VEHICLENO @ SETS4DSH

MODEL : JUA/cERAO 12 16 A SX

WIP : P66

Material $ uqe.00
Labour $ 535,00
Sub-Total $ |,03%.00
Less2% Disc ' 9 =

Less Excess $ =

Total $ 0 %%,00
GST 7% $ F2.3\
Grand Total $ ki |a'5:____31_l
Finalise By/Date : Uty o _1212[1%

Qf REVERT BACK WITHIN 7 DAYS,
OTHERWISE WILL PROCEED WITH INVOICING

[ ] SURVEYOR'S REPORT REQUIRED

REPAIR TOOK " WORKING DAYS

gy TP vehicle not SHDB25FF

+ claim locc o+ e TAL.



@ @ CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIAPTE LTD
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE
CYCLE & CARRIAGE 200 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684567 Fax: 65651240

PRO-FORMA INVOICE
Co Reg No : 199405410K TH'S |5 NGT AN OFF“:'AL TA}{ |NVD|CE G5T Reg Mo : MR-8500111-X

Involce Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
Mr Wong Yin Leong Mathew Cust No/Name {Mr Wong Yin Leong Mathew
Reg No/Reg Date SKTS48BH*FSIF/ 28,/02/2018
Blk 10 Robin Walk Date In/Mileage 26/11/2018/ 12887
#01-02 Chassis/Package KNAFZA11MJ576097C /KC17
Singapore 258159
Engine No GA4FGHHE90852
Contact Mo Mobile: 97667000 Make /Model KIA/CERATO K3 1.6 A Sk SR
26/11/ Colour/Trim SWP SMOW WHITE PEAR/ WK SATURMN BLACK
Account No  Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No
CTPOODBO Cash 13/12/2018/ 20:22 TLT 884 / Lauro Songcuan I6166
Description of Goods | Services Qty  UnitPrice Disc% Amount 9
E PNT8B000 225.00 4
RENEW FRONT RH VIEW MIRROR
E PNTOBO00 80.004"
SPRAY PAINT FRONT RH VIEW MIRROR COVER
A 54900099 30.00 +
CHECK WIRING AMD CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
A 10028901 200.004
T0 CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
X MIRROR ASSY-DUTSIDE RR VIEW,RH ~ 1.00 498.00 00.00 498.004"
7 TEXT |
TP FIRST CAP
DOA: 25.9.2018
SURVEYOR: TAUFIKH 26.11.18
2 DAYS
sGuorantee your worranty, maintoin with Cycle & Carriage."
Parts 498.00 Nett 1,033.00
Labour 535.00 7% GST on 1033.00 72.31
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 0.00 Total Payable 1,105.31
Diagnostics Job 0.00
Sundry/0thers 0.00
Total (w/o GST) 1,033.00

This is not an official tax invoice.
This 1% a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Page 1 of 1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 31561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GS5T Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCELTD Ref ©  CS/FCIA017568/T1vd3n2
i?ei%aéﬁ? I GUSESINGAPORE 068877 e pEaREian Mwummwmm
Code . FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD BESTP Veh. Inspected SKT 5488H
Policy No. D-1B0B8936MFSH Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D18007053MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOANNE YONG Assign Date 27/09/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model KIA CERATO K3 c.c 1581
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KMAFZ411MJSTERET0 Colour WHITE
Odometer 12887 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215M45R17 MEXEN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/45R17 NEXEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/45R17 NEXEM & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/45R17 NEXEN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S WING MIRROR.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  25/08/2018 Inspection Date 26112018
Survey held at CYCLE & CARRIAGE KIAPTELTD
209 PANDAN GARDENS
SINGAPORE 609339
Sa. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
8THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' Ve LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_;; ;‘- : 51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 406933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607192-R Page No.1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKT 5488H

| : Estimate By | Our Adjusted
cription of Parts Condition
fy Deacrpto Workshop (S)| ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1IMIRROR ASSY-OUTSIDE RR VIEW RH (SN} BROKEN 408 00 498,00
1|SUNDRIES (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.00
518.00 498.00
LABOUR
TO RENEW FRT RH VIEW MIRROR. 225.00 225.00
PAINT WORK SPRAY FRT RH VIEW MIRROR COVER. 120.00 8000
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM 30.00 30.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN 200.00 200.00
PRO TEST USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST.
575.00 53500
GRAND TOTAL 1,093.00 1,033.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I | [ 1,033.00]
Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017568/T1vd3n2
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE, AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

BISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Report is made sciely for the ws@ and benefit of the Client namad on the frent page of this Repodt.

WMIWW&MMMMWM
Report. in wiis or in part. doss S0 at his or her gwn sk



