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Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: CHAN LI Sl <lisi@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 September, 2018 10:34 AM

To: claims@chengauto.com

Cc assignments@|kkauto.com; 'SUR’

Subject: RE: SLE 207C - LIANG CLARENCE | DOA : 10/09/2018 | POLICY NO. ; MDOD8649 |
REF. NO. : NEW

Dear Murugesan,

We refer to our telephone conversation of 27 September 2018. We have appointed LKK Auto to conduct a pre-repair
inspection of your client's motor vehicle no.SLE207C

We are agreeable to explore a direct settlement on the following conditions:

(1) That you would agree to abide by the recommendation provided by our appointed surveyor on the costs of repair;
and

(£) That we shall not be held liable for any delay caused at your end due to your inability to obtain the spare parts to
carry out the repair to your client's vehicle within the reasonable period of time.

Regards,

Chan Li Si

Executive
Claims
United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road. #28-01 Springleaf Tower. Singapore 079809

Main = (85) 6222 7733 | DND =« (65) 6490 8330 | Fax « (653 8327 2869 | Email = lisi Ui com.eg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system, As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,

neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UCB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: CHAN LI 5l

Sent: Monday, 24 September, 2018 10:52 AM

To: 'claims@chengauto.com' <claims@chengauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLE 207C - LIANG CLARENCE | DOA : 10/09/2018 | POLICY NO. : MOOO8649 | REF. NO. : NEW

UOI's claim ref: L11D55161808

Without Prejudice

Dear Murugesan,

| refer to our telephone conversation just,

\We are the public liability insurers of Secure Parking Singapore Pte Ltd and is currently investigating the matter.

We would like to appoint LKK Auto Consultants to conduct a WP survey. Please advise when the vehicle is in the
workshap so that we can make the necessary arrangements.

Fegards,



Chan Li Si

Executive

iyt .
AdIms

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road. #258-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 070904
Main = (85) 6222 7733 | DID » (65) B490 9230 | Fax » (65) 6327 3869 | Email « lisifyoi com sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse. copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
racipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer systemn, As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UCEB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necassarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM [mailto:CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM
Sent: Monday, 24 September, 2018 9:39 AM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>
Subject: Fwd: SLE 207C - LIANG CLARENCE | DOA : 10/09/2018 | POLICY NO. : M0008649 | REF. NO. : NEW

Dear Ms Jenny Lew,

CHENG AUTO . ..
Ref No. t SLE207C / LIANG CLARENCE

Insured Name : LIANG CLARENCE
Policy Number  : MOD0B649

THIRD
Insurer/Policy CETIQA / Eﬂ&RE'] Y
Type INSURANCE s

THEFT
Date of Loss 104092018

Our Vehicle No. : SLE207C

We, the repairers for vehicle (SLE207C) is filing a Third Party Claim against your insured (Secure Parking)
kindly please review the attached document.

e

Kindly please arrange for a pre-inspection survey.

We look forward to yvour prompt reply.

-------- Forwarded Message --------
Subject:SLE 207C - LIANG CLARENCE | DOA : 10/09/2018 | POLICY NO. : M0008649 | REE. NO. :
NEW
Date:Fri, 21 Sep 2018 16:50:31 +0800
From:CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM =CLAIMS@CHENGAUTOQ.COM:=
To:CHUA JOHNSON <johnsonchua(@uoi.com.sg>

Dear Mr Johnson,
CRENCAUTO . SLE207C  /LIANG CLARENCE
ef. Mo.

Insured Name : LIANG CLARENCE
Policy Number  : MO008649



THIRD

Insurer/Policy  ETIQA / ;;PETY
Type INSURANCE AND

THEFT
Date of Loss : 10/09/2018

Our VYehicle No. : SLE207C

We, the repairers for vehicle (SLE207C) is filing a Third Party Claim against your insured (Secure Parking),
kindly please review the attached document,

Kindly please arrange for a pre-inspection survey.

We look forward to your prompt reply.

Thanks & Best Regards,

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

Reporting Centre
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-60 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607

Email: claims@chengauto.com

Workshop

Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-62 Pioneer Point. Singapore 627607
Email: cab@chengauto.com

Spraypainting
Address: 1 Soon Lee Street #06-41 Pioneer Centre, Singapore 627605
Email: cab@chengauto.com




Celine FunE (LKKAuto)

From: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 5:04 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuta)

Ce: SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLE 207C - LIANG CLARENCE | DOA : 10/09/2018 | POLICY NO. : M000B649 | REF. NO. :
L11D55161809

Dear Ms Celine,

We refer to your Re-offer L/5 $2,200.00 @ 4 DAYS, we accept offer.
Please advise if we should email LOD to you.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Claims Department

Murugesar
CHENG AUTO

B o dy woeoer ks

CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
HP: 8666 7775 | Office-Tel: 6631 0707 | Fax: 6316 2431

Reporting Centre
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-60 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607

Email: claims(@chengauto.com

Workshop
Address: 5 Soon Lee Street #01-62 Pioneer Point, Singapore 627607
Email: cab/@chengauto.com

Spraypainting
Address: 1 Soon Lee Street #06-41 Pioneer Centre, Singapore 627603
Email: cab@chengauto.com

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Monday, 15 April, 2019 11:54 AM

To: CLAIMS@CHENGAUTO.COM

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLE 207C - LIANG CLARENCE | DOA : 10/09/2018 | POLICY NO. : MO008649 | REF. NO. : L11D55161809

Dear Rachel,

My surveyor has further reviewed the price of frt rh door window and had re-adjusted to $1,200.00.
Re-offer L/S $2,200.00 @ 4 DAYS

Please confirm.

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
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ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date 04 Report
iate 0 Ancidant
W Acoidant

CouniryStale of Loss

11092018 16:71
1092018 10:05

4130 COMMONWEALTH AVE WEST CARPARK EXIT

SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Wehicle Registrabion Number

Insured/Policyholder

Mame OF Registared Cwiner

MNEIC N

Email Address

Mohile Phone MO

Allemative Phone Mo

Vehicle Particulars
lanutaciurer

Mool

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al

time of accidenl

Ara yau claiming under your gwn insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?
I Mo, Please state action o ba la4en
Vehicle Calegory
Insurance Company
Mame of [nsurance Company
Type Of Coverage
eai Polioy
Folicy Numbar
Cover Mate Mumbner
Driver
Name of Driver
NRIC Ma
Cate O Birth
Cocupahion
Date O Drving Pass
Dinving Exparence
Grnder
Mabile Number
ik Mumbet
Sartact Number

EMail Address

SLEZ2OTC

LIaNG CLARENCE
S7201161B

MNOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-93682600
CFFICE-83862690

MERCEDES-BENZ
E200K-1.8 [A)

NO

REPORTING QOMLY
PRIVATE CAR

ETIQA INSURANCE PTE LTD

THIRD PARTY FIRE ANDIOR THEFT
NO '

MODOBE4S

LEE TSE YING
S75192960G

20061975

OUTDOOR

140572001

17 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
FEMALE

{LOCAL) +65-93662600

MOEMAIL

Puge 1 o 21



Aodeess

Pasiooda
Was driver an empioves of the Insurad's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Drver with- the Insured

\ehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Cwn
Vehicle

Insurance Sompany af Dnvars Own Vahick

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weathar Conditions
ad Surlacse

Dther Information

as any lameign

wehunke ivDlved in 1his accsdant?

MNumbar of vahicles invdved in the acc:dent

Gas any body injurad in the Accidant?

Was any injured sonveyad 16 hospeal by
ambulanceT

Was any cther maternial or propeny damaged?

| hawe been approachsad by unknown person{s)
solicitina/offenng accident claims assistance,

Number of Passengers {Including Driver)

Details of Police Action

Wae tha acoldent reponed io the police

I Wes Please s1ale which Polce Station
Was notice of intended Proseculion given?
If ¥os, against wnom®

Circumstances of Accident

BLK 415 COMMONWEALTH AVENUE WEST
H#25-3009

120415
MO
SPOUSE

HIT BY FALLEM TREE | OTHER OBJECTS
CLEAR
Ry

MO

NO
MO
YES

NO

MG

MO

S e 10A0201E at 1005 hirs, | was at the mulll storey carpark at 413A Commonwealth Ave West, The gantry opened-and |
moved forward. Before | could axit completaly, | heard somathing drop on the roof of my car. | then reafised that tho gantry arm
broke and dropped an my car whan | excited the carpark. | moved out and parked my car and wesl back lo lake plotures of the
gandry, The ganiry grmy had dropped off. The cable thal had the arm secured was found on floor, snapped.

Attachment(s)
fur lanl photos available for allachment?

‘Was there any video capturad by Car Cameara?

WWas thera any awdio recorded?

YES

NO

NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vrhicle Regisiration Number
Wwehicla Make/Model/Colowr
Cetails OF Froperies
vshithe Category

mMama of Diriver
NRIC/Passpon Number
Contact Mumhber

Address

Paateodo

Insurance Cormpany Nama
Maturn Of Damage

i OF Passenger (Inchadng Driver)

GANTRY

NAUNHENCWN

Page 2 af 21



IMBOATANT NOTICE

g (e Lappptly e tecate o P g mmend o ubvasl up el Alaies TR
el e ne s eted e Folicynoler el ihe Auhornod Srast.

L e e L e L il i Tl 84 mOsnie Aren WAL s e i e s il ol matena
Taihn iy e om0 R 3 (i ey [y
Ve e el e I8 o T T (i GRTETYe ) R o sdmseeoey o gy (akilbiy om Do gar® of fes PTaneT
s
. hmmnmmm“
4 Re eran Wi S v e e Sy e smrroe o B G0 S i laeagetlent Certes etaicinma vy the deener sl T e

Lyhim e (e B0 Ao sy gt st Pt romsary o the sepert il i - foy e e avsdiiie Gt Spaaiexoce e
azerpvintd parde

e e ] e S Dy e A, g Pty CSrl S DT A thes fipivwt . thie e s i Ehgees o
e T e g kibe suldfee piuresa

b Camyem mter T Baeuenal DNES Projecnon & | P0Re)
e vt i cnrlee o e il caraenl AL

o Ry sl S s el A8 e Tenes brtursacs Adsocigtion ol Setgapcre "SRR ") s el i sofees, e,
e e w.’mnmn.rm—nwmﬂﬂhﬂhﬂﬂﬂﬂ-mm
el ey T el By Tp b (cailfer ety the Parvensd infarmatom™ snd ducloe s @t st
e e 0 25 LNETTa] W e ¥ At bt o4 W areaon £ Pnmapwry) whe gt e
b | et e T ate et L e CUBACHvRSY VEEITEE T0 42 The IEMIERY L The inarery” iETRSa flonm, Ve
Sohiruetars R ety oof WIGAEE T S sy b g Ry ety fusch i the polel, o the Sopmei

s

] P meeh, e bt Rdlimg st ey Sl ICEng L MDameat of Sher cleoey enet afy SsuRiLY
ittty e (e rleire
Toid vl R bl Lol SIabE] MW ATy O,
I by et il el et vy WP O FRADGEIN SO Sy priguiicie e vt
6] B e g oy R (it e e o o0 e, E, S, PORITIS i I 1 T

R e ————— s LR TR Y T e Dl
ewterryl Loem F esipstaornrall gl o
197 1 erpl g W e whil L 11 SRS ARTTE. (PRI, Raneial andar Bastig wih ey Ty R i e
Parpearens
8 e e e ) ey | Sl 9 £ st Sl Wi g g T T, 17y e ]
i e, e, i ek e e Reione beiameation kar One ar e SF S mSove Purmaes and

1)y Peruprst Vet sl mmmmhﬂrihw.___nfﬂh“‘ﬂ“mmii
st ek g e el i), wieeh MOy be tes euttide i Tagaoore fn oo o neone o e sbeve D

[ v Prnat o M wi A b (ol e svel T Lompie i Sty lar e (urposs oF [ deftedtiee,
R R B o e oy EI BT B Pt st e :

el W e (o oHEe e 1] e ey B ahsted  eckaud

I W2 s et e ey e Sl g e Wt I RSN, SRR conresing of Ay e,
PR, e O TSR R A g = ey vl b S wrpoiey et of

(W B SOPREEAIT T CR IR S ey repkaitoon. ey b ARrs petny.

; Page ot 31




' Accident Sketch Plan
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AMBRI019

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cnwner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Ma:-:jrnurn Pawer COutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate .ﬂ@mnunt:

The information contained herein is correct as at 16 Apr 2017

PARFICNF Rahata Fanning

Singapore MRIC
1161B

SLE207C

Mo

16 Apr 2017
MERCEDES BEMZ
E200K

Silver

2006
271954630806882
WDB2110412B012825
1350 kW (181 bhp)
$54,102.00

20 Sep 20046

20 Sep 2006

2

£59,513.00

Forfeited

$0.00

31 Jul 2026

B - Car (1601cc & above)
10

£51.630.00

$37,639.00

$37,639.00

NOPS/ATLIE.QOV.SgIANVIVacionanguirarepans ByFUDICEEeToreLreraginpulsrumNL 1 IVN_ILSTUMMUE | |

Il
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DATE: 21/9/2D18

HENG AUTO
86667775

REPAIR DETAILS

REFERENCE !
Vehicle Reg No. SLE207C
Make & Model - MERCEDES BENZ E200K,
Chassis No. WDBZ1104128012826
Engine Ma. £7195630806882
Manufactured Year 2006
Labaur REPAIRER'S
TP Vehicle Reg No.
DOA E Location 10/05/2018 A13A COMMONWEALTH AVE WEST CARPARK EXIT
Our Ref SLE207C /  LIANG CLARENCE
ESTIMATES OF PARTS
Ne, Oty Description Fart Mo, Price
| 1 ROOF 5 13q040 Ay
? 1 ROOF PANEL SIDE MOULDING 5 453,20 % '[ '
3 1 RHA-PILLAR 5 189435 % )
4 1 FRTRH DOOR FRAME 5 45735 f;s
5 1 FET RH DOOR WINDOW $ 1,653.50 hdf e &
6 1  REARRHDOOR s 250605 Ky
7 1 FRTRHDOOR CHROME 5 109.86 &5 YK
B 1 ROCKER PANEL GARNISH RH 13 523.35 R}ﬂ
Sub-Total (S$) § 953806 7 (2o
SAAA List Itern Discount 10%  (55) 5 353.81
sub-Total (83) § 858425 . (959
M, Description Prica
1 LABOLIR § 150000 -}‘-"“
2 SPRAYPAINTING 5 150000 oo
3 DISCONNECT & CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING, HARMESS, WIRE SOCKETS, ETC., REMOVE & 5 100,00
REINSTALL DAMAGED PARTS, TEST & RECTIFY FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING %o
4 ANTI-RUST COATING AND APPLY CORROSION PROTECTION 5 200,00 ﬁ"ﬂ !
REMOVE AND REPLACE WINDOW GLASS / QUARTER GLASS 5 w000 SO
DISMANTLE AND TRANSFER DOOR FITTINGS AND MECHANISM TO NEW DOORSFACILITATE
i 5 120,00 w7,
REPAIR
Total Labour (S$) §  3,520.00 TRl
MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS
No. Description Price
1 SCOLAR FILM s 15000 so @ W
2 ROCKER PANEL CLIPS (1 SET) 5 90,00 X Vi,
Total Miscellaneous ltems  {55) % 240,00
LXK Auto Consultants hence notify -
the Repairer of the following: ;
» To resurvey before/afier spray painting Total Parts (%) S  B,584.25
» To display damaged part{s) during resurvey Total Labour (5%) 5 352000 d
# Parta prices ane subject io confirmation

* Third party survey i on a “Without Prejudice” basis
= No ilegal modification{s) Is aliowed

* Supplemantary iemi{s] must be resurveyed and
is subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowedged by Repainer
Bignatune:
Dale:

ﬁfg,{zz.ﬂo



Total Miscellaneous {55) 5 240,00

Total (S8) & 1234405
G5T7% (S5 35 864,10

Grand Total (83) & 1320835

'*d*‘“ ‘HU{‘ISH’J

o w/{&@ 5o
firey b
SW.FE ULﬁ._»,f‘th-ﬂ#h



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Req. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-3607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD

3 ANSON ROAD #28-01

Ref : CS/UOI8017562/T1cd3s2

SPRINGLEAF TOWER SINGAPORE 079909 Bale:  17:04:2018 |H|”|"IIH|"””|‘”||!
Code: UOQI2
15 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  PUBLIC LIABILITY Veh. Inspected SLE 207C
Policy No. DHOL110042521302 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. L11D55161809 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CHAN LI 8 Assign Date 27/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E200K c.c 1796
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2006
Chassis No. WDB2110412B012826 Colour BEIGE
Odometer 207499 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
5 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |245/47R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/47R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[245/47R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/47R17 MICHELIN 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 10/0%/2018 Inspection Date 0112018
Survey held at CHENG AUTO BODYWORKS
1 500N LEE STREET
#06-41 PIONEER CENTRE
SINGPORE 827605
5a. Remarks
A)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT ALUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days
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AdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLE 207C
. : ‘Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition
Workshop ($) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|ROOF TO REPAIR SEE 1,840.40 -
LABOUR
1|ROOF PANEL SIDE MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 453,20
1|RH A-PILLAR NOT NECESSARY 1,894.35 -
1|FRT RH DOOR FRAME TO REPAIR SEE 457,35 7
LABOUR
1|FRT RH DOOR WINDOW cuT 1,853.50 1,200.00
1|REAR RH DOOR TO REPAIR SEE 2.506.05 -
LABOUR
1|FRT RH DOOR CHROME TO REPAIR SEE 100.88
LABOUR
1|ROCKER PANEL GARNISH RH TO REPAIR SEE 523.35
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -953.81 -120.00
8,584 25 1,080.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1{SOLAR FILM (SN) NECESSARY 150.00 100.00
1{SET ROCKER PANEL CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 90.00 .
240.00 100.00
LABOUR
LABOUR.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF ROOF,FRT RH 1,500.00 700.00
DOOR FRAME REAR RH DOCR,FRT RH DOOR CHROME
AND ROCKER PANEL GARNISH RH.
SPRAYPAINTING 1,500.00 800.00
DISCONNECT & CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING 100.00 30.00
HARMNESS WIRE SOCKETS,ETC,REMOVE & REINSTALL
DAMAGED PARTS,TEST & RECTIFY FOR PROPER
FUNCTIONING.
ANTI-RUST COATING AND APPLY CORROSION 200.00 40.00
PROTECTION
REMOVE AND REPLACE WINDOW GLASS/QUARTER 100.00 60.00
GLASS.
DISMANTLE AND TRANSFER DOOR FITTINGS AND NOT NECESSARY 120.00 .
MECHANISM TO NEW DOOR/FACILITATE REPAIR.
3,520.00 1,630.00
GRAND TOTAL 12,344.25 2,810.00

Report Ref No. CS/UOM8017562/T1cd3s2
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Page No.:2 of 2
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,200.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION})
Report Ref No. CS/UQOI18017562/T1cd3s2
| ~I {I ) ,\ |
\ N

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eny_‘ﬁ;lSDE.ﬁHJ RTE.AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report ks made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
spied to reply on the Reporl whally orin part. Any third party acting or regiving on this




