11/23/2020 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Your Ref: SLL5487R // LKK Ref: CC4/EQI18017536/Upb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SKP365H(EQ) AND SLL 5487R ON 25/09/2018]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Mon 23/11/2020 8:48 AM
To: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Without Prejudice

Hi Elin,

Thank you for your acceptance.

We confirm settlement at $2,700.00(all-in) as full and final settlement.

EQ is moving to E-payment modes. Kindly let us have your company’s bank details for our necessary action: -

Account Name
Account Number
Bank Name
Bank Code
Branch Code

Thank you.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability
on our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in
respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall
be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher
(for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have

made payment on the settlement sum.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 November 2020 11:53 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SLL5487R // LKK Ref: CC4/EQI18017536/Uph3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP365H(EQ) AND SLL
5487R ON 25/09/2018]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
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kindly send us DV.

Warmest Regards,
Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130
@9450 7920
“Bzoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -

On Fri, Nov 20, 2020 at 1:41 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Your Ref: SLL5487R Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC4/EQI18017536/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP365H(EQ) AND SLL 5487R ON 25/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,700.00.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability
on our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s)
in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference
shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher
(for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have
made payment on the settlement sum.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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