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51 UBTAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0635) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18006990MFSH
Our Ref® CSIFCI18017497/Gtd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

Date: 28/9/2018

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO__SMC 3290P
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

26/09/2018 at the premises of M/s Yong Sing Motor and have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check” Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

rear portion.

Commenis/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Guo Qiang
Automotive Assessor

9 6,102.00

'S8 4,532.50
: 5% 2.010.00




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) .
Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 9:40 AM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006990MFSH/

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 4:43 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006950MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System -
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.

‘AVG Www.avg.com



Denise TaZ (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) -
Sent: Friday, 28 September 2018 11:47 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); 'Claim Workflow System’; assignments

Cc: KAREMNTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1B006920MFSH/T

Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SMC 3290P.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,
Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SMC 3290P

Bast Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkayto.com | fax: 6256-4315 -
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 5:40 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' =cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006990MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd =~
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkavto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 4:43 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@EMSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006990MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 February 2019 8:11 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; SUR

Ce: 'Karen Tan'; assignments

Subject: RE: REMINDER - 2: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR
REF:D18006990MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA2796Z AND SMC3290P ON
21-09-2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Ed m fl\_z T;L’Z ‘g% %2

Thank you for the email.
Dear Denise, \({DH@ gl"lr’\
Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CS/FCI18017497/Gtd3

-
L2

b

BEST REGARDS,

(. Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments @lkkauto.com | fax: 5256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 6 February 2019 8:30 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: REMINDER - 2: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D18006990MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5HA2796Z
AND SMC3290P ON 21-09-2018

Dear Sir,

We received LOD from workshop/solicitor.

Please let us have the Survey Report including Vehicle Inspection Photos & Survey Fees Invoice asap.



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Yong Sing <yongsingmotors@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 March 2019 11:53 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalise for SMC3290P

Hi,

Confirm finalize amount at $4896.25.

Part by Part repair job and 05 repair days

With Regards,
Sam Sim (Mr)

Executive
Mobile: 9182 0027 Fax: 6284 2798
53 Defu Lane 12, Singapore 539144

g—

On Wed, 13 Mar 2019 at 11:23, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sam,

Can confirm the finalize amount??7?

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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Ho. 10 Defy Lane 8
Singapora 538315

Yong Sing Repair Estimate

e -
Vahicle Registration
Burmber SMCX2a0P Raf Mo
Make ! Model TOYOTA ALTIS Reg. Date :
Chassic Mo MROSIREHB04585085 Thar damages on the vehicle are as
indicafad i the following diagram ©
Mame of Drivar TAY CHOR CHAI -
Datel Time of
Accident 21912018 16.00
Type of Reoair PARTBY PART
Mileape
Rertal Vehicla Yes -"Nu
Yong Sing estimate repair cost Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable
Total Labour Charges 3 1,800.00 5
Total Spray Painting Changes : 5 1,900.00 5 *
Total Material Chargas 5 4,576.50 3 4, 578,50
Oitker Charges 420.00 5
B.698.50
TOTAL 5 4,578.50
Lump Sum Repair, if any
Ma: of Rapair Days o S| ar days [ 5 ] days
WORKSHOP's Remark SURVEYOR'S Remark
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Part 4 - Spare Parts / Material Usage

_ Regair @ Repair ®

ltem FIOS ot i mg;m Eg'::h F'“?'sf ] |

Reguest] Reconmend)
REARBUMPER 7 @ ¢ 1|S [T500] 2500% |5 seaTs| L L wl s
REAR BUMPER RENFORCEMENT _# (37 1|5 “as500] 2500% |5 2e62e repurce )|
REAR BUMPER RH RE TAINER 7 = 1|8 (F125.00| 2500% 5 9375 REPLACE {) /
REARBUMPER LHRETANER /|~ Ty s o500 | 2500 | s sas e
REAR BUMPER LHSEAL ( L 15 X ss00] 2500% |5 7125 repLace | X
REAR BUMPERRHSEAL 3 TIW‘-' 1|s Xosoo|2500% s 7128 repace | X
REARENDPANEL . by e 1|8 (esnoo| 2500 |5 s1000 REPLACE ()| -
REAR ENU LUGGAGE PANEL Y o / 1|8 Xosnoo| 2500% [s 72000 REPLAGE (/) )(
REAR END VENTILATION COVER ¢ &2 15 K 00| 2500% | s 7200 ———
REARBOOTLD -~ poq (. 1| ,/95000| 2500% |8 71250 | gepy aoe nl /
REAR BOOTLOCK . il 1]§ /45000 2500% (§ 337.50 REPLACE /) /
REAR BOOT WEATHER STRP _» 0 ( 1]s Z13800) 2500% [5 10125 | ey |/
REAR BOOT LH HINGE }< '} 1|5 wo600|2500% | § 7200 REPLACE () ){
REAR BOOTRH HINGE 3 s 1]$ X 96.00] 2500% | 5 7200 REPLACE 1) X
REAR LUGGAGE RH TRIM 3 N7V 1]§ K4a5000 | 25.00% |5 337.50 reprace | X
REAR LUGGAGE LH TR Y 1] 8 X 4s000| 25.00% |5 337.50 | peny ace nl X
REAR END PANEL GARNSH - @7 LTS e[ 200 s 27| pepiace | o
REAR LUGGAGE BOTTOM TRIM ‘%L NN | 1] s a000] 2500 [5 32250 Repuace )| X
REAR TAILLAMP RH ﬂ ! 1 $( S60.00 | 25.00% (5 42000 REPLACE (1) s
REAR TAILLAMP LH ¢ ( 1| $ /56000 | 2500% |5 42000 | pepiace y|
REARBOOTLAWMP RH 7} | / Cq—]] 1|3 /50000] 2500% |5 40| pepiace ]|
REAR BOOTLAMP LH 1 ‘1' 1|s /58000 2500% |5 a3s00 REPLACE (/) s

REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR fﬁn_n 1|8 /30000 2500% |5 28500 | pepiace y| Zeoe G

TOTAL MATERIALS § &,102.00

5 4,575.50
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Part 1 - Labour & Panel Beating Related Works

Yong !lng
B Job Scops [ Estimate Surveyor Adjustment
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT DAMAGED ITEMS, TO PULL
AMD ALIGN REAR LUGGAGE, REAR END PANEL Sk
FRAME TO CUT AND WELD OUT REAR END PANEL, N é o0
LUGGAGE AND ADJUST
*
Total Labour Cost 51,600.00 50.00
Part 2 - Spray Painting Related Works
Job Scope Yong Sing Surveyor Adjustment
Estimate
TO SPHAY PAINT REAR BUMFER. $350.00 2c.6
TO SPRAY PAINT REAR END PANEL
RA AR E $300.00 2.0 P
TG SPRAY PAINT REAR LUGGAGE PANEL $300 00 r% 100
.
TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BOOTLID 2350 00
O SPRAY PAINT REAR LH FENDER 300 00 @- [6e
TO SPRAY PAINT REAR RH FENDER
$300.00 _ﬁ r ¢0
Total Spray Painting Cost $1,50000 seo0 ),
Y
Bart 3 - Other Costs - Accident Repair Related Expenses
Joh Scope Yong Sing Surveyor Adjustmant
L ' Estimate
TO CONDUCT SYSTEM WIRING CHECK 5100 00 3 o
TO PROVIDE ANTI RUST COATING AFTER WELDING $100.00 {;D
TO REMUWVE AND REFIT REAR BUMPER SENSOR $80.00 QP!T
TO REFIT REAR BOOT ACCESSORIES INCLUDING
LOCK AND LAMP. $60 00 Yo
e
T CONDUGT WATER LEARAGE TEST TO WELDED
AREAS $100.00 X ANV
Total Other Costs §420.00 $0.00




' 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

—i 9 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607128 GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18017487/Gid3n2
neomeonsond wamoreceserr o o= [N
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 27962 Veh, Inspected SMC 3290P
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. 018006990MFSH Excess (3$) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 26/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Modal TOYOTAALTIS c.c 1588
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MRO53REHE04585099 Colour WHITE
Odometer 19702 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 MICHELIN 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  21/09/2018 [Inspection Date 26/09/2018
Survey held at  YONG SING MOTOR WORKS
10 DEFU LANE 8
DEFU INDUSTRIAL ESTATE SINGAPORE 539315
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 13-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMC 3290P

Page Mo..1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qaty Description of Parts Condition | SR e ;]'I {5%
REPLACEMENT QOF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 745.00 531.75
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 355.00 327.45
1|REAR BUMPER RH RETAINER MECESSARY 125.00 T2.50
1|REAR BUMPER LH RETAINER NECESSARY 125.00 72.50
1|REAR BUMPER LH SEAL NOT NECESSARY 95.00 =
1|REAR BUMPER RH SEAL NOT NECESSARY 95.00 "
1|REAR END PANEL BUCKLED 6B0.00 374.45
1|REAR END LUGGAGE PANEL NOT NECESSARY 960,00 .
1|REAR END VENTILATION COVER NOT NECESSARY 96.00 5
1|REAR BOOT LID BUCKLED 950.00 TH1.45
1|REAR BOOT LOCK BENT 450.00 277.40
1|REAR BOOT WEATHER STRIP TWISTED 135.00 135.00
1|REAR BOOT LH HINGE NOT NECESSARY 96.00
1|REAR BOOT RH HINGE NOT NECESSARY 96.00
1|REAR LUGGAGE RH TRIM NOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
1|REAR LUGGAGE LH TRIM NOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL GARNISH DEFORMED 385.00 150.10
1|REAR LUGGAGE BOTTOM TRIM NOT NECESSARY 430,00 -
1|REAR TAILLAMP RH CRACKED 560.00 381.90
1|REAR TAILLAMP LH CRACKED 560.00 381.90
1|REAR BOOTLAMP RH CRACKED 580.00 274.30
1|REAR BOOTLAMP LH CRACKED 580.00 274.30
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2,249.50 -1,008.75
B8, 748.50 3,026.25
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 380.00 200.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -95.00 .
285.00 200.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017497/Gtd3n2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3661 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 19980T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.2 of 2
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =8 rhhnh?:l} ﬁJ}

LABOUR

TO DISMANTLE AMD REFIT DAMAGED ITEMS.TO PULL 1.B00.00 &00.00

AMND ALIGN REAR LUGGAGE REAR END PANEL

FRAME.TO CUT AND WELD OUT REAR END PANEL

LUGGAGE AND ADJUST.

TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BUMPER. 350.00 200.00

TO SPRAY PAINT REAR END PANEL. 300.00 200.00

TO SPRAY PAINT REAR LUGGAGE PAMEL. 300.00 100.00

TO SPRAY PAINT REAR BOOT LID. 350.00 200.00

TO SPRAY PAINT REAR LH FENDER. 300.00 100.00

TO SPRAY PAINT REAR RH FENDER. 300.00 100.00

TO CONDUCT SYSTEM WIRING CHECK. 100.00 30.00

TO PROVIDE ANTI RUST COATING AFTER WELDING, 100.00 &0.00

TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR BUMPER SENSOR. 60.00 40.00

TO REFIT REAR BOOT ACCESSORIES INCLUDING LOCK 50.00 40.00

AND LAMP

TO CONDUCT WATER LEAKAGE TEST TO WELDED NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -

AREAS.

4.120.00 1,670.00

GRAND TOTAL 11,153.50 4,896.25

[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I | [ 4,3896.25]

Report Ref No. CS/FCI118017497/Gtd3n2

XING GUD QIANG

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and berefit of the CBent namsed on the front page of this Report.
Ay third party wheo may regly on the Repor :

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

by acting o



