Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svecs/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims)
<LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 October, 2018 3:37 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: SHF 446X DOA:19/9/2018 Our Ref: TAX/09/18/2087

Dear Vic,

Due to the size limit, we have forwarded the video footage to Ikkauto.photos@gmail.com.

Please confirm if liability is clear. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)
Sent: 22/10/2018 15:32

To: Ikkauto.photos@gmail.com

Subject: Re: SHF 446X DOA: 19/9/2018 Our Ref: TAX/09/18/2087

Dear Vic,
As spoken today, we attach the video footage as requested.

Please confirm if liability is clear. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE




