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Asn mam Pre Ltd Company Raegistration No_ 199607 198R

STUIEAVE |, #0225 PAYA UK INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAM : (D65) 62EB401 5

Your rel: 1 T8N B/NVCIO/020037 Date: 27.09.2018
Our rel: CC4/LPCI8017488/R 1fa3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. YP 2792D
We refer 1o the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 25.09.2018
at the premises of M/s Sin Sheng Engineering Services have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 3,021.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2,266.00
"Check” llems Amount : §% -

Taotal (Including Check ltems) : 8% 2,266.00
Market Value : SS - (est)
LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 - (est)
Nett Value : 8§ - f{est)

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the =
Rear N/S Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 3.0 days

Yours faithfully,

MOHD. RASUL
Licensed Appraiser
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type

Owner |0

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No:

Wehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour
Manutacturing Year:

Engine Na.:

Chassic No:

M i mum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
FARF Rebate Amount
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount

The Infermation contalned herein is correct as at 24 Sep 2018

PARFINMNF Rahsts Frimiire

Company
1196M

Yp2792D

Mo

31 Dec 2018
MITSLIBISHI
CANTER FEB71ER4SDEC (CBU)
White

2014
4P10C25779
FEB71EA20217
$35237.00

Oé Jun 2016

06 Jun 2016

0

£1.762.00

Mo

$0.00

05 Jun 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$44.213.00

$32.852.00
$32.852.00

OK
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SIN-SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

3 TECH PARK CRESCENT

SINGAPORE 638129

Tel No. : 6863-9595 Fax No. : 6863-6477
E-Mall : sinsheng1981@gmail.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
58 SENOKO ROAD
SINCAPORE 758123

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6861 0007 Fax No. : 6753 7780

S/IN  Quantity  Particular
MNETT ITEMS :
1. 1 FRONT DOOR, LHs CRéewt)
2. 2 DOOR HINGE
3. 1 CONTAINER LOCK

Nett Total 55 :
10.00% Discount 55 :

LABOUR :

TO REPAIR REAR BODY

TO DISMANTLE/REPLACE REAR DOOR
SPRAY PAINTING

TO APPLY NEW LOCO

LOSS OF USE : S DAYS @ S 120/DAY

Labour Total 55 :

Estimate

Date
Vehicle Num. :
Make/Model :
Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date :
Claim No.
Reference :
Palicy No. :

: ES002611

: 24/09/2018

YP27492D
MITSUBISHI FEB 21
FEBZ21EA20217
19/08/2018

YN103BR
29004183

Unit Price  Amount 55

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES _

.'3‘3!.,- M : <,

TR 71 500,00
@ 120000 24000k~

ﬂED.m)C;lil,‘

2,190.00
219.00

1.971.00

3=’Uymf

710 T v aperto
(o0 3050

1,050.00

Total 55 : 3,021.00
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Catherine Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 25 September, 2018 9:40 AM
To: assignments
Subject: FW: Accident Involving YP2792D with YN1038R on 19/09/2018
12-40 fﬂ‘\@as I 216
Qe v\
Best Regards Rtji.\.l".
Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone; 6366-0055 | email: shupel® kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. B02-25 | 5{408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 9:36 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: Accident Involving YP2792D with YN1038R on 19/09/2018

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VC10/020937
Dear Catherine/Nivitha,
Kindly proceed with the survey accordingly.

For your information, our insured has yet to lodge a
report and we are making enquiries.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mallto:sinsheng1981 @gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September, 2018 9:25 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Re: Accident Involving YP2792D with YN1038R on 19/09/2018

Hi Mr Gerald.

We are selected Mr Rasul,

Thank You
Regards



© Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9393

Fax: 6863 6477

On 24 September 2018 at 17:49, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Our Ref : To be advised

Dear Susan,

We attached the list of 10 surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

for your attention,

Please let us hear from you.

In addition,for future pre-repair survey, please email to mt_claim@Ilonpac.com

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng]981&gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 24 September, 2018 10:38 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Accident Involving YP2792D with YN1038R on 19/09/2018

Dear Officer In charge,

We are repairer of motor vehicle YP2792D. Enclosed Accident Statement and LTA search fee for your attention please.
Kindly assist to arrange for the Pre-Repair Inspection to be conducted within two {2) workings days upon received this
email,

Kindly let us have your list of 10 nominated surveyers to conduct the Single-Joint Inspection.

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue if direct settlement is in order.

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

e —————————————— e ——

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpaccom>

Sent Monday, 8 October, 2018 4:43 PM

To: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving YP2792D with YN1038R on 19/09/2018
Attachments: INSD REPORT. pdf

Categories: HMEK

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured’s report

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Melkwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 27 September, 2018 11:34 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Hslao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident Involving YP2792D with YN1038R on 19/09/2018

WITHOUT PREIUDICE’
SAVEAS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 17/18/18/VC10/020937
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18017488 /R1fa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter,

Enclosed revert of vehicle: YP 2792D

We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair
* Preliminary advice
+ TP GIA report

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841
2132.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou



Thank You
Repards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
3 Tech Park Crescent

Tuas Tech Park

Singapore 638129

Tel: 6863 9595
Fax: 6863 6477

On 24 September 2018 at 17:49, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh @ lonpac.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Our Ref : To be advised

Dear Susan,

We attached the list of 10 surveyors from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

for your attention.

Please let us hear from you.

In addition,for future pre-repair survey, please email to mt claim@lonpac.com

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
3
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SlN SHENG SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

REGISTRATION NO : 312029/00D

No 8 Tuas Ave 18 (Level 3), Singapore 6385892

[e] - 6863 9595 Fax: 6863 6477 Email - sinsheng 198 1 {@gmail.com
Date : 17/08/2019
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir / Mdm,

RE : CHANGED OF COMPANY CORRESPONDENCE ADDRESS

Refer to the above matter

| would like to inform you that my company correspondence address will change
immdediately as below and please update accordingly

8 Tuas Avenue 18
Singapore 638892

Your kind attention for this matter shall be highly appreciated

Your faithiully,

L
¢HUA GEOK TOH
SOLE PROPRIETOR
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Ingustrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL B256 1581 FAX: 8256 4115
Reg. No: 198607 198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affillsted to Federation Intermationale Des Experts En Automobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Rel - CC4/LPC1B01748A/R1hadn2
o Nmenen——_L LU | | [
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ¥N 1038R Veh. Inspected ¥P 27820
Policy No. ZNMBNC1D1102151-001 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 17118/18/VC10/020937 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 25/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI CANTER FEBT! |e.e 2008
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. FEBT1EAZ0217 Colour RED
Odometer 72438 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215T5R175 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |21575R17.5 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |21575R17.5(D) BRIDGESTONE 717 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |21575 R17.5 (D) BRIDGESTONE 717 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/09/2018 [inspection Date 25/09/2018
Survey held at SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES
3 TECH PARK CRESCENT TUAS TECK PARK SINGAPORE 638129
5a. | Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS

5b. . Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl industnal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL 8256 3581 FAX: 6258 4315

Rieg. No: 108607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-8607108-R Poge No.!1 ol 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YP 2792D
Qaty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate "-_-%']} W*"ﬁ““"’
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR DOOR ,LHS [N} TORN 1.500.00 1,500.00
2|D00OR HINGE @3120.00 [N) BENT 240.00 240.00
1|CONTAINER LOCK [N) NOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -218.00 -174.00
1,971.00 1,566.00
LABOUR
TO REPAIR REAR BODY.TO DISMANTLE /REPLACE REAR 450.00 300.00
POOR.
SPRAY PAINTING 400.00 300.00
TO APPLY NEW LOGOD 200,00 100.00
1.050.00 700.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,021.00 2,266.00
'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,800.00
{TO ITE PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) -
Reaport Ref No. CC4/LPC18017488/R1hadn2
1| Bt
Il
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS HO LEONG CHUAMN
Automotive Assessor Automative Assessor

DISCLAMIER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Rapor! (s mads ssdely bor e uss snd benadil of ike Clisni namsd s 1hs lront pege of this Reper




