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A BH AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Blk 1, Sector C |, Sin Ming Industrial Estate #01-111/ 113/ 115/ 117 Singapore 575636
Tel: 6339 8044 | Fax: 6269 2404

ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT DATE : 16/11/2018
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD PAGE : 1 OF 1

AlG BUILDING

78 SHENTON WAY /’f/ﬂ? A 4

#07-16 SINGAPORE (179120 e ” P

TEL : 6419 3000 £z 2c4
A
ACCIDENT REPAIR ON : SKN4860D 4/»,7 14 P
<2,

MODEL : NISSAN 200SX(M)
POLICY NO : GA233885/1

CHASSIS NO : JN1GBAS15A0031575

YEAR OF MANUFACTURE : 2001

DATE / TIME OF ACCIDENT : 20/09/2018@11:00HRS
LOCATION : ALONG SO0 CHOW DRIVE

THIRD PARTY VEHICLE NO : SKS4410T

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS QUANTITY| UNIT PRICE| AMOUNT
1[REAR BUMPER 1 ZU1Ss 138820| X
LESS 30% $  (410.48)
PARTS TOTAL s g57.74
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS QUANTITY| UNIT PRICE | AMOUNT
1[REAR BUMPER CLIPS 108 500 | 54~ 5000 A
PARTS TOTAL 3 50.00
- LABOUR CHARGES FOR REAR PORTION - AMOUNT
1[PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR TO REMOVE ALL DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL BEAT, CUT o~ X
AND WELD IF NECESSARY AND ALIGN ALL PANEL AND REINSTALL ALL DAMAGED | §  300.00
PARTS.
2|PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY ALL DAMAGED PARTS AND s 30000 | 22/
PANEL AND TO RESPRAY WITH 2K PAINT WITH OVEN SPRAY BOOTH FACILITIES. :
[ LABOUR TOTAL $  600.00
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR $ 1.607.74
GST 7% S 11254
GRAND TOTAL § 1,720.28
ESTIMATE REPAIR DURATION 3 DAYS

YOURS SINCEREL

LEK Auto Consultants hence nolify
the Repairer of ha following:

+ To ey boloreialier sorey saining

ESTIMATOR : KIT
TEL : 8405 4058
FAX . 6269 2404 ® Thiid pas ’
EMAIL : karkit.ngaii@bhauto,.com.sg * Mg fllegal t ) i alwed




Hsiao Tnnﬂ !wn!

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 November 2018 4:19 PM

To: Hsiao Tang (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: AIG ref 06243890905G-003 |l accident involving SKS4410T & SKN4B60D on
20/08/18

Dear Hsiao Tong.
We have previously cleared insured on liability. no need to engage him again.

thank you,

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Saliha Syed Yusoff

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | A1G Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

AlG Building. 78 Shenlon Way #08-16, Singapors 073120
Tal +{65] 8418 1817 | Fax +{65) 68357416
S i Eam g

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infarmation In this email {and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2018 10:45 AM

To: PCTan

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 0624389090SG-003 |l accident involving SKS4410T & SKN4860D on 20/09/18

Dear MR, Tan,
We acknowledge receipt of your report and will proceed to handle the claim accordingly.

thank you,

Saliha Syed Yusoff (Ms. Saliha)

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton \Way #08-16 Singapore{0T9120)



Tel +(65) 6419 1917 | Fax +(65) 68357416

saliha syed-yusoff@sia.com | www.aig.com.sq

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The informatan i this email (and any aitachmeants) 13 confidentia. I you are nol the intended recipent, you miust mof use or dlmmﬂmﬂf e
information - f vou have received this emad in ermor, pleases immadiately notify me by "Reply” comimand and pesmanaiily delete the oniginal armd
any .
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sysiem into whech if is received and opered, i i3 the responsibily of the recipeent lo ensure fhat It is virus free and o respansibiity & sccepted by
AlG

far any loxs or damage arising in any way from (8 ise

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this emall and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: PC Tan [mallto:specky168@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, November 13, 2018 6:34 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Cc: PC Tan

Subject: Re: AIG ref: 06243890905G-003 Il accident involving SKS4410T & SKN4B&0D on 20/09/18

Dear Saliha
I have submitted the report. Pls confirm receipt. Thanks,

Regards,
Mr Tan

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@alg.com=

Sent: Tuesday, November 13, 2018 5:21 PM

To: speckyl6B@hotmail.com

Subject: AIG ref: 06243890905G-003 Il accident involving SKS4410T B SKN4860D on 20/09/18

Dear Mr. Tan,
Thank you for taking up our call earlier on.

As informed, we have received claims notification from repairer of SKN4860D against your auto policy for
the alleged accident.

We would be grateful if you could lodge the report online via our website: www.aig.com.sg and choose the
option ‘reporting only’

If you require anything further from us on this claim, please feel free to contact the undersigned at 6419 1917 or
email at saliha.syed-yusoff@aieg.com




thank you,

Saliha Syed Yusoff (Ms. Saliha)

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1917 | Fax +(85) 68357416

sallha sved-yusoff@aig com | www aig.com.sg
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility
of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility
of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The infarmation in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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From: jcehn lchthauto.com.sg [ maito: jacniyn. oh@ibhsuts.com.sg)

Sent: Tuetdoy, Sepiermibor 25, 2018 11.08 AM

Teo; Arlan, Syazairding
mmwmm:ruum:m,uxmnmwmmmmmmmmmmmwmmm:m
Arstiwes met s

Subject: RE: - PRE-REFAIR TNSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING DR INSLRED VEHICLE SKE4410T AND SKN48500 ON 052018

KK Auto Consultamis Pie Lid

From: Azlan, Svarairdim

Sent: Tue, 25 Sep 2018 025527 +0000

Tee jncelyn lohfibhimo com sg

Ce: Tan, Lily (AIG), Fong, Andy-5Y. Kour, Baljit, Chin, Lee-Ying. Abu Kassim, Noar Martesa, Md lehak, Mohd Imemn, Lim, Sheng Yang, Chan, Yoke Shi,
Mithoostngh, Aashweemeetkaur

Suhjoct: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR [NSURED VEHICLE SKS44107T AND SKN4SS0D ON 200092018

Withimt Freiiglice

Yo Reforency  SRNARS0D
Char Reforency (SKSMI0T
Doaar St Mndnar

Wi refier fo your Notice of Acoident of even dae

'l'-'tnl-ulnm-wmﬂhhhwwmmlmm“amdmmum We propose i we one of ihe
mmmﬂmhmﬂlﬁmhmwmhlmjﬂlm

Name of Surveyor Compauny Nume
ben Wony AIG A Pooific Insurnnce Pae Lid
Kusmar Uthaya Al Asia Pocifie Insurance Pie Lid
| Fong Soon Yes AlQ Asia Pacific Inturance Pie Lid
| Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Friomy Services
Jefirey Ong Lerig Kiai Prionity Services
Jimmy Lee Priority Services
BC Lom Aulomobile Inspection Services Pe Lud
Pang Kiah Keen [Frankie) Formiemm Adusiens Pie Lid
Kg You Han Formizam Adisters Pie Lid
[ Soom HanXin (Gary ) Formseom Adpisters Pie Lid
Chow Bo Miong Formieam Adjustors Pie [4d
Chua Seo Teck (Besjamin} | Formieam Admiters Pre Lid
Fulvin Ang LEK Auto Consultants s Lid
Ming Guo Crang LKK Ao Consullania Piz Lid
Marcus Chom LEK Auwn Consuliants Me Lid
Mohamad Taufikh LEK Auw Consultunts Pre Lid
Adrmn Ling LEK Auto Conultmis P Ll
Mobammed Ramgl LEK Aum Consultonts Pie Lig
Kenneth Keomg LKE, Awo Consultams Piz Lid

Pleste bt un know within twa (2] wokdng diys whather you agres 40 fhe wppamment of ay of these mosor susveyors s & mngle joini expert Yo mily selort ime o
more of fhe listed mokor serveyon, “‘nmirbﬂhmnﬂhmlnqmudmthgﬂuﬂrh-m



Thamss end regands,

Symza (mainae &ilan

ARG

Exprenn Clmima saymr 11

B0 Clasees Diperatons | A0 Shaeed Seryvacey

From: AlG 5GP, Clasms-Survey

Sant: Monday, Septamber 24, 2018 1:55 M

Tt Arlar, Syarairding
Mﬁmmmmm-Mme-MIW

From:) BHAS - lacehm Loh [masiio: jecelyn, ishiibranto.com o)
Sent: Monday, Septurnies 24, 2018 3:40 PM

Tot AIG 5GP, Clats-Survey

Cox BHAS - Moo Wen Zhang; BHAS + fgail Kar KIE; BHAS - Ngai iae K2
MMHMIMW*MIWM—MIM

To. the oificer in charge

Dani alr, medm,

| would like 3 arrange surveyor on of the shiove mentioned accident vahice
P wutiste currpiitly nest n pur wierkshop.

Appreciate swaiting for your favourable regly ssap. Plaase kindly assist
Greatly spprecine it. Thank you and have 3 hice day

Thiwnk Vo & Desat Wiguribs.
Jorelvm Lads

Ml s+ AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

Addrenr ik Liector O San Ming industrisl Exate
B01-111TI3/115/117 Singaopre 575538

(7] +65-8559 8944 fE540 [Fl +&5-6515 3344 / +65-6269 2404
Emadl: Jyceiyn igluilinaute com ig

Wirbsite: bito s bihaito cumosg

IMPORTANT KOTICE:

The information m this amnadl (end wry anachments ) s confidential, |1 you are not the Intended reciplent, you must not use or disseminate the information Il vou
hmmsdvﬂtmnullhm.p[mcummudymdﬁ i by wﬁy'mwmymmmmmmmmmt
Although tsis emadl and any attachments are believed 1o be free of any vires or other defoct th miight aflect any computer system into which it is recetved and
apened, il {s the 'Hllrrnrthumhmhﬂhﬂﬂunﬂmmﬂﬂtynwﬂhhmmlﬂmﬁmﬂﬂmlhc.wél:l
subsistiares or i wither jointly or severally, for any hoss or damage arising in any way from its use
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BH AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

BLK I SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SECTOR C #01-115

SINGAPORE 575636

Tel: 6559 8944 Fax: 6269 2404
CO.REG, NO. 2000175125K

Your Vehicle: SKN48ROD
Our Vehicle: SK54410T

Date: 24/09/2018

M’ AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre. Lid.

78 Shenton Way

#07-16 WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Singapore 079120 BY FAX: 64153727 ONLY
Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKN4860D & SKS4410T ON 20/09/2018 ALONG SO0 CHOW DRIVE.

We refer to the above matter

Kindly let us have your list of ten surveyors for our consideration within the stipulated timeline under
the NIMA protocal.

Please be informed that the said vehicle can be inspected at:

BLK 1 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SECTOR C #01-115
SINGAPORE 575636

Please note that if you fail to conduct the pre-repair inspection within the next 2 DAYS excluding any
imtervening Saturday, Sunday and’or Public Holiday, we will commence repairs thereafier without any
further notice or reference to you,

Yours Faithfully,

BH Auto Services e Lid
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* Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Crwmerr 1D Typee:

Owmer ID:

Vehicle Details

Wehiche No

ehicle 1o be Exported:
Imtended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis No-
Maimum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Oiriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period{Years):

POP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Tatal Rebate Amount:

The information contained hereln ls correct as at 24 Sep 2018

P /LU GOV S0 I VT B CTIDN R MIGLITE S UA 3y DN CEMOT B LAETEQINPU 1 UL | 1LY _IL=T Uy | |

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Singapare NRIC
09997

SKN4840D
No

24 Sep 2018

MISSAN

2005K[M)

Grey

2001
SR20DET454142
INIGBAS15AD031575
£29,500.00
18 lan 2002
18 Jan 2002
7
$41,860.00

Farfeited

-

$0.00

17 Jan 2022

E - Open Category
10

$72.697.00
$24,095.00
£24,095.00

W
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04/2027)

Able Tp Be Driven Daily, Full Intorior With Working A

Fomiad (N-Aig-JULN  Tge LUEY Nesae JOSSE. Nigaeo JOUTE, Awee, PODSE, Lised M

Lave [t pepech oRrsip, in et &bl plerts wherevsr § malch B Paund.

Missan 200SK 513 (COE tii B8, BOO 110330 jyt O4-Mpr- 1959 LM 10,000 km

kg Siode! Price Deprecistion Heg Date Erg Cap Hilenge

For ald scvertisements, vew Expired sds

Mewly Ratuilt Engine With Less Than 30,000 KM On i, Tastefully Done Up With A New Gunmetal Grey Soray, Price Includes Wieh Mew 10 Years COE

Sporty Aynilable

Caits Oy, Mo Dsalery Or Consigrment, Wisrthy Specerern For Collection. Rare Genuine Descontinusd Type x Parts And Lighes, Tum Key, Problam Free, rett]

Home | New Cars | Usad Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products | Insurance | Aride | Forum | Hesources
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
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CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Cane Wotified £t Submitted Ad) Asmignas Aci] Rpr Ad] Submitted Ins Auth’ed Status
|26 550 2018 g §$220.00 $$220.00 Pending for Survey
£t Weg s adi st | e Esvmaves | | view mpe | :' el

Reference

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

[|Created by adjuster]

Insured:

Tan Pheng Chuang, 1D: SEE20542E

Main
Claimant:

KENNETH SIAH YIEN KIAT,

Ty STHI0GISZ

Vehiclke Reg,
No.:

SKNa860D

Date of Loss:

20/09/2018 11:00 - ;59
{200 Months and 2 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Claim Type:

TP / 062438909056

Policy/Cover
Note No.:

2100409220-03 (Comprehensive)

Policy Mo.
(Claimant):

GAZIIBAS 1

Excess:

G559 B944

Fusaif@aig.com

8H Auto Services Pte Ltd (Stn Ming) Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C, #01/111/113/115/117, 575636 Sin Ming - Tel:

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7268

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel 65-6419-3000 .. [Handled by Syed-Yusoft, Saliha] Saiiha Syed-

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: £256-3561 _, [Handled by KENMETH KONG] ... [ Final Rpt due 05/10/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

view A | compose Case Man ||

« AIG_SG (22/11/2018): Re: Mo O GIA Report (SKS4410T vs SKN4B50D)
* AIG_SG (27/05/1018); No OT GIA Report ({SKS4410T vs SKN4BEOD]

No results.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=
Due Date Priority Typae  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By

MMI sur:h‘rmI I:umuu‘r.drl Cnmnhhf

Completed On Created On  Done?

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 4/12/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*"SKN4860D (D6243890905G)
[SK54410T]
T
KENNETH SIAH YIEN KIAT
Sep 20 2018 11:00AM
[Tan Pheng Chuang]
BH Auto Services Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Video 1 per age &

[Ne |Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print

1 |38/09/1810:58 | Video - Accident Load MOV

(2 [236/09/18 10:58 | Video - Accident Lond MOV

|No | Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbmall| Print

| ; Accident Statement

B ISR I0AT | promist - amg. Mo SES441ET, Claemant: TAN PHENG CHUANG @ | tosa

Photos/Images 3 per poge E &

No_ | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print|

I |28/11/1812:42 | General View D | adrc | A

2 |2811/1812:42 | General View 0| e | &

3 |28/11/18 12:42 | General View ) | weavc | A

4 |2E/10/1B 12:43 | Genersl View D | wadrc | 4

5 |28/13/18 12:42 | General View D | e | B

6 |20/11/18 12:47 | General View 0 | s | A

7 |28/11/1B 12:42 | General View 0| wwaws | A

B |28/11/18 12:42 | Odometer Reading 0 | sadwrc | A

5 |28/11/18 12:42 | Chassis Mumber D | aawc | 4

Documentation lmm_u" A

to | Relabel/Reorder |LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HGQ) Thumiymail | Prirt

1 |26/09/18 10:57 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 25.09.2018 - RECEIVED CCTV FROM TP Load POF

2 (26/0%/18 10:57  EMAIL FROM AIG DD 25.00.2018 Laad PDE

3 I6/09718 10:57 | TP GIA REPORT 0 | Losdror

4 | 26/09/18 10:57 | NOTIFICATION FROM WORKSHOP O | Lodws | B

5 22/11/1808:49 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED ﬁ Laad POE

{0 [Finatized On AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnall | Print

|1 [30/11/18 14120 | Letter of Demand from Third Party @ | losd ror
Documents Checklist

'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | print

There are no document checklists confligured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Fal
W
Show Remarks To: ﬁ Handling Insurer
Fate Ramaris ane Drivate wniess e how iF m other paTes
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 4/12/2018
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Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (ce reg Ne 1ess071eer)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusfrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignmentsi@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/AIG18017488/KPA302

Date: D4/12/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No 2100409220-03
Claimant Vehicle
Mo SKN48B0D Insured Vehicle No : SKS4410T
Date of Loss: 201082018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 082438809056
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKN4860D
Make & Modal: NISSAN 200, 2.0 SX (M) Engine No: SR20DET464162
Reg. Date: 18/01/2002 (Man. Year; 2001) Chassis No JN1GBAS15A0031575
Colour: Metallic Gold Odometer: 38134 km
Engine Capacity. 1998 cc
Markel Value™ew Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$). Market Value/New Car Price
IT F AT THE TI
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/40 R18 Rear Tyre Size 2655Z R18
Front Left Side Michelin 8 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 8 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 8 mm
The above values represant e remaining fyre treads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Parts 1,007.74 0,00 1,007.74 100.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 600.00 220,00 380.00 63.33
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 1,607.74 220.00 1,387.74 86.32
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%5) 11254 15.40 a97.14 8632
Nett Amount (S§) 1,720.28 235.40 1,484.88 86.32
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 25/08/2018
Date Inspected: 20/ 172018 Inspected Al BH Auto Services Ple Ltd (Sin Ming)
Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C,
#3157
Singapore 575636
Estimated Period of Repair. 1.0 days

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 4/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: This mport regresants our findings af the me and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has heen cared oul Io the bas! af our
knowtedge and ability but any other linbility under any ofher ciroumsiances is hereby erpressly exoiuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 4/12/2018
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Adjuster Report
REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Repair 1.368.20FL =FL
2 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIPS Not Necessary 50.00FS *.FS
FeFmnchise part, S=5pcNell L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 1.418.20 0.00
- List Item Discount on L ltems 30.00/30.00% (S5) 410.46 0.00
Total Parts (S$) 1,007.74 0.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https:/singapore.menimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 4/12/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR TO REMOVE ALL DAMAGED New 300.00 0.00
PARTS ,PANEL BEAT ,CUT AND WELD IF NECESSARY AND
ALIGN ALL PANEL AND REINSTALL ALL DAMAGED PARTS
2 PROVIDE SKILL LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY ALL New 300.00 220.00
DAMAGED PARTS AND PANEL AND TO RESPRAY WITH 2K
PAINT WITH OVEN SPRAY BOOTH FACILITIES
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 600.00 220.00
Repori was unsubmitied during this print-oul.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 4/12/2018



