Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 October 2018 2:01 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: PRS REQUEST FOR GBA2313E: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA2313E & GY4111Y

ALONG ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2 ON 19/09/2018 AT ABOUT 1410HRS

Dear Nivitha,
Kindly use our insured’s vehicle number (GY4111Y) as reference first.

Our insured has yet to report the accident.

Regards,
Justin Wong
Executive | Claims

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9115 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 115 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWww.edinsurance.com.sg

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, October 22,2018 12:32 PM

To: Justin Wong <justin.wong@egqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRS REQUEST FOR GBA2313E: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBA2313E & GY4111Y ALONG ANG MO KIO
INDUSTRIAL PARK 2 ON 19/09/2018 AT ABOUT 1410HRS

Dear Justin,

Kindly assist to provide claim number for GBA 2313E.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



