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MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coheg ke 1950001050 ST Reg Ho M2-0001676-9
6 Raffies Quay #21-00 Singapore Q48580
Tal: {65) G222 311 Fax (656222 3547

Clams & Metor Undeswriting Depe 36 Robinsan Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0BEATT
Tek (651 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 30849

wiwne, msfirsteapltal. com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Persan.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
24-09-2018 Our Ref No. D18007004MFSH
20-09-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHES06E Third Party Vehicle. SJT34564

AUTOBAY @ KAKIBUKIT 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6BLK C #01-61/01-34
JUNE

67478064/ 67465519 Fax No. 67434896

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

MA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

MNIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

HUA MENG SPRAY
PAINTING WORKSHOP

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

= = #
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 27 December 2018 5:02 PM
To: 'Claim Workflow System’; assignments
Ce: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007004MFSH/1
Attachments: CSFCI18017409Aqb. pdf

Dear Karen,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SIT 3496).

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{q08933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 4:38 FM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims @ msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007004MFSH/1

Dear Karen,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIT 3496) on 25,/058/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4313
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 2:18 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007004MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

1
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- W Comsultants
AR BE B g Lid

5] UBL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065} 62563561 FAN : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18007004MFSH Date: 27 December 2018

Our Ref: CS/FC118017409/Agb

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SJT 3496J

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 25/09/2018 at the premises of M/s HUA MENG. and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§§ 20.913.00 .

Revised Estimate Amount S8 7.500.00 (Lump Sum)
“Check™ ltems Amount : 5% - .

Market Value 1 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : S$ -

Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the o/s portion.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 4:38 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'; assignments

Cc KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007004M FSH/A
Dear Karen,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJT 3496J on 25/09/2018.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-1561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: Ba50-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 2:18 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007004MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gasignme @1kl com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September, 2018 1:00 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMDTOHCLALMS@MSFIHSTCAF‘lTAL.CDM.SG; KARENTAN @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007004MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,
Admin Team



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 10 Type: Singapore NEIC
Owener 1D 04410
o VehicleDatails . ol R e e s e T s e
Vehicle Mo SIT34%4)
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 26 5ep 2018
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Yehicle Model: A4 18T FS| MU CVT ABS DVAB 2WD 4DR
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2009
Engine No.;: CDHO59370
Chassis Mo WAUZZZBKTAADLT 678
Maximum Power Output: 118.0 kW (158 bhp)
Cpen Market Value: £35,932.00
COriginal Reglstration Date: 01 Oct 2009
First Registration Date: 01 0ct 2009
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $35,932.00
[ liiktendad PARE Rebate DAl g e e i e
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eliglbility Expiry Date: 30 %5ep 2019
PARF Rebate Amount: $19.762.00
[ et COE Re bate DA T e N e P e e )
COE Expiry Date: 30 Sep 2019
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period{Years): 10
GP Paid: $19.830.00
COE Rebate Amount: $£1,750.00
Total Rebate Amount: $21,712.00

Tha information contained herein is correct as at 246 Sep 2018

OK



Y - ‘ |:| Audi A4 1.84 TFSI MU (New 358,800 $5,860 yr &7-Mar-200% 1,758 tc 121,000 krmi Luxury
10-yr COE)

Law Milaage Clocked. Fully Serviced And Maintained By Agent With Receipt To Shiw, No Expenses Spared For Preventive Maintenance And Always
Kept In Top Cordition, Well Maintained Exterior And Interioe....

Roadink Auto Fre Lid

[ Audi A4 Avant 3.2 FSI Quattro  $34,800 $14,170 fyr 15-May-2002 ERLE- - - Sratinvwagon
S-Line

Super Rare V6 fvant. Ideal For Shart Term Drive! Unique And Charming Sratiorwagon, Top Notch Condition! A Well Designed Everyday Car With
Sparty Appearance And Fowerful Performance Engine. Perfiect For..,

Trowm 2004 Al &4, 2000 A 74, hudi A, sudipd, Rudi; B4, o4, Usad Aus

[7] Audi A% Avant 2.0 TFSI (New 372,900 $7,280 fyr 16-Jur-2009 1,954 cc 115,185 km | Staticawagon
10-yr COE)

A Sadan Power House, A Cembination OF Powes, Comfort And Functional®y, [mpeceable Condition, Wall Maintzined By Cwner, Road Tax Just
Rerewsd And Inspection Just Completed, This Wil Be Your Best Buy ...

Save up to 25% on petrol
Compare the latest petral discount credit cards on sgCarMart, Enjoy discounts as high as 25% on your petrol bills,
Fand gt mare!

[] Audi A4 2.04 TFSI Quattro 5- 530,800 §11,920 fyr 27-Jul- 2009 1,984 oo 134,000 km Lusiary
tronic

55% Loan Welcome, 2.0 Model Audi A4, High OMV OF $41,810. No Repalr Needed! Well Malnkained By Owner, Servicing Done Regularly, Always
Parked Under Shetter, Enjoy A Comlartable And Serene Ride In The ...

Euny Perforrmance Asia Poe Ltd

{eSip-20111 Taisz - BO0Y Al e, 2005 ais¥ 54, Acdi A, pudl ot Aadi, A a4, U] Aud

[7] Audi A4 1.88 TFSI MU $26,800 $10,300 fyr 06-ALg-2009 1,798 cc 145,000 km Luixuiry

Drwiner Consignment U, Viery Low Miteage Done; Minimal Losses Foe A Year, Cheapis Than Renting A Car. Guarantesd PARF Rebate Is 518,000 Naot
Included The Scrap Body Price. Car Is In Good Candition, Ab..

[ Audi A% Avant 204 TFSI $33,800 $14,700 jyr 35-Aug-2009 1,884 o 135000 km  Stationwagen

Hew 6 Manth Resd TaxMew Front Suspension With This Avant, Spacicus Bt To At Huge Load Or Any Pats To Bring Along For Outing, Viewing By
Appaintment,

A i, mudiad, Adi, B4, @4, Used dud

|: Audi A3 Avant 2,0A TFSI 5- $31,999 $13,770 fyr 26-Aug-2009 1,584 2 - Sratianwagon
Line

M Gimmicks! Price Negotiable, Low Mileage Dore, 100% Beautiful Condition, Low Depreciation, Low Interest Rake, Mast Worthy Buy, Call Now For
Wipwang,

[] Audi A4 2,04 TFSI Quattro §-  $37,800 $12,550 Jyr [9-Nov- 2009 1,884 e 130,000 km Lubury
tronic

4505 Lnan Wekome, Sparty Gray Unit. 2.0 Mooal Audi Ad. High DMV Of $47 458, No Repair Needed! Wall Maintained By Owner, Servicing Done
Regularly. Atways Parked Undar Shefter, Enjoy A Comfortabie And 5...

Eurg Perfarmance Asia Fre Lid

AL Jebing 3008 Temis 2000 Rl &4, 2000 ausdl B9, Al 84, sudi ad Audi, B 8, Lhed Ao

M [] Audi A4 1.8 TFSI MU 432,858 $13,060 fyr 18- 2009 1,798 o 167,000 kv Luury
- Logn Up Ta 100% Loan Available! Baioon Schame To Lighten Your Manthly Instaliment. Vehicle In Showroam Condition. Fuity Stock Cordition. Bast

For Shart Term Use With Low Depreciation. Accident Free L.,

[[] Audi A4 Avant 2.0A TFSI $09,600 £9,970 fyr 08-Dec-2009 1,984 cc - Stationwagan
Quattro S-tronic S-Lina [New
10-yr COE)
Enmne Overhaul Was Done And Sk Spant In Aug 2018, New Transmission Was Done And Almast Bk Spent In Jung 2017, New Fual Pump, BI% Hew
Tyras Al Receipts Are Avallable, Perfect [deal Viehicle For COE Ren..,

tel: JE-GRO-FITN Taps 200D Al e, 20000 oyl pd. i A, Guct o, Aok AL a4 Lo Aud

R LT sinrost

Avallable

Availnbke

Available

Available

Available

Available

Lot owiea

Available

=

Available

Availabla

[ PREw )

Awailable



HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896
ESTIMATE
SIOW HUI PENG TP 45 Date :05.10.2018
762 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD Vehicle no :SJT 3496 )
#12-15 8z s ; Make/Model :AUDI A4
5479246 Accident date :20.09.2018
No DESCRIPTION Qty Amount (5%)
List items
1 Front RH door [ 1 5 1980 »°
2 Fron RH door glass w8 - 1 5 187\
3 Front RH door glass outer moulding ¢ #4 1 S 2204
4 Front RH door outer handle |, 4 1 s 110
5 Front RH door outer handle key lock »47 = 1 5 280 ¥
& Front RH door inner lock 3 1 S 286 v
7 Front RH door inner board € (¢ 1 S 1650 .-
8 Front RH door inner weather strip M 1 5 154 ¢
9 Front RH door inner top rubber A8 ¢ 1 5 308 S
- 10 Front RH door power window motor e 1 S 264 ?’/J_
11 Front RH door power window regulator G-~ & 1 S 297
12 Front RH door side mirror Al /e 1 $ 12987
13 Front RH door top hinge & ¢ 0, 1 $ 110 X
14 Front RH door lower hinge 1 S 110 X
15 Front RH door stopper A8 &7 1 5 93.5.%
16 Rear RH door T Sior i“‘ 1 5 1980 ~
17 Rear RH door glass outer moulding ¢« 1 S 2204
18 Rear RH door top hinge / ﬁ.if 1 5 110 =
19 Rear RH door lower hinge * 2458 1 S 110
20 Rear RH door stopper  r{ #d . 2 $ 9354
21 Rear RH door inner board M M~ 705375 1 § 16505
22 Rear RH door weather strip N0 1 5 165
23 Rear RH door top rubber 1 S 308 °
24 Rear RH door inner lock h o 1 5 319 v
25 Rear RH fender {-'I 1 S 1914 2
26 Rear RH fender quarter glass moulding 1 9 253
27 RH rocker panel 2L, 1 s 7814
28 Rear bumper P 1 § 9354
29 Rear bumper RH holcfer 1 5 17 -~
Total 5 16213




HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883
Autobaoy @ Kaki Bukit
Tel; 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896

ESTIMATE
SIOW HUI PENG Date :05.10.2018
762 BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD Vehicle no :SJT 3496 )
#12-15 Make/Model :AUDI A4
5479246 Accident date :20.09.2018
No Description Qty Amount (55)
Special Nett ltems
» 1 Rear RH sport rim M-£ r& 1 $ 800~
2 Rear RH tyre (2 1 $ _300-75°
Total 5 1100
Labour Cost
1 Remove & reinstall door glass & 1! [ —ﬂ - $ 300 /60
2 Remove & reinstall roof lining & cushion - S 150«
3 Remove replace & repair consistent to the accident $ 1600 2vo
4 Respray painting s .aa00 [100
5 Tuff kote 5 150
Total 5 3600
Grand Total 5 20913
. {4



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Lbi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo; 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automohbile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref - CS/FCI18017408/Agbn2

36 ROBINSON ROAD

; -12-201
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Daes HEENR

NI

Code = FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 65068 Veh. Inspected SJT 34964
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18007004MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 25/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDI A4 c.C 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2008
Chassis No. WAUZZZ8KTAADITESE Colour BLACK
Odometer 130543 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GoOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50R17 DUNLOCP & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/s BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/09/2018 Inspection Date 25/09/2018
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WKSP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-61 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WTHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 6 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: G250 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R Page No..1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJT 3496J
B Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition W mmp%} “]}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT RH DOOR DISTORTED 1,980.00 1,980.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR GLASS NOT NECESSARY 187.00 -
1|FRONT RH DOOR GLASS OUTER MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 22000 -
1|FRONT RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE cut 110.00 110.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE KEY LOCK NOT NECESSARY 280.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR INNER LOCK DAMAGED 286.00 286.00
1|FRONT RH DOCR INNER BOARD CRACKED 1,650.00 1,650.00
1|FRONT RH DOCR INNER WEATHER STRIP NECESSARY 154.00 154.00
1|FRONT RH DOCR INNER TOP RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 308.00 -
1|FRONT RH DOOR POWER WINDOW MOTOR DAMAGED 26400 264.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR POWER WINDOW REGULATOR DAMAGED 297.00 297.00
1|FRONT RH DOOR SIDE MIRROR NOT NECESSARY 1,298.00 -
1|FRONT RH DOOR TOP HINGE NOT NECESSARY 110.00 2
1|FRONT RH DOOR LOWER HINGE NOT NECESSARY 110.00
1|FRONT RH DOCR STOPPER NOT NECESSARY 93.50 -
1|REAR RH DOOR DISTORTED 1,980.00 1,980.00
1|REAR RH DOOR GLASS OUTER MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
1|REAR RH DOOR TOP HINGE BENT 110.00 110.00
1|REAR RH DOOR LOWER HINGE BENT 110.00 110.00
1|REAR RH DOOR STOPPER NOT NECESSARY 93.50 .
1|REAR RH DOCR INNER BOARD NOT NECESSARY 1,650.00 -
1|REAR RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP NECESSARY 165.00 16500
1|REAR RH DOOR TOP RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 308.00 -
1|REAR RH DOOR INNER LOCK DAMAGED 319.00 319.00
1|REAR RH FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 1,914,00
LABOUR
1|REAR RH FENDER QUARTER GLASS MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 253.00 .
1|RH ROCKER PANEL TO REPAIR SEE TA1.00 =
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 935.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER RH HOLDER NOT NECESSARY 27.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017408/Agbn2




' Ve Vd LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
i - i 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- " TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 19960T198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607188-R Fage No..2 of 2
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rhthup?;}} {s%"
LESS 5% DISCOUNT - -371.25
16.213.00 7,053.75
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR RH SPORT RIM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 800.00 4
1|REAR RH TYRE (SN} cuT 300.00 250.00
1,100.00 250.00
LABOUR
REMOVE & REINSTALL DOOR FITTINGS. 300.00 160.00
REMOVE & REINSTALL ROOF LINING & CUSHION. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 ;
REMOVE,REPLACE & REPAIR CONSISTENT TO THE 1,600.00 800.00
ACCIDENT INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR RH
FENDER,RH ROCKER PANEL AND REAR BUMPER.
RESPRAY PAINTING 1,400.00 1,100.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 X
3,600.00 2,060.00
GRAND TOTAL 20,913.00 9,363.75
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 7,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18017408/Aqbn2
MARKET VALUE: $32,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $21,712.00=NETT VALUE: $10,288.00

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and bene(i of the Client named on the front page of this Repart.
irl. is aceepied to any third party who may mly o f |

Repart. In whole o in gar. d




