Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 September, 2018 8:13 PM

To: Admin nht

Cc: Chloe; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SLN398L CLAIMING AGAINST FBH7021C DOA:20.09.18 *** LKK REF:
CC4/ASM18017190/Apa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has yet to report the accident and we are currently pending verification for direct
settlement.

Please provide us the following.
e Evidence i.e. video/ scene photo.
e Estimate cost of repair
® GlAreport

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 September, 2018 11:12 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>

Subject: SLN398L CLAIMING AGAINST FBH7021C DOA:20.09.18

Hi Motor Claims Department,
Please send your surveyor list,thanks.

***Please take note this claim under Chew Motor Pte Ltd***



Please kindly take note that we have a mutual agreement on the selection of appointed surveyor from your panel
surveyor’s list. We hope that there will not be any further changes to the finalised repair cost after confirmation
with your appointed surveyor or at the stage of LOD.

Thanks & Regards

Sukyi
Chew Motor Pte Ltd

1Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-43 Block C @ Autobay, Singapore 417883
T:67479241| F: 67417216




