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PARFICNFE Rahata Faming

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.;

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
8630H

SJC5632)

No

25Sep 2018

MAZDA

BIANTE SKYACTIV-G 2.0 SP&EAT
Brown

2016

PE30886190
JIM6CC1071G0109534
111.0 kW (148 bhp)
$23,131.00

14 Sep 2016

14 Sep 2016

0

$24,384.00

Yes
13 Sep 2026
$18,288.00

13 Sep 2026

E - Open Category
10

$57,501.00
$45,822.00
$64,110.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Sep 2018

nitpsiivr.ita.gov sg/iia/vri‘action/enquireHenatedyubhcHetoreLereginputl /P UNL 1 IU MN_IL=FUa0aum | ) n
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' TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD
NO:5 UBI CLOSE, SINGAPORE 408605 (%) ELROKARS
mazrpa ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS
[1¥E:N]
INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD NAME Ms Chia Li Shi wip 28856
64 CECIL STREET ADDRESS: Apt Hik 286b Toh Guan Road EMCESS :
#04-00 & #05-00 108 BUILDING #06-36 DATE: 17-Sep-18
SINGAPORE D48711 Singapore 602286 f
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL : 90038558 Cﬂ: A4 ﬂg
FAX : L~
VEH NO : SiC5632) DATE IN : - CONTACT PERSON : less GIS5TET4
CHASSIS NO IMBCC107160109534  |MILEAGE : M 6 M TYPE OF CLAIM : THIRD PARTY CLAIM
MODEL : BIANTE DATE REG. 14-Sep-16  |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
Parts Description
ND arny REVISED PRICES
1 [FRONTBUMPER Q A 1 MC605-50-031CBB $ 1,023.10
2 |RETAINER LHS X N 1 MC273-50-0U1D 5 38.80
3 |STRIPE LHS 7 f“ 1 MC467-50-887 5 7760
4 [sTRIPERHS <7 [' 1 MC467-50-877 5 77.60
5 |CLIP, FRONT BUMPER 7 : ; 10 MC274-50-133 5 35.00
6 |FASTENER, FRONT BUMPER > 1 MGD7A-50-EAL 3 1.00
7 |SEAL RUBBER, FRONT BUMPER ~ 2 MC467-50-262 3 80.80
B |FASTENER, FRONT BUMPER 2 MD350-50-£21 5 21.00
9 [FASTENER, FRONT BUMPER 7 2 MBO41-68-865 02 5 9.20
TOTAL PARTS (15714 1,366.10
LESS 10% 136.61
TOTAL PARTS COST | [4 ¢.C 1,229.49
¥
Labour Description
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER TO REPAIR FRONT FENDER LH AND ALL AREAS AFFECTED 66
1 | MZBR-FRONTI o e 2 mm DENT. O |5 132000
2 | MZ-SPSFRTO7 |TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND FRONT FENDER. ?? 5 % 1,260.00
1 | MZ-BR-CAVITY |TO CARRY-OLIT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION N V4 X |s 25000
4 | MZ-BR-ELECTR |TO CMECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FLNCTIONING ( S‘ p |5 25000
5 | MZ-BR-REPROG |TO REFROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS. [ 3 o |s 35000
6 | MZ-BR-SUNDRI [SUNDRIES Moo .; Or NETT 5 100.00

SJC5632) Page 1 of 2
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THIS IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE FROM WISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD
THERE BE MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF
REPAIRING, YOU WILL BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING
CARRIED OUT. TAKE NOTE THAT SHOULD YOU DECIDE NOT TO FROCEED
WITH THE REPAIRS. A QUOTATION FEE OF 5400 WiLL BE APPLIED
ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOURS INVDLVED IN SOURCING FOR PARTS
PRICE AS WELL A5 LABOUR CHARGES.

t os

pednt palt plrtos.

TOTAL LABOUR s . |s 353000

Lttt $ - |s 122049

TOTAL s - § 475549

LESS EXCESS < i

TOTAL AFTER EXCESS < .

GST 7% s ] i

GRAND TOTAL s . s =
TRANS EUROKARS PTE LTD

Authorised Signature
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Nivitha (LKK Al.rln!

From: Motor Claim - |Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 September 2018 11:25 AM

To: Jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg; ‘sur@lkkauto.com": Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

Ce: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg; Zuhaidah Samsuri

Subject: RE: INDIA INS - SHC8541S / TEPL - SIC5632J / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR
SURVEY ON SEP 21 AT 4 PM.

Attachments: 0044_180919202342_001.pdf 129 | el a0l 4 118

Jthicle rot \n
Dear Sir / Mdm, pusuha‘aiﬂ

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle S.JC5632. and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Aida, -
*Kindly upload this survey reques! email to meriman.

Thank You,

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

b4 Cecil Street | #05 10B Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: jess.francis@eurokars.com.sg IrnaiIt-:}:jess,francis@eurnkars.cnm,sg}

Sent: 20 September, 2018 11:06 AM

To: Motor Claim - |l <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Ce: ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg

Subject: RE: INDIA INS - SHC8541S / TEPL - $JC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY ON SEP 21 AT 4 PM.

Hi Motor Claims Team,

We are choosing LKK for this case.
Kindly do the necessary arrangement.
Sincerely.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close

Singapore 408605

Email: ;ess_Francig@eurokars.gom.sg

HP no.: 8128 9802



From: Motor Claim - Il <moterclaim@iii.com.sg>
Sent: 20 September 2018 10:06 AM

To: jess Francis Amurao Carlos <jess.francis@eurokars.com sg>

Cc: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>
Subject: RE: INDIA INS - SHCBS41S / TEPL - SIC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY ON SEP 21 AT 4 PM.

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.
We proprose using one of the following motor SUIVEyOors:

* LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecll Street | #05 108 Building | Singapore D49711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: less.francis@eurokars.com.sg [mallto: francis@eurokars.com.

Sent: 19 September, 2018 8:18 PM
To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com. se>

Cc: mnaTd.Iag@gurﬂkars.mmsg

Subject: INDIA INS - SHC85415 / TEPL - SJC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY ON SEP 21 AT 4 PM,

Hi India Insurance,

Kindly arrange the survey to our client’s car on Sep 21, 2018 at 4 pm.
Sincerely.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claims Executive

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd
5 Ubi Close
Singapore 408605

Email: '|ess-francig@egrokars,gom.sg

HP no.: 8128 9802

From: mazda;znnn@mazda.cgm.sg clranmurnkgrs@eumhg.cum.ggr

Sent: 19 September 2018 8:24 PM



To: less Francis Amurao Carlos <jess.fra eurokars.com.sg>
Subject: Attached Image

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification,

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
[ndia International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Poh Kin SLI(KAutu}

From: Pah Kin (LKKAuta)

Sent: Thursday, 4 October 2018 5:31 PM

To: ‘jess francis@eurokars.com.sg'

Ce: Admin A; ‘ronald yap@eurokars.com.sg’

Subject: RE: INDIA INS - SHCB541S / TEPL - SJC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY
OM SEP 21 ATA PM

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: CCa/ln118017183/Gfa3
Your Ref: SJCS5632]

Dear Jess,

ROAD TRAFFIC INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. SHC 85415 AND SJC 5632) ALONG OPEN SPACE CARPARK BUKIT TIMAH
PLAZA ON 16/09/2018

We refer to the above matter,

We have reviewed the circumstances of the incident and we are of the opinion that your driver is more liable by moving
out/moving forward from parking lot. the vehicle moving out/in parking lot should exercise greater care.

In view of this, we regret to inform you that we are unable to look into your claim.
Should you have further evidence to prove otherwise, please send us a copy for our review.
Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resalving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of Hahility/damages, sither party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | emal; pohking@lkkauto.com | fiax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933]
B 74 2

ELSRER ST Save the Earthe Print only when pecessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient 1s prohibied, and may be a wiolation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol read



Poh Kin !LI{I(Auto]

From: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@ii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 3:18 PM

To: Poh Kin (LEKAuUto)

Subject: RE: INDIA INS - SHCB541S / TEPL - SJC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY

OMN SEP 271 AT 4 PM_ I ref MCT18090452/75

H| Poh Kin,
Uploaded 0ID video footage in Merimen.

Best Regards

Alda Samsuri

Motor Claims Dept

india International lnsurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04/#05 10B Bullding
Singapore 04971

f'L-[- 6347 H100 Ext 257 Fax: 6224 4174
Emall: alda@iii.corn sg

Co, Reg Number, 198705792K

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto) [mailto: pohkin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October, 2018 2:19 PM

To: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida @iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: INDIA INS - SHC8541S / TEPL - SJC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY ON SEP 21 AT 4 PM. Il ref:
MCT18090452/Z5

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC4/11118017183/Gfa3
Your Ref: TBA (Ol vehicle no, SHC 85145)

Dear Ms Aida,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS SHC 85415 AND SJC 5632) ALONG BUKIT TIMAH PLAZA
OPEN SPACE CARPARK ON 16.09.2018

Any update with Ol video footage?



Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

Sent Tuesday, 2 October 2018 2:19 PM

To; ‘aida@iii.com.sg’

Subject: RE: INDIA INS - SHC85415 / TEPL - SJC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY

ON SEP 21 AT 4 PM

Importance: High

Our Ref: CC4/11118017183/Gfa3
Your Ref: TBA (Ol vehicle no. SHC 85145}

Dear Ms Aida,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS SHC 85415 AND SJC 5632 ALONG BUKIT TIMAH PLAZA
OPEN SPACE CARPARK ON 16.09.2018

Any update with Ol video footage?

Best Hegards,
Poh Kin, Chong (Mr) | Case Handler
LEEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

PPhone: 6841-2132 | email: pohkin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

- -

SERER ST Syve the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribulion by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation af law. If you believe that you recelved this e-mall in error, please do not read
this e-mall or any attached items. Please delate the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof. and inform the sender thal
you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 September 2018 11:31 AM

To: Pah Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@|kkauto.com=

Cc: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: INDIA INS - SHC8541S / TEPL - 5JC5632) / DOA SEP 16, 2018 / REQ FOR SURVEY ON SEP 21 AT 4 PM,

Hi PK,

FYIP.

Thank you.
Hest Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin



1012015 Merimen a-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail 1s associated with

*SJC5632) (MCT18090452)
[SHCB541S)
TF

CHIA LI SHI
Sep 16 2018 1:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Trans Eurokars Pte Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (IIl_SG), sent on 04/10/2018 16:23 PM,
To LKK_HO
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - SJC5632J - Claim Handler: Zuhaldah Bte Samsuri

Approved:0.00:Yes, please proceed to reject TP claim first.

hitps:fsingapore.menman.comichumalindex cimTuseboxr=SVCmall&luseaction=dsp_Prinl&ACFID=41 O4BIRIACFTOKEN=524777115814a55d-62634 1"



10/4/2018 Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL = ]
M, on Anedin Aemarks ay |
| . 20 Sep 2018 [A] HOW
e Clm Veh Model Changed {205919) MAZDA BIANTE 2,0 SKYACTIV-G SP.EAT (A). wel
KW
20 Sep 2018 Reg No: SIC5632), Acct Date: 2016/09/16. Claim Type: TP, Insurer: India Internations [A] HOW |
2 g3 Clm Created | Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid, (HQ). Wor  MEI
E kshop: Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd [) KWAN
20 Sep 2018 [A] HOW|
1 : Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consuftants Pte Ltd (HQ): MET
19:13 KWAN
[A] HOW
4 20582018 0 Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2018/10/01 MET
19:13 KWAN
[A] HOW
5 195591 Adj Mandate set Approved:0.00,Relnsp:Ad) decides. MEI
. KWAN
[A] HOW
6 19140 Label Added (30651):Vehicie Not 1n,(30653):Direct Sattiement. ME]
i KWAN
[A) HOW
7 1950 2018 pgy Adjuster Assigned  [None] -> MARCUS CHUA ME]
KWAN
[A]
g 255202018 yigeo Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident (TP) Chong
| - Poh Kin
L))
6 23570 video Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [TP) Chong
* Poh Kin
| (1
10 féﬁg 2018 video Downloaded Dewnloaded Video - Accident {TP) z“'&':"“
Samsun
[A]
11 290028 video Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident (O1D) chong |
Pah Kin
Oct 20 - Req:0.00: : : , ot (A]
12 20208 pgg ppandate & ¢ Curkes 0.00:PODS Liability: 100% Remarks:BOLA 24, OID moving out from parking | oot
Poh Kin
' ]
13 02 0ct 2018 yidea Downloaded Downloaded Videa - Accident (010) s
Samsun
1]
02 Oct 2018 Next Rot:Final Rpt.Due Date:2018/10/01. Mandate Remarks; 01D or TP moving out of Zuhaidah
14 16:09 Adj Next Rpt Changed 0.0 007 Please re-check and confirm, Bte |
Samsun
)]
15 E:gg‘ 018 pdj Mandate Set Maintained: 01D ar TP moving out of parking Jat? Please re-check and confirm. z“‘;‘:‘:'“
Samsun
04 Oct 2018 Cur.Req:0.00:Apologies for overlook the video footage, should be TP come out from pa [A]
|0 2aine Adj Mandate Request  rking lof. re-seek mandate as below:- PODS Liability: 100% against TP? Remarks:As p  Chong
| ) er Ol video, it show DID did swerve right to parking lat infrant of TP vehicle( Poh Kin
Date From 4| »| pate 1o 4|3 »] AuditType Nome v 6]
ACTIVITY N — mll
No record
'Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History .
[ W Rov @) [ Acs Type | hix Pedm .,:,1 et Rl 2 Amuouint
= BN — T india India
21/09/2018 International Interrational Zuhaidah Bte
1923154 11:39 Motor Insurance Pie Insurance Pte SicseIn) Samsuri AN |
I | Ltd (HQ} Ltd (HQ)
India India o
n2/10/2018 International International Zuhaidah
| 1933692 ‘ 15:16 e Insuranca Pte Insurance Pte SICS63n Samsuri i
A== ! Lid (HQ) Ltd [(HQ)

hupnifﬂnﬂnm.ﬂrhm.mﬂmlnﬁnﬂu.mw:mmrmnamw_mmﬂIWFmﬂt?011'3... 172



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

«+.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

we

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Notified Est Submitted | Adj Assigned Ad) Apt Ad] Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
ey |22 5%0 2018 ::3;" 2018 S53,184.57 5$3,184.57 Panding for Survey
- _.M £an Ay Ape | Edit Estuates | | view Rpt """""wtm |

Main Claim Detalls

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
| Inured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No. 195303821R

[ Main ;

Clakmaniz CHIA LI SHI, [D: S8118630H
Vehicle Reg. | cypg . [16/09/2018 13:00 - :59

IMo.: it Oute of "_|[24 Manths and 3 Days From LTA Reg Cate (Man Yr)]

Claim Type: | TP / MCT18090452 Note No.; | MCOMO01S
Wahiclke Reg.

| Palicy Ma.
rn " SHCE541S (Claimant); | AB0442337QMY

Excess:
Repairer: Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd [) KO, 5 UB] CLOSE, SINGAPORE, 408605 Ubi - Tel:

Ineurer. |1ndia Intarnational Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by Zuhaidah Bte Samsurl - 6347 6070

E-..Wm MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: <65 8827 7888
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tei: 62563561 . [Handied by MARCUS CHUA] ... [Final Rpt due 01/10/2018]
i view Al | Compose Case il |

» [11_5G (04/10/2018); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - SIC5632) - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte ...
« [I_SG (02/10/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Malntained - SICS632) - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Creste new Task | compiete |

Due Date Priority Typa Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Complated On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 20/11/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*S5JC5632) (MCT18090452)
[SHC85415]
T

CHIA LI SHI
Sep 16 2018 1:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Upload Documents | _Uplosd #hotos | _ Compose tew Latter | Viaw [View m Browser| ]
video - [Loerpoe _TT1| &
Ho | Finalized On India International Insurance Pie Litd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 21/09/16 11:3% | Video - Accident (TP) s Lond MOV
2 |DI/10/18 15:16 | Video - Accident (O1D) Load MP4
Fhotos/Images 3 per page ~|| &
No  Relabel /Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmnall | Print
1 |09/10/18 10:53 | General View D | csdws | B
2 |09/10/1810:59 | General View ©  icaws | B
3 |09/10/18 10:59 | General View D | wedws | 4
‘4 (D9/10/1810:5% | Genersl View D sams | B
5 |09/10/18 10:5% | General View D | waws | A
6 |09/10/18 10:59 | General View 0O | war
7 |DB/10/18 10:59 | General View D! oadwc | A
B |09/10/18 10:58 | General View D | Lwdis | F
9 |0%/10/18 10:58 | General View B | wadws | A
10 |09/10/18 10:59 | General View O | tosdws | 4
11 [09/10/18 10:55 | General View 0 | waars | B
12 [08/10/18 10:55 | General View 0| e B
13 |09/10/18 10:59 mm _i Losd IPG
14 |09/10/18 11:00 | Chassis Number 0 | Losaws |
15 |09/10/18 11:00 | General View D | oedws | B
16 (09/10/18 11:00 | Genersl View O | wecws | B
Documentation 1 ~]| &
to | Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |20/09/18 19:15 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO 1T DO 20.09.2018 © | oadror
2 |20/08/18 19:15 | TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT g Load POF
3 |28/09/18 15:26 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF
Ng  |Finalized Qn Indis International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |21/00/18 09:27 | Singapore Accident Statement-IV @ [ Losa For

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST feset | Save | prim |

There are no docurnent checklists configured,

Consultants Pte Ltd )]

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 20/11/2018
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Show Remarks To: D Handhing Insurer
L mwmuh-mmnumw

hitps:/singapore.merimen.convclaims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 20/11/2018



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico regno 1ssso71sam)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

Our Flla No: CC4ANMB01T1BAGFAIO2
Date: 20/11/2018

REFERENGCE

Handling Insurer: India Intemational Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMO015

E‘:':"““‘ Vehicle ¢ ,-re32) Insured Vehicle No : SHC8541S

Date of Loss: 16/08/2018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT1B0B0452

D‘ESERlF’TlQN & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE

Reg No: $JC5632)

Make & Model: MAZDA BIANTE, 2.0 SKYACTIV-G SP.6EAT (A)  Engine No: PE30886190

Reg. Date: 14/09/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: JMBCC 107160109534

Colour. Brown Odometer; 29529 km

Engine Capacity 1996 cc

Market Value/New Car Price: N/A

Sum Insured (SS$) Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable); Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification; Ne Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fromt Tyre Size: 205/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Front Lefl Side: Dunlop 6 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop & mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop & mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop & mm
The above values represent the remaining fyre reeds degath
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff 'Pi]
Parts 1.320.49 1,204.57 124 62 9.40
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3.430.00 1.880.00 1.450.00 42.27
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 4,759.49 3,184.57 1.574.92 33.09
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 33318 22292 11024 33.09
Nett Amount (5§) 5,092.65 3,407.49 1.685.16 33.09
Global Sum Settlement (5%) 0.00

INSPECTION

Date of Assignment: 20/08/2018
Date Inspected: 24/08/2018
Estimated Period of Repair 4.0 days

Inspected At

Trans Eurokars Pte Lid
NO. 5 UBI CLOSE. SINGAPORE
Singapore 408605

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA

Manager: Chong Poh Kin

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 20/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This mpart mpresents our findings af the Gime and ploce of nspection stated herein, Such inspoction has besn camad ow i the best of our
knowiedge and ability but any ofher nbiify undaer sy other circumstances is heeby erpressly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 20/11/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 {Last Synchronised. 20 Nov 2018)

Parts: M1-MPV MAZDA BIANTE 2.0 SKYACTIV-G SP.6EAT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour; Repairer's (Prica-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SJC5632.)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

Further Info: llemshvalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairar's Amount
1 1 ‘FRONT BUMPER Cul 1,02310FL  *1,023.10FL
2 1 *RETAINER LHS Not Necessary 38.80FL *-FL
3 1 *STRIPE LHS Necassary TTB0FL *TT.EBOFL
4 1 *STRIPE RHS Necessary 77.60FL *7TT60FL
5 10 *CLIP,FRONT BUMPER Mecessary 35.00FL *35.00FL
6 1 *FASTENER FRONT BUMPER Necessary 3.D0FL *3.00FL
7T 2 *SEAL RUBBER ,FRONT BUMPER Necessary BO.BOFL *B0.BOFL
8 2 *FASTENER FRONT BUMPER Necessary 21.00FL *21.00FL
8 2 *FASTENER FFRONT BUMPER Nmm 920FL *0.20FL
0 1 *SUNDRIES Necessary 100.00FS *10.00 FS
F=Fmanchiss part S=SpcNett Le=ListitemDisc
Sub Total (S5) 1,466.10 1,337.30
- List tem Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (5%) 136.61 132.73
Total Parts (S$)  1,320.49 1,204.57

Report was unsubmitted duning this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 20/11/2018



Adjuster Repont

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous lems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER ,TO REPAIR FRONT FENDER New 1,320.00 B860.00
LH AND ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT

2 TORESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND FRONT FENDER New 1,260.00 290.00

3  TO CARRY-OUT BODY CAVITY PRESERVATION New 250.00 0.00

4 TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER New 250.00 150.00
FUNCTIONING

5 TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS New 350.00 180.00

Gross Labour Cost [S§) 3,430.00 1,980.00

Reporl was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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