Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 12:40 PM

To: '‘Dynamic Autowork'

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLEB609P and FBJ4673E on 14.09.18 ***LKK
REF:CC4/FWD18016979/eb3

Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard
further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to
look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 September 2018 11:05 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLES609P and FBJ4673E on 14.09.18 ***KK REF:CC4/FWD18016979/eb3
Dear Asher,

We refer to the above matter.

Any update status for the said case?

Please let us have your reply soon.

On Fri, Sep 21, 2018 at 2:09 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Without Prejudice

Hi Michelle,

We refer to the email below.

We are still pending for our insured report to revert the liability.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 September 2018 2:01 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SLE8609P and FBJ4673E on 14.09.18 ***LKK REF:CC4/FWD18016979/eb3

Dear Asher,

We refer to the above matter.

Any update status for the said case?



Please let us have your reply soon.

On Tue, Sep 18, 2018 at 3:32 PM Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Asher,

As spoken,please advise liability once receive your client (FBJ4673E) GIA report.

Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778

On Tue, Sep 18, 2018 at 3:29 PM Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Michelle,

We refer to the below email.



Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Dynamic Autowork <dynamicautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 5:26 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Accident involving SLE8609P and FBJ4673E on 14.09.18

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter, attached our client GIA report for your required.

Kindly review and advise the liability for the said case.



Please assist us forward this email to case handler, we looking ahead for your reply.

Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax:63416778

Thank You.

Yours Sincerely,

Michelle

HP : 9856 4815



8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax:63416778

Thank You.
Yours Sincerely,

Michelle
HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778



