Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 April 2019 8:53 AM

To: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Cc: clarali@fwd.com

Subject: RE: SLE8603P (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : FBJ4673E
Hi Lionel,

We refer to the above matter.

We were informed by TP workshop that claimant do not come back to their workshop for survey / repair up to date.

In view of the above, We will proceed to close file without bill.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 3:39 PM

To: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: clara.li@fwd.com; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLE8603P (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : FBJ4673E

Dear Lionel,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com [mailto:motorclaims.sg@fwd.com]
Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 3:28 PM

To: sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com; clara.li@fwd.com

Subject: FW: SLE8603P (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : FBJ4673E

Hi Team

Please refer to the email below and liaise with TP repairer for survey arrangement.
Attached is the notice (no estimate), TP GIA report.

Please explore direct settlement with TP repairer and create the case in Merimen.
Thank you.

Lionel

From: Dynamic Autowork [mailto:dynamicautowork@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2018 2:48 PM

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common; Belliana - SGUser; Clara Li Zirong - SGUser; Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser
Subject: SLES603P (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : FBJ4673E

Dear person in charge,

Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.
Hope we can do Direct Settle and please provide the surveyor firm or surveyor name list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey
as a single joint expert

** PLEASE ADVISE LIABILITY**

Thank You.
Yours Sincerely,

Michelle
HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 6341 6778

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of
the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the
sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose,
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copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



