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Conguifants
Pie Lid Company Registration No. 1996071988

! !f'{ At

51 UBLAVE §, 802-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 308933 TEL (D65 ) H2ERIEH] FAX @ (b5 62564315

Your ref: Please Advised

Our ref: CS/GATIR016944/K1vb Date :19/9/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SH 6989R

We thank you for your instruction on ~ 17/9/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

18/9/2018  at the premises of M/s COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Waorkshop Estimate Amount : S511,882.04
Revised Estimate Amount : 585,826,608
"Check” Items Amount : §$50.00
Market Value ;5%

LTA Reimbursement Value (58

Nett Value. . 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
nfs body.

-

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG

Autamotive Assessor / fnvestigator



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 9:10 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)
Attachments: SH 6989R PREL| REVISED.pdf

CLMOMVYCO000003468

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 19, 2018 8:53 AM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Ce: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: [External] RE: SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SH 6989R
Date of survey: 18/9/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Please provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 5:07 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com=>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

Dear Rachel,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax; B256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
1



From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 4:55 PM

To: Ng Nyuk Phin <ngnp@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Lim Kwok Eng <limke @cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; LKK Assignments

<assignments@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

Wwp
Dear Sir

QOur client has not reported accident.
We will arrange for LKK to conduct survey on a without prejudice basis.

Dear LKK
Please accept TP survey assignment. Attached document for reference. thank you

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Ng Nyuk Phin <ngnp@cdge.com.sg>

sent: Monday, September 17, 2018 4:49 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Ce: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>; Lim Kwok Eng <limke@cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng

<rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: [External] SH 6980R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

4

From: ApeosPort-1V C5570 <shs-singnalling@sbstransit.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 4:43 PM

To: Ng Nyuk Phin

Subject: SH 6989R VS GBE2561M (GAIG) DOA:14.09.2018

Dear Motor Claims,
Please see attached Repair Estimate and SAS. Kindly arrange to survey the taxi at 59 Loyang Drive.
The taxi is at the Rooftop Carpark.

Regards,

Larry Ng

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Loyang Taxi Crash Repairs

6214 8316



Number of Images: 7
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort-IV C5570
Device Location:

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprigtary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and piease be advised that using, copying distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining Lo any matie outside our business are not 1o be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its refated companies. The comments/proposals provided are for disCussion pUIposes only and are subject to approvals. Mothing herein
shall sonstitute a binding agreement between the parties Neither party shall be bound in any way o any term or condition except a5 agreed in a
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatves of both parties

ComfertDeiGra - a Graen Office certified by the Singapare Environment Council - 18 committed to presanving the environment. Ve encourage you
to print this enly if necessary

ComforiDelGro Enginesring Pte Ltd [Registration No 1595060480




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 8:53 AM
To: ‘Tan, Rachel'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE- SH 6989R WV GBE2961M (GAIG)
Attachments: SH 6989R PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Rachel,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SH 6989R
Date of survey: 18/9/2018
Number of days : 4 days

Please provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 5:07 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel’ <Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

Dear Rachel,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: G256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel. Tan@sg.gaig.com]

sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 4:55 PM

To: Ng Nyuk Phin <ngnp@cdge.com.sg>

Ce: Lim Kwok Eng <limke @cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; LKK Assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

WP

Dear Sir



Our client has not reported accident.
we will arrange for LKK to conduct survey on a without prejudice basis.

Dear LKK
Please accept TP survey assignment. Attached document for reference. thank you

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Ng Nyuk Phin <ngnp@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2018 4:49 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.Ngian@sg. gaig.com=

Cc: General Claims <GeneralClaims(@sg.gaig.com>; Lim Kwok Eng <limke @cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng
<rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: [External] SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

From: ApeosPort-IV C5570 <sbs-singnalling@sbstransit.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 4:43 PM

To: Ng Nyuk Phin

Subject: SH 6989R V5 GBE2961M (GAIG) DODA: 14.09.2018

Dear Motor Claims,
Please see attached Repair Estimate and SAS. Kindly arrange to survey the taxi at 59 Loyang Drive.
The taxi is at the Rooftop Carpark.

Regards,

Larry Ng

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Loyang Taxi Crash Repairs

6714 8316

Mumber of Images: 7
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort-IV C5570
Device Location:

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
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the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed, Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals, Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential. privileged o proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately and please be advisad that uzing. copying, distriputing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed  Statements partaining to any matter sulside our business are not to be taken as endorsed Dy ComfortDelGro Comparation
Limited or its ralated companies. The comments/proposals providad are for disCUssIon pUrposes anly and ara subject to approvals MNothing herein
shall constifute a binding agresment between the paries Meither party shall be bound in any way Lo any term or condition except as agréed in a
wrilten agreement signed by the duly authonsed representatives of both partes

-
ComforiDelGr - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - i committed to preserving the environmeant. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary

ComforiDelGro Enginesring Pte Ltd [Registration No. 198506048W]

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If wou are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in ermor, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



Catherine Ehnns (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 4:55 PM

To: Mg MNyuk Phin

Cc Lim Kwok Eng; Roger How Keen Meng; LKK Assignments
Subject: RE: SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

Attachments: img-917164327-0001.pdf

WP

Dear Sir

Our client has not reported accident.
We will arrange for LKK to conduct survey on a without prejudice basis,

Dear LKK
Please accept TP survey assignment. Attached document for reference. thank you

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Ng Nyuk Phin <ngnp@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, September 17, 2018 4:49 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>: Lim Kwok Eng <limke@cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng
<rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: [External] SH 6989R V GBE2961M (GAIG)

From: ApeosPort-1IV C5570 <shs-singnalling@shstransit.com SE>
Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 4:43 PM

To: Ng Nyuk Phin

Subject: SH 6989R VS GBE2961M (GAIG) DOA: 14.09.2018

Dear Motor Claims,

Please see attached Repair Estimate and SAS. Kindly arrange to survey the taxi at 59 Loyang Drive.
The taxi is at the Rooftop Carpark.

Regards,

Larry Ng

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Loyang Taxi Crash Repairs

6214 8316



Number of Images: 7
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort-IV C5570
Device Location:

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in

any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SB5 Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653 M]

This message and any aftachmenis may contain canfidential. privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its sttachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclasing any contents
therein is not allowed Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its retated companies. The comments/propasals provided are for discussion purposes anly and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreemant between the parties Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term ar condition except as agreed in a
written agreement signed by the duly authonsed representatives of both parties

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office cartified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the envirenment, We encourage you
o print thes only if necessary

somfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid [Registration Mo, 1885060480




The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely fior the addressee. I you are net the intended
recipiént, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail s strictly prohibited. If vou receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediztely by reply email and destroy the message and s attachments.
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE?

VEHICLE NO : SH 6989R

AL |

DATE 17/9/2018 12:47

MAKE Pod L 1. o0 AR
MODEL : HYUNDALI i40 ) S -
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Rear Bumper Serd - ] F 553.00
Rear Bumper Clip 10 pes 3 A% 5 22.00
Rear Fender (LH) e P $ 2.171.40
Rear Fender Inner Lining (LH) xrr $ 169.30
Rear Windscreen Moulding 3¢ ™ $ 28.30
Rear Door (LH) & 2.201.10
Rear Door Rubber (LH) e 5 §  280.50
Rear Door Gear/Regulator (LH) v 7 B 242,80
Front Door (LH) £ 225640
Front Door Rubber s g ) 290.50
Rocker Panel Outer Garnish (LH) }CJK 5 341.40
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (LH) ~— & $  107.10 |-
SUB TOTAL $ 8,663.80
LESS 20% $ 1.732.76
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 6.931.04
Rear Bumper Advertisement Loge e bt 50000 |Net
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat ® X $ 50.00 |Nett
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (LH/RH) »~— #* $ 100,00 | $  200.00 |Nett -
Rear Windscreen Sealamt X na h 46.00 |Nett
Rear Door Advertisement Logo (LH) ~— # b 100,00 |Nett *
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (LH) ~— v % 8OO0 [Nett -
Front Door Coloured Comfort Logo (LH)»~ o $ 75.00 |Nett -
Front Door Advertisement Logo (LH)  ~~ ' 5 100.00 |Nett
1
- \ b 701.00
\ |
Labour Charge ]l ._ II bo=
Panel Beating | - - },em‘lﬁ '
Spray Painting Charge I'\ \ 5 I’}WU’ f so
Wiring Charge I', 5 U)Hﬂﬁd 2 an
Tuff Kote I'. s 15002
Towing Charge '! \ S 50.00 | K ™
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery RlLar ; 1|3 ISW'J" o
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass 1I| L e I o 5 1 2086 < 44
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor o kﬂ z 0 f(m : 120602
Remove/Refix Fuel Tank S 1 5pT ] [ =
Transfer of Door %ﬂ;ﬁ za-?{( 120,00 | $ 240 .ba (e
Remove/Refix Undercarriage (RR) % ;’ﬂp-.ﬂﬂ" (e M-
Rear Wheel Alignment e S 12060 2
P .
TOTAL LABOUR M th{‘o 'a' $  4,250.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL S 11,882.04
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appomted by the insurance company.




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER: 70100435

ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELITD
383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717

655087355

JOB NO

REGN NO
MILEAGE

MAKE

MODEL

DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

Date: 25.00.2018
Time: 14:21:35
Page: |

305213773

SH 6989R
0000000000
HYUNDAI

1-40

12.11,2015
15.00,2018 11:10
14.09.2018

JOB / PARTS DESCRIFTION QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

4001 04-01-0103-0593-G  140VC PANEL ASSY-FRDRLH 1 2.256.40 20.00 1.805.12

0002 04-01-0103-0596-G  140VC PANEL ASSY-RRDRLH 1 220110 20,00 1.760.88

0003 28-01-0103-0003-A  (I40)FRT DOOR LOGO SONATA | 75.00 75.00

0004 28-01-0103-2013-A  140V3 APP LOGO REAR DOOR 1 80,00 80.00

0005 04-01-0103-0658-G  140VC CAP ASSY-WHEEL HUB 1 107.10 2000 R3.68
SUB-TOTAL : 3.806.6%

JOB NATURE

CHOCHY L PANEL BEATING H00.00

0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 800.00

0002 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS, 20.00

0003 20-204 REMOVE/REFIX UPHOLSTERY ASST REPAIR 50.00

Do L TRANSFER OF DOOR 10000

0003 L ADVERTISEMENT - REAR BUMPER 50,00



COMFORIDELGRO

ENGINEERING

Our Job Ref Mo . 305_2‘!_3??3_

. © Engine 5]
Lale . 25'— Sep. 20—13 gﬂ;ﬂtﬁg Igri?le En;:&rg E:‘.E;{I;J'B

Fax: G546 6156

FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax:
Attn KALVIN
\ehicle Reg No. : SH 6989R Date of Accident. 14. Sep. 2018

The survey and estimates of the repairs af the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-

1 The repair job shall bill to: Great American Ins GBE2961M
2. The finalized amount shall be:
{a)  Spare Parts after List discount . 3425668
(b)  Labour Charges $1,570.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost ~ §5,826.68

{c.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less:
Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3. Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 warking days.

4, We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you
within 7 working days

5. Thank you for your assistance. We confirm the estimates and
finalized amoun

Signature : P ik ES Signature j

Mame . MName - K‘ h

Tel . 6214 8316 Date 157 4/)¢

Fax 6546 B156

For Official Use Only
Document
Item Amount Attached anﬁrm By Remarks
(Signature)
Yes ar Mo
Rental Rale P/Day YES

Less of Income Paid

Survey Fees

LTA Search Fae
Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicabla)

Owverrun

GET= [ [

[+7]

Remarks.




'Y V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

;‘:ﬁf‘:-'-—j—; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607136-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref ©  CS/GAINB016344/K1vDN2
|RUEIN
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date : 02-10-2018
SINGAPORE 039190
Code: GAl
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBE 2961M Veh. Inspected SH 6989R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMYVCO00003468 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  RACHEL TAN Assign Date 17/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 C.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLE41UMGUOB0454 Colour BLUE
Odometer 376597 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Moedification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/5 BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/05/2018 Inspection Date 18/09/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508369
5a, Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIMN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

Sb. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SH 6989R

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198807198R G3T Reg. No 19-0807108-R

Page No:1 of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | £ mmp?;}} ﬂ{"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 553.00
LABOUR
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP MOT NECESSARY 22.00 =
1|REAR FEMDER (LH) TO REPAIR SEE 2,171.40
LABOUR
1|REAR FEMDER INNER LINING (LH} SERVICEABLE 168.30 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 28.30
1|REAR DOOR (LH) DENTED 220110 2,201 .10
1|REAR DOOR RUBBER (LH) SERVICEABLE 280.50
1|REAR DOOR GEAR/REGULATOR (LH) SERVICEABLE 242 B0
1|FRONT DOOR (LH) DENTED 2.256.40 2,256 40
1|FRONT DOOR RUBBER SERVICEABLE 28050
1|ROCKER PANEL OUTER GARNISH (LH) SERVICEABLE 341.40
1|REAR WHEEL HUP-CAP (LH) GRAZED 107.10 107.10
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1.732.76 91282
6,931.04 3,651.68
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (SM) NMECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR BEUMPER RUEBBER MAT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 =
?|REAR FEMDER ADVERTISEMEMNT LOGO (LH/RH) MECESSARY 200.00 200.00
@$100.00 (SN)
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 48.00
1|REAR DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH)(SN) MECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1 RSEAR DOOR COMFORTDELGRD & APPS STICKER (LH) |[NECESSARY 80.00 BO.OO
(SN)
1|FRONT DOOR COLOURED COMFORT LOGO (LH){(SN) NECESSARY 75.00 75.00
1|FRONT DOOR ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LHNSN) NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
701.00 605.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1.600.00 G00.00
BUMPER AND REAR FENDER (LH)
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 1,250.00 a00.00

Report Ref No. CS/GAI18016944/K1vbn2




I V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i mam B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 406933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page Mo.:2 of 2
Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By
Qty P Workshop ($)) ($)
WIRING CHARGE. NDT NECESSARY 100.00 S
TUFF KOTE 150.00 20.00
TOWING CHARGE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 :
REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY REAR. 150.00 50.00
REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS NOT NECESSARY 120.00 :
REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR NOT NECESSARY 120.00
REMOVE/REFIX FUEL TANK NOT NECESSARY 150.00 ;
TRANSFER OF DOOR 240.00 100.00
REMOVE/REFIX UNDERCARRIAGE (RR) NOT NECESSARY 200.00
REAR WHEEL ALIGNMENT NOT NECESSARY 120.00 :
4,250.00 1,570.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,882.04 5,826.68
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 5,826.68)
Report Ref No. CS/GAI18016944/K1vbn2
KALVIN ANG WEI KUN ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor | Investigator B.Eng AMSOE AMI RTEAMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




