Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 10:19 AM

To: Jia Le (LKE Auto)

Ce: claims-singapore

Subject: [WVC011953] Direct Settlement - Accident Invaolving GBE3452) (Ol QBE - TBA) and

SHDZ217B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/QBE18016919/Kdb3) on 13.09.2018

Our ref: VC011953

Hi Jia Le

We refer to this matter.

Please reject this third party claim, as our insured had successfully claim against third party.

re g_ards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims [ Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 6224 B33 | +65 6477 1225

> QBE

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <halLe(@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Thursday, 14 November 2019 5:17 PM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh{@gbe.com=

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE34521 (OI : QBE - TBA) and SHD217B (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/QBE18016919/Kdb3) on 13.09.2018

Dear Sirs/Madam,
we reter to the below email dated on 25/10/1%.
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction.

Thank you.

Best Hegards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(q08933)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 25 October 2019 12:09 PM
To: Jenny Toh



Subjeet: RL: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3452) (O1 : QBL - TBA) and SHD217B (TP :
LKK REF - CCE:’QHHSﬂlﬁ‘JIWthS} on 13.09.2018

AlG Ref; VCD11953

LKE Ref: CC3/QBE180146%19/Kdb3
Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 3452J(Ol) AND SHD 217B(TP) ON 13/09/2018

we refer to the above matter,

we are of the opinion that this is @ case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence to
substantiate either’s parties version. We propose the settlement at 50/50.

we did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he is aware that NCD (it any) would be
affected.

We seek your approval to offer to Third Party repairer, “TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD" is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 3 40,058.75 % 688694
2. Loss of Rental [5days x $103.60) $ 518.00 % 518.00 (5days x $103.60)
3, Loss of Income (5days x $50) $ 25000 $ 250.00 (Sdays x $50)
$7.65494
E50% $ 3.827.47
4. L1A/ GlA Search Fee % 7.49 % 7.49
Total | § 40.834.24 $3,834.96

**03days recommendation for repair + 15unday + 1PRS = 5days.

For your approyv lease.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408931)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh(@gbe.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 12 December 2018 9:07 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupeif@lkkauto.com=

Ce: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh(@gbe.com=
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3452) (O1 : QBE - TBA) and SHD217B (TP : LKK

REF - CC3/QBE18016919/Kub3) on 13.09.2018

Qur ref: VC011953



Dear Shu Per
Please find attached as per requested.

regards

From: Shu Pei (LKK Auto) <shupeif@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 9:17 AM
To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh(@gbe.com>; Joyce Foo <joyce.fool@gbe.com=

Subjeet: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3452] (01 : QBE - TBA) and SHD217B (TP :
KK REF - CC3/QBE18016919/Kub3) on 13.09.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir /Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phome: 6300-0055 | email: shupeied lkkagto.com | fax 67414 108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Per (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 November 2018 7:17 PM

To: Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh{@gbe.com=

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3452) (OI : QBE - TBA) and SHD217B (TP .
1.LKK REF - CC3/QBE18016919/Kub3) on 13.09.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insu red’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Peii Admin

LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: #366-0055 | email: shupeiftlkkaute.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubs Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 7:00 PM

To: 'Jenny Toh' <jenny.toh(@gbe.com=>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBE3452) (01 : QBE - TBA) and SHD217B (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/QBE18016919/Kub3) on 13.09.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir /Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 2178 at M/s Trans-cab Auto
Services Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
TP GIA report

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841
2360.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Shu Peil Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6366-0035 | email; shupeiia lkkautp com | fax: 7414108
Blk 51, Paya Ul Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email 1s confidential and may also be privileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. 1f you have received this email in error, please promptly
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inform us by reply email or telephone, You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.
------------------ IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email 1s confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any
disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in
error, please promptly inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy

any hard copies produced.



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

———.
From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 10:43 AM
To: Mg Wai Yin; jasminetan@transcab.com.sg
Subject: Your ref: SHD2178 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBE3452) AND SHD2178 ON

13/08/2018] -- AAD1809-124

without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 3452J & SHD 217B ON 13/09/201%
We refer to the above matter,

Based on our insured's report, he was travelling straight within his lane, your taxi suddenly move off and
colided onto our insured's vehicle. Furthermore, our insured had successfully claim against your insurer.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to lock inte your client’s
claim.,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



