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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: stellachia <stellachia@halifa-bobo.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 February 2019 9:48 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: hoising

Subject: FW: accident YP7216T private settlement

Attachments: Re: accident case; 11102018154048-0001.pdf; 11102018164651-0001.pdf; 

11102018170449-0001 (002).pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Hi Asher, we just spoke over the phone, this is the case that already privately settled in Oct (not nov apologies for the 

mistake) last yr. Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Stella, Chia (Miss) 

Admin Officer 

DID: (65) 6432 6809 

 
This e-mail is confidential. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 

have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately 

by return e-mail. 

 

From: stellachia  

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November, 2018 2:41 PM 

To: 'Ashersng@lkkauto.com' <Ashersng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: hoising <hoising@halifa-bobo.com> 

Subject: accident YP7216T private settlement 

 

Hi, as spoken on the phone, we have already settled privately with the other Party SJE7529B; Bahtiar Rabani. Attached is 

the quotation he sent to us for payment, our money transfer transaction + email conversation. Any more question 

regarding this case, you can look for me, thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Stella, Chia (Miss) 

Admin Executive 

DID: (65) 6432 6809 
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This e-mail is confidential. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you 

have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately 

by return e-mail. 

 


