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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 8:29 AM

To: ANG Yvonne

Cc: winnie.ho; TEQ Kitty; richard.angbs; peter.wang; SUR

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV) - SBMOOVB3 / SLX9148E / DOA : 12.09.2018

Dear Yvonne,

The market value of SLX 9148E is $98K-$102K (Estimated) as at Sept 18.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Isabelle <isabelle@I|bs-auto.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 3:51 PM

To: chowauto <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; rta <rta@rta.com.sg>; admin <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>;
cynthia.ong <cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; motorsurvey
<motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>

Cc: admin <admin@Ilbs-auto.com>; winnie.ho <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>; ANG
Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; richard.angbs <richard.angbs@axa.com.sg>; peter.wang
<peter.wang@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV) - SSMOOVB3 / SLX9148E / DOA : 12.09.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48
hours.

Thank you.

Regards,

Isabelle Tan

LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 8 Kensington Park Drive
#01-07

Singapore 557323

tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866

fax: 6281 8748

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE .

This email (and any attachment) is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential
information. Its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete
the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender by return email. Thank you
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output;
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 Sep 2018

PARFI/CNE Rehate Fnanirv

pow s 2fa 1€
Singapore NRIC Qpﬂ{nj
3625C

SLX9148E

No

14 Sep 2018
MERCEDES BENZ
E250 SEDAN (R18)
White

2013
27492030068214
WDD2120362A815070
155.0 kW (207 bhp)
$50,848.00

27 Aug 2013

27 Aug 2013

1
$58,527.00 )9 uj

Yes
26 Aug 2023
$40,968.00

26 Aug 2023

B-Car (1601cc & above)
10

$77,600.00

$38,403.00

$79,371.00
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