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51 UBL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX @ (065) 625064315

Your Ref: D18006826MFSH Date: 18 October 2018

Our Ref: CS/FCL18016825/Ard3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SMC 2967C .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 17.09.2018 at the premises of M/s MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 5.141.60
Revised Estimate Amount :S8§  4.043.90
“Check” Items Amount . 5%

Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : S8 -
Nett Value : 8% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s body.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN
Automotive Assessor



) MS. Fi rstCa pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (okes bo J950000060  GST Reg. Mo M2 00016764

& Ratfles Quay 421-00 Singapore D48580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547

Claims & Woter Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068377
Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6207 3849
e, ﬂ"l!ﬂl’i'll:.iﬂltil.[ﬂm.ig

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

Cc : Workshop

Cc: TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

14-09-2018 Qur Ref No. D18006826MFSH
13-08-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHBE2026H Third Party Vehicle. SMC2957C

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01-58/61
MEI HUI, HO
B7444422/ 81213226 Fax No. 67476720

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD FARTY SURVEY REQUEST

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE
PTE LTD

MA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA

Attention. MIL

LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letler, no signature required.




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 10:32 AM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’

Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006826MFSH/1
Dear Sir,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMC 2967C on 17/09/2018.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janniee Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6a56-2561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4n8a33)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 2:43 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Ce: LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006826MFSH/1

Dear 5ir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 14 September, 2018 2:31 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LURE NEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSM ENT - D18006826MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

\We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CW5 within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, October 18, 2018 5:47 P

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006826MFSH/1
Attachments: SMC 2967C pdf

Dear Sirf Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SMC 2967C

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, September 20, 2018 10:32 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006826MFSH/1

Dear Sir,

please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SMC 2967C on 17/09/2018.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 2:43 PM
To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>




Ce: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006826MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailm:cwgmntorclaims@msﬁrstcamtal.cnm.sg]

sent: Friday, 14 September, 2018 2:31 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; LURENEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006826MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 10 Type: Foreign Identificatiocn Mumber
Owner 10 S6F9R
R D S e e ]
Vehicle Moz SMC2967C
Viehicle to be Exported Yes
Intended Deregistration Date; 17 Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: CHEVROLET
Vehicle Madal: CRUZE 1.6L AUTO ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year; 2009
Engine Ma.: F16035397841
Chassis No.: KLLJAGTE1AKG 10689
Maximum Power Qutput; B0.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $12,601.00
Original Registration Date: 31 Mar 2010
First Registration Date: 31 Mar 2010
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid; $12,601.00
Ednteded PR E R R D e e e S i S S s
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 30 Mar 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $6,930,00
L Intended COE Rt Dt e e e S S
COE Expiry Date: 30 Mar 2020
COE Category A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years) 10
QP Paid; $20.802.00
COE Rebate Amount: $3,192.00
Total Rebate Armount: £10,122.00

The information contained hereinis correct as at 17 Sep 2018

OK
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“REER # Inchcape WIDE RANGE OF PRE-OWNED 7.
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’ Mew 5 Years Coe Renewal Toyota Wish 1.8A. = A
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10 vehicles | » Search [2F5

Search Selection Crure Any Ay 2010 Ay Any Any Available

[7] chevrolet Cruze 1.64 16,800 58,100 fyr 4-Jan-2010 1598 cc - Sedan Available
53k Down Payrnert Well Maintained 5a Do Call To For Appointment To View This Beauty.

[[] chevrolet Cruze 1.64 $15,800 $7,180 fyr 13-Jan-2010 1,596 cc 112,000 km Sedan Available
Female Crwmer, Spacicus Interior, Sparty Sedan. Wear And Tear Parts Just Replaced, Most Sultable For Shart Term Family Car. Call Nowl Lcarict v §
teewrcdiet Crume, Chevralet Crute, Chewrokel Orurs, Used Chevrale
[[] chevrolet Cruze 1.64 $16,300 £7,290 fyr 03-Fen-2010 1,598 ¢ 119,412 km Sedan Avallable
Chavrolet Crupe AL Cheapest Pricing Yet Still Negotiable, Low Mileage Done And Well Maintained By One Previous Owrer, Posular Model Praviding I
Adaguate Pawer For Your Daly Drive, Comfortabie And Spad. .. | FRERE £0
et [] chevrolet Cruze 1.64 $15,000 $6,260 fyr 08-Feb-2010 1,588 oo - Sedan Available

Fixed Price. Fiexible Loan Repayments Schemes Avallable, Low Down Payment Options A5 Low As $3500 Driveawsay| Please Cail To Arrange An
Appointment For Viewing

E Car Buying * 6 Car Selling » 'p Car Dvmership »
‘? Car Aftermarket » E? On The Move # 1 Lifestyle »

[[] chevralet Cruze 1.64 §18,600 48,940 fyr 10-Fet-2010 1,558 cc 117,519 krn Sadan Available
Sporty White, Spacious Interior, Trendy Duthook, Best 1.64 Continental Sedan For Family, Consignment Unitl Trade In Welcoeme! Loan And Insurance
Avallabla! Call For Viewing Appointment
Prem Roy Motoring

Poemed: 1750 = T Chgrler Crute, Chenrokel Crites, Cheveoles, Crice, Lined Chewioled
D Chevrolet Cruze 1.64 516,800 6,920 jyr 19-Mar-2010 1,558 ec 150,300 km Sedan Availabla

Reliable And Great Fuel Efficient 1.6L Sedan, Candy Red Wrap With Luxury Black Leather, Straight Chassis/Undamaged Structure, View And Test To
Beliewe The Supert Conditions Rather Than Words, Welcome ...

|___] Chevrolet Cruze 1.64 23,800 §9,680 fyr 28-Jun-2010 1,588 oc 178,000 km Sedan Available
Classic White Chevrolet Cruze 1,64 DB2010 2nd Owner, Full Black Leather Seat And Interior. Full Stock Condition, View To Appreciate. Running On
17" Sport Rim Wel Taken Care With Regidar Mainfenance...,
Carro

weanmm wioat [T Chevrolet Cruze 1.6A $15,800 $6,300 fyr 31-Aug-2010 1,598 oz 138,331 kmn Sedan Available

(LR~ B Up To 95% Loan Package Avallable High Appraval Fiate. Balloan Seheme To Lessen Your Monthly Tnstaliment Burden, All Vehicles Are Inspected By Our



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 # 01-61
SINGAPORE 408717
Tel ;: 6748 4422 / 6745 4422 Fax : 6T747- 6710 REG MO 200504102H

QUOTATION
MS First Capital Insurance Lid DATE  : 14.08.2018
35 Robinson Road VEHNO : SMC2987C
#16-01 City House MODEL : Chevrolet Cruze
Singapora 068877 T pree DOA - 13.09 2018
Tel : 6507 - 3848 2 YR REF : 3HB2026H

lFax; 6507 - 3848
Attn: Motor Caim Dept (Pls armange survay & check liability)

RE: ESTIMATE FOR ACGIDENT REPAIR SMC2967C (Chevrolel Cruza)

Atem Description Aty _Ami
LIST ITEMS , ,
| Front Fender - RH Tovite 1 332.00 ¢
2 FrontDoor-RH = XL ; 1 1,603 00 S
3 Front Door Weathers:ipe - RH i it 1 28100 &
A Front Door Glass Quter Moulding - RH 1 172 00 /
5 Eront Door Wing Mirror~ RH - Onzele o 1 33600
. § 3,824.00
2311 Less 10% $ (382.40)
20 JE an § 344160
Total Paris 3 3441560
LABOUR CHARGE,
1 Ta knocking & pull out side portion & renew damage pars ] 700:00 HU2
2 To putty & spray up paint works g a;w,—mf 50U
1010
4 Tocheck wiring S 50 30
4 Totransfer old door pants 1o new $ 1 M )
s 1,700.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 5,141.50

GST Will be reflected In the final bills

T_.J W Auto Consultants hence notity
¥ F ~ O
hde@ERiter of the following: +olod 4043 JO
.'_._____‘__:.--. AIEY paintmg
% tler 3k
& Third party sunay /
« No iliegal moditication(s) is alowed d 14 Do
l‘.-l- o final .Cl_ eiCral irom nEuUr "."':- pmpany
Acknowteoged by Repairer
Signature:

Datad




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6255 4315

Reg, Mo: 198607188R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref ; CS/FCI18016825/Arbn2
316.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 R R R qummumm
Code : FCIZ
. | Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHB 2026H Veh. Inspected SMC 2867C
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. D4B006RB2E6MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From LURENE Assign Date 14/0%/2018
b Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model CHEVROLET CRUZE c.C 1588
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. KL1JABYE1AKE10689 Colour BLACK
Odometer 120385 Steering IN ORDER
Erakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/50 R17 MAXXIS & rmm
L/H Front Tyre |[215/50 R17 MAXXIS & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 MAXXIS & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 MAKKIS & mim
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE QJ/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  13/09/2018 Inspection Date 17092018
Survey held at MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD A1
#01-81
SINGAPORE 408717
Sa. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REFPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ATWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CyIN ACCORDANGE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Rieg. Mo: 198607198R. GST Reg. Mo 19-06071848-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMC 2967C
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER-RH DENTED 832,00 832.00
1|FRONT DOOR-RH DENTED 1,603.00 1,603.00
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIPE-RH NOT NECESSARY 281.00
1|FRONT DOOR GLASS OUTER MOULDING-RH NOT NECESSARY 172.00 =
1|FRONT DOOR WING MIRROR-RH CRACKED 936.00 936.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -382.40 -337.10
3441860 3.033.90
LABOUR
TO KNOCKING & PULL OUT SIDE PORTION & RENEW 700.00 400.00
DAMAGE PARTS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY UP PAINT WORKS. 800.00 500.00
TO CHECK WIRING 50.00 30.00
TO TRANSFER OLD DOOR PARTS TO NEW. 150.00 80.00
1,700.00 1,010.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,141.60 4,043.90
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,200.00
(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016825/Arbn2

MARKET VALUE: $17,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $10,122.00=NETT VALUE: $68,878.00

KL

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made solely for the use and benafis of the Client namad on the front page of this Repod,

W liabillty of responsibility whatsosver, in contact of tort. is sccepted to any third Darty #iie may reo) on the Repor wholly orin part. Any

Riepeart, [0 whote or in par, doas §o at his of fer cen sk




