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#

Catherine Chonﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: gary.ng@crawford.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 14 September, 2018 10:57 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: Re: Our Principal : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd - Window dislodged and hit onto vehicle
SLP1044R on 07/09/2018

Dear Catherine

We refer to our discussion and confirm that we are the Loss Adjusters appointed by AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to look
into the above matter on a 'without prejudice’ basis.

This incident reportedly involved a window dislodged and hit a car SLP 1044R causing damage to its windscreen and
roof,

The car repairs estimated at $510,000.00,
On behalf of AXA Insurance Ple Ltd, kindly assist to arrange your motor surveyor to survey this car SLP 1044R.

Please contact Mr Jack Ng at 82886309 (of Kah Motors - Body Repair and Paint Centre), 255 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159937 to arrange the survey,

Please let us have your motor surveyor report with the invoice addressed to the following: -

AXA Insurance Ple Lid

cfo Crawford & Company International Pte Lid
8 Shenton Way

#03-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Kindly acknowledge this assignment,

Please contact us if you have any further queries.

Regards

Gary Ng « 15, MLSE, A JEIF i5nr Assoc), CIP = Manager = Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = & Shentan Way, #03-01 AXA Tower, 06BE11, Singapore
Direct. + L4E = Mo e, 1408 = Office;+65 6632 8600 = Fax: 465 6632 8040 = Email;
gary.ng@crawford.com.sg = www.crawfordandcompany.com
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Date 1410872018 10:57 AM

Subjact Qur Principal | AXA Insurance Pte Lid - Window dislodged and hit onto vehicle SLP1044R on 07/08/2018




Dear Catherine

We refer to our discussion and confirm that we are the Loss Adjusters appointed by AXA Insurance Pte Lid to look
into the above matter on a 'without prejudice’ basis.

This incident reportedly involved a window dislodged and hit a car SLP 1044R causing damage to its windscreen and
roof.

The car repairs estimated at $$10,000.00.

On behalf of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd, kindly assist to arrange your motor surveyor to survey this car SLP 1044R.

Flease contact Mr Jack Ng at 82886309 (of Kah Motors - Body Repair and Paint Centre), 255 Alexandra Road
Singapore 155937 to arrange the survey.

Please let us have your motor surveyor report with the invoice addressed to the following: -

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

clo Crawford & Company International Pte Lid
8 Shenton Way

#03-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Please contact us if you have any further gueries.

Regards

Gary Ng = 15), M.Sc, NEZIF (Snr Assoc), CIP « Manager » Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = & Shenton Way, #033-01 AXA Tower, 068811, Singapore
Direct: +6 13- = Mo #05 BE0S 9498 « Office; +65 6632 2600 » Fax: +65 6632 8040 « Email:
gary.ng@crawford.com.sg = 1o www . crawfordandcompany.com

s __/’rl:!.lWI-'_- DL & COMPANTY

Please think of the environment before printing out this message.

This message and any files transmitted with it may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged information
and is intended sclely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. No confidentiality or privilege is
waived or lost by any mistransmission. If you have received this message in error, please immediately delete it and all
copies of it from your system, destroy any hard copies of it and notify the sender. You must not review or in any way
use or publish the content to any party. Crawford reserves the right to monitor communications through its network.

Flcase think of the environment before printing out this message.

This message and any files transmitted with it may contain confidential, proprietary or legally privileged infarmation
and is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. No confidentiality or privilege is
waived or lost by any mistransmission. If you have received this message in error, please immediately delete it and all
copcs of it from your system, destroy any hard copies of it and notify the sender. You must not review or in any way
usc or publish the content to any party. Crawford reserves the right to monitor communications through its network.



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

#

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuta)

Sent: Thursday, September 27, 2018 9:13 AM

Tao: gary.ng@crawford.com.sg

Subject: RE: Our Principal : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd - Window dislodged and hit onto vehicle
SLP1044R on 07/09/2018

Attachments: SLP 1044R.pdf

Dear Gary,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SLP 1044R.

Kindly let us have your reference number.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: gary.ng@crawford.com.sg [mailto:gary.ng@crawford.com.sg]

Sent; Friday, September 14, 2018 2:04 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Principal : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd - Window dislodged and hit onto vehicle SLP1044R on 07/09/2018

Dear Catherine
Thank you for your assistance.

We look forward to hear fram you further in due course.

Regards

Gary Ng » B.5c{Hons), M.5c, ACLA, ANZIEF (3nr Assoc), CIP = Manager + Singapore

Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd « & Shenton Way, #03-01 AXA Tower, 0BBA11, Singapore

Direct: +65 6632 8648 = Mobile: +65 8809 9498 « Office: +65 6632 8600 « Fax: +65 6632 8040 = Email.
ary.n rawford.com.sg = Web Site: www.crawfordandcompany.com




Froin *Catherine Chong \(LKK Autol)" <admin-d@lkkauto com>

To ary.naEcrawford com sg>

Cc ‘assignments’ <assignmentsiikkauto com=, "SUR' lkkauto. com>

Dale 140972078 11:38 AM

Subject RE: Qur Principal : AXA Insurance Pte Lid - Window dislodged and hit anta vehicle SLP1044R on 07/09/2018

Dear Gary,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be infarmed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignmenta@kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: gary.ng@crawford.com.sg [mailto:gary.ng@crawford.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 14 September, 2018 10:57 AM

To: assighments@lkkauto.com
Subject: Re: Our Principal : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd - Window dislodged and hit onto vehicle SLP1044R on 07/09/2018

Dear Catherine

We refer to our discussion and confirm that we are the Loss Adjusters appointed by AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to look into
the above matter on a 'without prejudice’ basis.

This incident reportedly involved a window dislodged and hit a car SLP 1044R causing damage to its windscreen and
roof.

The car repairs estimated at 5510,000.00.
On behalf of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd, kindly assist to arrange your motor surveyor to survey this car SLP 1044R.

Flease contact Mr Jack Ng at 82886309 (of Kah Motars - Body Repair and Paint Centre), 255 Alexandra Road Singapore
158837 to arrange the survey.

Flease let us have your motor surveyor report with the invoice addressed to the following:; -
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

clo Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd

8 Shentan Way

#03-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Kindly acknowledge this assignment.

Please contact us if you have any further gueries,

Regards

Gary Ng * B.5c{Hons), M.5c, ACLA, ANZIIF (Snr Assac), CIP =« Manager * Singapore
Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = & Shenton Way, #03-01 AXA Tower, 068811, Singapore
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Janice Lee {LI(KAutu!

From: gary.ng@crawford.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, September 27, 2018 9:35 AM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Qur Principal : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd - Window dislodged and hit onto vehicle

SLP1044R on 07/09/2018 | Crawford Ref : 1089923/G/GN

Dear Janice
Thank you for your email of 27.9.18.
Kindly note our claim reference no. as above.

We have checked and confirm that we do not have the GIA report as the third party had asked Kah Motors to make the
claim against us. Could you assist to ask Jack of Kah Motors to see if he can pass you a copy.

Meantime, for your information, our investigations on the incident on a ‘without prejudice’ basis are as follows:-
Our Principal's Insured, Bounty Design Pte Ltd is carrying out interior renovation works to an apartment at No. 1 Pandan
Valley #06-104, Singapore 587625,

At about 9.30 am on Friday, 7 September 2018, Bounty Design's worker was pushing open the bathroom window to
ventilate the apartment, when the window suddenly broke at its hinge and fell from #06-104. The window landed on the
car SLP 1044R.

Ve await your report on the matter.

Regards
Gary Ng » B.5c({Hons), M.5c, ACLA, ANZIIF (5nr Assoc), CIF « Manager * Singapore
Crawford & Company International Pte Ltd = & Shenton Way, #0301 AXA Tower, 068811, Singapore

Direct: +65 6632 2648 « Mohile: +65 8809 2498 « Office: +65 6632 8600 » Fax: +65 6632 8040 = Email

gary.ng@crawford.com.sg » Web Site: www.crawfordandcompany.com

From "Janice Lee (LKKAutlo)” <Janicelee@lkkauto.com=

To “gary.ng@crawiord.com.sg” <gary.ng@crawford.com.sg>

Date 270972018 0913 AM

Subject RE: Gur Principal : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd - Window dislodged and hit ento vehicle SLP1044R on 07/08/2018

Dear Gary,

Enclosed preliminary revised for SLP 1044R.



FHER 18116503 [ Kah Maler Ca 584 Brd - Ubi B
ENTRY DATE K TIME: ORO2018 15:09
SUBMITTED BY: Lai Swas Ham

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Maase report carreclly the delails of the accident to speed up he claims process,

2. This Farm mus! be complated by 1he Policyholder andfor tha Authorised Driver.

3. Infarmpticn grovided must be as tnahful and acourete as pessible. Any willul misgseprasentation ar withalding of matarial facts may allow insurance companies 16

repudiate policy ability

4, The issue and acceplance of this Form by insurance campanies s not an admission of policy Rabdity on the part of the insurance companies,
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation,

8, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of tha GiA Records Management Centre astablished by tha General Insurance Assocatan of Singapare (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for & fee, s made svailable upon applicalion by interesied parties

7. By the lodgament of 1 report 1o the indurans, you heraby consent be the archeving of this rapor al the cendre and to coples af the repart being made available

aforasain

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

0B/09/2018 16:09

O7/08/2048 09:20

1 PANDAN VALLY (S5)587625 CARPARK
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Yehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Cwner
NRIC Mo

Emagil Address

Mabile Phone No

Allernative Phona Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please siate action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleat Policy

Falicy Mumber

Cover Note Number

Driver

MNamea of Drivar

NRIC No

Date OF Birtn

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experiance

Gandar

hobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number

EMalil Address

SLP1044R

JOGJAMAN JAP

S85T9008.
JOGJAMAN@SPECTRONIK.COM
(LOCAL) +65-98158945
OFFICE-98158945

HONDA
ODYSSEY 2.4

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AVIVA LTD
COMPREHENSIVE
MO

JOGJAMAN JAP
SA570008)

16/06/1985

INDOOR

22/08/2009

9 YEARS AND 0 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-88158945

OFFICE-SB158845
JOGJAMANESPECTROMNIK.COM

Page 1of 11




Address
Fostcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this acetden!?
Mumber of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

I have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering sccident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reporied 1o the polica?

If Yes, Flease state which Paolice Station

Was natice of Intended Prosecution given?

If ¥as against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO ATTACHMENT

Attachment|s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

1 PANDAN VALLY #08-103
507625

NG

OWNER

HIT BY FALLEN TREE { OTHER OBJECTS
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO
WO
NO
YES

0

NO

NO

NO
WO
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= Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Crhwner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle MNo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:

Cpen Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARE Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QF Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Sep 2018

Singapore NRIC
2008)

5LP1044R

No

27 Sep 2018

HOMDA

ODYSSEY 2.4 EX-5CVT
Purple

2016

K24W72013815
JHMRC18B0GC209261
129.0kW {172 bhp)
$27,653.00

25 May 2017

25 May 2017

0

$30,715.00

Yes
24 May 2027
$23,034.00

24 May 2027

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$54,406.00

$47.094.00

$70,130,00

OK



) HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Sanvice and Body Repair

Tel: +65 G841 3838

Website, www.honda.com.sg

For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 98203838

QUOTATION

GST Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref, No.: S60FC13806G

Customer s AXA INSURANCE S'PORE PTELTD Document No. + SQT18003788 Page 1
8 SHENTON WAY Date : 10. Sep 2018
#27-01 AXA TOWER Customer No, + WZADOE
SINGAPORE 068811 Svc Advisor : JACK NG
RegistrationNoe - SLP1044R Engine No + K24WT72013815
Chassis No : JHMRC1B880GC209261 Date | Time : 10. Sep 2018 7:48:54 AM
Maodel : ODYSSEY 2.4 EX-S 18¥YM Surveyor Name
Owner's Name : JOGJAMAN JAP Survey Date £
Ins Policy No. . Authorisation Date
Date of Accident 2 792018
0% GST Amount
Item Description Qty  UnitPrice Disc%  Amount Amount incld GST
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT {J/NC:;
OWHNER: JOGJAMAN JAP
OWHNER INSURER: AVIVA
ACC DATE: DB/DS/2018
SURVEYED BY:
DATE:
REF MO
TR INSURER: AXA,
TP VEH:
G2100-THA-4052F PANEL COMP.RODF 1 -'E'{flﬂﬁ?.ﬂ] 25 B22 B2 5760 880.42
93404-08016-08 BOLT-WASHEREX1E g nd ’J.ﬂ.?ﬂ 25 4.20 0.28 4.449
73111-TeA-UDM GLASS SET FRWINDSHIELD 1 LM ""J231E.EI'D 25 735.17 121.74 1860.91
T3126-SYY-000 RUBBER BFR W/SHIELD 3 w7360 25 8.10 0.57 867
TI163-TGA-013 MOLDINGL.DRIP SIDE 1 o f23-5.ﬂ1} 25 176.25 12:34 188.59
T73153-TEA-013 MOLDING R.DRIP SIDE 1 e 235.00 25 176.25 12.34 188.59
T73150-T6A-003 MOLDINGFR.WINDSHIELD 1 7 18,20 25 14.40 1.01 15.41
TT466-TLO-GOY SEALFR.NSTRUMENT 1 w4 -7 13,30 26 9.4y 0.y0 10.67
91568-TAQ-ADD CUPFR WINDSHIELD UPPER 2 -7 580 25 870 0.61 9.3
BO-IU-BKT{NEW) I BRACKET TAPE{MY- 1 ik ..26.1}0 26.00 1.82 27.82
BO-WS-SEALANT WINDSCREEN SEALANT (M) 2 #7 60.00 120.00 &40 128.40
Sumltem 310586  217.42 3,323.28
BOWAOOUIWS: | oart EL INSRALL BOLAEILM b FRONT ¢ s000 30000 21.00 321.00
Sum Ext. Service 300.00 21.00 300
BOSUN SUMNDRIES well 1 52 P1DD.DD 100.00 7.00 107.00
BOJSE BODY JOINT SEALANT ROOF AR ljb " 100.00 100.00 7.00 107.00
BMIO1D REMOVE & INSTALL ROOF LINING GARNISHES SEATS 1 562-800.00 &00.00 56.00 856,00
BGOD REMOVE & INSTALL FR. WINDSCREEM (N} 1 " _560.00 560.00 39.20 580,20



W HONDA
KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. EHD.

(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Senace and Body Repair
Tel: +65 6841 3838
For 24-hours Foadside Assistance, Call 98203838

Website: www honda.com.sg

QUOTATION

GST Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. No - SE0FC1380G

Customer : AXA INSURANCE SPORE FTELTD Document No. : SQT18003786 Page 2
8 SHENTON WAY Date : 10. Sep 2018
H#27-01 AXA TOWER Customer No. : WZADDE
SINGAPORE 0BBE11 Svc Advisor : JACK NG
Registration No : SLP1044R Engine No + K24WT2013815
Chassis No : JHMRC1880GC209261 Date | Time + 10, Sep 2018 7:48:54 AM
Maodel : ODYSSEY 2.4 EX-S 16YM Surveyor Name .
Owner's Name : JOGJAMAN JAP Survey Date
Ins Policy No. : Authorisation Date
Date of Accident  : 7/9/2018
0% GST Amount
Item Description Qty it Price  Disc % Amount Ameunt  incld ST
BODAMEIT WINDSCREEN DAM KIT. ek 1 100.00 100.00 7.00 107.00
BKROR REMOVE & RENEW ROOF PANEL. LLo 1 11%2&%.1}1] ZB00.00 196.00 2996.00
h-
e SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. Iz5 e 150006 1600 1605.00
Sum Labor 596000 417,20 6,377.20
Survey By {q»«.tH""-\ 1 %’ i 'III‘"{(/]
Date & Time 19 l qu' Ik Q jov Total Amount 936586 65562 1002148
Excess L Vi Taotal {Inclusive of GST) 10,021,
Status "
Signature ’1»-;_,-{:*} -

P

LKE Aute Consultanis hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey belore/afier spray painting
» To display damaged partis) during resunsey
= Paris prices are subject to confirmation
» Thied party survéy is on 8 “Withoul Prejudics” baais
= o ilegal modification(s) is aiowed
» Supplemantary item(s) must be resurveyed aad
s subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repainer
Signature;

Diata:

Printed on 10/3/2018 8:46:03 AM
Thig is & compuier ganarated nvoice. Mo signaiune is required,

Pad prices are subjeclead lo changs wilhoul nalice.
The above estmeied cost of repeir do not include any unforasaen damages.

GET Amaount ig calculeted from Indivdual bne(s)

—_—— S



Y HONDA
KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

{M Member of the Criental Holdings Berhad)
370 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408651, Tel! +65 G841 3883 Fax: +65 6741 5022
255 Alaxandra Road Singapore 158937, Tl +65 6471 5458 Fax: +65 6471 5480

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

GST Reg Nao.: M200050223
Company Ref, Moo SBOFC1380G

Customer: WZADOE f AXA INSURANCE Document No: SVO 18056202
Chassis No: JHMRC1880GC209261 Printed By: JACKNG
License No: SLP1044R Order Date: 24. September 2018
Mileage: 24854 Order Time: 1:43:21 PM
Engine No: K24WT720138156 Service Advisor: JACK NG
ITEM DESCRIPTION QT UNIT DISC% AMOUNT aeost Ameuntincid
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (JINO: ]
OWMNER: JOGJAMAN JAP
OWHNER INSURER: AVIVA
ACC DATE: DR/OR/2018
SURVEYED BY:
DATE:
REF NOr
TP INSURER: AXA
TP VEH:
G2100-TEA-405ZZ PANEL COMP,ROOF 1 1.097.10 25 B22.52 57.60 BBEO.42
93404-08016-08 BOLT-WASHERAX16 B 0.70 25 4,20 0.29 4.49
73111-T6A-011 GLASS SETFR.WINDSHIELD 1 218990 25 1.642.42 114.97 1,757.28
T3126-57Y-000 RUGBER BFR WISHIELD 3 3.60 25 8,10 Q.57 867
T3163-TEBA-D13 MOLDINGL.DRIP SIDE 1 23500 25 176.25 12.34 188.59
T3153-TEA-013 MOLDING R.DRIF SIDE 1 235.00 25 176.26 12.34 iB8.69
TI50-TEA-003 MOLDINGFR. WINDSHIELD 1 19.20 25 14.40 1.01 16.41
TT466-TLO-GO1 SEALFR.INSTRUMENT 1 13.30 25 59.97 0.70 1067
91568-TAD-ADD CUPFR WINDSHIELD UPPER 2 5.80 25 B.70 0.61 9.3
BO-IU-BKT(NEW) I BRACKET TAPE[N) 1 26.00 26.00 .82 2782
BO-WS-SEALANT WINDSCREEN SEALANT {N) 2 60.00 120.00 B.40 128.40
SUM PARTS: 3,009.11 210.865 3,210.76
BOSUN LT | 1 30.00 30.00 2.10 3210
SUNDRIES
BOJSE 1610 1 a0.00 2000 560 BS.B0
BODY JOINT SEALANT ROOF
BMIDMD 1757 1 560,00 S60.00 39.20 5089.20
REMOVE & INSTALL ROOF LINING
GARMISHES SEATS
SPEAKER BOARD CARPET & ETC.(N)
BGOiD 1757 1 560.00 SE0.00 3920 £00.20
RIE:IMBUE & INSTALL FR. WINDSCREEN.
BODAMKIT 06T 1 100.00 100.00 7.00 107.00
WINDSCREEN DAM KIT,
EKROR 0671 1 224000 2,240.00 156.80 2,398,860
REMOVE & RENEW ROOF PANEL,
BPOZR 1610 1 1,350.00 1,350.00 54 .50 1,444 .50
SPRAY PAINTING OM REFAIRED OR
REPLACED AREAS.(2F)
S5UM LABOUR: 4,920.00 144,40 5,264.40
BO-V-KOOL-FWS R SRS e 1 30000 30000 21.00 321,00
SUM EXT SERVICE: 30000 21.00 321.00
TOTAL SGD 822911 576.05 8.805.16
Total Payable (SGD) B.805.16

GET Ampunt i calculated lrem Indiidusl baais)



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2018 10:58 AM

To: gary.ng@crawford.com.sg; claims@insurehub.com.sg; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: FINALIZATION FOR 5LP 1044 R

Attachments: 4818_001.pdf: FW: Resurvey B4 Paint _ SLP 1044 R

Importance: High

Dear All,

We enclosed the total final repair costs for,

Vehicle No. S5LP 1044 R
[Final Repair Costs (exclude GST) 558,299.11
IRepair Period* (Days) 8 WORKING DAYS

*Note: Repair period does include Sunday and Public Holiday.

Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and Public
Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment will be
made.

In addition, | have attached photos of before paint, ‘?' items and supplementary parts (if any) for your records.

Thank you and have a great days ahead
Cheers !!|

Best Regards,

Jack, Ny

Hp.' 8288 6309

Email : Jackng@honda.com.sg

BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE

255 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937

DID : +65 6514 5481 FAX : +65 6362 5015
Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD)
Website: www.honda.com.sg

@ n Visit our

Facebook page
ﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this email



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

A —— e e R e s R

From: Jack Mg <jackng@honda.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, October 08, 2018 10:59 AM
To: Janice Lee (LKKAuUto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SLP 1044 R

Dear Janice,
Moted with thanks

Jack

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <lanicelee@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, October 08, 2018 10:51 AM

To: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SLP 1044 R

Dear Jack,

Confirm 58,229.11 @ 8 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jannice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Jack Ng [mailto:jackng@honda.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, October 03, 2018 10:58 AM

To: gary.ng@crawford.com.sg; claims@insurehub.com.sg; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINALIZATION FOR SLP 1044 R

Importance: High

Dear All,

We enclosed the total final repair costs for,

Vehicle No. SLP 1044 R

[Final Repair Costs (exclude GST) 558,299.11
[Repair Period* (Days) 8 WORKING DAYS
1




¥y LN LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al BE B 51 Ubl Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CRAWFORD & COMPANY INTERNATIONAL PL Ref . CS/CWF18016804/T1rbs2

Y esseoe e oae:ostozore | [N
Code: CWF
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PUBLIC LIABILITY Veh. Inspected SLP 1044R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 1089923/G/IGN Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From GARY NG Assign Date 14/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA ODYSSEY c.c 2356
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2017
Chassis No. JHMRC1880GC209261 Colour GREY
Odometer 024472 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/55R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55R17 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55R17 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55R17 DUNLOP B mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE ROOFTOP AND WINDSCREEN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/09/2018 ]Inspactlan Date 1710972018
Survey held at KAHMOTOR CO SDN BERHAD
NO. 255 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159937
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIF.-'IATEE} NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 8 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLP 1044R

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:1 of 1

Qty Description of Parts Condition ﬁ::i;::?:{g} Our A{:j}ustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|PAMEL COMP. ROOF (SN) BENT 822 82 822 .82
8|BOLT-WASHERSX16 (SN) MECESSARY 420 4.20
1|GLASS SET,FR WINDSHIELD (SN) CRACKED 1,739.17 1,642.42
3|RUBBER BFR W/SHIELD (SN) MECESSARY 8.10 8.10
1|MOLDINGL.DRIP SIDE (SN) NECESSARY 176.25 176.25
1|MOLDING,R.DRIP SIDE (SN) NECESSARY 176.25 176.25
1|MOLDINGFR.WINDSHIELD (SN) NECESSARY 14.40 14.40
1|SEALFR.INSTRUMENT (SN) MECESSARY 9.97 .97
2|CUPFR WINDSHIELD UPPER (SN) NECESSARY 8.70 8.70
1|1U BRACKET TAPE (SN) NECESSARY 26.00 26.00
2|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 120.00 120.00
1|SUNDRIES (SN) MECESSARY 100.00 30.00
1|BODY JOINT SEALANT ROOF (SN) MECESSARY 100.00 B0.00
1|WINDSCREEN DAM KIT (SM) MECESSARY 100.00 100.00
3,405 86 3,219.14
LABOUR
SUPPLY & INSTALL SOLAR FILM ON FRONT 300.00 300.00
WINDSCREEN.
REMOVE & INSTALL ROOF LINING GARNISHES SEATS. 800.00 560.00
REMOVE & INSTALL FR. WINDSCREEN. 560.00 560.00
REMOVE & RENEW ROOF PANEL. 2,800.00 2.240.00
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. 1,500.00 1,350.00
5,960.00 5,010.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,365.86 8,229.11
RECOMMENDED COST REPAIRS | 8,299.11

Report Ref No. CS/CWF18016804/T 1rbs2

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-AM.MATAI

Automotive Assessor

Licensed Appraiser




