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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX:- 5258 4316
fieg No: 199607198R GST Reg Mo 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FWD SINGAPORE PTE LTD Rel CC4/FWD18016802/T1eb3
sremsexmouein avcaroneasssss 2 s [[[HHIHIN
Code - FWD
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Vah. SKV 1576C Veh. Inspected SJK 6851P
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 14/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Modal c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odomater Steering
Brakes Moedification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre e
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. l General Information
Accident Date  09/09/2018 |Inspection Date 14/08/2018
Survey held at PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD
& BENOI| PLACE
SINGAPORE 628927
S5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
BjiN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




PRIME GROUP

Date: 13.09.2018

FWD Singapore Pte, Lid.

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

GST Reg. No : 201606560M
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

& Temasek Boulevard #18-01

Suntec Tower Four
Singapore 038986

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

RE: ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR TO VEHICLE SJK6951P TOYOTA ALTIS (2008)

To Supply -~
1) 1pe Right rear dooar s M -"1,198.50
2] 1pc Right rear door top hinge 5 - 79.10
3) 1pc Right rear door lower hinge S H"/TB.AD
4) 1pc Right rear door checker S £ 159.40
Sub total parts S 1,515.40
Less: 25% discount S 378.85
S 1,136.55
L/charges 5
1) Totuff kote s *7 5000
2 | Totransfer right rear door trim, handle, window glass, mechanism 5 7 40.00
parts
3 ) Toremove & replace right rear door. Knock right rear door pillar. S 22= 300.00
Align & adjust right rear door.
4 ) To putty, respray painting right rear door inlet & outer. To polish = ““2 300,00
— — Sub total L/charges S £90.00
LICK Auto hence notity Estimate Grand Total S 1,826.55
the Repairer of tha Tollowing:
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. Lransfer Fee Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Transfer Fee
Vehicle Details
Vehicle Mo :
Vehiche Type:
Vetucle Attachment 1 ;
Vehiche Scheme :
Viethicle Make :
Vehicle Model
Chassis No.:
Propellamt
Engine Na,
Engine Capacity
Maxirnum Power Qutput :
Maxitmum Laden Weight
Unladen Weight -
Year Of Manifacture ©
Original Registration Date
Litespan Explry Date
COE Category -
Chuota Premium :
COE Expiry Date -
Road Tax Expiry Date -
PARF Eligibility Expiry Diate :
Inspection Due Date :
Intended Tramsfer Date
CO2 Emivsiat -
CO Emiasicn
HC Emingion :
WO Emission
P Emnision:

Late rencwal feefs] will be impased if road tax / Lay up has expired. Please use Enguire Road Tax Payable for feels) pavable

Road tax, including Over Payment (if any), of a vehicle will follow the vehicle to the new registered owner when its ownership is being transterred

Amount Payable

Transter Fee;

Total Amount Pavable -

SIKAYS1P

R10 - Private Hire (Seit-Drivel Motor Car
Mo Attachment

HNormal

TOYOTA
COROLLAALTIS 1.4 AUTD
MROSIZEE 104120344
Petrol

IZZAB0I45Y

1598 cc

HO.0 kW | 107 bhg )

1630 kg

1195 kg

2008

30 Oct 2008

A~ Car [1600ce & below)
$13,801.00
29 Oct 2018
29 Oct 2018
29 Oct 2018
29 Oct 2019
12 Sep 2018

Amaunt Before GST
[55)

2500

You may print this page for reference.

L LT e, [ SSPS-JS (—

OK Print

G5T Amount
(5%)

Page 1 of 1

Amount After GST
153

25.00

25.00

soman T s el e o = TV ab D s VET TRICP T IO ITY—TDAEAL N ST Y A Tata sl l L



Catherine Chnnﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Joseyloh@fwd.com

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 3:31 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com; sur@Ikkauto.com; admin-a@Ikkauto.com; admin-
d@lkkauto.com

Ce: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.08.2018 INVOLVING SJKE951P & SKV1576C
FWD Ref: 1201800011361)

Attachments: img-180913114109 pdf

Importance: High

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the attached and liaise with TP repairer for PRS.

Attached is the TP GIA report.

Please create the case in Merimen. \.‘r_’Qﬁlﬂﬁ Q 1’%?‘1
. A\

Thank you. ﬂu‘{ll Wi

Kind Regards

losey Loh

Executiva, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)6727 5872

E josey.loh@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

FWD

insurance

With NeD, yom ped b heep you
SO O For Lidw Mo mus{led whuai

gii .‘..tmn-—\.

From: Pei Yee [mailto:peiyee @ primeautoclaims.com)

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 3:06 PM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wal - SGUser

Cc: aliceleong @primeautoclaims.com

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING 5JKE951P & SKV1576C
Importance: High



Hi Sir/Mdm,

Refer to-above matter. Clara is on leave and 1 have sent the email to motorclaims.sgi@fwd.com and it was
showing email failure,

Kindly assist to settle this matter.
Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1230-1330pm lunch hour.

*We select LKK Auto Consultants Pre. Lid.

*Please arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

Thank you.

Thank you & Best regards,

Pei Yee

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group
Disclaimer: This mail (Including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified reciplent(s) to whom It is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us

immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpase, or atherwise disclose
its contents to any person.

From: Pei Yee [mailto:peiyee@primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 10:23 AM

To: 'contact.sqg@fwd.com'

Cc: 'aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com’

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SIK6951P & SKV1576C
Importance: High

Hi Sir/Mdm,

Refer to above matter. Clara is on leave and | have sent the email to motorclaims.sgi@fwd.com and it was
showing email failure,

Kindly assist to settle this matter.

Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1230-1330pm lunch hour.

"We seleet LKK Auto Consultants Pre. Lud.,

*Please arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

2



Thank you,

Thank you & Best regards,

Pei Yee

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group
Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It Is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us

immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose
its contents to any person.

From: Pel Yee [mailto: palyestprimeautociaims.com)

Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 9:56 AM

To: ‘dama.li@fwd.com’

Cc: ‘aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com'

Subject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SJK6951P & SKV1576C
Importance: High

Hi

The above referred

Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis,
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1230-1330pm lunch hour,

*We select LKK Auto Consultanis Pre. Lid.

*Please arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

Thank you.

Thank you & Best regards,

Pei Yee

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mall (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It |s intended
solely for the Identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us

3



immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose
its contents to any person.

Virus-free. www avast com

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT

been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Asher Sna !LKKAutu} ——

From: Josey. loh@fwd.com

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 9:32 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SJK6951P & SKV1576C

FWD Ref: 1201800011361)

Hi Asher,
Please proceed.
Thank you.

Kind Regards

Josey Loh
Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd,
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T [65) 67275872
E josey.loh@fwd.com

W fwd.com.sg

4

insurance

Wk WD gore ot Lo beap your

S HCD For Life Mo masile: what

ol 0 ki b it mew

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October, 2018 5:15 PM

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser

Cc: Mator Claims 5G - 5G Commaon

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SJK6951P & SKV1576C FWD Ref: 1201800011361)
Hi Josey,

We refer to the above matter.

Both party reported third party open rear right side and collided with our insured vehicle.

1



We are of the opinion that BOLA 26 shall be applied and liability is not in third party favour.
in view of the above, we are intending to reject TP claim,
For your approval/ comments/ instruction.

Thank You,

Best Regords,

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LEK Auto Consultonts Ple Lid

phone: 4841-4051 | email gshersng@kkoulo.com | fox 4741-4108
Bik 51, Payo Ubl iIndustrial Pork, U Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 3:44 PM

To: josey.loh@fwd.com; assignments <assignments@ |kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
afd|kkauto.com>

Cc: motorclaims. sg@fwd.com
Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SIK6951P & SKV1576C FWD Ref: 1201800011361

Dear Josey,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@ lkkauto.com | fivx: Bas6-4413
Blk 51, Pava Uhl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{(4089:473)

From: josey.loh@fwd.com [mailto:josey.loh@fwd.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 3:31 PM

To: assignmants@ikkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com; admin-a@ikkauto.com; admin-d@Ikkauto.com

Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SJKB951P & S5KV1576C FWD Ref: 1201800011361)
Importance: High

Hi LKK team,

Please refer to the attached and liaise with TP repairer for PRS.
Attached is the TP GIA report.

Please create the case in Merimen.

Thank you.

Kind Regards
lasey Loh



Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
& Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four. Singapore 038986

T (b5) 6727 5872

E josey.loh@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

4

insurance

From: Pej Yee [mailto:peyes @ primeautoclaims.com]

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 3:06 PM
To: Josey Loh Kah Wal - 5GUser

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SJK6951P & SKV1576C
Importance: High

Hi Sir/Mdm,

Refer to above matter. Clara i1s on leave and | have sent the email to motorclaims.sg@ fwd.com and it was
showing email failure.

Kindly assist to settle this matter.
Our client’s GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1230-1330pm lunch hour.,

“We select LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd.,

*Please arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

Thank you.

Thank yvou & Best regards,

Pei Yee
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.



6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail {including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its
contents to any person.

From: Pel Yee [mailto:pelyeciiprim laims.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 10:23 AM

To: 'contact.sg@fwd.com’

Cc: 'aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com’

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SJK6951P & SKV1576C
Importance: High

Hi Sir'Mdm,

Refer to above matter. Clara is on leave and | have sent the email 10 motorclaims.sg(@ fwd.com and it was
showing email failure.

Kindly assist to settle this matter.
Our client’s GLA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1230-1330pm lunch hour.

*We seleet LKK Auto Consultants Ple. Lid.

“Please arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

Thank you.

Thank you & Best regards,

Pei Yee

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.
6 Benol Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the identified recipient(s) to whom it Is addressed. IT you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose Its
contents to any person.



From: Pel Yee [maillo; pelyee@primeautoclaims,com]

Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 9:56 AM

To: 'clara li@fwd.com’

Cc: 'aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com’

Subject: PRI REQUEST TO ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING SIK6351P & SKV1576C

Importance: High

Hi

The above referred
Our client's GIA report enclosed for your retention. Please arrange PRI on urgent basis.
Please inform surveyor to avoid 1230-1330pm lunch hour.

*We select LKK Auto Consultants Pre. Lid,

“Please arrange PRI soonest possible due to loss of income and loss of rental per day count.

Thank vou.

Thank you & Best regards,

Pei Yee

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte. Ltd.
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927
Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer: This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential Information which may be privileged. It is intended
solely for the Identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us
immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose [ts
contents to any person.

Virus-free. www avast.com

ATTENTION:
The email and any attachments transmitied with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of
the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the

sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose,
copy or store this email and any attachments,

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any

5



attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or store
this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any attachments
at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been scanned for viruses
by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



-

Asher Sna !LKI{Autn)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 October 2018 1:58 PM

To: ‘Alice Leong'

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SJIKE951P & SKV1576C  claiming
against FWD

Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client open the door
and collided with our insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor,

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client's claim.

OPENING/ CLOSING OF VEHICLE
DOOR (Anywhere)

26. Vehicle X

- Driver / passenger 100% | 0%
opening/closing the

. Door vehicle door into path of

— ) other traffic

— Driver / passenger inside /
outside the vehicle

Vehicle Y — Moving

Reason: Driver should not
obstruct / cause danger 1o
passing vehicles

Thank You.

Best Begards
Asher Sng | Cose Hance

LEK Aute Consultants Ple Lid
phone: 6841-4051 | emoil: gshesng@kkoulo.com | fax: 674]-4108



Bik 51, Paya Ul incusiial Pork. Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Alice Leong <allceleong@primeautoclaims.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 12:36 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 09.09.2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SJK6951P & S5KV1576C claiming against FWD
importance: High

Hi Asher,

The above referred.

Your appointed surveyor Mr. Taufikh had surveyed our client's vehicle on 14.09.2018

For swift & amicable settlement, please establish liabilities as we have to define hirer's accident excess within
limited period. Our client had no video footage but have | pc accident scene photo inside the GIA report.

Regards

Alice Leong
Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Lid

6 Benol Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 | F (65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group

Disclaimer

This e~mail {including all atinchment) contains confidential information which may be privileged, I is intended solely lor the identified reciplentis)
1o whiom it is addressed. 17 you are not an intend recipient, please reply to us immedintely and delete this message from your system. You may not
copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct E=rtiemant

[_:LA:III SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Cass Notified Esl Submitted Ad) Assigned Ad) Apt Ad] Submezed Ins Auth'ed Status

I
|20 5002018 T $$1,150.00  |5$1,150.00 s for Survey
- AR e ape | | St estmates | | view not | Cancel case |

Makrn Aaferance

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Craated by adjuster]
Irnsured: TAN NANCY, ID: SFE325264

M PRIME CAR RENTAL AND TAXI SERVICES PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 1996062932

Clasmant:
. | D909/ 2018 14:00 - :59
SIK6951P Date of Loss: |14 19 Months and 10 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr}]

Palicy/Caver " "
TP/ 1201800011361 | Note No.: P01 7-00006300-01

| Palicy No.
{Clabrmant )

o Extess:
| Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd - Ploneer (HQ) 5 BENG] PLACE SINGAPORE 629926, 629926 Monesr - Tel:

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ... [Handled by Josey Loh)

SKV1ST6C

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 221 6111
Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handied by MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID] ... [Final Rpt due

LEK Auto
25/09/2018]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All | Compose Case Mail |
There are no mall for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tasks | Create Mew Task | compiets |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Mandler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Mo resuits.

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 17/10/2018
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Claim Documents

*5]K6951P (1201800011361)
[SKV1576C]

PRIME CAR RENTAL AND TAXI SERVICES PTE LTD
Sep 9 2018 2:00PM
[TAN NANCY]
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd - Pioneer

Page | of 2

Upload Documents |  Upload Protos | Compose New Letter | View [Vew i Srowser <
Assessment Reports 1 per page “1| &4 |
Mo | Finalived On LMK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 17/00/18 1402 | Adjuster Immediate Advice 0O | oaanmm

|Photos/Tmages T I_v:_l_ﬁ
fio | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |o3none 1402 Odometer Reading O | oeoc | M
'3 |03/10/18 14:02 | Chassis Number 0 | adis | &4
[a |03/10/18 14:02 | General View D | toeawrc | A
4 DVIO/IE 14102 | General View 0 | waws | B
5 |03/10/18 14:02 | General View O e ]
{6 |03/10/18 14:02 | General View D | edis | A
7 |B3/10/18 14:02 General View D s | A
8 [03/10/18 1402 | General View O | cows | A
9 (031018 14:02 | Geners! View O | issaws | A
10 |03/10/18 14:02 | General View 0 | toadwes | A
11 |03/10/18 14:02 General View _ﬁ_ Load 3P | A
12 |03/10/18 14:07 | Genaral View 0| acaws | A
13 (03710718 14:02 Ganeral View ) | ades | A
14 |03/10/18 14:02 | General View ﬁ Loag 3rG | A
|15 03/10/18 14:02 | General View © | wows | A
116 |03/10/18 14:02 | General View O | sews | B
117 [03/10/18 14:02 | General View O | weors |
lig los0ae 14:00 | General View 0| v | &
19 [03/10/18 14:02 | Genersl View O | toars |
20 [p310/18 14:02 | General View 0| osds | A
21 |03/10/1814:02 | General View 0 | e | A
22 03/10/18 14:02 | Geners! View 0| waws | B
23 |03/10/18 14102 | Genersl View O waws | 2
24 |03/10/18 14:02 | General View 0| edws | A
25 103/10/18 14:02 | General View 0| caaws | A
6 0310718 14:08 | General View O | e | &
27 |03710/18 1402 | General View O v | &
28 |03/10/18 14:02 | General View O | cadic | B
Documentation 1 per page ~1 &
Mo | Relsbel/Reorder mmmwﬂ-mmm{uq; Thumbnall | Print
1 [14/09/1812:5] | EMAIL FROM FWD DD 13091018 Load POF

s 1405/ 18 12:53 TP GIA REFORT Load FOF

3 [17/09/18 19:30 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load FOF

4 [03/10/1813:58 | MANDATE TO REJECT TP CLAIM Load POF

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do...

17/10/2018
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|Assessment Reports [1 per page E A

[Ha_|Fmalized On TLKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print

& |03/10/18 13:50 | EMAIL WSP TD REJECT TP CLAIM © | Loaavor

[Me |Finalized On FWD Singapors Pte. Ltd. (HQ) Thumbnail| Print

{1 l20/09/18 11:01 | INSURED GIA © | Loaaror
Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

meset | Save | pom |

There wre no docurment checklists configured.

Gur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Shew Remarks Te: [ Handling Insurer
Mol BeTRYE e PrvELE ehiesd you wRow | te otier Zertm

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_do... 17/10/2018
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ice res ne1ossorisar
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Indusirial Park
Singapore 408533
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@likkauto.com assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/FWD1B016802/T1EB3O2
Date:; 172018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: FWD Singapore Pte. Lid Policy No: PNPV2017-00006300-01
ﬁ:‘i:"“"‘ Vehicle ¢ keas1p Insured Vehicle No : SKV1576C
Date of Loss: 08092018 MNalure of Claim: ™ Claim No: 1201800011361
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJKeas1P
Make & Model: TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS, 1.6 (A) Engine No: 3774801458
Reg Date: 30/10/2008 (Man. Year. 2008) Chassis No: MROS3IZEE106120346
Colour; Black Odomelar: 130852 km
Engine Capacity: 15088 cc
Market Valua/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/Mew Car Price
ONDITION OF VEHI ATTHE T F Y
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceable), Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabie), Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Maodification No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/85 R15 Rear Tyre Skze: 185/85 R15
Fronl Lefl Side: Falken 6 mm Rear Left Side: Falken 6 mm
Front Right Side: Falken & mm Rear Right Side Falken 6 mm
The above values reprosent ihe remaining lyre treads depth
(COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1,138.55 1,017.00 119,55 10.52
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 690.00 460.00 230.00 3333
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 1.826.55 1.477.00 348.55 19.14
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,150.00
(S$) 1,826 55 1,150.00 676.55 37.04
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 127.86 B0.50 47 .36 aros4
Nett Amount (S$) 1,954.41 1,230.50 T23.91 ar.o4
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 13/09/2018
Date Inspecied. 14/09/2018 Inspected At: Prime Auto Claims Service Ple Lid -
Pioneer (HQ)
5§ BENOI PLACE SINGAFORE 628626
Singapore 629926
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 17/10/2018
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Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID Manager: Asher Sng Rong ¥i

NOTE: This report represents aur findings af Me hme snd place of inspechion stafed barein. Such nepecton has been camed ouf fo fhe best of ow
knowladge and abdity but any athar fabiity under any other circumatances (8 homby oxpresaly sxcluoiod

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 17/10/2018
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REPAIR DETAILS

| Reference

|Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 16 Oct 2018)

|Parts:; 143 TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 (A) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapore 1.0)
| Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

{Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SJKB951P)

|

| Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prini code {above) on all estimaie pages. running page

|
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

iFurlhir Info: ltems/values nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *RIGHT REAR DOOR Bent 1,198.50 FL *1,198.50 FL
2 1 *RIGHT REAR DOOR TOP HINGE Bent 79.10FL *T9.10FL
3 1 *RIGHT REAR DOOR LOWER HINGE Bent T8 40FL "TB40FL
4 1 *RIGHT REAR DOOR CHECKER Repair 15840 FL *FL

F=Franchmsa pant. LeLstiemDisc

Sub Total (55) 1,515.40 1,356.00

- List ltem Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (5%) 37a.8s 338.00

Total Parts {S5) 1,136.55 1,017.00

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 17/10/2018
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous tems selectod.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO TUFF KOTE New 50.00 20,00

2 TO TRANSFER RIGHT REAR DOOR TRIM HANDLE WINDOW New 40.00 40.00
GLASS MECHANISM PARTS

3 TO REMOVE & REPLACE RIGHT REAR DOOR ,KNOCK RIGHT  New 300.00 200.00
REAR DOOR PILLAR .ALIGN & ADJUST RIGHT REAR DOOR

4 TO PUTTY,RESPRAY PAINTING RIGHT REAR DOOR INLET & New 300.00 200.00

OUTER .TO POLISH

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 690.00 460.00

Report was unsubmitted dunng this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 17/10/2018



