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Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Joel Goh <joel goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 2:57 PM

To: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation

Cc: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Counter; Patrick Chung Chan Kim; Denis
Teo Chin Chye; Admin A; 'assignments’

Subject: RE: SIV3482M CLAIMING AGAINST GWO9489K DOAZ4082018 CHECK LIABILITY &
ARRANGE SURVEY (DM18HO02297-1G)

Attachments: SIV3482M DOA24082018 ESTIMATE.PDF

Without Prejudice
Dear William

We will appoint LKK to survey your client’s vehicle.
Liability is unclear as our insured reported that your client vehicle hit into the rear of our insured's vehicle.

Dear LKK
A0S @ 5}'}?“
Please assist on the following PRS. 'Q'Q “& R
Best Regards, \'-P\"'mm
Joel Goh
#
nsurance
L e (G Tl
EQ Insurance Company Limited
& Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 0689110
did 6565006772 | tel 656223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
WA W B IS e.co <
W\ A Member of Citystat @
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If vou are rniot th ipient, please notify t

From: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation [mailto:braddell_operation@sparkcarcare.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 11:24 AM

To: EQI PRS

Cc: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Counter; Patrick Chung Chan Kim; Denis Teo Chin Chye
Subject: SJV3482M CLAIMING AGAINST GW9489K DOA24082018 CHECK LIABILITY & ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Sir / Madam

Please arrange to survey the car at COGE, Braddell.
And to advice on the liability of the accident.

William Wang



Best Regards
External Businéss | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
. Off: 6383 7656 (Ngo - Supervisor) / Off: 6383 8115 (William) / OfF: 6383 7362 (Andrew)

Fax: 628] 5767
www SPARKcarcare, com



Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April, 2019 11:06 AM

To: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: SIV3I4AR2M CLAIMING AGAINST GW9489K DOAZ40B2018 CHECK LIABILITY &

ARRANGE SURVEY (DM18HO02257-1G)

Dear Joel,
We refer to the above matter,
Please be informed that till date TP did not arrange for survey.

In view of the above, We will proceed to cancel file, no survey done.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 3:25 PM

To: 'Joel Goh' <joel.goh insurance.com.sg>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SIV3482M CLAIMING AGAINST GWS489K DOA24082018 CHECK LIABILITY & ARRANGE SURVEY
(DM18HO02297-JG)

Dear Joel,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]
sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 2:57 PM



To: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Operation <braddell operation@sparkcarcare.com>
Cc: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Counter <braddell cr@sparkcarcare.com>; Patrick Chung Chan Kim
+<patrickchung@cdge.com.sg>; Denis Teo Chin Chye <denisteo@sparkcarcare.com=: Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com=; 'assignments’ <assignments@lkkauto.coms
Subject: RE: 5)V3482M CLAIMING AGAINST GW9489K DOA24082018 CHECK LIABILITY & ARRANGE SURVEY

(DM18HOD2297-)G)

Without Prejudice
Dear William

We will appoint LKK to survey your client's vehicle.
Liability is unclear as our insured reported that your client vehicle hit into the rear of our insured’s vehicle.

Dear LKK
Please assist on the following PRS.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

ec]nsuronce
Mt G Trendhe

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 0433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190

Www eqinsurance.com.sg

~’. A Member of Citystate

H—

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t}

From: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Plépair Operation [MMWW]

Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 11:24 AM

To: EQI PRS
Cc: CDGE Braddell Private Cars Crash Repair Counter; Patrick Chung Chan Kim; Denis Teo Chin Chye
Subject: 51V3482M CLAIMING AGAINST GW9489K DOA24082018 CHECK LIABILITY & ARRANGE SURVEY

Dear Sir / Madam

Please arrange to survey the car at CDGE, Braddell.
And to advice on the liability of the accident.

William Wang

Best Regards

External Business | ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off: 6383 7656 (Ngo - Supervisor) / Off: 6383 115 (William) / OFF 6383 7362 ( Andrew)



Fax: 6281 5767
www.SPARK carcare.com




