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PARFICOE Rebate Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

COwner 1D:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
\ehicle Make:

Vehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
05070

SGW3453C

Yes

14 May 2018
TOYOTA

ESTIMA AERAS 2.4 A
Silver

2010

2AZF547061
ACR5070978%0
125.0 kW (167 bhp)
$38,918.00

07 Jan 2011

07 Jan 2011

0

$38,918.00

Yes
06 Jan 2021
$23,350.00

06 Jan 2021

B - Car (1601cc & above)
10

$42.801.00

$11.321.00

$34,671.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 14 May 2018
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Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 September 2018 3:15 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna'

Cec 'SUR': ASSIGN MENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)’
Subject: RE: TP survey DOA 10.5.18 Insd FBH5375U Third party SGW3453C
Attachments: SGW 3453C - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Kelvyna,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SGW 3453C.

Kindly provide us the claim reference no.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 5:30 PM

To: 'Mgian, Kelyyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: 'SUR' =<sur@lkkauto.com>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: RE: TP survey DOA 10.5.18 Insd FBH5375U Third party SGW3453C

Dear Kelvyna,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 18.09.2018.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6as6-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com]

sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 5:08 PM

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com=; Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; "Admin A’ zadmin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: TP survey DOA 10.5.18 Insd FBH5375U Third party SGW3453C

Hi team
TP survey
Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive



Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: MNgian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 September, 2018 5:08 FM

To: 'SUR'; Mivitha (LKK Auto); "Admin A'

Subject: TP survey DOA 10.5.18 Insd FBH5375U Third party SGW3453C
Attachments: FBH5375U (O0). pdf; TP - SGW3453C (M5IG).pdf

Hi team

TP survey

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267

Thanks
Kelvyna

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissermination, distnibution, or copying of this ¢-mail 15 stnctly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachmenis
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Company Registration No. 1996071980

1 UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UEBLINDUSTRIAL P'ARK, SINGAORE 408933 TEL: (065} 62362501 FAX @ (65) GIE6AME

Your Ref: TBA

Our Ref: CS/GAI18016763/Ksb

The Motor Claims Department
Greal American Insurance Company

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.

Date: 18 September 2018

SGW 3453C .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 17/09/2018 at the premises of M/s Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :5%  1,802.20
Revised Estimate Amount S8 1,752.92
“Check™ Items Amount : 5% 4928
Market Value 153
LTA Reimbursement Value : 83
Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear ofs portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor




S 18061168 | STAINSPECTION PTE LTD = 5in Ming
ENTRY OATE & TIME. 100 BTl
SUBMITTED BY: Wong Lip Yo

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Piease repor correctly the detads of the accident to speed up Lhe claims procass

2, This Form must be completed by the Policyholder andior the Authoriged Driver.

3. Information provided st be as truthful and accurale as possible. Any wiliul migrepreseniation or witholding of material facts may allow nsurance companies 1o
repudiate policy ability.

4 Thae issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance coMpaniss 13 not an admission of policy liability on the part af the insurance CoMpanies.

5. Any false reparting may be refarred to the Police for investigation.

&. This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the Gia Records Management Cenire establizhed by the General Insurance Association of Singapare {GlA) for
areniving and that copes of this regan will. far a fee, be made avalable upon application by interested parties

7. By the lodgement of iiis report io the meurers, you heraby ronsent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre and o COMEs of the report being made available
aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Repori 10/05/2018 17:41
Date Of Accident 10/05/2018 08:45
Exact Location Of Accident NOUTH-BOUND CTE BEFORE JALAN BAHAGIA EXIT

Country/State of Loss SINGAFORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
vehicle Registration Mumber SGW3453C
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner WEE JEFFREY
NRIC Mo 579105070
Email Address '-.u"-.'EIF"IMGELIC:IA@YAHDD.CDM.SG
Mabile Phone Mo (LOCAL) +65-98237052
Alternative Phone No OTHERS-98237052

Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer TOYOTA
Model ESTIMA-Z.4 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

VATE L
time of accident PRIVATE USE

Are vou claiming under your own insurance olic
g } p

for repair to your vehicle? NQ

If No. Pleaze siate action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Mame aof Insurance Company MSIG INSURANGE (SINGAPORE) PTE. L TD

Type Of Coverage COMPREHEMSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Paolicy Mumber P 29054319 DMV

Cover Mole Number

Driver

Mame of Driver SOH WEI PING (8U HUIFING)

MRIC No S80096111

Date Of Birth 10/03/1980

Ocoupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 09/04/2001

Driving Experience 17 YEARS AND 1 MONTH

Gender FEMALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-08237052

Fax Mumber

Contact Mumber

EMail Address WEIPINGELICIA@YAHOO COM.SG
Page 10f 25



Mo. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1

Mamea MA(RIDER)

Approximale Age

Injunes Sustain REFER POLICE REPORT
Injured person in which vehicle? FEH5375U

Were seat belts worn?

Was this injured conveyed to haspital by
ambulance?

YES

Address

Postcode

Page 3 of 25



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1
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SKETCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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Page 5 of 25



Accident Sketeh Plan Pg. 1

A P AR R

Trz0180510/2038
Police Station Of Origin: S
Bishan N.P.C Report Mo, TI2D180510/2038
20 Bighan Street 23 SINGAPORE 579757
Tel Mo 1800-5529999 CONTINUATION OF REPORT
Driver .. ; : : 2
Marme S0OH WEI PING ID No. SBRO0YG11!
Related Vehicle | NIL ' | Contact No.| 98237052
W:rspitaifcnn_ic NIL Class of Class: 3
Driving Date of Expiry: MIL
Licence &
Ll e Expiry Date |
Date Treatment | ML Date Discharge | NIL
[No. of Days granted Medical Leave [ NIL Degree of Injury | NIL |
Brief Details.

On 10.5.18 at about 0840hrs, | was along CTE, driving on the third lane when suddenly the car in front of
me jammed brake. | managed to hit the brake on time to avoid collision with the vehicle in front, After
which | felt an impact coming from the rear of my vehicle (SGW3453C).

It happenad so fast that | did not manage to take a look at who had collided onto the rear of my vehicle
When | got down my vehicle, the vehicle behind me was no longer there. | also noticed that the vehicle in
front of me had hit the brake as there was an ccident in front which | was not really aware of. | only knew
that there was a vehicle which had collided with a dog and a motorcyclist (FBH5375U) was injured and
conveyed to the hospital.

| wish to state that traffic police and ambulance was at scene. | do not have any camera installed inmy
vehicle. | was advised by the fraffic police to lsdge a traffic accident report and was given a case number
vide F/20180510/0064

| am lodging this report for insurance claim purposes. | am hopeful that the Traffic Police is able to
retrieve the expressway footage so that we can identify the vehicle that hit my vehicle.

Fage ¥ of 25



REPUBLIC OF SINGAPORE

IDENTITY CARD NO. SB8009611I b

Hame

S0OH WEI PING
(SU HUIPING)

% & 5
CHINESE
Dbt i g A BOOEET
10-02-1980 F
Coamry ol birth
SINGAPORE
¥OU ARE LICEMSED TO. DRIVE 'h'EH_IC_LES N THE FOLLOWING If:L;IP-SSIES] | ol

[N

wec He S 80096111

e ||

which unladien des nol exceed 2500 kilograms

Coxim of Sl

03-02-2012

Ecdrass

y Mo 111 100 GERALD DRIVE
#03-83
NP 4 28A SINGAFORE THBS582
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ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GR-18-073132
14/05/2018

Our Ref No:
Date of Request:

Lai Huat (Meng Kee) Motor Pte Ltd
180 Sin Ming Drive #04-01

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Invoice

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref Mo

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday ta Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: MA0001TT35

Online Purchase

Dear Swr'Madam,

Enquiry Date 14/05/2018

Enquiry By Jenny Lim La Foong

TP Wehicle Mo, FBH5375U

Accident Date 10/05/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87

GST Amount 0.13

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00}

Thank You,

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

Eor GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[%] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

htlps:.u';singapnra_merimen :nm.l’nlnims.l'mdsx.cfm’r‘m5ebcn-c=MTH5a9&fu59actinn=dsp_genlnvl.n&reﬁd=

180387 2&CFID=33TEBTETACFTOKEN =G T4da8cicl
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! LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTELTD

Sector A, Block 21, Sin Ming Industrial Estate #01-56/58/60 Singapore 575679, Tel: 6453 8110 Fax: 6450 6267
RCB No: 199407592C
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the Repairer of the following:
* To resurvey befora/afer spray painting
'N“WWMW
© Parts prices aew subject to confirmation
* Third party survey is on & "Without Prejudice” basis
* No illegal modification(s) is sliowed
L]
h&whmbnmnm.:wm
kLEmAREexe CAROLINER MARK IV Wi, Tie i skaa@iﬁ?&"m%&nwmtrﬂ KR
B, ER RSN SAICO Deluxe m & 4 # . Oale:
"Our services include the latest and reliable CAROLINER MARK Ic ' he support

dolly system to provide accurate re-alignment and speedy repairs. We also provide the new and advanced SAICO
Deluxe oven heater for re-spraying all motor vehicles."



' V4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
T e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607188-R
Affiliated to Fedoration Internationale Des Experts En Automoblie
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref | CS/IGAI18D16763/Ksbe2
LA
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date . 2B8-01-2019
SINGAPORE 039190
Code: GAIl
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. FBH 5375U Veh. Inspected SGW 3453C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVMO00000315 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KELVYNA Assign Date 13/08/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA ESTIMA (A) c.C 2382
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 20m
Chassis No. ACRS507097890 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 143718 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [225/55 R17 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/55 R17 GOODYEAR 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre [225/55 R17 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  10/05/2018 Inspection Date 17/08/2018
Survey held at LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #04-01/02
SIMN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ATWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No; 199607T188R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198.R F’ag:e Mot of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO., SGW 3453C
; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
t Parts Condition
Qty Description of ith Workshop (§)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER BENT 54170 541.70
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE RH SERVICEABLE 85.70 "
1(REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER RH DISTORTED 51.94 51.04
1|REAR TAILGATE ESTIMATE EMBLEM NECESSARY 48 41 48 41
1|REAR TAILGATE AERAS EMELEM NECESSARY 51549 £1.50
1|REAR TAILGATE TOYOTA LOGO EMELEM MNECESSARY T0.24 7024
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -207.40 -190.55
622 18 57292
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR REVERSING SENSOR WITH INSTALLATION (SN) DENTED 200.00 200.00
200.00 200.00
LABOUR
TO KNOCK DENTS ON REAR FENDER RH, TAILGATE 380.00 380.00
AMD RENEW OF PARTS.
TO SPRAY PAINT 600.00 B00.00
980.00 S80.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,802.18 1,752.92
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 1,752,92|

Report Ref No. CS/GAI18016763/Ksbe2

y/svs

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Report is made sobely for the use and benefst of the CHent named on the front page of this Repori.




