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SNIA | RUTDIMOINS DErvICEs M L

& SMRT T

AUTOMDTIVE Tt 65 362 MT2
Fax 85 8388 2420

SMRT Accident Taxi Repair Estimates

Section A - To be completed by Claims Advisor/Duty ONicer at Accident Reporting Centre

Reg. No. SHD 62140 Refl. No, TAX g / 18 2043
Make / Model ¢ TOYOTA PRIUS Reg. Date :  24/06/2016
Name of Driver HAN MIN KWANG
DatedTime of Accident @ 11/09/2018 12:15 The damuges on twe Taxl are as
indicated in the fallowing diagram
Surveyer is Required 7 YES / NO
H¥es, VICOM / LKK / LHTeo { AIS (Piease circle one] Fromt
Taxl is Towed Back 7 YES / NO
Replacement Taxi Issued 7 YES |/ NO
Accident Repair Job Card No. : 24097898
Special Instruction 1o ARC, if any ®
Rear
Signed Data
Section B - To be i:mphndeawm Aﬂvlﬁlﬂmﬂ Repair cmT O pn —
Chassis No : JTDKN3BUODS7688165 Mileage
Date Prepared ; Repair Completed dateftime:
Summary of Repair Estimates
Quotation from ARC Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable
Tatal Labour Charges 3 676.00 5
Total Spray Painting Charges 5 756.00 $
Total Material Charges S 1,380.38 3
Other Charges $ 240.00 5
TOTAL - g 305238 ] { )
No. of Repair Days ! | A | L
Signature : Preparsd by FOO e
13/09/2018 D8:50
Section € - To be Compieted by Admin Assistant, Accident Repair Centre, Upen Completion of Repalr
QN No, Invoice No. Invoice Date

Signed Date

FR-AS-ARC-02 Rev 6



Saction D - Daetalls of Repair Estimates

1

Par 1 - Labour Works

Ref. No. TAX ] ! 18 I 2043 -

Job Scope CQuotation from ARC Adjusied by Surveyor, if applicable
TO REPAIR LH PORTION B876:00 7
Total Labour $ 676.00 5
Part 2 - Spray Painting & Panel Beating Related Works
Job Scopa Quotation from ARC Adjusted by Surveyor, if applicable
TO RESRAY REAR DOOR LH 37800 v
TO RESPRAY REAR FENDER LH 378.00
Total Spray Painting & Panel Beating s 756.00 s

Part 3 - Other Costs - Accident and Acciden! Repair Related Expenses

Job Scope Cuotation from ARC
TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION B0.08 " p
TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED AREA 120.00 i
TO WASH AND VACUUM 60 .00 X nn
Total Other Costs s 240.00 L

Soction D - Dutails of Repalr Estimates

FR-AS-ARC-02 Rev &



Ref No. TAX 8 f_18 | 2043

Part 4 - Spare Parts / Material Usage

Resarvation No : Page 1 )
To be completed by Service Advisor, ARC Surveyor Adj
Mot given [x)
Farm Numbser Pars Dascnpoon Oty Lt Pnce  |Diacourt| Final Price |Repmr (R) Repair (R]
(5) (%) &3] Replace (/) | Replace (/)
67004-47080 DOCR RR/LH 1 95450 | 25% | 715.88 / w £
PIXEL STICKER t | s000 | 0% | soo0 | e
61602-47091 FENDER RR/LH 1 7EEBD | 25% | S575.10 I [
STICKER DECAL 8555 8888 1 2180 0% 2160 ! AR
STICKER SMRT LOGO 1 7.80 0% 7.80 / v Z.‘l,_;(
VY LKk
e 0 {'
{ I —
T, '
T
':_"", L K In'l;'\r‘
e Repaires of the followng:
d 18 -
* 70 resurvry betorewie: soray pmearg
# T3 mgay carmeged parlt) aung o]
+ O (o o Bt & confrmaon
* Therd pasty survey w on & WML-‘ g
+ T TG mOOnCIBON 1] 1 skcwed
. _Em:l_--q i) must be #-
—_—
My stay
TOTAL MATERIALS 5 1,380.38

FR-AS-ARC-02 Rev B



" Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - Ill <motarclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September 2018 10:44 AM

To: Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/Taxis/Claims);
‘sur@lkkauto.com’, Catherine Cheng (LKK Auto)

Ce: Sundari Nagarajan - || @12 hg

Subject: RE: SHDG214U - Survey (Il) 10 46 I lﬂ

Attachments: 2043 - 6214.pdf Ve hl‘[lul. \-\.ﬁ!\

Dear Sir / Mdm, ﬂuF-f.‘: NuZ

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SHDS2 14U and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Sundar.
"Kindly upload this survey request emall to merimen

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Lid

64 Cecil Street | #05 108 Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:BThalyalN@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: 12 September, 2018 9:38 AM

To: Motor Claim - |ll <motorclaim @iil.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SHD6214U - Survey (Ill)

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We agree to your proposal.

Regards

Shanti

SMRT Automotive Services PTE LTD
Accident Reporting Center (Claims Dept)

6866 2671/2 | bthaiyaln@smrt.com.sg

S SMRT

ALUITOMOTWE

From: Motor Claim - I1I [mallto:motorclaim@iil.com.sg]
Sent: 12/09/2018 09:37




Toz Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)
" Subject: RE: SHD6214U - Survey (II1)

Dear 5ir / Mdm,
We acknowledge recelpt of your email,
We proprose using ane of the following motor surveyors:

= LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
* Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Motor Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecl| Street | #05 10B Buliding | Singapore 045711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Shanti B Thalyal Nayagi (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & I1A/Taxis/Claims) [mailto:BThaivalN@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: 12 September, 2018 9:07 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Kok Tuck Foo (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC) <TuckFoo@smrt.com.sg>; Yeo Poh Suan {Auto Svecs/Ext Biz
Sves/AR & SC/ARC) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>; Koo Yew Chung (Auto Sves/Ext Biz Svs/AR & 5C)
<YewChung@smrt.com.sg>; Phua Zhi Yang (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR) <ZhiYang Phua@smrt.com.sg>;
Grace Ng 5iu Ching (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR) <ngsiuching@smrt.com.sg>; Lim Kha Chiew (Auto
Sves/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR) <limkhachiew@smrtlan.com.sg>; Lim Wei Siong (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Sves/Claims &
|A/Taxis/Claims) <weisiong@smrt.com.sg>; Chin Kim Ming {Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/AR & SC/ARC/AR)
<kimming.chin@smrtlan.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SHD6214U - Survey (111)

Dear Sir / Mdm

Kindly arrange to survey the vehicle SHD6214U within 48 hours according to GIA guide line, Invelving your insured
SHCE973D

Vehicle in Woodlands SMRT Depot

Regards

Shantl

SMRT Automotive Services PTE LTD
Accident Reporting Center (Claims Dept)
6866 2671/2 | bthaivaln@smrt.com.sg

&5 SMRT

AUTOMDTIVE




~ Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If vou are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No, 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim. which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it 1s absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



BIE2018 Marman s-Claims

View Received Message

This mall Is associated with ;

*SHDEZ14U [MCT1BO90291)
[SHCBS73D]
TP

EMAT TAXIS FTE LTD
Sep 11 2018 12:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMRT Automotive Services Pre Lid

EI I !EIAII I Mark as Unread I Pﬁn‘l“l_lﬂ! I ﬂﬂlﬁm --._I.--Fﬂ!wlrﬂ_ I
:rm mmnlq““ml Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (I11_SG), sent on OB/07/2019 10:14 AM.
. —
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SHD6214U - Claim Handler; Sundari Nagarajan

Approved:0.00:Agreed to do direct settiement. Please revert with your quantum advice

hitps:/isingapore merimen com/claims/index cfm Musebox=SVCmall&fusaaction=dsp view&mode=1&iinboxid=15115844iDomainid=118i0bjid=3. .

12




11282019 Menmean e-Claims
= AUDIT TRAIL
I-‘l 1 " L) [A‘]
VIVIAN
54 0 240 2019 video Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident-TP LAU PEI
’ FENG
[A)
05 Aug 2019 VIVIAN
55 n-n-:n' Vides Downloaded Dawnloadad Viden - Accident VALY Dt
' FENG
[A]
05 Aug 2019 VIVIAN
55 on.ne’ video Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident-TP-cut LAL PEL
' FENG
[A] .
s7 14 283015 445 mpt Initiated LEE
14:30 KHANG
MIN
[A]
IOANNE
gg 14 AUG 2019 o by Modified JP) Reg. Date: -> 2016/06/24. LEE
14:30 KHANG
MIN
(Al
JOANNE
gg AU 2019 o Detalls Notified LEE
14:30 HHANG
MIN
Cur.Req:1399,25:PODS: LIABILITY: 1m?u qutzm'.;:; ;}l COR ::mrn,:u + (8). (] Asher
26 fav 2019 LOR : $349.89 [3days x $116.63) + (c) LO] §120.00 (3days x catbic = Non
60 15:4e Adj Mandate Request o, 000 e MODEL: TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI $798cc PLEASE REVERT WITH YOUR app =79 1079
ROVAL / MANDATE /
Date From 4|75 »| pateTo 4| 5] | Audit Type None v Go
ACTIVITY
[19/09/2018 17:46] VIVIAN LAU PE] FENG:
Seek llability unciear via mermen
Meriman Billing for this case - Transaction History
India Indis
37515 D7 May 2019 International  [niernational Sundan _
a 10:28:22 Video Upload ¥akos Insurance Pte  Insurance Pte SHRtiAG Magarajan I
Ltd (HQ) Ltd (HQ)
India India
14 Jun 2019 Iinternational  International Sundar
177580 10:26:26 Videa Uptond Pekor Insurance Pte  Insurance Pie SHOG1M MNagarajan e
Ld (HQ] Ltd (HQ]
India India
2184526 z'i :':';ﬁg;g video Upioad Mator IM"TEL"z l':*"'”'”"::: SHOG214U 5"'“""'““ o
. Ltd (HQ) Ltd (HQ)
India India
B4 Jul 2019 international  International Sundari
07 14:43;22 | Videolpload | Motor L ance Pta  Insurance Pte o PPRiW Nagarajan s
! Ltd (HQ) Lid (HQ)
LKK Adto LKK Auto
naa338 | PGS COF NS | Motor  Consultants  Comwhtants | SHDE214U  SHC8973D 1177
s Pte Lid Pte Ltd (HQ]

hitps /isingapore merimen comiclaimalindex. cfm Musebox=MTRadjusterdfuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=T426288extid=2627045CFID=631 ...

343



1712018 Merimen o-Liuime
Print Received Message

This mall is associaled with |

*SHDE214U (MCT18090291)
[SHC8973D)
TP
SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Sep 11 2018 12:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) {Ill_SG), sent on 26/11/2018 17:13 PM
To LKK_HO

Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5§1388.29) - SHD6214U - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagarajan

ﬁpprmed:lm.zgrﬂ.équest TP WS to issue Tax invaice for Repairs in TIT's favour

hiipa:/fsingapore meriman mmmmwswﬂmmwhmmwmmcﬂummnm. .



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Settlement

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING )
Case Hatified Est Sobmitted Adj Assigred | Adf RApt Adj Bubmitted Ina Auth’ed Status
oy |19 Se0 2018 IS I018  |sepa0.a0 | $5929,40 iy Vor Burewy
ton keg aae dcy s | mm”mml P |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insured: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co feg Mo 199303851R
Main &
Eiaimans: | SMAT TAXIS PTELTD. Co. Reg. No.: 198905365K
Vahicle Reg, | . |11/09/2018 12:00 - -59
No.: SHDG214U [Dat= of Loss: | o ihe and 18 Days From LTA Reg Dats (Man Yr}]
i i
Clsim Type: | TP / MCT18090291 oicyicever | wcomoos
Vehicle Reg. I
N SHCAS73D :g:"' No. | b 1BOSGZIIMFSH
[Tnsured) rmanit] -
Excees
RAepalrer: SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woadlands ) 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel: 68662628
fnend |undia International Tnsurance Pie Lid (HQ) - Tell 83476100 ... [Handled by Sundari Magarajan - 6347 £071]
CIRIMANTS | s First Capital Insurance Lid (WQ) - Tel: 62222311
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 6256-3561 . [Handled by Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah] ... [Final Rpt dug
Adjuster:  131/09/2018)
ASSOCIATED MATL RECEIVED View Al |  Compose Case man |

IN_5G (26/11/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($3$1399.29) - SHDE114U - Claim Handler: Sundari Mag...
I11_5G (DB/07/2019): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved [5$0.00) - SHD6214U - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagara...
M1_SG (I0/06/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - SHD6214U - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagara...
11156 (23/05/2019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (530.00) - SHDG6214U - Clalm Handler: Sundari Nagara...
I11_SG (19/0%/2018): Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved ($30.00) - SHDG2 14U - Claim Mandler: Sundarl Nagara...

L

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view all | Search Tasks | Crmate New Task | Comgpete |

Cue Dale  Priority Type Task Group  Subject  Handler  Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
e results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 18/12/2019



Mermmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

“SHD6214U (MCT18090291)

[SHCBS73D]
™

SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
Sep 11 2018 12:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Video ]
Ne |Finalizsd On Indla International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |14/06/19 10:26 Video - Accident-TP Load AV

2 | J0/06/19 14:24 Video - Accdant Load M

3 |04/D7/19 14:43 | Vides - Aceident-TP-cut Load MP4
Photos/ Images iperpage [v] M
Mo | Relabel/RAeorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd {HQ) Thurrrhnall | Print
1 |1youi8 1798 | Genersl View 0| wacws | B |
2 [13/09/18 17:48 | General View 0| eews | A
1 [1W09/18 17:48 | General View @ | wadwc | A
4 [13D9/1817:48 | General View 0| dws | A
5 [13/09/1817:48 | General View 0! wedrc | BB
6 |13/09/1817:48 | Ganeral View _l_ﬂ Load PG | BA
7 |1309/18 17:48 | General View 0| wesws | BA
8 |1N09/18 1748 | General View Q| s | A
9 |13/00/18 17:48 General View 0| lwdws | A
10 [13/069/18 17:48 | Genaral View 0! edwrs | B
11 [13/09/18 17:48 | General View 0| wasws | A
{12 [17/01/1912:11 | Photo After Spray 0| woewc | B
(13 [17/01/19 12111 | Phots After Spray 0 | osaws | A
lta l17o1/19 12411 | Phots After Spray @ | eews | A
15 [17/01/19 12411 | Photo After Spray Q! weews | B
Documaentetion _ [iperpage 1/ 92|
Ne | Aalabel/Reorder | LK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbrall | Print
i |12/00/1819:22 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO 111 DD 12.09.2018 @) | Losd FOF

2 |13/09/1B19:22 | TP GIA REPORT @ | LoadFoOF

3 |16/09/1809:15 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF

4 |14/08/1% 14:37 | WORKSHODP INVOICE Load POF

5 |14/08/10 14:37 | RENTAL RECEIPT Load PDE

6 | 14/DB/19 14:37 | RENTAL MILEAGE Load POF

7 |14/06/19 14:37  |LOD ) | Lood POF

B |18/12/1% 10:46 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM 0 | Loed ror

8 [18/12/18 1046 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER @ | Loespor

Mo | Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 14/09/18 09:08 Singapore Accident Statement Load POF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | pont |

There are no document checklists configured.

show Remarks Tor [ Handling Trsurer
Pote: Bemarks as prvEw uniess you Shew @ 13 Srher portm.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 18/12/2019



Menimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 18/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno 1sssorissr

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6644-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/111B01BE968/NEA3Q2

Date: 181272018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India Intemational Insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMDO15
Claimant "
Vehicle No : SHDE214L Insured Vehicle No : SHC8973D
Date of Loss: 11/08/2018 Mature of Claim: i Claim No: MCT18080291
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SHDB214U
Make & Model, TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI, 1.8 (A) Engine No 2ZR1680981
Regq. Date: 24/06/2016 (Man, Year: 2015) Chassis No: JTDKN3BU005768165
Colour: Brown Odometer: 172208 km
Engine Capacity 1798 cc
Market Valua/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S§) Market Value/Mew Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/65 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/85 R15
Front Left Side: Falken 5 mm Rear Left Side: Falken 5 mm
Front Right Side: Falken 5 mm Rear Right Side: Falken 5 mm
The above values represant the rermaring fyre ireads dopth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff ‘Hu|
Parts 1,810.70 B89.40 1.721.30 85,06
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.672.00 840,00 B832.00 4978
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount (S5) 3,482.T0 929.40 2,553.30 TaM
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x 5540.00/day) (55) 120.00
+ Car Rental (3.0 x $§116.63/day) (S§) 348.88
Nett Liability (S$) 1,399.29
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 12/09/2018
Date Inspecied: 12/09/2018 Inspected At SMRT Automative Services Pte Lid
(Woodlands)
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimaled Period of Repair: 2.0days
Adjuster: Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yi

NOTE: This repor represents aur findings al the tims and piace of inspection slated hersin, Such inspection has bean camed out to e best of aur
knowledge and ability but any other labiily under any alher circumstances s hemby aspressly secluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 14 Aug 2019)

|Parts: 144 TOYOTA PRIUS TAXI 1.8 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
'Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted. no print-code for SHDG214U)

Validity: These astimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are preficed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 “PIXEL STICKER (SN) MNecessary 80.00F *60.00F
2 1 *STICKER DECAL 6555 8888 (SN) Necessary 21.60F *21.60F
3 1 *STICKER SMRT LOGO (SN) Necessary 7.BOF *7.B0F
4 1 *DOCR RR/LH Repair 854 50F ~F
5 1 *FENDER RR/LH Repair 766.80F *-F

Total Parts (S§) 1,810.70 89.40

| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING & BODY WORK Naw 676.00 400,00
2 SPRAY PAINT New 756.00 400.00
3 TO CHECK WIRING AND SYSTEM FUNCTION MNaw 80.00 0.00
4 TO APPLY RUST-PROOFING ON AFFECTED AREA New 100,00 40.00
5 TO WASH AND VACUUM New 80.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,672.00 840.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. I

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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