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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August 2018 5:22 PM

To: SUR; assignments

Subject: Enquiry on Market Value - XE3546L; OUR REF: CMTD1803192; DOA: 24.07.2018
Attachments: 2517_001.pdf

Dear LKK

Please advise the market value of XE3546L as at 24.07.2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards } Lff ol ( ((L(F G

Agnes Chan

Claims Divison
D: 63295327 T: 6461 6555]| F: 6221 3147

@ Siro

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www.sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG

A Century of Trust

:Dewnload now @ AppStore or L GOOQ‘GPIay i

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legaily privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please ciick here for
our Privacy Paolicy.

From: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes [mailto:agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 21 August, 2018 5:18 PM

To: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: Attached Image




PAXF/COE Rebatc Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner ID Typse:

Owner [D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Enginz No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Outpuf:
Open Market Value:

QOriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COFE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Periad{Yearsh:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Aug 2018

https:/fvrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION _1D=F030...

Company
07400

KEA546L
Yes

21 Aug 2018

UD TRUCKS
GKBSELDHNT ESCOTV
White

2017

GH11746523

INCM1F 1AXHU026404
$76,652.00

100ct 2017

10 0ct 2017

1

$3,833.00

No

$0.00

09 Oct 2027

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$42,6809.00

$34,247.00

$34,247.00

OK
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Denise Tay (LKXAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 27 August 2018 4:50 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Chan, Shu Hui Agnes; SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: Enquiry on Market Value - XE3546L; OUR REF: CMTD1803192; DOA: 24.07.2018

Dear Agnes,

The market value for XE 3546L is $145K - $148K(est) as at July 2018

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | =2l den'setay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrizl ark, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 4:55 PM

To: Chan, Shu Hui Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Enguiry on Market Value - XE3546L; OUR REF: CMTD1803192; DOA: 24.07.2018

Dear Agncs,

Please be informed that we still need some times to check on the market value of XE 3546L.

Besl Reaards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Crse Handler
LEKK Auto Const o tanis Pre Lid

Phone: 6250-3501 i siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blks1. v ibil ark. Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LY Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 22 /. 7ust 2018 10:07 AM
To: Chan, Shu Hui /ones <cznes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments

<assignments@ om>
Subject: RE: Enc 'ry - n Market Value - XE3546L; OUR REF: CMTD1803192; DOA: 24.07.2018
Dear Aones,

Thank you for the email.
We will check an rt to you.

Best ;,'!\L'i_'.i'l rds,

Shisu Chan (0 andler
LEKK Auto Cons te Lid
Phaons —1560 siowse@ldmuto.com | fax 6256-4315
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