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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 4:01 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); ‘'ongbobo@mova.com.sg’
Cc SUR

Subject: RE: SLD3539E FINALISATION

Dear Bo Bo.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm finalise at $2171.60 with 3 repair days

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Bobo Ong [mailto:ongbobo@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 29 September, 2018 12:51 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: SLD3539E FINALISATION

Dear Rasul =

Please see attach for above mentioned finalisation and after repair photos.

Please advise if we can finalise at $2171.60 with 3 repair days ?

Best Regards,
Bo Bo

Estimator
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel- 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA o o

Automolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of tha intended recipient only. If you have received this message in error, please do not copy. disclose or use
its conterd. We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delele the original transmission and any attachment from your system.

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution 1o
minirnize this risk, we do not accept any liabllity resulting from software viruses, Please camy out your own virus chaecks before opening any attachmant,



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September 2018 2:32 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD
ROAD

Dear Catherine,

Claim No. M11D05051809

Warmest Regards

Jenny Lew

Claims Department

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleal Tower, Singapore 079809
Main = (65) 6222 7733 | DID - (85) 6450 9329 | Fax « (65) 6327 3869 | Email pnnylewE ol Com. 59

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, Copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

Erom: Catherine Chong [LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 19 September, 2018 2:13 PM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments’ <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539F AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

Dear Jenny,
Kindly provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 5:16 PM

To: 'LEW JENNY' <jennylew i.com.sg>: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'assignments’ <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

Dear lenny,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

1



Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{a08933)

Erom: LEW JENNY [mailto:jennylew @uoi.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 4:39 PM

To: nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: crystal@mova.com.s

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Catherine/Shiau Chan,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Mova Automotive.
Password: ugi123

Thank You.

Warmest Regards

Jenny Lew

Claims Department

United Overseas Insurance Limited

4 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 079909
Main « (651 6222 7733 | DID « {55) 6400 9229 | Fax « (85) 6327 385% | Email » [EnnylewEiuo Gom.59

UOE EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]
Sent; Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 2:51 PM

To: LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: crystal@mova.com.sg
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL260D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

Dear Jenny,
Please assign LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Thank You

Best Regards,
N it
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Ple Ltd
Tal: 6272 3882 Fax: 6270 8314

From: LEW JENNY [umﬂ.tmmyﬁﬂ@uomﬂmg]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 September 2018 1:16 PM
To: nitha



Cc: crystal@mova.com.sg
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Nitha,

Pursuant to the amended Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident (NIMA), we enclose a list of our
Surveyors, for your attention.

In this case, we propose to appoint M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Please revert to the undersigned within two (2) working days whether you have any objections to the
appointment of any of our Surveyors, failing which we shall proceed to carry out the survey of your client's
vehicle by our appointed Surveyors.

We reserve all our rights in this matter.
Thank You.

Warmest Regards
Jenny Lew

Claims Department

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 079908
Main « (85) 6222 7733 | DID » (65) 5490 8325 | Fax » (65) 6327 3865 | Email » jennylewuni.com sg

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse, copy,
disciose. distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If you are not the intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email may not necessarily
represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the LOB Group.

From: nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]
sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 1:25 PM
To: LEE KATIE <katielee @uoi.com.sg>; LEW JENNY <jennylew uoi.com.sg=

Cc: crystal@mova.com.sg
Subject: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

Dear All,
Kindly assist revert liability and assign surveyor for the above mention case.

Thank you.

Best Regards.
N Utha
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel 6272 3892 Fax. 6270 8314



Catherine Ehonﬁ (LKK Auto)

From: LEW JENNY <jennylew®@uoi.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 4:39 PM

To: nitha; SUR; assignments

Ce: crystal@mova.com.sg

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD
ROAD

Attachments: 3539.zip

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Catherine/Shiau Chan,

Please arrange to survey the vehicle at Mova Automotive
Password: uoi123

Thank You,

Warmest Regards

Jenny Lew

Claims Departimeant

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road, #28-01 Springleaf Tower, Singapore 0759502
Main + {65} 6222 7733 | DID » (B5) 6490 9329 | Fax » (65) 6327 38689 | Emall +

UOB EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidental ahd nol misuse, copy,
disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts io a breach of confidentiality I you are nol tha intended
recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. As the integrity of this message cainndl be guaranized,
neither UOB nor any entity in the UOB Group shall be responsible for the contents Any opinion in this emall imay nol necessarily

represent the opinion of UOE or any entity in the UOB Group.

From: nitha [mailto:nitha @mova.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 2:51 PM

To: LEW IENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: crystal@maova.com.sg

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3530E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

Dear lenny,
Please assign LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,

Thank You

Best Regards,
N ita
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pie Ltd
Tel; 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

From: LEW JENNY [mailto:jennylew@uoi.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 September 2018 1:16 PM

To: nitha



Cc: crystal@mova.com.sa
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SLD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Nitha,

Pursuant to the amended Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident (NIMA), we enclose a list of our
Surveyors, for your attention.

In this case, we propose to appoint M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Please revert to the undersigned within two (2) working days whether you have any objections to the
appointment of any of our Surveyors, failing which we shall proceed to carry out the survey of your client’s
vehicle by our appointed Surveyors.

We reserve all our rights in this matter.

Thank You.

Warmest Hegards

Jenny Lew

Claims Department

United Overseas Insurance Limited

3 Anson Road. #28-01 Sprir glea

Main - (B5) 6222 33 | DID = 15 51Gae E

UCE EMAIL DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not misuse. copy,
disclose, distribule or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If vou are not the inten
recipient. please delete all copies of this email fram your computer system. As the integnty of this message cannot be guarani=ed,
neither UCOEB nor any entity in the UCOB Group shall be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this amall may not necessanly

represent the opinion of UOB or any entity in the UOB Group,

From: nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 September, 2018 1:25 PM
To: LEE KATIE <katielee@uoi.com.sg>; LEW JENNY <jennylew@uoi.com.sg>

Cc: crystal@mova.com.sg
Subject: TP CLAIMS - 5LD3539E AGAINST EL26D DOA 10/09/18 AT ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

Dear All,
Kindly assist revert liability and assign surveyor for the above mention case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Nitia
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 8272 3892 Fax: 62708314
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please report corracily the details of the accident 1o speed up e CLaIMS Process.
2. This Eorm must be complated by the Policyholdar and/or the Authorised Driver.

3, Infermation provided muet ba as truthful and accurale as possinle. Any willul misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies lo

repudiate policy abdity.

4 The lssus and acceplance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy habiiy on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any lalse reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&, This report will b forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and thal copies of this regort will, for 2 fee, be made available upon application by interested partes
7. By e lodgement of this report fo the inserers. you heraby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and io comes of the report being made available

aforesaid

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
10/09/2018 18:38
10/09/2018 09:40

ALONG ORCHARD ROAD

Country/State of Loss SINGAFORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Mumber SLD3539E
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner TEC O MENZHANG AIMEL)
NRIC Mo ST40B271H

Email Address
Maobile Phone Mo
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please slate action o be laken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverags

Fleet Paolicy

Policy Number

Cover Nole Mumber

Driver

Mame of Driver

MRIC No

Date Of Birth

Qeccupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number

EMail Address

OIMEI_TEO@YAHOO.COM.SG
[LOCAL) +65-93693896
OTHERS-93693896

FORD
FOCUS 1.6 TITANIUM 4-DR C346

NO

THIRD PARTY
FRIVATE CAR

NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE
MO

TEQ O MEIZHANG AIMEI)
ST40827T1H

13/03/1974

INDOOR

1310171994

24 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-93693896

OTHERS-33693896
OIME|_TEQ@YAHOO.COM.5G

Page 1ol 11



Address

Postcode

APT BLK 4 QUEEN'S ROAD
#11-133

260004

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWHNER
Wehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own

WVehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Cwn Vehicle #

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident
Weather Conditions
Road Surface
Other Information

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
AFTER RAIN
WET

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Mumber of vahicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance?

NO

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown personi(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Mumber of Passengers (Including Driver)

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported (o the police?

If ¥es, Please state which Police Station

MO

Was notice of intended Prosecution given®? MO

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER TO THE SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident pholos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks/ Reasons:

Was there any audio recorded?

Wehicle Registration Mumber
Vehicle Make/ModelColaur
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Calegory

Name of Driver
MRIC/Passport Mumber
Contact Number

Address

Postocode

Insurance Coempany Name
MNature Of Damage

Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

VIDEO WILL BE SENT TO NTUC INSURANCE DIRECTLY
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
EL26D

PRIVATE CAR

Page 2af 11



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident 1o speed up the Claims process.
7. This Eorm mint be egmpleted by thi Policyholder andfor the Authorised Driver.

3. |nlormation provided must be-as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepreseniztion or withholding of material
fatte may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy lakility.

& The issue andacceptance-of this Form by insurance companies s ngt an admission of policy ability on the pert of the Insurance
companies.

B, The repart wili be forwarded by thie isurgrs of the SiA Records Management Centre estabiished by the Ganetal Insurance
Asspciation of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that coples of this report will for 2 fee be made available upon application by
interested parties.

By the lodgment of this report 1o the insurers, you hereby consent te the archhing of this report at the centie and Lo coptes of
the repart being made available sforesaid.

& Consent under the Personal Data Protectlon Act (PDRPA}
| understand, acknowledge, agres and consent thal:

{al My insurer, my workshap and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA") may/ate permitted to collect, uss,
diseinse and/or process my personal dats/personsl informatian setout in this |[form] and any ‘other persenal information
provided by me or possesaed by my insurer [rollectively the “Personal Informatlon”) 2nd disclose and transfer such
Pereonal Infarmation 1o all insurer(s] whe have insured vehicieds) involved In this accigenl [zl insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s] invalved (o this accident shall be callectively referred toas the “Insurers”), the thsurers” tdwyirs/law tirms, the
Maneiary Authotity of Singapore and any relevant goveimment agency/authority (such s the palice), fol the purpese(s)
o
(1) processirg, handing and/or dealing with oy clzims including the settlement of the cininig and any necessary

inwestigations relating ta the claims;

[Hl} investigating the sccident and/or my clalms;
(i) earrying ut andfor dealing with my instructions or responding 1o any enguines by me;

(w] administering my claims [including the mailing of cotredpindencs, atemani immlceL, reporis or robices o e
which could invalve dizclosure of certam personal dats about me 1o being about delibery ol the same as well 35 on the
gxternal cover of ervelopes/mail packages); snd/for

v} complying with applicabie law in administering, procesying, hendling andfor dealmg with my Claims: [collpctively ths
"Purpises”|
(B all insgired (5] wiit Hadve inguned vehiclels) invohed in thes Todident and this infureis’ lawyersfaw firms, mayfare permitted

ta collect, uae; diaclose andfor proceds my Peranal information lor one or more of the ahowve Pur poges; and

1] iy Personal Infarmation may/can be disclosed by-any of the Insurers and/or GIA to thelr third party service providées &
agents{including their imwyers/law firms), which may be sited gutside of Singapore, for one or mese of the-above Purnossy

{4} my Personal informittion will also be chifncted and vaed 1o complle claimg history for the pyrpose of fraud detectian,
investigation and manogament in présent and al future-clalms.

(e} the informaton so collected under (d] shove may be thared | disclosed:

1) to sl msurersandfor 2ny other third perties that ascist inevaluating, investigating, certrolling or maneging fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies a3 reasonably required Tor the purpores stated; o

|l Teor complying with requirements under any regulations. bnws or colirt orders.

= B I A —
Fnhc'ﬁm-ldar'!. Signature Dirveer' s S pRatt e Epporting Cenfre Percoanil's Sagnature
Diate & Time: 1_|l' driver B onot Ui policyhodder) MEme

Date-H Tume: NRIZSFIN No.-

Page 3af 11



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

¢ ﬂlﬁ' Pomald Houge ﬁF SLD3S39 E

. ___,_I!ﬂi‘LiF.T_.
,%‘ L 2 264
J_d{z A D frd fus love B+ B 2P

Otehard ,Eﬂﬁﬁi

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

ucenserate.  SLD 3539 E ACCIDENT DATE B TIME  H[) || q118 09 %0
CONTACT NUMBER ﬂlg LAk 1§ E-MAIL ADDRESS ;_-,.,me-nl__';f oE Yahoo. iavm s

LEGATIO, filaney D!’:.lbncﬁﬂf{ Kﬁﬁﬂ owl el @ MarDimed H‘Ge.m;
e t:-mE;} 6 haut

e MW gar Wity Wavdhing  alona  Otchad Boad and
the BMW cac (ER26D) W on e qee ek of oy
o T Ilkﬂfﬂv'q ﬂ\i’hm 'r.m'i. (qing iM] s Q—hﬂﬁiﬁﬂ"l‘\
lame  to ’ME bus  lane. fe Heoee dle dar Qp.m‘\- Ul wa
stopped 1 e hud o L’cqp Tve, Eow (& CEL2AD D
JL’NEH %.ll‘ i) L'IIH A0, ET"'M fead  buwiger oo Awvk dt,.:r{
r.‘*.m.'i e I..-M’fﬂ E-.(‘MJEMJ:. i rﬂu. Lndmlm-r‘

NOTE: PLEASE NGTE THAT YOUR INSURER MAY HAVE 14 DAYS TIME FRAME FOR YOU TO SUBMIT AN
OWN DAMAGE CLAIM UNDER YOUR CWN POLICY FLEASE CHECK YOUR POLICY FOR MORE INFORMATION

Pleats stale .
[ ) Claim Owr Pofcy ﬁ Clanm Third Pary [ ) Claam GOVTE al olher workshop [ | Reporting Only
DECLARATION '

1We declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

g
%.l\& / i
Palicyholder s Sgnature Drriver s Segraature Hegorting Centre Pareannel's Ssgnature

Dl & Timne: |IF griver s nat 1he polcyhalder) Hamme
Date & Time NRIC/FIN No

Page 4 of 11



Estimate

12/09/2018

UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE

3 ANSON ROAD

#28-01 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

SINGAPORE 079909

Attention - XAD32

Page #

Veh#

Veh Model -

Estimate# :

Claim #

ACC. Date -

Terms

Remarks

1

SLD3539E
FORD FOCUS

CK417962

10/09/18
C.OD Days

@MOVA

Main Office:
Mova Building
akan KHang,
Singapore. 163419
|65) 6476 3333
ax: [(B5) 6271 58931

Workshop Dq_a_-pt:

ntEpore 15972
Tel: (66) 62723802

Fax: (B53) B2

2] = L
Aag, M2-0088864-2

No.  Description

U.Price Amounts S%

LIST ITEMS :
REAR BUMPER

e

LIST TOTAL 5%
20% DISCOUNT 58

SPECIAL NET ITEMS :
1, REVERSE SENSOR REAR LH - CHECK ;Cﬂ"‘-.

SPECIAL MET TOTAL S8

LABOUR :

REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH
REAR BUMPER RETAINER LH
REAR BUMPER LOWER GARMNISH
REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH
REAR BUMPER CLIPS

TO REMOVE & REPLACE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS
AMND REALIGN AFFECTED AREAS

TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS

TO REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSOR

Rory b

anA_

PR T e e §

PC
PC
PC
PC
PC
PC

LLe 9 6o [wo Ly

) 20

F&(uﬁ/tﬁ EOW

’*M

crA—
1.560.00 1.560.00
85.00 85.00
&B.E:EIFVL 88.50

35500 S 355.00
Bz.O0 FeL-" 8200
1050 M-~ 105.00

227350

LABOUR TOTAL 5% G80.00
L NON-TAX AMOUNT S

* o AMOUNT S$ 2,500.40

o/ GST@ 7% 175.03

DSk 0000 TR el Z

[ AMOUNT DUE S§ 267543




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL

6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R G5T Reg. Mo. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

UNITED OVERSEAS INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/UOI18016662/R 1vbn2
L PRINGLEAF TOWER SINGAPORE 079909 Bama- 1502000 NHI‘||MI|‘||||H”‘|
Code: UOI2
il Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. EL 26D Veh. Inspected SLD 3539E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. M11D05051809 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JENNY LEW Assign Date 12/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model FORDFOCUS 1.6 TITANIUM |c.c 1596
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. WFOMXXGCBMCC26765 Colour GREY
Odometer 66922 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/50 R17 NEXEN &6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [215/50 R17 NEXEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/50 R17 NEXEN 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 NEXEN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
1 General Information
Accident Date  10/08/2018 Inspection Date 18/08/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/06/08 .
SINGAPORE 159722
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

"_‘ = B ; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLD 353SE
Qty Description of Parts Condition ﬁ?;;:ﬁ:{;} Qur Al.[::j:iustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER CRACKED 1,560.00 1,560.00
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET LH SERVICEABLE 85.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER LH SERVICEABLE 88,50 -
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH SCRATCHED 355.00 355.00
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LH SCRATCHED 82 .00 B2.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @3$10.50 MNECESSARY 105.00 105.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -455.10 -420.40
1,820.40 1,681 680
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR REAR LH (MPA)SN) NOT NECESSARY - -
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS 300.00 200.00
AND REALIGN AFFECTED AREAS.
TO SPRAY PAINT ON ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREAS. 300.00 250.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REVERSE SENSCR, 80.00 40.00
680.00 490.00
GRAND TOTAL 2,500.40 2,171.60
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 2,171.60

Report Ref No. CS/UOI18016662/R1vbn2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




