
1

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 September, 2018 3:43 PM

To: jackng@honda.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION FOR SLZ 4341 K LKK REF CC4/AXA18016639/R1hb3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Jack, 

 

Please find below COR recommendation by our surveyor (subject to our principal’s approval). 

 

Vehicle Date Of Accident Recommended COR 

SLZ 4341K 08/09/2018 P/P @ $1,919.37 with 3 DAYS 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 21 September, 2018 1:59 PM 

To: 'Jack Ng'; Rasul (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A; assignments 

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION FOR SLZ 4341 K 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Jack, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Kindly assist. Our Ref: CC4/AXA18016639/R1hb3 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Jack Ng [mailto:jackng@honda.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 21 September, 2018 1:56 PM 

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FINALIZATION FOR SLZ 4341 K 

Importance: High 

 

Dear ALL, 

We enclosed the total final repair costs for, 

Vehicle No.  SLZ 4341 K 

Final Repair Costs (exclude GST)   S$1,919.37 

Repair Period* (Days) 3 WORKING DAYS 

*Note: Repair period does include Sunday and Public Holiday. 

Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and 

Public Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment 

will be made. 

  

In addition, I have attached photos of before paint, ‘?’ items and supplementary parts (if any) for your records. 

 

 

 
 
Thank you and have a great days ahead  
 
Cheers !!! 
 
Best Regards, 

Jack  Ng 
Hp: 8288 6309 
Email : Jackng@honda.com.sg 
BODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE 

255 Alexandra Road Singapore 159937  

DID : +65 6514 5481  FAX : +65 6362 5015 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd. 

(A MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD) 

Website: www.honda.com.sg 
 

 

� Please consider the environment before printing this email 

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Information contained in the e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and 

may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable low. If the reader of this message is not the 

intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you 

have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you for your collaboration. 
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Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and 

exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended 

recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 

communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately 

notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you. 


