Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh®@lonpac.coms=

Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 5:22 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLKBO2C & SFXBE30X ON 7.9.2018 [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vivian,

Please see our email below.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by autharised external parties only

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Sent: Thursday, 25 April, 2019 1:49 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAUto)'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLKBO2C & SFXBB30X ON 7.9.2018 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vivian,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TeuES] 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authonsed external parties only
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From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 3:12 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK802C & SFX8830X ON 7.9.2018

Our Rel - 17/18/18/VP0O5/020897
Your Ref :CC4/LPCIR016588/Gwa3l

Hi Gerald
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 11 September 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a chain collision involving 3 vehicles chain collision where Ol was the 2*! vehicle
In accordance to the MCF guideline, we have to settle 3" claim at 100%.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Motor Edgevantage Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $17.324.37 $ 10,900.20
2. Loss of USE (8 150,00 x Sdays) $§ 750.00 $ 500.00{5days x $100,00)
3. LTAJ/GIA search fee § 745 $ 745
Total | 518,081.82 S 11.407.65

**5 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

v o al

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@[kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 January, 2019 5:39 PM

To: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLKBD2C & SFX8330X ON 7.9.2018



Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020897
Your Ref :CC4/1LPC1B016588/Gwa3

Dear Vivian,

Please see attached documents and revert to them.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
‘I‘eﬂﬁﬁ} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)

Vehicle No

ISR %% B 0X

(Insd veh) = Model

T d ROVI7 Gty >

|SLEFIAC  (TPveh)

Dateof Accident [:| 9 ./ 5 o

Global Sum Settlement | : 1 ygs

‘DHI‘J

Liability ' fcT % |[A¢rendfhssuud]
Repair Estimate :S ;f ; 5’7{. 0
Final Repair Cost 218 10, 4900 3¢
Loss of Use 18 14T ¢ daysat$ /¢ perday |
Rental (if any) HE daysat$ (incls of GST) per day
Others S
1 $
| $
AR
Final SettlementSum | : §
Remarks:
Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown
)| £2pniv bl 19 e, ¢t M
| oy of ure 19 T£T ot
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

|, Tan Hwee Hock (“the third party Claimant”)

of Blk 988A Jurong West St 93 #10-623 (address).
owner of SFXBB30X (vehicle no.)

hereby authorize Motor Edgevantage Pte Ltd (“The workshop”)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and / or rental and / or loss of use

{“claim®) for my Vehicle No. SEX8830X that was damaged

pursuant to the accident which occurred on 07/09/2018 (date) along
Along AYE towards Tuas near Alexandra (location)

imvolving Vehicle No/s SLKB02C [*The accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to sign the discharge voucher on my behalf to settle my above
mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made Iin favour of the

workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liabllity basis insofar as the driver / owner / insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Date this day of {month) 20 \ 53 {year)

Signgdl by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop®



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : 17/18/18/VPOS/020897
DATE - 03 May 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, TAN HWEE HOCK confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of SLK 802C the sum of Singapore Dollar Eleven Thousand
Four Hundred and Cents Twenty only (§ 11,400.20) in full and final satisfaction,
liguidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us
whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from
an accident involving SFX 8830X & SLK 802C on 07 Seprember 2018 along AYE (
TUAS)

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/LIM TECK / WONG BOON TENG LOUIS aganst all claims and any
claims whatsoever  made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said
accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly 10 Motor
Edgevantige P1e Lid

I/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
hubility busis and wi prejudice to all related claims and in respeet ol our
insured’s recovery acti

T e M _uba

Name of vehicle owner /Date

ll Il“
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4 MOTOR EDGEVANTAGE sre o

M 160 Sin Ming Drive, Sin Ming AutoCity #03-01/02, Singapore 575722 & &% 201534758N
& 46564537683 [ clientservices@edgevantage.com € www.edgevantage.com

Invoice
Mr Wilson Tan H H Inv No. 1 INV19010065
SFXB8830x Invoice Date 08 |]an 2019
LAND ROVER RANGE ROVER EVOQUE 2.0 AT ABS 4wD HID  Ref : WJ1809093
SR Terms : COD
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Mechanic : Yap Kim Thien
300, Beach Road #17-04/07 Mileage In : T6506 KM
The Cancourse
Singapore 199555
Tel: 96882479
Attn: Wilson Tan H H (96882479)
# Description Oty UOM uwe Amt
1 LR tallgate Evoque 1.00 PCS 2,718.90 2.718.90
2 LR rear windscreen Evoque 1.00 PCS 891,90 B51.90
3 LR rear bumper Evoque pure 1.00 PCS 1.512.00 1.512.00
4 LA rear bumper heat shield Evogue 1.00 PCS 103.50 103.50
5 LA parking aid Evoque 1.00 PCS 171.00 171.00
& LA exhaust muffler Evoque 1.00 PCS 1,890.00 1,890.00
7 LA rear fog lamp LH 1.00 PCS 166.50 166.50
8 LR “Land Rover* nameplate tailgate Evoque 1.00 30.60 30.60
9 LR "Evoque 514" name plate tailgate Evoque 1.00 PCS 142.20 142.20
10 LR "RANGE" name piate taligate Evoque 1.00 PCS 132.30 132.30
11 LR "ROVER® name plate tallgate Evoque 1.00 PCS 132.30 132.30
12 To replace rear bumper, rear bumper reinforcement , 1.00 500.00 500.00
rear parking sensor rh center, rear taligate, lower moulding,
Lh side outer wheel arch moulding
13 To putty respray rear bumper , rear taligate 1.00 500.00 6500.00
14 To transfer tallgate components parts 1.00 60.00 60.00
15 Toremove rear windscreen 1.00 100.00 100.00
16 To install rear windscreen UV film 1.00 180.00 1B80.00
17 To replace rear exhaust muffler Lh side 1.00 120.00 120.00
18 To check wiring including electrical module 1.00 60.00 60.00
19 Supplementary parts 1.00 0.00 0.00
20 LR Rear bumper moulding RH Evoque 1.00 256.50 256.50
21 LR Rear bumper moulding LH Evoque 1.00 256.50 256.50
22 LR Rear wheel arch outer moulding LH Evogque 1.00 162.90 162.90
This is a computer generated Invoice. No Signature is required. Subtotal | 5$10,187.10
GST 7.0% : S5 713.10
Total : 55 10,900.20
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