Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 3:12 PM

'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

MT_Claim_SG

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK802C & SFX8830X ON 7.9.2018

LKK Inspection Photos.pdf; LKK Reinspection Photos.pdf; LKKAdjustmentl.pdf;
LKKInspection.pdf; LOD.pdf

Our Ref 1 17/18/18/VP05/020897
Your Ref :CC4/LPC18016588/Gwa3

Hi Gerald

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 11 September 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a chain collision involving 3 vehicles chain collision where OI was the 2™ vehicle

In accordance to the MCF guideline, we have to settle 3" claim at 100%.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Motor Edgevantage Pte Ltd is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)

$17,324.37 $10,900.20

2. Loss of USE ($ 150.00 x 5days) $ 750.00 $ 500.00(5days x $100.00)

3. LTA/GIA search fee

$ 745 $ 745

Total | $18,081.82 $ 11,407.65

**5 days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 9 January, 2019 5:39 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK802C & SFX8830X ON 7.9.2018

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VP05/020897
Your Ref :CC4/LPC18016588/Gwa3
Dear Vivian,

Please see attached documents and revert to them.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555




