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'.‘ l’{!'{ Auto

T Consultanis
AW B gL R Piw Lid Company Registration No. 199607198R

51 U AVE 1, #0225 PAYA URTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPURE JRYAY TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX : (IG5 62564315

Your Ref: TBA Date: 14 September 2018

Our Ref: CS/GALIBD16577/R1sd3

The Maotor Claims Department
Great American Insurance Company

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. __SHD 3693P .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 12/09/2018 at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 58 1,139.04
Revised Estimate Amount : 58 317.60
“Check” Items Amount 1 5%

Market Value : 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value . 8%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 2 Days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 20 September 2018 10:57 AM
To: Lim Tien Siong

Cc: Admin-D (LEKAuto) Admin A

Subject: RE: SHD3693P - Finalize

Hi Lim,

Finalised amount of $300.00 /2 days part by part confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ L7E”m %

SmnEn WETT guve the Earthe Print only when necessary:

From: Lim Tien Siong [mailto:limts@cdge.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 18 September, 2018 12:17 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuUto); Admin A

Subject: Fw: SHD3693P - Finalize

Hi Rasul,

Please expedite. Low amount.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

From: Lim Tien Siong
Sent: Thursday, 13 September 2018 3:32 PM

To: rasul@lkkauto.com
Cc:

Subject: SHD3693P - Finalize
Hi Rasul,

Finalize at PP S 300.00 and 02 repair days.
Rear Bumper Clips - Not Taken.



After paint

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

his message and any attachmeants may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary infermation. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised thal using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therain is not allowsd. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be laken as endorsed by ComfortDelGre Corporation
Limited or its related companies The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing harain
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition excep! as agreed ina
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties

CamfortiDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Envirenment Council - 2 committed (o preserving the environment. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary

ComfartDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Reaistration No 199506048




Shirlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 September 2018 2:32 PM

To: 'Mgian, Kelvyna'

Cc: 'SUR" 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'; ASSIGNMENTS@lkkauto.com

Subject: RE: RE: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SJX7787Y dated 07.09.18
Attachments: SHD 3693F - Preli Advise.pdf

Dear Kelvyna,
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SHD 3693P.

Kindly provide us the claim reference no.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408323)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 5:15 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; ASSIGNMENTS@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.09.18
Importance: High

Hi Nivitha,

Please touch base with Cdge first on survey as they just send another email to us

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2018 5:08 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; ASSIGNMENTS@lkkauto.com

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [External] RE: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.05.18

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin



m{itha 1 (LKK &uto] _

From: Mgian, Kelvyna = Kelvyna.Ngian@sqg.gaig.com>

Sent; Tuesday, 11 September 2018 4:40 PM

To: Mivitha (LKK Auto); ‘Admin A" "SUR™

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.09.18
Attachments: img-910081501-0001.pdf

Hiteam

TP survey

Thanks

Kelvyna

From: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, September 11, 2018 3:56 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] Re: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.09. 18

Hi Kelwyna,

LKK Auto Consultants
Thanks,

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 2:54:04 PM

To: Lim Tien Siong

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SJIX7787Y dated 07.09.18

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mr Lim

We append the following list of our panel surveyors for survey without prejudice:-

AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
A-PAC Investigation Solutions Pte Ltd
Priority Services

RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants

JP KNIGHTS PTE LTD

L e

Please advise

Thanks
Kelvyna

“___*



From: Lim Tien Siong
Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 8:22 AM

To: kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com
Ce: generalClaims@sg.gaig.com
Subject: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.09.18

Hi Kelwyna,

Fyna.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to
any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in
any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment. \We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M)]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. IFyou are not the intended recipient kindly notify
us and delete this message and its atiachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing ar disclosing any contants
tharain is not allowed Statements pertaining to any matter oulside our business are not o be laken as endorsed by ComfarntDelGro Corporation
Limited or ifs related companiez. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subjedt to approvals Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding aoreemant between the parties. Neither pany shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agread in a
written agraemant signed by the duly authonsed representatives of both parties

ComfgnDaiGro - & Green Office cartified by the Singapare Environment Councl - is committad to presenving the environmant. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid [Registration Mo, 1559506048W)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solaly for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recigient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you recebve this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privil ] or prapretary information If you are not the intended recipient, kindly natify
us and Jelete this message and i3 attachments immediately, and please be sdvised that using, copying. distributing or disclasing any conlants

2




thergin is not aliowed. Statements peraining to any matter outside aur business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Coerporation
Limited or its related companies. The commants/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject 1o approvals Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agresment betwesn the parties Neither party shall be baund in any way to any term ar condition. exceplt as agreed ina
written agreement signed by the duly authornsed representatives of both parties

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Enviranment Council - is commidted to presenving the enviranment We encourdge you
o print this enly if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engingering Pte Ltd |Registration No 1995060480

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. I vou are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments,



H112018 Accident involving SHD3ES3P and your insured SJXTTATY daled 07 0918

“'Reply|v [ Delete Junk|v e

RE: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SJX7787Y dated
07.09.18

Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com> & 5 Reply | v
T Lim Tien Steng: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' < Kelvyna Mgizn@sg.gaig.com=;

'LKK Assignments' <assignments@lkkauta com>
Cr Roger How Keen Meng; - Tan Pel Wei =

To help protect your privacy, some content in this message has been blocked. To re-enable the blocked features, click
here

To always show content from this sender, click here
Dear Mr.Lim,
Thank you for the email.

We will arrange for the survey on 12/09/2018 before 12pm.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{q08033)

From: Lim Tien Siong [mailto:limts@cdge.com.sg]

sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 5:28 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna =Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; LKK Assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Roger How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg=; Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Accident involving SHD3693F and your insured SJX7787Y dated 07.09.18

Hi Nivitha,

Urgent !
Just answered your call.
GAIC assigned the survey to LKK

Please advise on your surveyor the timing for tomorrow.
Refer to below email.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

hitps:outlook office. comiowalprojection. asox 1/4



011172018 Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SJXTTETY dated 07.09.18

€' Reply | ¥ i Delete Junk|Y e

............ [ mm e e

To: Mgian, Kelvyna

Cc: Roger How Keen Meng; Tan Pei Wei

Subject: Re: Accident involving SHD3633P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.09.18

Hi Kelvyna,

Fyi - 48 hrs guide line ends tomorrow, 12/9 morning 08:30 hrs
Please advise your surveyor arrangement.

Without further delay, if we don't hear from you by 12/9 @ 09:30 hrs
we shall engage an independent surveyor for this claim.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

From: Lim Tien Siong
Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 3:55 PM
To: Ngian, Kelvyna

Subject: Re: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SJX7787Y dated 07.09.18
Hi Kelvyna,

LEK Auto Consultants.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna Ngian@sg.gaig.com=
sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 2:54:04 PM
To: Lim Tien Siong

Subject: RE: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.09.18
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mr Lim

We append the following list of our panel surveyors for survey without prejudice:-

AJAX Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
A-PAC Investigation Solutions Pte Ltd
Priority Services

RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

LKK Auto Consultants

iz i s

htlps:I.-'u:uutlonk.ofﬁce.mrn.‘r:nwa.'pmjection.aspx



9112018 accident invelving SHD3893P and your insured SJXTTETY dated 07.09.18

€ 'Reply|¥ [ Delete Junk|> e

Please advise

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Lim Tien Siong

Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 8:22 AM

To: kelvyna.ngian@sg gaig.com

Cc: generalClaims@sg,gaig.com

Subject: Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SIX7787Y dated 07.09.18

Hi Kelvyna,

Fyna.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Crash Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not
the intended recipient, kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be
advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining
to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to
approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound
in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised
representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the
environment, We encourage you to print this only if necessary.

SBS Transit Ltd [Registration No. 199206653M]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information, If you are not the intended recipient, kindly
notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately. and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any
contents therein i not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not ta ba laken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its related companies, The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals.
Nothing herein shall constiute a binding agreement between the parties, Neither party shall be bound in any way to any tarm or condition
except as agraed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of baoth parties.

ComfortiDelGro - 8 Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - 18 committed to preserving the environment. We ancourage
you o print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Englneering Pt Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

The content af this e-mail message and any anachments are confidenmal and may be iegally privileged, intended solely for the addresses If wou are nat the intended

recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, of capying of this e-mail i strictly prohibited. I you receive this message in errof, please notify the

htinsioutinok office comiowalproiection. asox



91172018 Accident involving SHD3693P and your insured SJXTTETY dated 07.09.18

S Reply|v [ Delete Junk|v  ee»

Thiz massage and any attachments may contain confidential, privileges or propristary information. If you are niot tha Intended reciplent. kindly

notify us and delets this message and ils allachments immediately. and please be advised that using, capying, distributing of disclosing any
cantents thersin & not aliowad, Statemenis partaining 1o any mattar oulside our busingss are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro
Corporation Limited or its ralated companies, The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject o approvals.
Nathing harsin shall constituts a hinding agreament betweean the paries, Neither parly shall be bound in any way to any term ar canditian
except 85 agreed in 8 written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatves of both parties.

ComiorDelGre - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Envirenment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage
voul to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Enginearing Pie Lid [Registration No. 199508048W]

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software,

AVG logo
WWW.avg.com

https:/outiook office. com/owalprojection. asps 414



OMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

fmember of COMPORIDELCGRD

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
Mariine + 55 8353 86k Fucteie - 65 4280 7es
Wnrhshups

& Loyang O

w] S0 il ;lEI
Fadsn Hog

Date/Tima: 08092018 11: 35

'la.l

Paga v 1

Team:  ARC Repair TP(CLS0)1 ~  JOB CARD ‘Sales Order: Jo O 305210105
- COMFORT TRANSPORT 1 semssse ' - |
o Jotooss A M wyuwoar s
E: Singapore smsagg% 575717 M 1-a0. éﬁﬁf%fﬁ 17:05 |
o !' YA OF Mn% 02.2015 TARGET DATE
— y - IF CHASSIS CﬁﬁLB:llUHF’U 064570 COMPLETION DATE/TIME

_ JOB DESCRIFTION i
Accident Date: 07.09.2018 |
NATURE: 3P 07.09.18 I
S/NO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION OV |
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE (j f*‘ ’\_/(_ "L[\

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO

CUSTOMER: 7010045 REGN NO

ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD MILEAGE
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL

65508755 DATE OF REGN

DATETIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

L~

Date; 10.09.2018
Time: 08:14:52

Page: | ‘_['_<)
_--"':-_";'_"
—
05210105
SHD3693P

oooooooooo [ % ()
HYUNDAI

1-40

05.02.2015

07.09.2018 17:05
07.09.2018

JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION E"Lti'i l \ < Gt {_‘l-’tfg.l QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

(001 04-01-0103-0579-G  REAR BUMPER 1 553.00 20,00 442.40 rqﬂ‘u'*"

0002 04-01-0101-0111-G  REAR BUMPER CLIPS
0003 04-01-0103-0907-G  REAR BUMPER SIDE BRKT LH 1

0004 04-01-0103-0658-G  REAR WHEEL CAP LH

N
0L 22.00 2000 17.60 A*€ K

3560 2000 2848 )X Y
1 15070 2000 12056 Y F

SUB-TOTAL (0904
JOB NATURE
0000 T PANEL BEATING W [0
0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED ARFA 25900 488 200
SUB-TOTAL 530.00
TOTAL 1,139.04

L k mﬁ
MV A NAME & SIGNATURE

DATE :

SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE

B (F»w-

AUTHORISED : YES / NO




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PIELTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS)

CUSTOMER: 7010043

ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
383 SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717
65508755

JOB / PARTS DESCRIFTION

JOB MO

REGN NO
MILEAGE

MAKE

MODEL

DATE OF REGN
DATETIME IM
ACCIDENT DATE

Date: 12.09.2018
Time: 17:26:21
Page: 1

3052101035
SHD34693P
0000000000
HYUNDAI

[-40

05.02.2013
07.09.2018 17:05
07.09.2018

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

PART REQUISITION

JOB MATURE
0000 L PANEL BEATING
0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA

L

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE : DATE :

SUB-TOTAL :

100.00

200.00

SUB-TOTAL

TOTAL

0.00

300.00

300,00

AUTHORISED : YES/NO

SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE



.Lp.f‘,.ll,

COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING
Our Job Ref No a05210105
ComforDalGro Enginaaring Phe Lid
Data 13/08/18 55 Loyang Drive Singapore 508569
Fax: 6546 8156
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax:
Aftn RASUL
Wehicle Reg Na. SHD3E03P Date of Accident : 07-Sep-18

The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicls are as follows:-

1.  The repair job shali bill to: Great American Ins Co__ = SJXTTETY
2. The finglizad amount shall be:
ja}  Spare Parts after List discount NIL
{b)  Labour Charges $300.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost $300.00
{c) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost afler Less: 20%
Final Lumpsum Repalr cost
3. Estimated normal period for repalrs: 2 working days.
4 ‘We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you
within 7 working days
5, Thank you for your assistance. We confirm the estimates and
finalized amount
Signature : u ‘ E t Signature
MNamea LIMTS Name RASUL
Tel : 52148398 Date '}IIU‘L ,’L}
L
Fax 65468156 {
E sa 0nl
Documaent 2
ltem Amount Attached ?;g{;?uig Remarks
Yes or No
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Pald NO
3, Survey Fees s snman-
4. LTA Search Fee £7.49
= Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)
Cvermun

Remarks:




! ' P4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al JB B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607188R G5T Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref :  CS/GAIMB01657T/R1sd3n2
N
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date : 256-09-2018
SINGAPORE 039150
Code @ GAI
1. Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SN TTETY Veh. Inspected SHD 3693P
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. SJXTTETY Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  KELVYNA NGIAN Assign Date 11/08/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYLUNDAI 40 1.7L c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req. 2015
Chassis No. KMHLE41UMFUDE4570 Colour BLUE
Odometer 411916 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RfH Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 WEST LAKE & mim
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/09/2018 Inspection Date 12/09/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAFORE 508569
5a. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BIIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' B P4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

& ,‘.' ; ; s 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/—. TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-5607158-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 3693P

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition
Y pd Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 553.00 -
LABOUR
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 22.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE BRKT LH SERVICEAELE a5.60
1|REAR WHEEL CAF LH SERVICEABLE 160.70 L
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -152.26 -
6049 04 -
LABOUR
PANMEL BEATING INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 280.00 100.00
BUMPER
SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA. 250.00 200.00
530.00 300.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,139.04 300.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 300.00
Report Ref No. CS/GAI18016577/R1sd3n2
M ‘g‘
MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng.AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appralser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely lor the use and benefit of the Client named on tha front page of this Report.

o ary Lhird party wio may realy on fbe Beporl wiwily of in e iy Shird g

Mo liability of mspensibility whatsoever, in Contaclor o
Beport. in whole o in part. does S0 at his or her own sk



