Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 December, 2018 3:47 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: 2nd -Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6395Y Our Ref:

17/18/18/VP05/020815 LKK REF CC4/LPC18016546/Gha3

Dear Vic,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all {N6W3 lonpac.com.sg

From: VIC (LKKAuto) [mallto wcalpeh@lkkauto com]
Sent: Saturday, 22 December, 2018 1:13 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: 2nd -Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6395Y Our Ref: 17/18/ 18/VP05/020815
LKK REF CC4/LPC18016546/Gha3

Your Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020815
Our Ref: CC4/LPC18016546/Gha3

Dear Gerald,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SJT 6395Y(0l) AND SJE 1852G (TP) ON 04/08/2018 ALONG BLOCK 320 JURONG

EAST STREET 31

We refer to the above matter.

We refer to the assignment dated 11% September 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our

Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a clear cut case where our Insured vehicle moved out from parking lot and collided to TP vehicle.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “KANG AUTO ENGINEERING PTE LTD" as below:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair S 5,107.28 S 1,850.00 ]
Loss of Use (5110 x 4 days) S 440.00 S 400.00 ($100 x 4 days)
LTA Search Fee S 2.00 S 7.45




TOTAL | $ 5,549.28 | $ 2,257.45

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor’'s recommended days to repair 4 days
TOTAL 4 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October, 2018 3:26 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: 2nd -Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6395Y Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020815

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

LPC ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020815
LKK REF: CC4/LPC18016546/Gha3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SJE 1852G
We have not authorized repairs.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

. TP estimated cost of repair

. Preliminary advice

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
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AUTO ENGINEERING PTE LID wvstoe
Sin Ming Auto City
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-16 Singapore 575722 Tel: 6556 0103 (Main Line) Fax: 6556 1015
Email: kangauto@singnet.com.sg

M/S Lonpac Insurance Bhd Date :30/11/2018
100 Beach Road #19-00
Shaw Tower DIRECT SETTLEMENT
Singapore 189702 Your Insured: SJT6395Y
To : Motor Claims Dept Our Ref: TP18/09/1121
LETTER OF DEMAND

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJE1852G & SJT6395Y ON 04.08.18 ALONG
CARPARK OF B/320 JURONG EAST ST.31.

Our Client's vehicle SJE1852G had been surveyed by your éppointed assessor
Mr Guo Xiang (LKK) and we had finalised the repair cost at S$1850.

Details of our Offer as follows:

Cost of Repair $ 1,850.00
Loss of Use ( $110 x 4 Days ) $ 440.00
LTA Search Fees $ 7.45

Total : $ 2,297.45

SGD TWO THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED NINETY-SEVEN AND CENTS FORTY-
FIVE ONLY.

YOURS FAITHFULLY,

NN
N\
\‘\ \ {\\ t\N\J\N\\

KANG AUTO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Specialised in :

« Motor Insurance Claims « Repairs all Types of Motor Cars ¢ Vehicle Inspection Services « Car Rental * Sourcing of Motor Insurance Premium



Your Insured SJT6395Y

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
100 Beach Road #19-00
Shaw Tower

Singapore 189702

To : Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sirs/Mdm
LETTER OF AUTHORITY

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE SJE1852G & SJT6395Y ON 04.08.18 ALONG
CARPARK OF B/320 JURONG EAST ST.31.

I, ONG CHIN SHENG owner of Motor Vehicle No. SJE1852G at all material
times of the above accident, hereby irrevocably authorise you to pay my
workshop, Kang Auto Engineering Pte Ltd , the compensation sum for my loss

and damage suffered in the above accident involving your insured motor vehicle
no. SJT6395Y.

Yours Sincerely,



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO  : 17/18/18/VP05/020815 Signed without prejudice fo

DATE : 18 JANUARY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, ONG__CHIN SHENG confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SJT 6395Y the sum of Singapore”Dollars
Two Thousand Two Hundred Fifty Seven and Cents Forty Five Only ($2,257.45) in
full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to
me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, SJE 1852G on 04 AUGUST
2018 along CAR PARK AT BLOCK 320 JURONG EAST STREET 31.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (NG WEE LING (HUANG
WEI LING) / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S KANG
AUTO ENGINEERING PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Name of vehicle owner/Date }ML“N%



INVOICE : 00002595

Bill To : Our Ref: - TP18/09/1121
Lonpac Insurance Bhd .
100 Beach Road #19-00 Date © 30/111/2018
Shaw Tower . ‘
Singapore Make/Model No : Mazda 6
Date Discharge : 08.10.18
Tel : 62507388
7 bescription Quantity | Unit Price Amount ‘
" Cost of Repair 1 $1,850.00 $1,850.00
Loss of Use 1 $400.00 $400.00
LTA Search Fees 1 $7.45 $7.45
1

Your Insured : SJT6395Y Ref no. CC4/LPC18016546

. B | pe |
Goods sold are not returnable. Total Payable $2,257.45

Specialised in Motor Insurance Claims. Repairs all Types of Motor Cars.
All Vicom Inspection Service, Sourcing "Cheaper Premium" for your vehicle.

Received the above in good order and condition

KANG AUTO ENG!NEERING PTE L_TD

J

Kang Auto Engineering Pte Ltd
Sin Ming Auto City 160 Sin Ming Drive #02-16 Singapore 575722 Tel: 65560103 (3Lines) Fax: 6556 1015
Email: kangauto@singnet.com.sg

Co. Reg. No: 200617880K



, :11M'['t‘;el'ﬁ‘.ntli'lﬂ"ati‘ R,

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006528-2

Print Date/Time : 04 Sep 2018/ 11:42:13
Receipt Date/Time : 04 Sep 2018/ 11:42:03
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-180204-000785
Previous Receipt No. ;
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S9) (S$) (S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SJT6395Y
As at 04 Aug 2018/20:00:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
1 Insurance Enquiry - SJT6395Y
Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20180904114123434426
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
Credit Card: Visa
XXXXXXXXXXXX 3858 IMastercard 7.45
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



