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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOF Rahate Frnsing

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 21331

Vehicle No.: SJE1852G

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 05 Oct 2018

Vehicle Make: MAZDA

Vehicle Model: MAZDAG6 4-DOOR SEDAN 2.0L SP.AEAT
Primary Colour: Blue

Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No.: PE20565780

Chassis No.: IM6GI1071F0144465
Maximum Power Output: 114.0 kW (152 bhp)
Open Market Value: $18,190.00

Original Registration Date: 27 Feb 2015

First Registration Date: 27 Feb 2015

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid:; $8,190.00

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 26 Feb 2025

PARF Rebate Amount: $6,142.00

COE Expiry Date: 26 Feb 2025

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $66,751.00

COE Rebate Amount: $42,692.00

Total Rebate Amount: $48,834.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Oct 2018

OK
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!’! Auto

Company Registration No. 109807 198R

(

S1URLAVE 1 #02-25 PAYA UBIH INDUSTHIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564312

Your rel; 178 8/VPOS/O20815 Date: O5/10/,2018
Our refl: CC4/LPC18016546/Gha3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SJE 1852G
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 04.10.2018
at the premises of M/s Kang Auto Engineering Pte Ltd - Sin Ming have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 35 5,107.28
Revised Estimate Amount : §% 2,319.20
"Check" Items Amount : S% -

Total (Including Check Items) b 2,319.20
Market Value : S$ - (est)
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8§ - (esL)
Nett Value t 58 - (est,)

Description of Damage: —
The vehicle sustained damages at the i i '| } jj o
N/S Portion =

s

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4.0 days

Y ours faithfully,

XING GUO QIANG
Licensed Appraiser



IKANG,

AUTO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Sin Ming Auto City

SN
TOP 100
PSME

SENMGA DKL

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-16 Singapore 575722 Tel: 6556 0103 (Main Line) Fax: 6556 1015

Email: kangauto@singnet.com.sg

M/S ONG CHIN SHENG POLICY NO THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
BLK319 JURONG EAST OURREF : TP18/09/1121
STREET.31, #12-52 VEHICLE NO : SJE1852G
SINGAPORE 600319 MAKE/MODEL : MADAZ6

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 04.08.18
| PC REARBUMPER X etmar 607.55 X
1 SET REARBUMPERCLIPS  #€€ 13.50 7
I PC REAR BUMPER LH RETAINER X MY 16.05 ¥
1 PC REARR/HFENDER X uzm 661.20 ¥
1 PC REARR/H FENDER INNER SHIELD X A7 64.80
1 PC PETROLCOVER X MV 89.00 v
1 PC REARLHDOOR _~ furc 121050 /
1 PC REARLH DOOR REGULATOR X 569.00 ¥
1 PC REAR LHDOOR COVER s I 205.00 ¥
1 SET REARLH DOORHINGES X 85.00
1 SET REAR DOORSTONE GUARD .~ &<t 50.00
S$ 3571.60 '
LESS 20% 714.32
S$ 2857.28 (27, -
TO CHECK WIRING 5$ 50.00 X ~N/
TO TRANSFER NEW DOOR 120.00 e
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING ON REPLACED/REPAIRED PANEL 80.00 €o
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON DAMAGE PARTS 120000 Bee
LABOUR CHARGE 800.00 oo
S$ 510728

SGD FIVETHOUSAND ONE HUNDRED SEVE

e

-

YOU stéﬁ&_lff._!:,! FUW” '_ f P " K

St / Q,HW}:- N{’W MS

altsge: A,

KANG AUTO ENGINEERING PTELTD |

Specialised in :

« Mator Insurance Claims « Repairs all Types of Motor Cars

=3 f

N AND CENTS TWENTY-EIGHTY ONLY.

» \fehicle Inspection Services + Car Rental - Sourcing of Motor Insurance Premium
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[BEST AR R S e S ES e — s

From: ONGLUU

Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 9:55 AM

To: JOSELINE CHIA; MT_Claim_SG; assignments@lkkauto.com; catherine

Ce: kangauto@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJE1852G & SIT6395Y Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020815
H 4-§-18, 2 10 22 PM.IPG

Attachments: Fhoto 1 2 4 ‘!‘.FT\ @ “ﬂ & q h ‘

wthide nof \n
pusor QgNu

Without Prejudice
Dear May
Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for quantum(survey) & liability.

Dear Catherine/Nivitha

cr
Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254
Fax: (65) 6296 2706

----- Criginal Message----- Chabiis vus -
From: JOSELINE CHIA
Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 9:43 AM :]' Yes - Completed
To: MT_Claim_SG EE
Cc: kangauto@singnet.com.sg D N& - Reasan/s:
Subject: Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6395Y
- [
Dear Li Li and Gerald
oiticen U/V]
= ;
(\ or your action. _— lﬂ[q! 13

Best Regards

Joseline Chia

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 257 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

----- Original Message-----

From: kangauto [mailto:kangauto@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 4 September, 2018 11:59 AM

To: JOSELINE CHIA

Cc: JOSELINE CHIA

Subject: Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6395Y

>Motor Claims Dept

-

>Your Insured : SJT6395Y
=0ur Insured : SJE1852G




GERALD POH WEE BIN

anm: ONGLILI

Sent: Monday, 10 September. 2018 10:00 AM

To: assignmeants@Ikkauto.com; catherine

Ce. MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW" 2nd -Atcident involving SJE1852G & SJTE395Y Our Ref: 17/18/18/NP0O5/020815
Attachments: Accident Report.pdf; Accident Report Final.pdf

Dear Nivitha/Catherine

Part 2 of earlier email for your action.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254
Fax: (65) 6296 2706

m: JOSELINE CHIA
went: Monday, 10 September, 2018 9:44 AM
To: MT_Claim_5G
: kangauto@sin .com.s
Subject: FW: 2nd -Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6395Y

Dear Li Li and Gerald
For your action.

Best Regards

Joseline Chia

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 257 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

(r ---Qriginal Message-----

rom: kangauto [mailto:kangauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Tuesday, 4 September, ZDIB 12:00 PM

To: JOSELINE CHIA

Cc: JOSELINE CHIA; JOSELINE CHIA

Subject: 2nd -Accident involving SJE1852G & SIT6395Y

>----0Original Message----

>From : kangauto@singnet.com.sq

>Date : 04/09/2018 - 11:59 GMT+8

>To : JOSELINECHIA®lonpac.com

>Cc : JOSELINECHIA®@lonpac.com

>Subject : Accident invoiving SJE1852G & SIT6395Y
=

>>Motor Claims Dept

2

>>Your Insured : SJT6395Y

==>0ur Insured : SJE1852G
=

>>»Date of Accident ; 04/8/2018




GERALD POH WEE BIN

— s —
From: ONG LI LI
Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 5:59 AM )
To: JOSELINE CHiA: MT_Glaim_SG; assignments@lkkauto.com; catharing
Cc: kangauto@singnelcom.sg
a::.lb}act: RE: Accident involving $JE1852G & SJTEISEY Our Rel 17/ 8/18A/POSA020815
Attachments: Photn 4-8-18, 2 10 22 PM.JPG

Without Prejudice

Dear May

please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for guantum{survey) & liability.
Dear Cathering/Nivitha

fya

Regards,

Ong Li Li

==nior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

_J0 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254
Fax: (65) 6296 2706

o~

----- Original Message-----

From: JOSELINE CHIA

Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 9:43 AM
To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: kangauto@singnet.com.sg
Subject: Accident involving SJE1852G & SJTB395Y

Dear Li Li and Gerald

For your action.

Best Regards
gwseline Chia
enior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 257 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

----- Original Message-----

From: kangauto [mailto:kangauto@singnet.com.sd]
Sent:; Tuesday, 4 September, 2018 11:59 AM

To: JOSELINE CHIA

Cc: JOSELINE CHIA

Subject: Accident invoiving SJE1852G & SJT63935Y

>Motor Claims Dept

-

>Your Insured : SJT6395Y

>Qur Insured : SJE1852G

=

>Date of Accident : 04/8/2018

>Location : Carpark roundabout of B/320 Jurong East St.31

>

>Please find attached report, scene photos for your reference.

1



h_ﬂei Kvﬂ {LKKAu_tu]

= # ——— ——
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 4:19 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuUto)
Cc MT_Claim_5G
Subject: RE: 2nd -Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6395Y Our Ref. 17/18/18/VP05/020815
Attachments: 11092018161511.pdf
Categories: HMEK

Dear Mei Kwan,

Attached copy of insured's GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

-----Original Message--—-

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 3:39 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_SG; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: 2nd -Accident involving SIE1852G & SJT6395Y Our Ref: 17/18/ 18/VPO5/020815

LPC ref; 17/18/18/VP05/020815
LKK REF: CCA/LPC18016546/ha3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Please take nate that the case handler in-charge Is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: Meikwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
##02-25 | S(408933)

----- Original Message-----
From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)



To: JOSELINE CHIA
Cc: JOSELINE CHIA; JOSELINE CHIA
Subject: 2nd -Accident involving SIE1852G & SJT6395Y

>----0Original Message---

sFrom : kangauto@singnet.com.sg

>Date : 04/09/2018 - 11:53 GMT+8

>To : JOSELINECHIA@lonpac.com

>Cc ¢ JOSELINECHIA@lonpac.com

>Subject : Accident involving SIE1852G & SIT6395Y
-

=>Motar Claims Dept

>2

s==Your Insured : SJTE395Y

>>0ur Insured : SIE1852G

-

>=Date of Accident : 04/8/2018

>sLocation : Carpark roundabout of B/320 Jurong East 5t.31
b0

>>Please find attached report, scene photos for your reference.
>

>>Please assist reply on claim officer in-charge.

>>Please revert liability on this claim.

o5

»>>Car not in.

3

>>Yours Sincerely,

==May Ang

-



Catherine ChunE (LKK Auto) _

From: ONG U U <llong@lonpac.com:

Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 9:59 AM

To: JOSELINE CHIA; MT_Claim_5G; assignments@lkkauto.com; catherine

Cc: kangauto@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJE1852G & SJT6355Y Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020815

Attachments: Photo 4-8-18, 2 10 22 PMUPG

Without Prejudice

Dear May

Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for quantum(survey) & liability. %
"\M\S

Dear Catherine/Nivitha

fya @ SR

Regards, \\ h[\'}m D

Ong Li Li \ji\,ﬁ 1k

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555 Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

----- Original Message-----

From: JOSELINE CHIA

Sent: Monday, 10 September, 2018 9:43 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc: kangauto@singnet.com.sg

Subject: Accident involving SJE1852G & 5IT6395Y

Dear Li Li and Gerald

For your action.

Best Regards

Joseline Chia

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 257 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: kangauto [mailto:kangauto@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 4 September, 2018 11:59 AM

To: JOSELINE CHIA

Cc: JOSELINE CHIA

Subject: Accident involving SIE1852G & SIT6395Y

>Mator Claims Dept
=
>Your Insured : SITB395Y

=0ur Insured : SIE1852G
b




- >Date of Accident : 04/8/2018

>Location ; Carpark roundabout of B/320 Jurong East 5t.31

>

>Please find attached report, scene photos for your reference.
>

>Please assist reply on claim officer in-charge.

>Please revert liability on this claim.

>

>Car notin,

-
>Yours Sincerely,
=May Ang



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408913
TEL: B255 3661 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 18-5607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CC4/LPC18016546/Gha3n2
#17:04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 199555 DSt 90012018 ” ‘"‘I“"‘l”l"mml
Code: LPC2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJT 6385Y Veh. Inspected SJE 18526
Policy No. Z17VP05015480 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 17/118/1B/VPOS/020815 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GERALD Assign Date 10/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDAB c.c 1998
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. JMBGJ10T1F01 44465 Colour ELUE
Odometer 94892 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/55 R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/55 R17 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 MICHELIN 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  04/08/2018 Inspection Date D4/10/2018
Survey held at KANG AUTO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
160 SIN MING DRIVE #02-16
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722
5a, Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




/|

ey

| Pl V4

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJE 1852G

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Fage No..1 of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop {{ﬂ {ijl
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 607.55 -
LABOUR
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 13.50 13.50
1|REAR BUMPER LH RETAINER NOT NECESSARY 16.05
1|REAR R/H FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 661.20
LABOUR
1|REAR R/H FENDER INMNER SHIELD NOT NECESSARY 64.80
1|PETROL COVER NOT NECESSARY 89.00 -
1|REAR LH DOOR BUCKLED 1,210.50 1.210.50
1|REAR LH DOOR REGULATOR NOT NECESSARY 569.00 7
1|REAR LH DOOR COVER NOT NECESSARY 205.00
1|SET REAR LH DOOR HINGES MNOT NECESSARY B5.00 -
1{SET REAR DOOR STONE GUARD SCRATCHED 50.00 50.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -714.32 -254.80
2,857.28 1,018.20
ILABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING, NOT NECESSARY 50.00
TO TRANSFER NEW DOOR . 120.00 B60.00
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING ON REPLACED/ REPAIRED B0.00 40.00
PANEL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT ON DAMAGE PARTS. 1,200.00 800.00
LABOUR CHARGE.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 800.00 400.00
BUMFER AND REAR R/H FENDER .
2,250.00 1,300.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,107.28 2,319.20
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,850.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/LPC18016546/Gha3n2
I
XING GUO QIANG HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor




