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51 URIAVE 1, #8225 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARE, SINGAPORE $08033 TEL - (065} BISRAER1 FAX D (0651 62564315
Yourref: DI8005108MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCI18016545/Kvd3 Date : 17/9/2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SLG 1938]

We thank for your instruction on 11/9/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

124/9/201 at the premises of M/s ~ CHENG HOE MOTOR FTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §$947.28
Revised Estimate Amount : 8892728
"Check"” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Yalue 1 5%

Nett Value 1 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear

front ofs door mirror,

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

Kenneth Kong
Licensed Appraiser



MS. Fi I'ﬁtca pital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Co®ee Mo 1950001000 CST Reg he. M2 00016709

£ Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapone Q48580
Tel: (65)6222 2311 Fac (B5) 6222 3547

Claima & Hator Undenwlting Dept: 35 Robinsan Road #L6-01 City House Singapore 0BBATT
Tel (B5)6507 3048 Fax: [55) 6507 3848
wiaiv, maficsteapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
29-06-2018 Our Ref No. D18005108MFSH
25-06-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHC1926L Third Party Vehicle, SLG1938J

BLK 1012 YISHUN IND. PARK A #01-374
JUNE
67556142/ 0 Fax No. 67557719

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

CHENG HOE MOTOR
PTELTD

MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

KARENT

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignmeant and 7 days for re-inspection,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 2:24 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'

Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005108MFSH/1, SLG 1938)
Attachments: SLG 1938) PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLG 1938]
Date of survey: 12/9/2018
Number of days : 1 day

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 3:09 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <suri@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005108MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

(G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 2:27 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18005108MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

1



Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. WWW.aVE.com




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 1

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
43588

SLG1938)

No

03 Sep 2018

TOYOTA

COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT
Red

2016

1ZRY 328339
MRO53REH104556696
90.0 kW (120 bhp)
$17,982.00

23 Sep 2016

23Sep 2016

1

$17,982.00

Yes
22 Sep 2026
$13,486.00

22 Sep 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$51,506.00

$41,476.00

$54,962.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Sep 2018

hﬂps:fz’vrl.lta‘gnv.sgf]tafvrlfactinnfenquireRebaleB}fPubli{:BefﬂrcDeregl

... 03/09/2018



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd [ G
' Bik 1019, Yishun Indusirial Park A #01-374/382, Singapore 768701 h I,-' A
TEL: 67556142 (Y1) FAX: 67557719 (Y18} Fmail: chmatori@singnet.com.sg £y f v
GST:201001158E RCB NO:201001158F . -
M/S: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
36 ROBINSON ROAD Estimate No: ES1891052/YISHUN
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Date: 12 Sep 2018
SINGAPORE 068877 Policy No: 5194394014
TEL: 65073848 FAX: 65073849 Veh Reg No: SLG1938)
ATTN: Motor Claim Department Make/Model: TOYOTA TOYOTA
ez 7 hgak/ COROLLA ALTIS
CLASSIC 1.6CVT
WS Ref: TP/FC/YS ﬁ forrey 4 {/ﬂﬁg,},.f Chassis No: MRO53REH104556696
Claim Type: Third Party Engine No: 1ZRY328339
Accident Date: 25/06/2018 Reg. Date: 23/09/2016
/e
TP Veh Reg No:  SHC1926L 4
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLG1938J
Description U/Price Quantity List Price Amount
8% S5
List Price
| RH SIDE MIRROR 1,089.70 pc €24 108070 —
1,089.70
Less 25% 27243 g17.2%
Labour
3  REMOE & REFIX FRT RH SIDE MIRROR & CHECK SYSTEM 50,00 | LA 50,00 e
PUTTY & RESPRAY ON FRT RH SIDE MIRROR 8000 I LA 80,00 c{g{
130.00 1 30040
Total 5% 947.28
Add GST @ 7% 6631
Total Amount Pavable S5 1,013.5%

For Cheng Hm:_f!\rlumr Pte Lid
! |

N

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey baforefafiar spray pamiing

« To display damaged partis) dufing resunsey
» Parts prices are &
» Third party swnve

to confirmation

« Mo illegal modificationis) 15 allowed
« Sypplementary tem(%) must be resurveyed and
is gubiect 10 final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowiedged by Repamar

Without Prejudice” basis

AL

i
'HORISED SIGNATURE



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-96071%8-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 063877

Ref CS/FCI18016545/Kvd3n2

Date : 20-12-2018

[IRTAFAA

Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 1926L Veh. Inspected SLG 1938)
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18005108MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From KARENT Assign Date 11/08/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALTIS (A) C.C 1598
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MROS3IREH104556696 Colour METALLIC RED
Odometer 52833 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 NEXEN 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R18 MEXEN 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 DUNLOP 5 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE WVEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT /S DOOR MIRROR,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  25/06/2018 |inspection Date 12/09/2018
Survey held at CHENG HOE MOTOR PL
BLK 1018 YISHUN IND. PARK A
#01-374/282
SINGAPORE 768761
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED OM A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

1 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5LG 1938J

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page MNo..1 of 1

. i Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
ety P Workshop (8)|  (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RH SIDE MIRROR CRACKED 1,089.70 1,089.70
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2T2.42 -272.42
817.28 B17.28
LABOUR
REMOVE & REFIX FRT RH SIDE MIRROR & CHECK 50.00 50.00
FUNCTION
PUTTY & RESPRAY ON FRT RH SIDE MIRROR. B80.00 &50.00
130.00 110.00
GRAND TOTAL 947.28 927.28
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 927.28

/44

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report [s made sobely for the use and benefit of the Chant named on the fropl page of this Reporl

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016545/Kvd3n2




