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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>
Sent: Thursday, 1 October 2020 4:51 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: LOD for SJT 6218 B //LKK REF: CC4/III18016493/Upa3

Dear Hsiao Tong , 
 
We do not posses any video footage. 
 
Due to conflicting statement , Let us close at 50% 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Shanelle Lim 
 

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
#02-24, Singapore 415875 
Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: claims@rico60.com 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Saturday, 7 September 2019 1:47 PM 
To: Rico 60 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: LOD for SJT 6218 B //LKK REF: CC4/III18016493/Upa3 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that liability is unclear as our insured driver reported that “No Collision”. Attached is a copy of 
our insured accident report for your easy reference. 
 
As per III instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our 
necessary action. 
 
Appreciate an early reply. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>  
Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 3:59 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LOD for SJT 6218 B 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Do you have any update(s) for the mentioned claim? 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Jin Hai 
 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD. 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
#02-24, Singapore 415875 
Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060 
Email: claims@rico60.com 
 

From: Rico 60 
Sent: Monday, 10 December 2018 10:35 AM 
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) 
Subject: LOD for SJT 6218 B 
 
Dear Vivian, 
 
Attached file as per your pursuant. 
Kindly release DV/cheque. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Yvonne Teoh 
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