Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 September 2018 9:44 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Re: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD5902U & FBF4177S ON 6.9.2018
Attachments: 21092018094142.pdf

Our Ref :17/18/18/vC00/020883

Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20 September, 2018 7:07 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Re: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD5902U & FBF4177S ON 6.9.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Our case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 3:23 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Re: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD5902U & FBF4177S ON 6.9.2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 2:01 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Re: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD5902U & FBF4177S ON 6.9.2018

Dear Nivitha/Catherine,

Kindly proceed with the pre-repair survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Sg Motor [mailto:sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sq]

Sent: Friday, 7 September, 2018 1:50 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: Fw: Re: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD5902U & FBF4177S ON 6.9.2018

Thank You

Regards

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd
Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622



Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

----- Forwarded message -----

From: Sg Motor <sgmotor2000@yahoo.com.sg>

To: Sg motor enterprise Giam <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018, 1:48:01 PM GMT+8

Subject: Re: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD5902U & FBF4177S ON 6.9.2018

Plse arrange Mohamad Taufikh to survey bike FBF 4177S.

Thank You

Regards
Leena

SG 98 Motor Pte Ltd

Blk 4001 #01-21

Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1
Singapore 569622

Tel: 64524898 Fax: 64526898

On Friday, 7 September 2018, 12:26:11 PM GMT+8, Sg motor enterprise Giam <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>
wrote:

----- Forwarded message -----

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

To: sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg <sg_motor_enterprise@yahoo.com.sg>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ionpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018, 12:20:21 PM GMT+8

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD5902U & FBF4177S ON 6.9.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref :17/18/18/VC00/020883

Dear Rose,

Please see attached and revert.



Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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