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- Pre repair inspection request - SJV402F VS SLTAEEGK (O1) DOA 03092018
From  Milhoosingh, Asstwaenjastiaw

To edmir-a@ikkauio com, assignments@ikkauo com

Ce: Tan, Lily (AIG), Fong, Andy-8Y, Kaur Baljit, Chen, Lee-Ying. Abu Kassmm, Moor Marssa, Md Ishak Mehd Imran. Lim, Sheng Yang, Azlen, Syazairging, Chan, Yoke Shi
Gara 12018 Bd8 30 AN

Altachments = {Eng-807 8 41Ea ol

Hi,
Please refer to the enclosed request from Kuru & Co,

Claim no TEE70981555G003
Case Cwner JACLYHN MANLAM KESAVAL

If yeu have any queriesicancams, please let us know.
Kindly assist to ossign Marcus Chua as Single Joint Expert as requested,

Thanks and regards,

Aashweenjeet Kaur (Aashwoen)

ANG

Express Claama Adjusier 11

5G Clamms Operations | AG Shared Services

From: Kuru & Co [railto:kurulegal@yahoso.com,sg)

Sent: Friday, September 07, 2018 6:01 PM

To: Chan, Yoke Shi

Ce: Tan, Lily (AIG); Fong, Andy-5Y; Kaur, Baljit; Chin, Leg-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh,
Aashweenjeetkaur; Azlan, Syazairdina

Subject: Re: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLTBEESK AND 5Iv402F ON 03/09/2018

Dear Sirs

Owur client is agrecable o the following surveyor as the S1E: Marcus Chuw/LKK Auto Consultants Fre Lid

Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client's vehicle at the following address;
M-TECH MOTOR SERVICES

Blk 9005 Tampines St 93 #01-252
Singapore 528839

Tel: 9735 45367/Mr Chan

Please mstruct your survevor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and eom plete the pre-repair survey within 2 working days of his
appointment,

Kindly let us have the pre-repair andior post repair survey report upon completion of the survey,

As solicitors on record, our client shall look 1o you for payment of our legal costs plus dishursements should you reach a direct settlement with our
client's repairer.

Regards
Anne
Kouru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-06 Fook Hai Building
Singapore 058727

Tel: 6332 2009

Fax: 6532 2007

From: "Chan, Yoke Shi <yokeshi.chan@aig. coms>

To: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo com sg>

Ce: "Tan, Lily (a1G)* <Lily. Tan@aig com=: "Fong, Andy-5Y" =Andy-3Y. Fong@aig.com>; "Kaur, Baljir <Baljt Kaur@aig.com=; "Chin, Lee-Ying" <Lee-

Ying Ching@alg com>, “Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa® <MoerMariesa AbukassimiZaig.com=, “Md Ishak, Mohd Imran® <imran,|shakDaig.cams; "Lim. Sheng Yang"
=ShengYang, Lim@aig.com>; "Mithoosingh, Aashwesnjestkaur™ <Agsh, jeatkaur Mithoosingh@aig. com:=: "Azian, Syazairding®

=Syazairding Azlan@alg.com=

Sent: Friday, 7 September 201 8, 14:40

Subject: - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED WEHICLE SLTRBBGK AND SJV40ZF ON 03092018
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From: yoxeshi chan(@alg com

To: kunulegak@yahoo com sg

ez Lily. TangDaig com  Andy-5Y Fengiffaip com  Balt. Keuri@alg com | Les-

ing. Chingliag.com Nooddariesa Abulassim@aig com Imran. Ishakiaig.com . ShengYang Limaig com Aashwaenjsstkaur Mithoosingh@aig com Syazairdna Azlanaig.com
Subject: sipancrypt - FRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SLTSESEK AND SJVA02P ON 0302018

Date: Fri, 7 Sep 2018 08:40:33 +D000

Without Prejudi

Your Reference LB 1324 AT

Our Reference D THATO981955G003
Dear SirMadam,

W refer to your Notice of Accident of even date,

We intend 1o conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage ta vour client’s’your customer's vehicle jointly with your client'vour motor workshop. We propose o use
one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint pee-repair survey as & single joint expert:

Name of Surveyor Company Name
Ken Wong AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
Kumar Uthaya AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pe Lid
| Fong Soon Yee AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid
Lawrence Mg Chun Kee Priority Services
Jeffrey OngT_enE Kiat Priority Services
Jimmy Lee Priority Services
EC Looi Automobile Inspection Services Pre Lid

Pang Kigh Keen (Frankie)

Formteam Adjusters Ple Lid

Ng You Han Formteam Adjusters Pie Lid
Soon HanXin (Gary) Formicam Adjusters Pe Lid
Chow Bo Xiong Formteam Adjusters Pie Lid
Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin) Formteam Adjusters Ple Lid
Kalvin Ang LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid
Ming Giuo Qiang LEK Aute Consultants Pre Lid
Marcus Chua LKK Auto Consultams Pre Lid
Mohamad Taufikh LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Adrian Ling LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Mohammed Rasul LKEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Kenneth Kong LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree 1o the appointment of any of these moter survevors as a single joint expert. You may

select o2 of more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.



Thank you,

Ragarda,

Yoke Shi @ Ashley
AlG

Claim Admster ||, Singapors FNOL, Claims Oiperations — Auto

From: Kuru & Co [mailte: kurulegal@vahon.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, Septerber 07, 2018 2:18 PM

To: Lim, Sheng Yang; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Fong, Andy-5Y
Subject: Our Ref: L 18132487/ Your ref: SLT BR3EK,/PRS

Dear Sirs

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJV 402P & SLT 8886K ON 03.00.2018

ALONG MCE TUNNEL TOWARDS ECP

NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

We act for Foong Sun Shipping Pte Ltd, whose vehicle registration number SV 402F was damaged in the sbove accident,

A copy of the Accident report filed is enclosed,

As 85 resull of the accident, our elient's vehicle has been damaged. Before our elient proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know
within 2 working days of vour receipt of this notice whether you would like w conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle.

If'we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeling, our client shall procesd to repair the vehicle without further reference to ¥OuL

Regards

Anne

Kuru & Co

150 South Bridge Road
#04-046 Fook Hai Building
Singapore (58727

Tel: 6532 2009

Fax; 6532 2007



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 1
> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 0969N
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SIV402P
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 12 Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: FIAT
Vehicle Model: DOBLO PANORAMA 1.4 M ACTIVE
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2009
Engine No.: 350A10005118293
Chassis No.: ZFA22300005691543
Maximum Power Qutput: 57.0kW (76 bhp)
Open Market Value: $15,767.00
Original Registration Date: 07 Jan 2010
First Registration Date: 07 Jan 2010
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $15,767.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 06 Jan 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $8.671.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 06 Jan 2020
COE Category: A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $6,848.00
COE Rebate Amount: $2,437.00
Total Rebate Amount: $11,108.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 12 Sep 2018
OK
https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTION_ID=F030... 12-Sep-18
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aloresaid.

Date Of Repor

Date OF Accident

Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

Wehicle Registration Number
InsuredPolicyholder
Mame Of Registerad Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone Mo
Vehicle Particulars
Manufaciurer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

lime of accident

Are you claiming under YOUF i insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Compary
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Numbes

Cover Noté Number
Driver

Mame af Drver

NRIC Mo

Date Of Birth
Cccupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Dwiving Experlence
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Comact Number
EMail Address

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
04/09/2018 10:04

D308/2018 1715

ALONG MCE TUNNEL TWDS ECP
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SIvipzp

FOONG SUN SHIPPING PTE LTD
1283000969N
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-63231133

FIAT
DOBLO PANORAMA 1.4 M ACTIVE

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

MT204 77095

D7/01/2018 - 0B/01/2019

NG KWEE KANG
S1589002]

25/071963

OUTDOOR

03/06/1986

32 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-85938266

MNOEMAIL

Any wiul misrapresentation & witholding of o ate=rizal E3085 MiEy a

Iy MSLIGANDE COMDartes §o

Page 1af 11



Address BLK 1 PINE CLOSE #08-177
Fostcode 390001

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES

It Mo, Relatienship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own -

Vehiclo -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Wealher Conditions CLEAR
Foad Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle invoived in this accident? NO

Number af vehicies involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NC
Was any injured conveyed (g hospital by NG
ambulance?

Was any other malerial o property damaged? YES
| hﬁl\l’f‘ been apprcact::?d by ur|kr1-:}\-.'n_p&r5-::n|:5] NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistancs,

Number of Passengers {Including Drivesr) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported ta the police? NG
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prozecution given? NOD

If Yes,against whom?
Cireumstances of Accident

ON THE STATED DATE AND TIME, | WAS DRIVING ALONG MCE AT THE EXIT OF ECP. SUDDENLY | FCLT AN IMPACT, MY
VEHRICLE MOVED TO THE FRONT AND | REALIZED VEHICLE B (SSLTBBBEK) HAD HIT ONTO REAR OF MY VEHICLE.

Attachment(s)
Are aceident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camarg? NG

Was there any audic recorded? M3
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SLTHBE6K

Vehicle MakeModel/Colour
Details OFf Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver ZHANG JIAN
NRIC/Passport Number SHOBET34D
Cantact Number

Address

Postoode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage
Mo. Of Passenger {Including Drivier)

Page 2 af 11



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

4 Pleasereport cartectly the detais of the actident 1o speed up the clams process:

L Thig Form must b tomglete o by the Poficyhaicer and/or the Authorised Drive

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate a5 possible Any wifu misrepresentation orwithholding of material
faets may alldw insurenoe campanies to repudiate poficy lizhility,

4. The issue and acceotance of this Form by imsuranice companies is nat an sdrmissian of pohey hability an vhe part of the insurance
COmparmegs

@ Any false reporting may be referred 1o the Paolice for investigation,

B Thertepors witt e forwarded by the insasders of the' GIA Records Managersent Centre eutabilished by the General Insurance
Assaciatian of Sngapore (GIA] far archiving and that copies of this reportwill f5r a fes be made avaidanle upon application by
Interested paities

7. By the bodgment of this repert to the insurers, you herehy consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and ta copées of
the repor being made avallable aforesald.

5. Consent under the Persanal Data Protection Act (PDPA)

I underatand, acknowledee, agres snd consent that:

[@ Wiy insurer, my workshop nd the General insurance Assocation of Singapore {7GRA%) may/are permitted to collect, use,
giscloge andfor process my personal datafpersonal information set out in thiz {form] and any other personal informatian
pravided by me or passessed by my insurer (collectively the “Porsanat Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Fersanal Information to all insurerfs) who hawe insyred vehicleis} involved in this accident fall imsureris) who have insurcd
wehiclels) invalved in this accident shali ba collectively referred to 25 the “Insurars”), the insurers’ Lwyers/law firmns, the
Manetary Authority of Smgapore and any relevant Bovernment agenoyfauthoriny [<uch as the oolice), far the purpaus(s)
of ;

i} processing, handling andfor d=aling with my claims Heiiding the settlement of the claimg and 3ty necessary
Investigations relating 1o the claims;

(i} mvestigating the accident sndior my elaims;

[} easring aut sndf s deating with my InStructions o § esponding ta any engusries by me;

{i] administering my clasms {including the mailing of correspondenes, statomiénts, invnices, reports or nobices to me.
which couid invalve distlosure of tertain personal dats sbait me ta Baing about delivery of the same 35 well 33 on the
esternal cover of envelopes/mall packages); and/oe

[v] comglying with apglicabde Baw in administering, pracessing, handng and/os deafing with my clalms.{collectively the
“Purposes”)

(b1 - all msurer{s) who have insured wvehicle(s] mvalved in this accident and the insurers’ lawyers/law firms, mayfare permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/ar process my Personal Infarmation far ong of move of the above Purpoces: and

[} my Personal infarmation may/can be disclasad by any of the Ingurers and/or GIA to their third Party service peovidars ar
agents(including their lawyers/law firms), which miay be sited outside of Singapare, fae ane ar more of the abovs Purpases.

{d] iy Personal Information will also be coiected snd ysad 1o camgile tlaims histary for the purposa of fraud datestion,
Imvestigation and management in presant and all future claims

[e]  theinformation sa collected under (d] sbove may be shared / disclosed:

i to sl insurers andior any other third Rartes that assist in evaluating, investigating, contrading or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agences as reasanably requ ed for the purpeess stated, or

with requirements ynder any reguiations, laws o tourt oodess
o«
L
Palicvhalder's Signature Dirlwer's Sng;n:.Tl.llr;_\l Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signatu-
Bate & Time: [1f dhriver is not the paliryholder) Hame;
Date & Time NREC/FIN Mo,

Page 34l 11



Blk 9005 Tampines St 93, #m -252 Tampines Industrial Park A Singapore 528839

Tel: 6784 0077 Fax 6788 3025
{Registration No. 260252/008)

Foong Sun Shipping Pte Lid

Estimate : TIO30172

Allsntion : Motor Claim Department

ot A MW/

I54,.

nf‘i/f

Date : 12/09/2018
Viehicle Num. : SJV 402 P
Make/Model : Fiat Dobio

Accident Date - 03092018
Claim No. :
Reference - MT/402/2018
Policy No. : MT20177096

SN  Quantity Particular Uinit Price Amount S
LIST ITEMS :
1. 1 Rear bumper - centre e 44000 —
2 1 Rear bumper-LH Qe 33000 —
a 1 Rear reflacior-LH /ﬁZ Lo 6000 __—
List TotalS$ : 830.00
LABOUR :
To respray accident affected parts 200 40000
To replace rear burnper, repair boot cover 3,['9 400.00
Labour Tolal 5§ : 800.00
3%
LEK Autp Consy'tants hence notify
the Fepairer of e f WITHg.
T iy el 1y paning
g resLreay
;:-'4.-_.,;-:.#‘ basia
roval from Insurance Compamy
wfndgad by Repaires
SingDollars : One Thousand Six Hundred Thirty Only
E. &0E Total 535 - 1,830.60
e

for M-TECH MOTOR SERVICES



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

L KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (ccregNo1sss07158R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ikkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CS/AIG18018426/UQD3N2

Date: 18/09/2018
REFERENCE
Handling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.  Policy No: 1700067219
Insurer:
. SIV402P Insured Vehicle No : SLT8886K
ehicle No @
Date of Loss:  03/08/2018 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 765709819556
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SJv402P
Make & Model: FIAT DOBLO PANORAMA, 1.4 Active (M) Engine No: 350A10005118293
Reg. Date: 07/01/2010 (Man. Year: 2009) Chassis No: ZFA22300005691543
Colour: Blue Odometer: 134933 km
Engine Capacity: 1368 cc
Market Value/Mew Car
Price: R
Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/New Car Price
MDITI HICLE TIME Y
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDIT FTYR
Front Tyre Size: 215/45R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/45R17
Front Left Side: Kumho B mm Rear Left Side: Kumho & mm
Front Right Side: Kumho & mm Rear Right Side: Kumho & mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre resds cepn
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  Diff %
Parts 830.00 747.00 83.00 10.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 800.00 650.00 150.00 18.75
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0,00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (53) 1.630.00 1,397.00 233.00 14.29
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) 1,100.00
Nett Amount (S5) 1,630.00 1,100.00 530.00 32.52
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 10/08/2018
Date Inspected: 12/09/2018 Inspected At: M-tech Motor Services (HQ)
BLK 9005 TAMPINES ST 93, #01-2562
TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
Singapore 528839
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: SHIAU CHAN

NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time ard place of inspechion stated karein. Such inspection has been carmed out to the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other fabiily wnder anmy other cincumstances (s hereby exprassly excluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fuse box=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 19/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
Mo. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 “‘REAR BUMPER-CENTRE Deformed/Dented 440 .00 F “440 00 FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER-LH Deformed 330.00F *330.00FL
3 1 *REAR REFLECTOR-LH Broken 60.00F *B0.00FL
F=Franchise part, L=ListitamDisc S
Sub Total (S§) 830.00 830.00
. List Itemn Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (S%) 0.00 83.00

Total Parts (S%) 830.00 747.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm 2fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 19/9/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Mo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Items

1 TO RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED PARTS New 400.00 300.00

2 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER,REPAIR BOOT COVER MNew 400.00 350.00
Gross Labour Cost (S%) 800.00 650.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https:f.’r,ingapnre.mcrimen.cnmu“ciaims;'indcx,ci"m'?fhgebox=MTRadjuslcr&f‘uscactionﬁg... 19/9/2018



