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Company Registration No, 139607194R

S1UBLAVE L, #02-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 04933 TEL « obaSi 62563361 FAN @ ilhS) 256015

Your ref: D18006354MESH

Our ref; CS/FCII8016379T1vd3

The Motor Claims Departiment

M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear SirMadam,

Date: 10/10/2018

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO_SK] 5308Y

We thank you for your instruction on

1192018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

8/10/2018 at the premises of M/s

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check” Items Amount
Total

Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
MNett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
ofs mirror

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A
Automohile Assessor

MOV MOTIVE PTE LTD

: 551,648.20

: 55641.70

: 55886.50

: 5%

5%

1 5%

1 5%




MS @ FirstCapital

B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel (656222 311 Fax (B5)62c¢ 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg ho 1950001060 GST ek ha, M2 -0001676-4

Claims & Moter Underwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #1E-O1 City House Singapore OBEETT

Tel: (B5) G507 3848 Fax (656507 3849
wwnwi mstirsteapital. com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
24-08-2018 Our Ref No.
17-08-2018 Claim Type.
SHA300YL Third Party Vehicle.

BLOCK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/08/08
NITHA

62723882/ 0 Fax No.
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18006354MFSH

Third Party

SK.5308Y

62708314

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE

'TD Attention,
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No.
JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 11:14 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System'

Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006354MFSH/1, SKJ 5308Y
Attachments: SKJ G3I08Y PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKJ 5308Y
Date of survey: 8/10/2018
Number of days : 1 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 4:57 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: JOANNEYONG@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006354MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer will arrange.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assipnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 4:52 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@EMSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.S5G; JOANNEYONG @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006354MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

1



Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

P5: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

’ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
. T wWww.avg.com




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 11:35 AM

To: ‘Jacelyn'; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SKJ5308Y - TR/FCI - MERCEDES BENZ E200 (DOA 17.08.2018)

Dear Jacelyn,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm finalize amount at Part-by-Part $ 1,528.20 @ 1 working day.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veran Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jacelyn <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 October 2018 5:27 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: FINALIZATION: SKJ5308Y - TP/ECI - MERCEDES BENZ E200 (DOA 17.08.2018)

Hi Taufikh,
Please find the attached ‘Marking Estimate’ & After-Paint’ photographs for your reference.

We propose the finalize amount at Part-by-Part $1,528.20. Kindly revert.

Best Regards,

Jacelyn Ooi

Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Lid

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd

This message is confidential and is for the use of the intended recipient only. If you have received this message in edror, please do not copy, disclose or use
its content. We would be grateful If you would notify us by email and delete the criginal transmission and any attachment from your syslem.

Any attachment to this e-mail may contain software viruses that could damage your computer system. Although we will take reasonable precaution to
minimize this risk, we do not accept any liability resulting from software viruses. Please carry out your own virus checks before opening any attachment.



Performa Invoice

06/08/2018

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 Robinson Road

#16-01 City House
Singapore 068877.

Page # - 1

Veh # - SKJ5308Y

Veh Model - MERCEDES BENZ E200
Performa# - CK507627

Claim# - TP /ck1%254%

ACC. Date .- 17/08/18

Terms . C.0D Days

@ MOVA

Automotiive Pta Ltd

Main Office:
Mova Building

Mo, 22, Jalan Kilang,
Singapore 159419

Tal: (65) 64763333
Fax: (B5) 6271 6891
WO TRV RCOINL S0

Workshop Dept:
Block 1008

Bukit Merah L
RO1-04506

Singapaore 159722

Toi . (65) 6272 3892

Fax: (G5} G270 8314

Aftention - XAD26 Remarks - mMF& 1S APR 301> (2012)
Mo.  Description Qty U.Price Amounts 5%
LIST ITEMS :
% SIDE MIRROR GLASS RH - CHECK NN 1 PC 6{;{(’ L
2 SIDE MIRROR HOUSING WITH MOTOR RH 1 PC 985.00 SE5.00
3 SIDE MIRROR INDICATOR LIGHT RH 1 PC 385.00 r.-vlfta""' 38500
4. SIDE MIRROR LOWER COVER RH 1 PC 128.00 ed- .~ 128.00
LIST TOTAL 5% 1,498.00
10% DISCOUNT 5% -148.80
1,348.20
LABOUR : -
TO REMOVE & REPLACE DAMAGED ITEMS. TO S ae
DIAGHNOSE FUNCTION 200.00
TGO SPRAY ON REPAIRED AREAS .j-l"':' ¢ 100.00
LABOUR TOTAL 5% 300.00
E.&0E
NOMN-TAX AMOUNT &
AMOUNT 5% 1,648.20
\ GST@ 7% 115.37
AT,
AMOUNT DUE S% 1,763.57

Customer's Sianature/Co. Stamp MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

LKK AutgConisuftants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey beforelafier spray pasnling
» To display damaged part{s) durng resurvey
« Parts prices are subject o confirmation
» Third party survey is on 8 “Withoul Prejudice” basis
» No fllegal modification|s) is aliowed
» Supplementary Mem(s) must De resurveyed and
is subsect 1o final approval from Insurance Coempany

Acknowlgdged by Repainer
Signature:
Date:

Tfpe 51
et

Lﬁ'ﬂ{Lc-([(S Q_J'r]“‘:u-f‘ o\
[y - I:'-.-\.:l-
&_. . ] /ﬂ"x
ij qf

sur @ [ it 2o ~
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 4083233

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Ref . CS/FCHMB01637THT 1vd3n2

esreohsunanorcoserr o o | [{HIHHIAA
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 2007L Veh. Inspected SKJ 5308Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18006354MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  JOANNE YONG Assign Date 07/09/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ E 200 c.c 1796
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2013
Chassis No. WDD21204B2A696255 Colour BLUE
Odometer 104594 Steering IN CRDER
Brakes IN ORDER Maodification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre 245/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/40 R18 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[245/40R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 24540 R18 MICHELIN & rmrm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S MIRROR.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date 17/08/2018 Inspection Date 0BM10/2018
Survey held at MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 1008 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3 #01-04/08/08 |
SINGAPORE 159722
5a, Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 1 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 256 4315

Reg. No: 199607T1%8R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKJ 5308Y
Description of Parts Condition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty 0 Workshop ($)|  ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|5IDE MIRROR GLASS RH (NPA) MOT NECESSARY -
1|SIDE MIRROR HOUSING WITH MOTOR RH DISTORTED 985.00 985 00
1|SIDE MIRROR INDICATOR LIGHT RH cuT 385.00 385.00
1|SIDE MIRROR LOWER COVER RH cuTt 128.00 128.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -149.80 -149.80
1,348.20 1,348.20
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLAGE DAMAGED ITEMS. TO 200.00 100.00
DIAGNOSE FUNCTION.
TO SPRAY ON REPAIRED AREAS 100.00 80.00
300.00 180.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,648.20 1,528.20
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 1,528.20|

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18016379/T1vd3n2

s

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

% g‘

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Automotive Assessor

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely Tor the use and banalit of iha Clisnd named on the Frond page of this Report.

Mo Bability of responsibility whalsoever, 0 contact of Lo,
Reparl in whole or inpan., doas o a8 his of hér o sk,



