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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 December 2019 9:59 AM

To: CWS Motor Claims

Cc: Karen Tan; assignments

Subject: RE: Request for (ECONOMICAL REPAIR VALUE AND REPAIR PERIOD) Ref: D18006658MFSH , 

SLZ4879B accident involving with SHD3076X on 06-09-2018

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Please be informed that the estimated repair period for vehicle SLZ 4879B is 8 days and the valuation as below: 

 

Market Value     : $24,000.00 (Est) 

LTA Rebate         : $17,130.00 

Nett Value          : $  6,870.00 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2019 3:08 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: Request for (ECONOMICAL REPAIR VALUE AND REPAIR PERIOD) Ref: D18006658MFSH , SLZ4879B accident 

involving with SHD3076X on 06-09-2018 

 

Please find below link to download document 

LKKPREREPAIRINSPECTION[1].PDF 

 

Dear Sirs,  

 

We refer to the captioned matter. 

Please let us have the ERV and Repair period . 

 

Yours Faithfully, 

Motor Claims Department 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd 

cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg 


