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SMAPNR PARFITNF Rahata Frmimn

>Backto OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner |1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 4656G
[ 1 0 | = R e e = RS- - Wi |
Vehicle No.: SLR&6796K
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: VOLKSWAGEN
Vehicle Model: NEW GOLF 1.4 AT 5K13G5
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2010
Engine No.: CAX586325
Chassis No.: WVWZZZ1KZBW112113
Maximum Power Qutput: 90.0 kW (120 bhp)
Open Market Value: $22,231.00
Original Registration Date: 29 Dec 2010
First Registration Date: 29 Dec 2010
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $22,231.00
OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility: No
OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility Expiry Date:
OPC Cash Rebate Amount:
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 28 Dec 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $13,338.00
COE Expiry Date: 28 Dec 2020
COE Category: A -Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $16,089.00
COE Rebate Amount: $3,697.00
Total Rebate Amount: $17,035.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Sep 2018

OK

Mpslivr ita gov.sgritaivriaction/enquiraenata s yrubhcHetoreUareginpulitUNU 1IUN_IL=SHUGSUAUUY | |



-~
-

¥ - 1 CNe 5 T
Foe < L SND & s
Estimate Repair For Vehicle SLR 6796 K ( VOLKSWAGEN New Golf 1.4 AT) <t wr, —Terdy e,
ltenneslc=glttlnn Parts _ _ ﬂlz Pricenli_gt R
1 Front bumper 1 § V118200 0T
2 Frontbumper side retainer UR @ $105.00 21 & 0§ &5 21000
3 Front bumper grille 1 $ T 30890 RH
4 Front bumper reinforcement 1 $ =4 eso.40 U\
5 Front radiator grille 1 $§ =07 S645R
6 Front bumper form RH 1 $ 56,0074 M ™)
7 Front headlamp RH 1 $ 490 1,01050 <.F
8 Front headlamp mount bracket RH 1 $ 288.00 4 +11-)
9 Front headlamp bracket RH 1 $ 194.10 7 1A\
10 Front fender RH 1 $ 620.10 X <
11 Front fender inner liner RH 1 $ 165.00 © &
$ 5,279.75
Less 10% § 527.98
$ 4,751.77
S/NETT ITEM
12 Front fog lamp RH 1 -$ 19% 20800 CF W
13 Front fog lamp mesH RH 1 oy 8 ~ 15850 ¢ &
14 Front fog lamp chrome ring RH 1 —5 45,007 A
15 Front headlamp fibra protector RH 1 set $ 50 180.00 MEC
16 Front number plate with casing 1 set 5 £ 120.00 5
17 Front fender under shield clips RH 1 set $§ -5 40.00 MET
18 Front radiator grille emblem 1 3 68.50 )/ M
19 Front bumper clips 1 set $ L0 4850 M=
Parts Total : $ 5,720.27
LABOUR CHARGES & MISC
20 Check wiring, lighting & focus headlight. $ 50.00 < O
21 To braking & re-seal front license plate at LTA. $ 120.00 “. )
22 Remove & replace all damaged parts, repair & realign. $ 900.00 ~D 7
23 Spray painting front fender, bonnet, front bumper .
and all affected portions. $ 100000 00
24 To diagnostic checks &resef. .. . oy $ 280.00
25 Anti-rust proofing » $ 100.00
vy Labour Total: $ 2,450.00
" b _: _"_"; 2‘13 Q Q
- Sub Total : § 8,170.27 s
Lump sum mtlrsﬂndjﬁgfknant $ 6,500.00
Estimated time required for repairs 8 days




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Hi,

Please assist. TP smart.

Thank vou
Best Regards,
Mel Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Melkwan@|kkauto.com>

Friday, 7 September 2018 10:05 AM

assignments

FW: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR6796K & SLC25X ON 5
SEPTEMBER 2018

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiRwan@lkkauto.com | fux 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 6 September, 2018 1:52 PM

To: customer.service@axa.com.sg; SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR6796K & SLC25X ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2018

Your Ref:

Our Ref: SLR 6796 K

6 September 2018

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way
#27-01

AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attn: Claims Department

Dear SirfMdm,

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 6796 K & SLC 25 X ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2018




We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 5 September 2018 at about 11.45 pm at Bideford
Road towards CTE(SLE) involving our client's vehicle registration number SLR 6796 K and vehicle registration
number SLC 25 X driven by your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed list of
10 recommended motar surveyors for our appointment.

Kindly note that If we do not hear from you by 10 September 2018 (Monday), 1400H, we will be forwarding our
proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your appointment, in accordance to the new regulations.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)

aslamotorsports@hotmail.com



Aut
| ) 7 F -

Bl Ba =B Pra Lid

S1 UBLAVE |, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 42563561 FAX : (165) 2S5

04 October, 2018

JORDAN ONG CHIN TIONG

BLK 265 BISHAN STREET 24

#03-130

SINGAPORE 570265

Dear Sir,

OUR REF : CC4/ASM18016345/Gwa3 // SBMO0UO6
YOUR REF : SLC 25X

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 25X & SLR 6796K ON 05/09/2018 ALONG/AT
BIDEFORD ROAD TOWARDS CTE (SLE)

We write 1o inform you that we are the appointed loss adjuster by your motor insurer,
AXA insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your motor policy.

We refer to the above subject matter. We have received third party claim(s) against
your motor insurance policy.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result
of the claim against your policy.

We highlight that this accident has not been reported to your insurer. Under the
Motor Claims Framework (MCF), you are required 1o report any accident with the
accident vehicle (whether damaged or not) within 24 hours or by the next working
day after the accident. The primary purpose of this reporting is to provide your
version of the accident to AXA. Omission to report the accident will result in a loss of
your No Claim Discount (NCD) upon renewal of your policy, and will prejudice any
claim(s) by or against you. We would appreciate it if you could urgently file a report
at our approved reporting centre.

The report has to be lodged at any of AXA Premium Workshops or reporting centres
(subject to your policy). For the list of AXA Premium Workshops conveniently located
throughout Singapore, please refer to the back of your Certificate of Insurance or the
accompanying folder, or visit htips://www.axa com.sa/customer-care/personal/motor
/owndamageaccidentreporting.

Your full co-operation is required. Kindly submit the following when lodging the
report which list is not all inclusive and further document may be required:
» Police report, Police Investigation resull, appeal against the Traffic Police
offence and status (if any)
e Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)



Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 October, 2018 2:56 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Vivian Lau (LKKAuta); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 6796 K & SLC 25 X ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2018 - CALL
FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Attachments: SLR6796K_estimate_finalization pdf; SLR6796K_invoice.pdf; SLRETIEK_report. pdf

SLR6796K_rental_invoice pdf; SLC25X_ins_search pdf

Your Ref:

Our Ref : SLR 6796 K

16 October 2018

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SLR 6796 K, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert, SIMON HO. We are
pleased to inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SLR
6796 K & SLC 25 X on 5 September 2018. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount
as stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SIE) : $3,300.00
Cost of Rental $ 720,00

LTA Search : % 745
Total: : $4,027.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SLR 6796 K, the Singapore Accident Statement of SLR
6796 K, rental invoice and LTA Search, for your easy reference.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest,

Regards,



Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
568 Geylang Road
Singapore 389514

6745 3811
6746 5110 (fax)
aslamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Mej Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, September 7, 2018 1:20 PM
To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

Ce: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto); Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments
Subject: RE: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR6796K & SLC25X ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2018 *** LKK REF:

CC4/ASM18016345/wa3
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that 01 has yet to report the accident and we are currently pending verification for direct

settlement,

Please provide us the following.
« Evidence i.e. video/ scene photo.
« Estimate cost of repair

» GlA report

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vivian at 6841 8625.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiEwan@ lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{g08933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com=>

Sent: Thursday, & September, 2018 1:52 PM

To: customer . service@axa.com.sg; 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA 5GP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR6796K & SLC25X ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2018

Your Ref:
Our Ref: S5LR 6796 K

6 September 2018

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
B Shenton Way
#27-01
XA Tower

ngapore 068811

PROPERTY CLAIM

(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)



Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,
NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 6796 K & SLC 25 X ON 5 SEPTEMBER 2018

We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 5 September 2018 at about 11.45 pm at Bideford
Road towards CTE(SLE) involving our client's vehicle registration number SLR 6796 K and vehicle registration
number SLC 25 X driven by your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed list of
10 recommended motor surveyors for our appointment.

Kindly note that if we do not hear from you by 10 September 2018 (Monday), 1400H, we will be forwarding our
proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your appointment, in accordance to the new regulations.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asla Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
6745 3811

6746 5110 (fax)
aslamotorsports@hotmail.com




Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

 ——— e e ——

From: Vivian Lau (LEKAUtD)

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 12:46 PM

To: ‘jordanongl980@hotmail. com’

Ca Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 25X 8 SLR 6796K ALONG BIDEFORD RD TWDS CTE /5LE
ON 05/05/2018

Dear Sir/ Mdm

OUR REF  : CCH/ASMIS016345/Gwad
YOUR REF :SLC 25X

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC 25X & SLR 6796K ALONG BIDEFORD RD TWDS CTE /SLE ON
05/0972018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform vou that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
msurer. AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd acting on behalf of the owner of SLR 6796K
against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, hiability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek 1o take conduct of third party claim(s)
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this letter. You
intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
Vivianlau@lkkauto.com within 7 days if not provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and

further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)

Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us
informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without our prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemmity upon conclusion of the matter(s).



If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us 6841 8625 or email us at Vivianlau@lkkauto.com

Please guote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assisi you more effectively.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau! Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Pheme: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408043)



LETTER OF UNDERTAKING & AUTHORISATION

To:  Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd WITHoUT PREJUPICE
NO.568 Geylang Road T0: ANY PERSONAL INJURY CLAIMS
Singapore 389514

In the matter of an accident involving vehicles SLRE:HGK 3 SLC}SX on 5M

NOR MuHAMmAD SoFT BIN JoBRI
I/We the owner of vehicle registration no, SLRE:HGK
Hereby do authorize you to commence repalrs to my abovementioned vehicie.

|/We confirm that you are hereby authorized to handle the repalrs of my vehicle and/or to negotlate and settle any
claims relatingto a accident Which |/We may have against the third party/parties or insurers and/or to instruct
lawyers on my/our behalf to facilitate the third party claim for me/fus.

You are hereby authorized as my attorney to execute and/or sign any documents/discharge vouchers /discharge
agreement regarding my/our claim for my convenience.

In the event that |/We am/are required to attend at my/our solicitors’ office or to attend court in connection with
my/our claim ,|/we shall render full co-operation.

| confirm that in the event of an unsuccessful claim aﬁainﬂ the n:dirent party and/or my own insurer for the
darnaFes caused to my vehicle | a to pay all rem r cost, survey Tee and any incidental expenses incurred by you
or ta lodge an own damage claim (only for comprehensive cover) to cover the expenses incurred,

| undertake not to independently make negotiate pr settle any claim in respect of the above accident without first
giving you 7 days notice in writing and upon so doing | further undertake to pay to you immediately your
administrative charges for work done and time expended In managing my claim herein .For the purpose of
clarification ,the aforesaid administrative charges shall not include any work done or sum expended towards repairs
to my said vehicle and in the event that repair work/s has commenced before the giving of the above notice ||
hereby undertake to pay to you the full sum of tie costs of repairs as shall be recommended by a licensed surveyor.

Datedthe G dayof Sepfember A0/

I %Lh
Owner [Signature) Witness (signature)
NOR MUMAMMAD SOFT BIN JOBRT LOO CHENG CHUAN
Owner [Name) Witness{Name)
STR04E56G 51169633C
NRIC NO, NRIC NO.

Address: 5l unes al Address: 345_5!# ﬂ:ﬂd SIW “ﬂé
¥02-473 S@Q@LEQHQSI




m redefining /insurance

CLAIM REF : 58BM0O0UDGE

: REJUDICE
INSURED  :JORDAN ONG CHIN TIONG Tﬂwﬁ}ﬂ%L INJURY (LATMS

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We/l Nor Muhammad Sofi Bin Jobri 58704656G hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars Three
Thousands Six hundred Sixty Seven and Cents Forty Five Only (5$ 3,667.45 ) paid to us/me by AXA
INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final settlement of all claims of whatever kird including damages for
personal Injuries and damages to property that we/l may have against the sald AXA INSURANCE PTE
LTD or their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle no. SLC 25X as a result of an accident along
Bideford Rd on 05/09/2018 of which we/l were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/
passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehicle no. SLR 6796K.

We/l hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SLC 25X In connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/| hereby declare that we/l arefam the person(s) entitied to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement.

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SLC 25X.

Dated this 13 gayor_ Jecember 2018

Ciaimant’s Signature : ,ﬂ

NRIC no/ Company Stamp 81046566

Occupation/ Business . FREELANCE

Address . Bik 25| Towpwes Sheet 21 #0248 S(52025)
Telephone No. . 22330636

Witness's Name . Loo CHENG CHUAN

Witness's Signature - (.HL

Witness’s NRIC No. . 51169633




ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD
Specialise in sales of new & reconditioned bikes

Co. Reg. Mo: 20050776EN

No. 568, Geylang Road Singapors 389514 Tel: +635 6745 3811 FPax: +65 6746 5110 Website: www.asinmotorsports.com.sg

NOR MUHAMMAD SOFI BIN JOBRI INVOICE NO: 2017/C093

S8704656G
DATE: 05/10/2018

VEHICLE NO: SLR 6796 K

ENGINE CAPACITY : 1390 CC ENGINE NO : CAXS586325
MAKE : VOLKSWAGEN CHASSISNO: WVWZZZIKZBWI112113
MODEL :NEWGOLF 14 YEAR : 2010
AT 5KI13G5
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total lump sum repair including supply of parts and labour

Adjusted total lJump sum repair costs §83,300.00

Total amount payable S83,300.00

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd



8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #05-27 Premier Singapore 415875 D@I

Email: dreamcarzleasing@gmail.com

Tel: +65 6384 5206 Fax: +65 6384 5205 b Flll" IJGI:
VHA No: 1 9 3 3

ROC No: 201433037R VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT
HIRER'S PARTICULAR Vehicle No: SFM 3493 6% Replace Veh No:
Name: (a3 In 1/C) _NOR MUnA®Ma0 SOR By To BRI Milsage Out: Mileage Out.
NRICIPASSPORT No: __ S8 1046 54& ek & Mode: o |
Address (Res) P21 251 TAMPINES STOkes Td"j.r.';"."ﬂ nerd p:
EI2-40R S\n6APIRE 520151 Out:Dale 06|09 |28 Time:
Nume & Address of Empioyer HIRE/PERIODEXPIRY  Time:
NON-WAIVER EXCESS=§ Lopo 90
Oicoupation: Driving Exp: 11 12 3 #10 l g
Driving Licence No: _SET0%56%, oo % 1n]mla|u3nal :
lssua Date: mlﬂéi;ﬂlé Date of Birth: of |03 Daly € @5 120 perday dlo oo
Tek: (0) R) HPIPG Weakly @s per week
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS Monthly as per monlh
Name: (asinl/C ) Hours a@s per hour
NRIC/PASSPORT No: Others @s
Address (Res) cow as per day/manth
PAI as par daylmonth
Driving Licence No: VL Type ; Local / Intarnational Dellvary/ Collsction Service
Issua Date; Date of Birth:
Occupation: Driving Exp: SUB-TOTAL §| T20 |
VEHICLE CHECK LIST PETROL LEVEL
g DG
E 12|34 | F
E 3
@
ow
g TOTAL CHARGES §
ui 2
O
(]
83
Zaq
ACCESSORIES CHECK
[ Ashtray [__] Cig Lighter [ syre
ST Tooks Jack Pl Cape Hirer's Signat Additional Driver Authorised Person
rer's Signature na 5 u
[__lRadio/Cass [ CD [ Cartridges Signatura Signature
| heva nd to the and condition on both sig fthe sgras IFl presanied i credit card for f
| mamnuh am : “T:ndur fhis wn:m m::l Fu.r:arkhn urhdmu'nr#l'c inm s n'mr‘be to that accoun m:r
signature above will be con o heve been made on tha chargel credit card voucher. All information | have given Draam Carz Leasing
Pta Lid in connection with this agreamant s trus.
IMPORTANT

1 OLY FEMSDM ARCIVE 13 YEANS OF A0E WTTH MORE Thas J YEARS DRRING EXPERIENCE ALTIACMIBED, LICENSED AND SIGMING THES AGREEMENT WMAY DRIVE THE VEFICLE

3 ALL PRRKING AMD TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS ARE THE REEBPONEEAITY OF THE HIRER, AW ADMIMIETRATIVE CHARIGE WILL BE LEWVIED 0N ANY TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS REINFECTED

A THE HIRER BHALL B LIABLE FOR EXTESS CHABGES FOR AMNY LATE FETLIRS AT THE RATE SHOWN FER HOLIR OR PER DAY, INCLUSIVE OF COW ANDIOR P WHERE APPLICARLE.

4 IN CASE OF ACCIDENT, THE HitIER EHALL FEEPORT TO RENTAL OFFICE BMMECAATELY. IF THERE 13 BODAY BLILNRIER A& POLICE REPORT MUST BE MADE WITHIN 3 HOURE. VEFICLE 13
STRECTLY FOR BINGAPCDRE UISH CiLY AMD WAY NOT BE DRAVEN OUT OF SHGAPCIRE WITHOUT FRIOR CONSERT  OF THE DOMSANY Wik Wik CAR REMTAL

AETURN OF VEHICLE THE HIRER § DRIVER S REQUIRED TO SGA N THE COLUMK ERGAPDRE OF HIRER | DRFVER * FAILING WHICH THE 0AY AMD TIME MESERTED BELOW Sl DEEMED
TO BE THE D&Y AND ITIME THE VEHICLE |8 RETURMED TD WIN Wil CAR RENTAL AND THE RAME GHALL BE ACCEFTED AS COMCLUSIVE EVIDEMCE OF THE BAME AND BHALL KOT [&E
EHALLENGED 0OR QUESTIONED 08 ANY ACCOUNT WHATROEVER

DATE IN | TMEMN | miLease | cHECKED BY REMARKS 6

ylon| &

BIGNATURE OF HIRER/DRIVER




DREAM CARZ LEASING PTE LTD cnpeoyiniiiciiins i

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, 805-27, Pramiler, Singapore 415875  Tal (E5) 63845206 Fax: [65) G3B45205 Emall: dreamcarileasing @y mall com

INVOICE
Nor Muhammad Sofi Bin Jobri Invoice No: 10419
Blk 251 Tampines Street 21 Invoice Date: 12/9/2018
#02-428 Due Date 12/9/2018
Singapore 520251 VHA No: 1833
Description
Rental for 6 Days @ § 120.00 per Day $§ 72000
Vehicle No SFN2926X
Vehicle Description TOYOTA ALTIS
Rental Period 6/9/2018 to 12/9/2018

Total Amount Payable $ 720.00



emz018 Recsipt
> Back to OneMotoring

Land TranspartRhuthority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
GST Registration No, ; Md-0006529-2
Print Data/Time 08 Sep 2018 / 13:28:37

Recelpt DatafTime : 06 Sap 2018/ 13:28:37

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt Mo, ; TNET-00000-180806-001125
Privvious Recaipt No, :
SIN [tem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Referance Before Amount After GST
No. GST (55) (5%) (S%)
Result of Insurance Enguiry - SLC25X
As at 05 Sep 2018/23:45.00
Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
. 1 Insurance Enguiry - SLC25X
L:] Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.48 7.49
201B0B0E132742094241
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 T.49
Total Before Rounding T.00D 0.45 T.49
Rounding Differonce 0,04
Total Amount Payable TAS
Paid By
Dimect Debit; eNETS Debit
20180806132755830 TA5
{Internat Banking)
Total T A5
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Reflundable Amount 0.00
L) THANEK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ansure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider [ financial instiution. Ctharwise, the transaction and receipl is considered void and lale fea

may apply.

MRS AL WA GOV SQI N YTHSCUDNCOMPIETEFEYMEBNL M LINL: | RN_IFSEiauiiuu e w



THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
Vehicle No: FLC 25X {insd veh) |Model: VOLKSWAGEN GOLF
PLR GTO6K {TP veh) y

Date of Accident: PSHJB-‘!MI

Global Sum Settlement | | [ 1 Yes | %] No

Repair Estimate - 8,154 42

Final Repair Cosi £ 3,300.00

Loss of Use 5 days al $0.00 per day
Rental {if any) - 360.008 B days

LTA / GIA Search Fee S T,45‘| .
lﬂlhnm. [ $| 0.00 I

Final Settlement Sum $ 3 667 45

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [1] YES [ X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 {%a)

BOLA Appiicable Yes/ No " BOLA Scenario No.
B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessad Liability (*); (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain coflisions and for cases whers BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) }QSIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD 'S 3,667 4
/
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 26122018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Madical
Report/ Bill {if any)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uil Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 256 35681 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No: 19980T188R GST Reg. No 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationaie Des Experts En Automobila

AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE 068811

ATTN.CYNTHIA LOH

Ret CC4/ASM18016345/Gwalg2

Date  26-12-2018

Code: ASM

IR

1.

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SLC 25X Veh, Inspected SLR 6796K
Policy No. VPX/P2080123 Coverage ($) 000 /
Claim No. SEMODUIOS Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 06/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition )
Make & Modal VOLKSWAGEN GOLF c.c 1380
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. WVWZZZ1KZBEW112113 Colour GREY
Odometer 103987 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [225/45 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 YOKOHAMA, & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 05092018 Inspection Date D7/08/2018
Survey held at  ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTELTD
588 GEYLANG ROAD
SINGAPCORE 388514
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE® BASIS,
B]IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b Estimate Days of Repair

IEST]MATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR

5 Working Days




' 7d 74

Sds BE 2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi industnal Park, Singapare 408533
TEL 5256 3581 FAX G258 4115

Reg. No: 18980T108R GST Reg No. 19-8607188-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLR 6796K
aty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate ?” i
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DENTED 1.182.00 814.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER L/R @35105.00 O/S DISTORTED 210,00 4500
(COMNSISTENT)
1|FRONT BUMPER GRILLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 308 E{]; 185.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (CONSISTENT) DENTED BBO 40 58800
1|FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 554 75 317.00
1|FRONT BUMPER FOAM RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 56.00
1|FRONT HEADLAMP RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 1,010 5? 49000
1|FRONT HEADLAMP MOUNT BRACKET RH NOT NECESSARY 288.00
{CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT HEADLAMP BRACKET RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 19-1.10‘
1|FRONT FENDER RH (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 620.10
LABOUR
1|FRONT FENDER INNER LINER RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 16500 165.00
1|FRONT FOG LAMP MESH RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 158.50 158.50
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -543.83 -285 25
4 894 42 2 587 25
1|FRONT FOG LAMP RH (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 29800 18800
LESS 10% DISCOUNT 10.80
29800 178.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1 :::Sﬂh?NT FOG LAMP CHROME RING RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 45001 -
)
1|SET FRONT HEADQLAMP FIERA PROTECTOR RH NECESSARY 180.00 50.00
(CONSISTENT) (SN)
11SET FRONT NUMBER PLATE WITH CASING DISTORTED 120,00 40.00
(CONSISTENT) (SN)
1|SET FRONT FENDER UDER SHIELD CLIPS RH NECESSARY 40 00H 25.00
(CONSISTENT) (SN)
1|FRONT RADIATOR GRILLE EMBLEM (CONSISTENT) (SN) |NOT NECESSARY 6850

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM1B016345/Gwa3q2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubl industnal Park, Singapore 408813
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: G258 4115

Automotive Assessor

DRSS LAIER OF LIABELITY T0 THIRD PARTIES - This Megpor is mais solely for the use snd sersiil af the Clien nomed on the ironl page of ihis Rapert.

Reg Mo 189607T18BR GST Reg Mo 19-8607198-R Page No. 2ol 2
. - Estimate Our Adjusted
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS(CONSISTENT) (SN) NECESSARY 48 50 30.00
51200 145,00
LABOUR
CHECK WIRING LIGHTING & FOCUS HEADLIGHT 5000 30,00
TO BRAKING & RE-SEAL FRONT LICENSE PLATE AT 120.00 90.00
LTA
REMOVE &REPLACE ALL DAMAGED PARTS REPAIR & 900.00 50000
REALIGN INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
FENDER RH
SPRAY PAINTING FRONT FENDER BONNET FRONT 1.000.00 600.00
BUMPER AND ALL AFFECTED PORTIONS
TO DIAGNOSTIC CHECKS & RESET. NOT NECESSARY 28000
ANTI-RUST PROOFING NOT NECESSARY 100.00 d
2.450.00 1,220 00
GRAND TOTAL 8,15442 4,110.45
’f
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,300.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION) - ol
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM1B016345/Gwa3q2
f
Iy
XING GUOD CHANG HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI,L AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

it party BCEing e replying on this
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