Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Ng, Sharon

Cc: SUR

Subject: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle FBK 5932X Ref: CLMOMVMO000000368
Attachments: LKKAdjustment-FBK 5932X.pdf; LKKInspection-FBK 5932X.pdf

Dear Sharon,

Amended.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@I|kkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

From: Ng, Sharon [mailto:Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 24 January 2019 9:28 AM

To: Reports (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: FW: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle FBK 5932X Ref: CLMOMVMO000000368

Hi Elaine
Excess is not nil. Please amend.

Regards
Sharon
Great American

From: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 17, 2018 4:35 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: [External] Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle FBK 5932X Ref: CLMOMVMO000000368

Dear Sir / Madam,



Enclose Survey Report of FBK 5932X.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, be
advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply
email and destroy the message and its attachments.



