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DE XING MOTOR PTE. LTD.

Blk 3006 Ubi Road 1 #01-356 Singapore 408700
Tel : (65) 67468582 (4 Lines) Fax : (65) 67439525
Email : dxmotor@singnet.com 59
Website : www.dxmotor.com

Co. Reg. No.: 198303312R 1

=

{ ) Third-Party (X ) Own Damage ( ) List Price

Bike No : FBM5848X Date of Acc
Make/ Model : BAJAJ PULSAR 200NSFI  Chassis No

Year : 2016 Requested by : TION

S/NO Parts Description Quantity | Unit Price
1_|R/HHANDLE BAR 7 $165.00] $165.00
2 |R/H HANDLE BAR BALANCE ~C§ $18.00 $18.00
3 |BRAKELEVER _“(t $38.00 $38.00
4 [RH/MIRROR __ zA ) $68.00 $68.00
5§ |LOWER FRONT FORK BRACKET $320.00] $320.00
6
7
8
9

<

FRONT FENDER -~ §185.00] 18500
BRAKE PEDAL .~ $115.00] $115.00
RH/ REAR FOOTREST BRACKET » T $98.00 $58.00
RH/ REAR FOOTREST .~ Gt $53.00 $53.00
10 |RH/CENTER COVER (T $125.00] $125.00
11_|REAR RIM FENDER 7 $155.00] $155.00
12 |STEERING CONE 7 $120.00] $12000
13_|RHENGINE GUARD _~ Z+A . $80.00 $80.00
14 |REAR BOX BRACKET -7 $135.00] 13500
15 |REAR BOX KAPPA 46 - $180.00] $180.00
16 |REAR NUMBER PLATE .~ (o _ $20.00 $20.00
17_[|ALIGNFORK = $120.00] $12000
18 |LABOUR $480.00]  $480.00] /&G

el o o |y [ o o o | e [ | e | | i | i e | i | s ] s

’LD"‘]S ' Sub Total $2,475.00
F”+ h‘] ADD 7%GST $173.25

L MPMI Grand Total $2,648.25
Aét:(&:y o e -

ol
PLEASE NOTE THAT THE ABOVE IS ONLY AN ESTIMATE. THEREFORE, SHOULD THERE B
ADDITIONAL PARTS REQUIRED OR DAMAGED DURING OUR COURSE OF REPAIRS, WE
INFORM YOU ACCORDINGLY FOR NECESSARY ACTION. PRICES OF PARTS QUOTED ARE
SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE

e

APPROVING OFFICER'S SIGNATURE & COMPANY'S STAMP bt )

Fa




BANRTIA PARFTNF Rahata Frmun

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 6485G
ELVeRIIeDetalls 1 = e e e e e 2]
Vehicle No.: FBEM5848X
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 10 Sep 2018
Vehicle Make: BAJAJ
Vehicle Model: PULSAR 200 NS FI
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2016
Engine No.: JLZCGF64134
Chassis No.: MD2A36FZ2GCF47149
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value: $2,210.00
Original Registration Date: 28 Dec 2017
First Registration Date: 28 Dec 2017
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $332.00
Elntended PARF Rebite DetpilSs i T = I S e
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Elitended COFRehate Detalls s e e ey
COE Expiry Date: 27 Dec 2027
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $5,502.00
COE Rebate Amount: $5,114.00
Total Rebate Amount: $5,114.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 10 Sep 2018

OK
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or24r2018 Merimen a-Claims

View Received Message

This mall is associated with ;

*FEMS848X (MC201815286)
[SKU2301C]
'|".F
STAFFORD GOH JIAN HUL
Jun 2 2018 10:00PM
[NGOH AH YEON)
De Xing Motor PLe Ltd

-lt;p.h-_l -Ru_prrﬁl _r-_ﬂrmnumnqthli;int-_ﬁ:mpl mm&wl Fnrwnrdl S
From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (II1_SG), sant on 24/09/2018 16:05 PM.

Ta LKE_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$0.00) - FEBMSB48X - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi

Approved:0,00:WE ARE KEEN ON DIRECT SETTLEMENT

DDCUHEHTEWEH!R‘! N S - B
There are no Socuments.

hitps:/singapore_merimen.comiclaims/index. cimMusebox=SVCmail fuseacton=dsp_view&mode=1&linboxld=13588258IDomainld=11810bjId=3. .  1/2



Vivian Lau {LKKAutnl

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 May, 2019 3:42 PM

To: C Meenachi - Il

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your ref: MC20182526,0ur Ref: CC4/M18016288/Gwa3 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU

2301C AND FBM 5848X ON 02/06/2018 ALONG UBI AVE 1
Your ref: MC20182526
Our Ref: CC4/11118016288/Gwa3
Dear Meenachi
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 2301C AND FBM 5848X ON 02/06/2018 ALONG UBI AVE 1
We refer to the above matter,
Be informed that till date TP’s repairer had not finalised with our surveyor since 07/09/2018 after inspection .
In view of no further development, we will proceed to temporary close the file and submit the report to your office

If any new development in future, we will keep you informed for an update and follow up the matter accordingly.

Thank vou

Hest Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivignlau@lkkanto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim®iii.comsg>
Sent: Thursday, 6 September 2018 10:22 AM
To: WAIWAI DEXING; ‘sur@Ikkauto.com'; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)
Ce: DE XING MOTOR PTE LTD; Mrs Loo; C Meenachi - Il
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 02/06/2018 INVOLVING SKU2301C (Ill) & FBM5848X
Attachments: sku2301¢_20180905142322 pdf
Hbam@ 6|4 l\e
Dear Sir / Mdm, Whicle notin
person @ Mg Hre

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FBMS848X and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Meena.
*Kindly upload this survey request emall to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee

Mator Claims Dept.

India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street | #05 [0B Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: WAIWAI DEXING [mailto:waiwaidx@gmail.com]

Sent: 06 September, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: DE XING MOTOR PTE LTD <dxmotor@singnet.com.sg>; Mrs Loo <ANGELA_DEXING3@yahoo.com.sg>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 02/06/2018 INVOLVING SKU2301C (IIl) & FBM5848X

Dear Sir,
Please let us know first when the surveyor is coming.
We need to arrange the owner of FBM5848X to put the bike here.

Thanks & best regards,
Wai Waij
De Xing Motor

On Thu, Sep 6, 2018 at 10:04 AM WAIWAI DEXING <waiwaidx@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Slr,

Please arrange the surveyor from LKK.
Thanks & best regards,

Wai Wai
De Xing Motor



On Thu, Sep 6, 2018 at 9:35 AM DE XING MOTOR PTE LTD <dxmotorf@singnet.com.sg> wrote:

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed 10 us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us 1o ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended. or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)
we

|CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Case Fotified Est Sutimirheg All) Assigred Ag] Rpt Ad) Submitted Ing Auth'ed Status
|24 S0 2018 Q6 5ep 2018 lgg1,130.00  [$81,130.00 et
= Ecit Fieg edn Ay et | Edit Estimates | | view hot | Concel Case |

Main Clalm Datails

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insured: NGOH AM YEON, IDO: 518492004

Main .
Cla £ STAFFORD GOM JIAN HUL, 1D: 593164855

Vehicle Reg. . | B2/08/2018 22:00 - :59
Ng.1 FBMS848X Nkl it L it [S§ Months and § Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Y]]

Claim Type: |TP / MC20182526 ::I::vun: Ve [Mag2505

Policy No. )
SKU2301C (Clamanty: | MOMVMO00002238-00-000

| Excess:
De Xing HMotor Pte Ltd (HQ) Bik 3006 Uit Road 1, #01-356, 408700 Ubi - Tel: 67488582

| Indla International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63476100 ... [Handled by C. Meenschl - E347 £071]

Immm-uum Company [HQ) - Tel: G804 H047

iu;umr | LEK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by XING GUO QIANG] ... [Final Rpt due 17/09/2018)

(ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case ai |

« IH_5G (24/09/2018) Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved (550.00) - FEMSB48X - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi
+ MI_SG [07/0%/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (550.00) - FEM5848X - Claim Handler: C. Meenachi

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= Wiew All | Search Tasks | Create Wew Task | complete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group  Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On~ Done?
No results

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp ... 17/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*FBM5848X (MC20182526)
[SKU2301C]
™
STAFFORD GOH JIAN HUI
Jun 2 2018 10:00PM
[NGOH AH YEON]
De Xing Motor Pte Ltd
Upload Documents | _Uplasd Photes | Compose New Lester | View [View in Browser > |

|Photos/ Images 3 par page )
|No | Aslabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 J0/05/19 15:35 | General View 0 s |4
2 30/05/1915:3% | General View 0 edwc | A
13 [30/05/19 1535 | General View 0| acws | &
4 [30/05/19 15:38 General View ﬁ Load PG | A
5 |30/05/1915:35 | General View D | ediws |
6 |30/0%/15 15:38 | General View 0| waws | &
7 |30/05/18 15:38 | General View 0| wews | A
B [30/05/19 15:39 | General View D | teadws | M4
9 |10/05/19 1538 | General View 0 | weews | 4
10 |30/05/15 15:3% | General View 0D | weaws | B
11 | J0/05/19 15:38 | Genersl View 0 s | A
12 |30/05/15 15:35 | Genersal View D s | A
13 |30/05/19 15:33 | General View 0| drs | A
[14 [30/05/19 15:35 | General Viaw O wurs | &
15 [I0/05/19 15:39 | General View O | waiws | B2
16 |30/05/19 15:39 General View |-I Lowd 7G| A
17 [30/05/19 15:38 | General View 0| cedws | A
18 (30/05/19 15:39 | Genarsl View D | weaws | A
19 |30/05/19 15:3% | General View 0| adws | A
20 |30/05/10 15:39 | General View © | e | B2
21 (30/05/19 15:3% | General View 0D | waws | M
27 |30/05/19 15:39 | General View D | edws | B
13 |30/05/19 15:39 General View D | tcadwvc | A
24 30/05/1915:33 | General View D | ssaws | &
25 [30/05/19 15:39 | General View 0 | owaws | &4
26 |(I0/05/1% 15:39 | General View D | Loadirs | 4
27 |30/05/19 15:39 | Ganeral View 0 | lesawe | A
28 |30/05/19 15:3% | General View ﬁ" Load PG | [
2% |30/05/19 15:39 | General View O | woarc | B
30 |30/05/19 15:38 | Genersl View 0 | Lesdwc | A
31 |30/05/18 15:39 | General View é Load G | B4
32 |30/05/15 15:39 | General View 0 | loors | A
33 |30/05/18 15:39 | General View 0 | Losdwe | 4
34 [30/05/19 15:39 General View D | eadws | (A
35 |30/05/1% 15:39 | General View 0 | loadws | A
36 |30/05/1% 15:39 Ganaral View I-I Load PG | [
37 |30/05/19 15:39 | Ganaral View D | osdws | A

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc...

17/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

Photos/Images Jperpage |~ B4
|No Relabel mmwmmgm Thumbnail | Print
38 |30/05/19 15:39 |Guneral View Load PG | [
39 [30/05/19 15:39 | General View 0| tedws |
lap |30/05/19 15:38 | General View O | tedws |
41| I0/05/19 15:38 | General View 0| tosws | 4
|42 |30/05/49 15:39 General View 0 | taadrs | BA
|43 |30/05/19 15:39 | Ganeral View 0| caaws | A
a4 |30/05/19 15:35 | General View 0 | toades | A
45 |30/05/19 15:39 | Genersl View 0| Lot | A
46 |30/05/19 15:39 | General View O | coews | BA
47 |30/05/19 15:39 | General View 0 | icecirs | A |
Dacumentation 1 per page [ m
No | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail| Print
1 DE/D9/18 1445 ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO 111 DD 06.09.2018 Load POF

2 |06/09/18 14148 TP ESTIMATE + TP GIA REPORT Load POF

[3 | 11/09/ 1B 1946 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Lsad POF

54 30/05/19 15:47 Email to 111 to Temporary close file- FBM 5848 0 | Load poF

|Na_|Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
11 O7/0%/18 08:57 Singapore Accident Statemeant g Load POF

Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | ene |

There are no document checklists configured,

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
Mata- Barraras avm BrVALE Uniess vou $how I o obPer partie.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 17/6/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreq no 1sseor1ssr

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email:

VEHICLE DAMAGE

sur@lkkauto. com;assignments@ikkauto.com

INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/1I1MB0162BR/GWAID2
Date: 17/06/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Ple Lid Palicy No: M482505
Heimant Vehicle ¢gy15848x Insured Vehicle No:  SKU2301C
Date of Loss: 02/06/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: MC20182526
| F I
Reg No; FBMS5848X
Make & Model: BAJAJ PULSAR 200 NS, 200cc Engine No: JLZCGFB4134
Reg. Date: 28/12/2017 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: MD2AIBFZ2GCF4T148
Colour: Black Odometer: B911 km
Engine Capacity: 200 cc
Market Value/Mew Car Prica: N/A
Sum Insured [S§): Markel Value/New Car Price
NDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIM F R
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabls): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 1107017 Rear Tyre Size: 130/70-17
Front Left Side: Pirelll 5 mm Rear Lefl Side: Pirelll 5 mm
Front Right Side: 0mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The sbove valuss represen! the remaining lyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff H.]
Pars 1.995.00 880.00 1.015.00 50.88
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 D00
Labour 480.00 150.00 330.00 88.75
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 2,475.00 1,130.00 1,345.00 54.34
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (58) 17325 732.10 04 .15 5434
Nett Amounl (5§) 2,648.25 1,209.10 1,439.15 54.34
Global Sum Settlemant (5§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 0&/08/2018
Date Inspected, 07092018 Inspected At; De Xing Motor Ple Ltd (HQ)
Blk 3006 Ubi Road 1, #01-356
Singapore 408700
Estimated Period of Repair 2.0 days
Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: VIVIAN LAU PEl FENG
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen ... 17/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE! This report represents our finclings & the time and place of inspaction stated herein. Such inspection has bean carrisd out lo tha best of aur
kpowledge and sbilly but any other kabilily under any olfier circumstances i hereby expressly sxciuded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 17/6/2019



Page 3 of 4

Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 16 Jun 2018)

Parts: NIA BAJAJ PULSAR 200 NS 200cc (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard Lisi)
|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FEMS5848X)

|Validity:

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
,Fuﬂhrrr Info: ltems/values nol in reference catalogue are prefixed v_dth an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 ‘R/H HANDLE BAR *Check 165.00F *F
2 1 ‘R/H HANDLE BAR BALANCE Cut 18.00F “18.00F
3 1 *BRAKE LEVER Cut 38.00F *38.00F
4 1 ‘RH /MIRROR Cut EB.00F *68.00F
5 1 *LOWER FRONT FORK BRACKET *Check 320.00F ~F
8 1 *FRONT FENDER Cut 18500F  *1B5.00F
7T 01 *BRAKE PEDAL Cul 115.00F *115.00F
g 1 *RH /REAR FOOTREST BRACKET Benl 898.00F “98.00F
g 1 “RH/ REAR FOOTREST Cul 53.00F *83.00F
0 1 *‘RH/ICENTER COVER Cut 125.00F *125.00F
1 1 “REAR RIM FENDER “Check 155.00F *-F
12 1 “STEERING CONE *Check 120.00F *-F
13 1 *RH ENGINE GUARD Cut 80.00F *80.00F
14 1 “REAR BOX BRACKET *Check 135.00F *F
15 1 *REAR BOX KAPPA 46 Cut 180.00F  *1B0.0OF
168 1 *REAR NUMBER PLATE Cut 20.00F *20.00F
17 1 *ALIGN FORK “Check 120.00F *F
F=Franchise pan
Total Parts (S§) 1,995.00 980.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous Hems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour tems

1 LABOUR Wew 480.00 150.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 480.00 150.00

Repont was unsubmitied during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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