~ Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
“

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent; Monday, 27 May, 2019 5:21 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cubject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGF6108U (Ol : EQI - DM18HO02388-)G)

AND 5HA74808B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQI18016283/K1wa3) on 04/09/2018

Lear Vivian
Please proceed to reject third party’s claim.
bost Regards,

loel Goh

,.q iIsurance
| B Q.r‘-'ﬁu&..

1 Insurance Company Limited
Il Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190

1ISLUrance.com 58 q
& Member of Citystate

red/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t/

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, May 27, 2019 2:40 PM
13 Joel Goh
Lo Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGF6108U (OI : EQI - DM18HO02388-JG) AND SHA74808B (TP :
KK REF - CC3/EQI18016283/K1wa3) on 04/09/2018

Yoour ref; DMISHO02388-1G
ir Ref: CCY/EQII8016283/K 1wa3

Jear Joel,

\ecident Involving SGF6108U & SHA 74808 on 04/09/2018
'\ ¢ refer to above matter.
lased on the circumstances of both parties and available information in hand, OID and TP’s video, as the Bus stop is
<lose 1o yellow box, it is not possible for OI to move into Bus lane before turning left. TP came out from side road
should give way to Ol before coming out, otherwise , he is liable for the collision.

Y5 such. we intend to reject the claim,

Findly advice on vour view/opinion/instruction for this claim,



Thank you

lest Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkayto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Iilk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

I rom: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May, 2019 9:23 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com=; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com=>; Admin A
<agmin-a@lkkauto.coms>

subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SGF6108U (OI : EQI - DM18HO02388-JG) AND SHA7480B (TP : LKK
t0F - CC3/EQI18016283/K1wa3) on 04/09/2018

Near Mei Kwan

#tteched our insured’s accident report for your attention.
W/e are of the view that BOLA 34 is applicable for this accident.

l'est Regards,

x| Goh

= a.l surance

1..- s Qﬂt_‘ ‘F:'!.-l"\if

FO Insurance Company Limited
ell Road #17-00 Tower L'ru 'ic MND Complex Singapore 069110
5006772 | tel 65 6223 3 ext 772 | fax 656223 4190

asirance.com '-'.?.
~
@——

& Member of Citystate

leged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tl

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, September 10, 2018 2:05 PM

Ta: Justin Wong

“ci Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A

;thect Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SGF6108U (OI : EQI - TBA) AND SHA7480B (TP : LKK REF -

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Justin,
r
e refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case,
VWe had inspected TP vehicle SHA 7480R at Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang).

iwlosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

MMeanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.

1 check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

ink yom,
lost Regards,
viei Kwan | Admin
I Auto Consultants Pre Lid

e 6306 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
I 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

RS S S———————— e EEEEEE———

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sont: Tuesday, 28 May, 2019 10:29 AM

To: Jim Wong See Pah

Cc Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ¥ref CC3/EQI18016283/K1lwa3, Oref TO918/SHAT480B/jw.Accident on
04/09/2018 involving SHA 74808 & SGF 6108U

Attachments: VIDEOQ-2018-09-04-17-10-41.mp4,; Sketch Plan.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE?
SAVE AS TO COSTS

wir Ref: TO918/SHAT480B/jw
Cur Ref: CCI/EQIB016283/K 1wal

[Jear Sir/Madam,
Accident on 04/09/2018 involving SHA 74808 & SGF 6108U
We refer to the above matter

Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Based on our
Insured’s CCTV as the Bus stop is close to yellow box, it is not possible for OI to move into Bus lane before
1orning left. Your client came out from side road should give way to Ol before coming out

We attached herewith our insured’s accident report and CCTV for your perusal.

| mder such circumstances, we have our principal’s instruction to deny liability of your client’s claim.

Lindly nove that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prefudice basis with the sole intention of
cosolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
cemed | inferred from this negotiation of terms/settfement.

Ve event of mew evidence being discovered or subseguently produced by either party that will marerially affect/influence on the
v of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

hank vou

Hest Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlan@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
1% 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jim Wong See Pah [mailto:jimwong @cdge.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 10:52 AM



Tuo: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Yref CC3/EQI18016283/K1wa3, Oref T0918/SHA7480B/jw
[ear Ms Lau

Please find the attached video footage.

[hank you,

Best Regards

lim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@|kkauto.com>

Sont: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 9:56 AM

To: Jim Wong See Pah

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Yref CC3/EQI18016283/K1wa3, Oref T0918/SHA7480B/jw

ITHOUT PREJUDICE”
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Rel TO918/SHAT480B/ jw
Cur Ref: CCI/EQITB016283/K1wa3l

[Dear Sir'Madam,
Accident on 04/09/2018 involving SHA 74808 & SGF 6108U
\We refer to the above matter

"We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence to
aithstantiate either's parties version. Enclosed herewith a copy of our insured's accident report for your
serusal.

Veanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage as stated in your client’s accident report in order to
seek further instruction from our principal.

. indly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 8625

| il nate that this negotiation berween parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
Civing the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
e Sdnferved from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

b the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
swines af liabilitw/damages, either party is not bound, thereafier, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



Thank you
[test Repards,
‘ivian Lau| Case Handler
KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone: 6841-8625 | email; Vivianlaw@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
14k 51, Pava Ubi Induostrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

F'rom: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent; Friday, 17 May, 2019 11:24 AM
oz Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

C'¢: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau(@lkkauto.com>
subjeet: FW: Yref CC3/EQI18016283/K1wa3, Oref TO918/SHAT480B/jw

Without Prejudice
Jeor Sirs/Mdm,
verefer to your below email.

Ve will check and get back to you.

By copy to Mel Kwan/ Yivian,

—

MaA, CC3/EQITB016283/K1wad

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
itk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(308033)

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@edge.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 10:14 AM

T'o: 11siao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht(@lkkauto.com>

Subjeet: Yrel CC3/EQI18016283/K1wa3, Oref T0918/SHAT480B/jw

Dear Ms Chew
We refer the attached mail of 12.09.2018.

I"lease advise the status of our property damage claim, despite numerous extended reminders.



I_haﬁk you.

Rest Regards

Jim Wong
(jaims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

I ipessane and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or propristary infarmation, If you are not the intended racipient, kindiy notify
ot delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contants
s s not aliowsd, Statements pertaiming to any matter oulside our business are nolt to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
rited ar its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Mothing hergin
b=l aonstitute @ binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in 3
1 agreement signad by the duly authorlsed representatives of both parties.
tOeltre - 3 Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment, We encourage you

1t this anly If necessary.

n0=IGre Engineering Ple Lid [Registration No. 199506048W]

massage and any atlachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprigtary information. If you are not the inlended recipient, kindly notify

[
o Jelete this message and ils attachments irmmeadiately, and please be advized that using, copying, distributing or distlosing any contents
5 ot aliowed. Staternents pertaining to any matter outskde our business are nal 1o be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGre Corporation

[ ar ite related companies. The commentsiproposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
- mslitute & binding agreement between the parties. Melther party shall be bound In any way to any lerm or condition excapl as agreed in a

o agresment signed by the duly autherised representatives of both parties.
Ti0RIGra - 3 Green Office certified by the Singapore Envirenment Council - is committed to preserving the enviranment, We encourage you

1 thig anly if necessary.
HOelGro Enginearing Ple Ltd [Registration Mo, 199508048W)




