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TyreSize:  F: %2 _____‘ o
(Policy Condition) < R: 3 6o — 1§ I
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Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notified Est Submitted Adj Assigned |Adj Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
6 Sep 201
Main 01 Sep 2018 gg:zgp 9 New Assignment
f Assign | Cancel Case I

Reference Claim Details _Show Al |

Documents

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

| [Created by insurer]

Insured:

SL METALS PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 198306087E

Main
Claimant:

SULAIMANKANI MOHAMED ABUSALITH, ID: G6583210R

Vehicle Reg.
No.:

31/08/2018 17:00 - :59

GBF8275K [68 Months and 24 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Date of Loss:

Claim Type:

Policy/Cover
Note No.:

A27927444MKC (Comprehensive)

TP / 569220 Coverage: 09/07/2018 - 08/07/2019

Vehicle Reg,
No.
(Insured):

Policy No,

YN5635R (Claimant):

Excess: S$%$1,500.00

Repairer:

Bike Production Pie Ltd (HQ) 610 SERANGOON ROAD, 218216 Serangoon - Tel: 63922555

Handling
Insurer:

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7888 ... [Handled by Chhia Nyuk Pui - 6594 2521]

Adjuster:

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Imm.Advice due 07/05/2018]

Driver/Custo
| | dian
| (Insured):

TAN TIEW HENG (), NRIC: 512403421, Tel: +6593907207

Adj Asg,
Remarks:

on WP. SURVEY AGREE ON SJE - REQ TO ASSIGN LKK LIABILITY:100% CONTACT:MR KWAN 6392 2555

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View All | Compose Case Mail |

There are no mail for this case.

Due Date
No results.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS=

View All | _Search Tasks | _Create New Task | Complete | |
Created On

Done? I

Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_cimheader&caseid=740027&extid=282103&CFID=3999... 1/2



S_hi_rley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 11:53 AM

To: 'Sbk E'

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS - FBG8275K

Dear Mr Kwan,

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| S(408933)

----- Original Message-----

From: Sbk E [mailto:sbk5643e@yahoo.com]

Sent: Sunday, 7 October 2018 4:04 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS - FBG8275K

Dear Shirley,

Please help submit report. Thanks.
Regards,

Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Thu, 10/4/18, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS - FBG8275K
To: "'Sbk E'" <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Date: Thursday, October 4, 2018, 4:56 PM

Dear Mr Kwan,

Please confirm final fig of $1,900.00 (lump
sum) @ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shirley Hiew | Case Handler



Shirlez Hiew (LKK AutO) e

From: Sbk E <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Sent: Sunday, 7 October 2018 4:04 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS - FBG8275K
Dear Shirley,

Please help submit report. Thanks.
Regards,
Kwan S. H.

Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

On Thu, 10/4/18, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS - FBG8275K
To: "'Sbk E" <sbk5643e@yahoo.com>

Cc: sur@lkkauto.com

Date: Thursday, October 4, 2018, 4:56 PM

Dear Mr Kwan,

Please confirm final fig of $1,900.00 (lump
sum) @ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK

Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 |

email: Sur@lkkauto.com

| fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial

Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sbk E [mailto:sbk5643e@yahoo.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 October 2018 3:10 PM

To: sur@lkkauto.com

Subject: FINALIZATION: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS
- FBG8275K

Dear Sur,



Please confirm the lump sum
repair amount and number of repair days. Thanks.

Regards,

Kwan S. H.
Director
Bike Production Pte Ltd

--- On Sun, 9/16/18, Sbk E
<sbk5643e@yahoo.com>
wrote:

> From: Sbk E
<shk5643e@yahoo.com>

> Subject: RE: AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS -
FBG8275K

> To: "Naz (LKKAuto)"
<Naz@lkkauto.com>

> Date: Sunday, September 16, 2018, 8:57 AM Dear Naz, > > After repair photos for your info.
> Thanks.

>

> Regards,

>

> Kwan S. H.

> Director

> Bike

Production Pte Ltd



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.regNo:1gs807198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

To: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
4 Shenton Way 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
#21-01 SGX Centre 2 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 068807 Singapore 408933

Attn:  Chhia Nyuk Pui Date: 17 Sep 2018

Preliminary Advice

Insured Vehicle No : YN5635R

TP Vehicle No .@BF8ZTsK  FB4 § 275 /< Accident Date  31/08/2018
Make : HONDA CBF150 Assignment Date : 06/09/2018
Date of Inspection  : 14/09/2018 Est. Duration of Repair  : 3 days
Inspection At : Bike Production Pie Ltd (HQ)

610 SERANGOON ROAD

Singapore 218216

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages
The vehicle sustained impact / damages o/s rear portion & n/s body and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) :S§ 6,246.60
Revised Amount :S$ 1,913.52
Check ltems (Estimated) :S$ 0.00
Total :S% 1,913.52
Lump Sum Repair :S$

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value :S%
Pre-Accident Value :S%
COE / PARF Rebate :S%
Salvage Value :S$
Margin for Repair :S$

Remarks
( )  The vehicle is economical/not economical for repair.

( X ) The above survey was conducted on a 'without prejudice’ basis.
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Merimen e-Claims
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

| Case | Notified | Est Submitted __ Fd) Assigned Adj Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
[ | |06 Sep 2018 Pending for Survey
Main 01 Sep 2018 |09:23p $%$1,900.00 $$1,900.00 Report
| Edit Adj Rot | Edit Estimates view Rpt | i

Show All

Reference Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

| [Created by insurer]

Insured:

SL METALS PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 198306087E

Main
Claimant:

SULAIMANKANI MOHAMED ABUSALITH, [D: G6583210R

venicle Re9- | ppGB275K Date of Loss: |31/08/2018 17:00 - :59
e . Policy/Cover |A27927444MKC (Comprehensive)
ot Typew: |UR/9G9280 Note No.: |Coverage: 09/07/2018 - 08/07/2019
Vehicle Reg.

Policy No.
No. . YN5635R (Claimant):
(Insured): -

Excess: S$$1,500.00

T
Handling
Insurer:

Bike Production Pie Ltd (HQ) 610 SERANGOON ROAD, 218216 Serangoon - Tel: 63922555
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +65 6827 7888 ... [Handled by Chhia Nyuk Pui - 6594 2521]

Adjuster:

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah] ... [Final Rpt due
06/10/2018]

Driver/Custo
dian
(Insured):

TAN TIEW HENG (), NRIC: 512403421, Tel: +6593907207

Adj Asg.
Remarks:

on WP. SURVEY AGREE ON SJE - REQ TO ASSIGN LKK LIABILITY:100% CONTACT:MR KWAN 6392 2555

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

View All I Compose Case Mail I

There are no mail for this case.

Due Date
No results.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™

Create New Task I Complete ]
Created On Done?

view All | search Tasks
Assigned By Completed On

Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handler
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Claim Documents

*FBGB275K (569220)
[YN5635R]
TP
SULAIMANKANI MOHAMED ABUSALITH
Aug 31 2018 5:00PM
[SL METALS PTE LTD]
Bike Production Pie Ltd

Page 1 of 2
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Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | save | Print |

?h;re are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: D Handling Insurer
Note: Remarks are private uniess you show It to other parties,
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Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 19ss07158r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/MSG18016272/NSD3E2

Date: 15/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: A27927444MKC
Claimant Vehicle £ggg275K Insured Vehicle No:  YN5635R
Date of Loss: 31/08/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 569220
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: FBGB275K
Make & Model: HONDA CBF150, 149¢cc (M) Engine No: HIDDEN
Reg. Date: (Man. Year: ) Chassis No: LALKC11B4C3300149
Colour: Black Odometer: 51313 km
Engine Capacity: Occ
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A

Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 80/90 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 3.60-18
Front Left Side: Shinko 6 mm Rear Left Side: Shinko 6 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’'s Difference Diff_'fé]
Parts R N 4,416.60 1,731.90 268470  60.79
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,830.00 660.00 1,170.00 63.93
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 6,246.60 2,391.90 3,854.70 61.71
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1,900.00
(S$) 6,246.60 1,900.00 4,346.60 69.58
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 437.26 133.00 304.26 69.58
Nett Amount (S§) 6,683.86 2,033.00 4,650.86 69.58
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 06/09/2018
Date Inspected: 14/09/2018 Inspected At: Bike Production Pie Ltd (HQ)
610 SERANGOON ROAD
Singapore 218216
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
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Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah Manager: Hiew May Fung

NOTE" This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carmed out to the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.
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Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 11 Oct 2018)

Parts: N/A HONDA CBF150 149cc (M) (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FBG8275K)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT MUDGUARD Cracked 140.00FL *140.00FL
2 1 *FRONT WHEEL AXLE Serviceable 45.00FL *-FL
3 1 “LEFT FORK ASSEMBLY Serviceable 480.00FL *-FL
4 1 *WINDSHIELD Scratched 65.00FL  *65.00FL
5 1 *HEAD FAIRING Cracked 105.00FL *105.00FL
6 1 *HEADLAMP ASSY Cracked 195.00FL *195.00FL
7 1 *HEADLAMP BRACKET Serviceable 145.00FL *-FL
8 1 *LEFT FAIRING ASSEMBLY Scratched 185.00FL *185.00FL
9 1 *LEFT BALANCER Serviceable 45.00FL *-FL
10 1 *STEERING STEM BRACKET ASSEMBLY Not Necessary 214.00FL *FL
11 1 *STEERING STEM UNDERBRACKET Not Necessary 214.00FL *-FL
12 1 *HANDLE BAR Not Necessary 95.00FL *-FL
13 1 *LEFT VIEW MIRROR Scratched 48.00FL  *48.00FL
14 1 *LEFT HANDLE BALANCER Not Necessary 35.00FL *-FL
15 1 *CLUTCH LEVER Scratched 35.00FL  *35.00FL
16 1 *SIDE STAND Scratched 70.00FL  *70.00FL
17 1 *LEFT FRONT SIGNAL Scratched 78.00FL  *78.00FL
18 1 *FUEL TANK ASSY Not Necessary 480.00FL *-FL
19 1 *LEFT ENGINE COVER Not Necessary 360.00FL *FL
20 1 *GASKET Not Necessary 35.00FL *-FL
21 1 *REAR GEAR PEDAL ASSY Scratched 125.00FL *125.00FL
22 1 *LEFT FRONT FOOTREST HOLDER ASSEMBLY Serviceable 135.00FL *FL
23 1 *LEFT FRONT FOOTREST Scratched 55.00FL  *55.00FL
24 1 “LEFT REAR FOOTREST Scratched 55.00FL  *55.00FL
25 1 *LEFT SIDE COVER Scratched 165.00FL *165.00 FL
2 1 *MAINSTAND Scratched 130.00FL *130.00FL
27 1 “FRONT SPORT RIM Not Necessary 480.00FS *-FS
28 1 *BOX RACK Not Necessary 150.00FS *-FS
29 1 *FRONT NUMBER PLATE Necessary 20.00FS  *20.00FS
30 1 *ERP IU Scratched 166.00FS *156.00FS
31 1 *TOP CASE Scratched 250.00FS *250.00FS

F=Franchise parl S=SpcNett. L=ListitemDisc.

Sub Total (S$)  4,790.00 1,877.00

- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S$) 373.40 145.10

Total Parts (S$)  4,416.60 1,731.90

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Iltems

1 TOWING CHARGES New 80.00 80.00

2 DISMANTLE, REPLACE, REALIGN AND ADJUST ABOVE New 500.00 200.00
DAMAGED PARTS

3 ANTI RUST APPLICATION New 60.00 30.00

4 TO KNOCK, STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS & BODY BALANCING New 380.00 100.00

5 TO REMOVE / REFIT, REPLACE (IF DAMAGE) CHECK AND New 180.00 0.00
STRAIGHTEN FRONT FORK TUBES

6 TO REMOVE / REFIT AND REPLACE FRONT SPORT RIM New 180.00 0.00

7 SPRAY PAINTING New 450.00 250.00

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,830.00 660.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen... 15/10/2018



