Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 1 December 2018 1:26 PM

To: ‘Gan, Angiegeokling'

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> Your Ref: ~ 2909161781SG *Our Ref: CC3/LCR18016268/T1pb3

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 7860U(Ol) & SGU 7717B(TP) ON 04/09/2018]

Your Ref: 2909161781SG
Our Ref: CC3/LCR18016268/T1pb3 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 7860U(Ol) & SGU 7717B(TP) ON 04/09/2018
We refer to the above matter.
This is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our insured driver's favour.

We seek your approval to offer to Third Party repairer, Volkswagen Centre Singapore is as follows: -

Amount Amount
Claimed Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $24,973.73 $15,424.79
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $120.00w/GST) $ 840.00 $  749.00(7days x $100) (w/GST)
3. Loss of Use (1day x $60.00) $ 60.00 $ 60.00
4. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 7.45 $ 7.45
TOTAL $25,881.18 $ 16,241.24
Total amount of claim (Liability 100%) $16,241.24

All the relevant documents had been uploaded in Merimen.

For your approval in Merimen please.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Gan, Angiegeokling <Angiegeokling.Gan@aig.com>
Sent: Friday, 7 September 2018 2:28 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 2909161781SG

Hi Hsiao Tong,



Video uploaded.

Best Regards,

Angie Gan

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1013 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Angiegeokling.Gan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, September 07, 2018 2:03 PM

To: Gan, Angiegeokling

Subject: 2909161781SG

Hi Angie,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly assist to upload Ol video in Merimen for our viewing.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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