Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 3:08 PM

To: 'Fievel Foo'; SUR

Subject: RE: TP survey report SLM 6069 C MSIG ref no. 569189

Dear Fievel,

Survey report submitted in merimen.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Fievel Foo <Fievel Foo@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 November 2018 2:34 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: TP survey report SLM 6069 C MSIG ref no. 569189

Dear Case handler

Please upload your surveyor report when it is ready.

Thanks & regards

Fievel Foo Wenyao
Executive, Claim Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6643 1316 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | Fievel foo®@sg.msig-asia.com

Insurer Claims

M S I G Team of the Year

2016

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg k' "o

AMember of IMETSENRR (NSURANCE GROUP

From: Rico 60 [mailto:claims@rico60.com]

Sent: Saturday, November 03, 2018 4:06 PM

To: Claims <claims@sg.msig-asia.com>; Eileen Ang <eileen_ang@sg.msig-asia.com>; Fievel Foo
<Fievel Foo@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: marcuschua@Ikkauto.com

Subject: LOD for SLM 6069 C




Dear Motor Claims Department,

Attached file as per your pursuant.
Kindly release DV/cheque.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Cass Chua

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com




