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Y 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

i TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Expartz En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18016218/Nqd3
36 ROBINSON ROAD
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 DalEs ORI ”””M”l'lMl'l““”'
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 962 Veh. Inspected SLN 68384
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No, 01800657 1IMFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From CWS (LURENE JAW) Assign Date 05/08/2018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/02/2018 Inspection Date 05/09/2018

Survey held at WORLD AUTO PTELTD

47 JALAN PEMIMPIN
#01-02/02 HALCYON 2 BLDG
SINGAPORE 577200

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




51 UBLAVE 1, #01-23 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAMRE 408933 TEL : (D65} G2E63561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D18006571MFSH Date: 11/9/2018
Our Ref: CS/FCI18016218/MNgd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO___ SLN 6836A

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
5/9/2018 at the premises of M/s_ World auto and have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount 8§ 8.578.50
Revised Estimate Amount -5 2.688.50
“Check™ Items Amount :85%  1.180.00
Market Value ' 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%
Mett Value - 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear portion,

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Naz
Automotive Assessor



H i M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Co®eg Mo 1950000060 CST Reg. No. M2 00016759
Ms.FlrStcapltal B Ratfles Quay $21-00 Singapore (48580
Tel (B5) 6222 2311 Fax: (B5) 6222 3547

[laims & Meier Undenariting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 083877

Tel: (B5) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) B507 3849
winivimatirsTcapital.com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 04-09-2018 QOur Ref No. D18008571MFSH
Accident Date 03-09-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHADOSEZ Third Party Vehicle. SLNGB3GA
Survey Location NO.1, KRANJI LOOP ,SINGAPORE 739535

Contact Person. AINEE

Contact No. 83621776/ 63621776 Fax Mo. 63631250
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
ARpoined LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Person A Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop WORLD AUTO PTE LTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge LURENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 December 2018 4:43 PM
To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SLN6836A Our ref: TP/2221/18
Dear Sophia,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $2,818.50 and 4 repair days.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg <tgttan@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent; Friday, 30 November 2018 5:18 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLN6836A Our ref: TP/2221/18

Hi Shiau Chan

Attach please find our estimate markings.

We are unable to agree to your proposal of item 5 at $700 and item 11 at 594.80.
Therefore, we finalise COR @52818.50 and 4 repair days.

Kindly revert.

Rdgs

Sophia Tan
World Auto Pte Ltd (Kranji)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 5:54 PM

To: tettan@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLN6836A Our ref: TP/2221/18

Dear Sophia,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
As spoken with you.

Offer final fig $2,649.60 before GST and 4 repair days.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 5:18 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUta)

Subject: RE: SLNGB36A Qur ref: TR/222118
Attachments: SLNGB36A - ESTIMATE MARKINGS.pdf
Hi Shiau Chan

Attach please find our estimate markings.

We are unable to agree to your proposal of item 5 at 4700 and item 11 at 594.80.
Therefore, we finalise COR @52818.50 and 4 repair days.

Kindly revert.

Rdgs
Sophia Tan
World Auto Pte Ltd (Kranji)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 5:54 PM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLN6836A Our ref: TP/222 1/18

Dear Sophia,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

As spoken with you.

Offer final fig $2,649.60 before GST and 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: tettan@worldauto.com.sg <tgttan@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 19 November 2018 11:28 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLN6836A Our ref: TP/2221/18

Hi Shiau Chan

Can revert urgently.



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 8:50 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuta); ‘Claim Workflow System'; assignments
Cc LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D1800657 TMFSH/1
Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SSLN 6836A.pdf

Dear SirfMadam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLN 6836A

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408923)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

sent: Wednesday, 5 September 2018 11:02 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: LURENEJAW@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006571MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

BEST REGARDS,

. Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System @aiIto:cwsmqturctaims@mzﬂrstcagital.cnm.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 4 September 2018 6:15 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cec: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.5G; LU REMEJAW @MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18006571MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.
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Sketch Plan #4

Land Transport S Authority serialNe. A 13117

Name: Wowg wee Clas NRIC: SHOR0SI&G

TEMPORARY PRIVATE HIRE CAR PRIVER'S VOCATIONAL LICENCE

| Yoo have passed the vocauonal livence compelensy 1o and have been gramed a Private Hire Car Driver's Vocatonal Lixence (PDVL)

PDVL Commencement Date: 12 JUN JUiE

2 Wou must displiy this Tomporary PDVL in your car at all limws while driving a chaufTeursd private hire car.

3 1TA will subsegoertly (nform you 1 coltect your Yocational |icence Cand that will replave this Tergwivary FDVL
You must collect your Vocstinnal Licence Card within 6 months of the FOVL Commenteirznl Date and disploy o in your oo
thereafter Otherwise, your POVL niny be revoked.

Kwin Méi Fong
Asviszant Regisrmar of Vehickes
Land Trampor Authority of Sengapon

This Tempocary POVL bs handed 1o you by _ gu“uﬂ_ _icentre officer name |, QE*EE'_ = .
{centre officer designatiomi.of __%  icentre pame)
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WGORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No.: 200006765H

FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES000327
80 ROBINSON RD #09-02/03
068898 Date : 04/09/2018

Vehicle Num. : SLN BB36A (LCR)
Make/Model : TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID

Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Engé :
Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547 Accident Date : 03/09/2018
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
S/IN  Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5§
LIST ITEMS :
1 A REAR BOOT LID 40000 R
2. 1 REAR BOOTLID OUTER GARNISH 570:00~5~ 7 NAX
3, 1 REAR BOOT HYBRID EMBLEM (PRIUS) 89.00 s
4 1 REAR BOOT PRIUS EMBLEM 89.00  Acp
5. 1 REAR BUMPER 900.00. {24
6 1 REAR BUMPER TAIL LAMP LH 760:00 S\
¥ 9 REAR LOWER BUMPER §70.00" - 1
g 1 REAR BUMPER TOW COVER 100.00 < <y
9. 1 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING 25000 o 1
10. 1 REAR WINDSCREEN LOWER MOULDING 180:00 + 1
1. 1 REAR BUMPER RETAINER LH 120.00 ? NEC W
12. 1 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 350.00 7 N Ny pie
13. 1 REAR BUMPER EXTENSION FILLER - LH 23000 ep g
List TotalS$ : 5,598.00
25.00% Discount 5§ : 1,399.50
4,198.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1. 1 REAR BOOTLID OUTER GARNISH CLIPS 46:00 )01l
2. 1 REVERSE SENSOR : 280.00 = 5V
3. 2PC REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT 160.00 320:00 7 1N
4 1 REAR BUMPER CLIP 40.00 0,
Special Nett Total 5% : 680.00
LABOUR :
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES 180.00 X 119

CONTINUE / ...



WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Haleyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. - 6451 3933 Fax Mo. : 6455 7576
E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Website : www.worldauto.com.sd

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED
80 ROBINSON RD #09-02/03
068898

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547

Page 2/ 2

Estimate : ES000327

Date : 04/09/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLN EB36A (LCR)
Make/Model : TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID

Chassis/Eng# :

Accident Date : 03/09/2018

Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy MNo. :
S/N Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount S§
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 360.80 % 7 1)
(2PC WINDSCREEN GLASS)
:I"D APPLY RUSTPROOFING! TUFFCOATING TREATMENT TO 18000 S0
REPLACED PARTS.
TO DISMANTLE REAR DAMAGE PARTS, CUT AND WELD REAR 1;‘5ﬂﬂfﬁl§ 'r:' ©0
SUPPORT PANEL, KNOCK, STRAIGHTEN AND RESHAPE OIS REAR
CHASSIS FRAME AND REPLACE RECOMMENDED PARTS.
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR AFFECTED AREAS 130000 ©9C
TO CHECK WIRES, CONNECTORS, REPLACE DAMAGED LAMPS 480700 _}' o
REVERSE SENSORS AND START/STOP UNIT CAPACITORS
Labour Total 5% : 3,700.00
E. & O.E. Total 5% : 8,578.50
EEmmm==ETT
ants hence notify
Ay L
NAL LY
for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD e (
?f!% iy ~
[y ﬂ[‘ 2 [ Yool » Third party survey i3 on @ “Without
T laa q”-:‘_l_ i i i | A Yq « No Hiegal modification(s) is alicwed
o \ \r:k o Supplementary ibemls) must be resurvayed and
. L \ i subject 10 final approval from Ensurance Compasy
| 0 Dr")b] 5

fer-pe {pwT {Hom

Acknowiedged by Repainer
Signalune:
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' PVl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

adm i %1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/’—‘ TEL: 6256 3561 FAX. 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 190607198R GST Reg. No 19-8607136-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI18016218/Nad3n2
11601 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Cig:  Tpae M“wumwumu
Code : FCIZ2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 962 Veh. Inspected SLN 6836A
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D1800B85T1MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  LURENE Assign Date 04/08/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS HYBRID c.c 1796
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JTDKB3FUS03558181 Colour SILVER
Cdometer 104702 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 ROVELO & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 ROVELO & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/85R15 ROVELD 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/65R15 ROVELD 5 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/09/2018 Inspection Date 05/08/2018
Survey held at WORLD AUTO PTELTD
47 JALAN PEMIMPIN
#01-02/03 HALCYON 2 BLDG
SINGAPORE 577200
5a. Remarks
A)JDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 6836A

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199607108R GST Reg. Mo 18-9607198-R

Page No..1of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rluhop?:}} {5%:]
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BOOT LID TO REPAIR SEE 1,400.00 =
LABOUR
1|REAR BOOTLID OUTER GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 570.00 -
1|REAR BOOT HYBRID EMBLEM (PRIUS) NECESSARY 89.00 89.00
1|REAR BOOT PRIUS EMBLEM MECESSARY 89.00 89.00
1|REAR BUMPER CRACKED 800.00 900.00
1|TAIL LAMP LH SERVICEABLE 750.00 -
1|REAR LOWER BUMPER CRACKED 570.00 570.00
1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER SERVICEABLE 100.00 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 250.00 .
1|REAR WINDSCREEN LOWER MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER LH MECESSARY 120,00 120.00
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 350.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER EXTENSION FILLER-LH CRACKED 230.00 230.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,399.50 -499 50
4,198.50 1,498.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BOOTLID OUTER GARNISH CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00 .
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 280.00 -
2|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT @$160.00 (SN) NOT NECESSARY 320.00 .
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 40.00
680.00 40.00
LABOUR
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
ACCESSORIES
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS (2PC NOT NECESSARY 360.00 -
WINDSCREEN GLASS)
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING/TUFFCOATING TREATMENT 180,00 50.00
TO REPLACED PARTS.

Report Ref No. CS/FC118016218/Ngd3n2




' 7d V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

i) ‘. B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
/—_‘. TEL: 6250 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-3607 186-R Page No. .2 of 2
Description of Parts Gondition Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty pt Workshop ($)) ($)
TO DISMANTLE REAR DAMAGE PARTS, CUT AND WELD 1,500.00 &800.00
REAR SUPPORT PANEL KNOCK STRAIGHTEN AND
RESHAPE 0/5 REAR CHASSIS FRAME AND REPLACE
RECOMMENDED PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
REAR BOOT LID,
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING ON REAR AFFECTED 1,300.00 500.00
AREAS
TO CHECK WIRES,CONMNECTORS REPLACE DAMAGED 180.00 30.00
LAMPS REVERSE SENSORS AND START/STOP UNIT
CAPACITORS
3,700.00 1,280.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,578.50 2,818.50
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 2,818.50
Report Ref No. CS/FCI1801621 8/Nad3n2
MUHAMMAD NAZRIL BIN ABDULLAH ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIASILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report |8 mace solely for the uss and banefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repart.
WIWM;W mird party v may reply en ihe Report wholly of i D Ary third party acting o
Repart, in whiste or o part, doss 8o al his of her own risk,




