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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ALLIED WORLD ASSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Ref : CS/AWA18016217/T1vb
CoANon ROAD 08 VAR
SO e iy
SINGAPORE 079914
Code: AWA
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PC 4853Z Veh. Inspected SLG 8009V
Policy No. BVBPSB0005921800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. NSV1800500/KW Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From KIN WONG Assign Date 05/09/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer = Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/08/2018 Inspection Date 06/09/2018
Survey held at 249 JLN BOON LAY
Repairer DING AUTO PTELTD
5a. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




.. Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 September 2018 4:40 PM

To: ‘Duan Hongbo'; Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kenneth Ding; You jingfeng; Dd hashim; Ding Auto Admin; Accounts Ding Auto;
Carlor Chan

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLGB00SU & PC4853Z ON 31/08/2018-CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Hong Bo,

Please refer to Kin Wong for liability.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Duan Hongbo <duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 September 2018 4:10 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng <JINGFENG@dingauto.sg>; Dd hashim
<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; Ding Auto Admin <admin@dingauto.sg>; Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg>;
Carlor Chan <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG8009U & PC4853Z ON 31/08/2018-CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Officer,
Please advise the liability of this case as soon as possible for us to proceed the repair,
Vehicle done survey since 06 Sep 2018 by Mr Taufikh.

Here | attached together with the GIA and Estimate for your reference.

Many thanks.

BEST REGARDS

DING AUTO PTE LTD
DUAN HONG BO

TEL Office : 92394128
FAX :62652690

*ALL MAILL LETTER AND CHEQUE PAYMENT IS TO BE MAILED TO OUR MAIN OFFICE AS BELOW*
- BLOCK 10 #01-20 SIN MING INDUSTRIAIL EST.SEC C SINGAPORE 5756



Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com> on behalf of Motorsurvey
<Motorsurvey@awac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 September, 2018 3:58 PM

To: ‘assignments’

Cc: 'SUR’; 'Duan Hongbo'

Subject: TP Survey assignment for SLG 8009U - DOA: 31/08/2018  Our ref:
NSV1800500/KW

The above captioned accident refers.

Pursuant to the Practice Directions Amendment No. 1 of 2016 which was effective on 1 April 2016, we like to advise
that the third party claimant and us do have consensus in the appointment of Mr Mohamad Taufikh [ Mr
Mohammed Rasul as the Single Joint Expert to conduct the pre-repair survey of the third party claimant’s vehicle.

Please conduct "THIRD PARTY" survey on without prejudice basis. The information as are follows:

3" Party Vehicle  { SLG8009 U

Insured Vehicle : PC 4853 2

Policy Number : BVBPSB0005921800
Name of Workshop : Ding Auto Pte Ltd
Contact Number : 9239 4128
Person to Contact : Duan Hong Bo
EStiml'a;::f Igmst of $ NA

Regards,
Claims Division

Copy to Ding Auto Pte Ltd via Email

Note -
(x) 1. This is to keep you informed that we have appointed surveyors to conduct inspection to your
client's damaged vehicle on a without prejudice basis.

2. Please keep our motor surveyor and us informed so as to enable the surveyor to conduct a
post repair inspection once your client’s vehicle has been repaired and before returning
the repaired vehicle to your customer.

3. Please quantify your client's claim with all relevant supporting documents once your client's
vehicle has been repaired.

4. Please do not construe this appointment of surveyor and our above request as an admission of
liability.

Regards
Motor Claims

Claims Group



Glohal Market

* The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments hereto is confidential. If you are not the
intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate any of this information. If you have received this e-mail
in error, please immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete the original e-mail
(and any attachments hereto) and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this e-mail and any attachments
hereto are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which
it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by Allied World Assurance Company Holdings, GmbH or its subsidiaries or
affiliates, either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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MDAF18114538 | Ding Auto Pte Lid - HO Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 04/08/2018 12:44

SUBMITTED BY: Duan HongBa Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 04/09/2018 12:52

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies o
repudiate policy abillity,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 04/09/2018 12:44
Date Of Accident 31/08/2018 19:35
Exact Location Of Accident ALONG DELTA ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number SLG800sU
Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner LCRF PTELTD

Co Reg No 201624597K

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No OFFICE-31584255
Vehicle Particulars .

Manufacturer MITSUBISHI

Model ATTRAGE-1.2 CVT (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? NO

If No, Please slate action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category PRIVATE HIRE

Insurance Company .

Name of Insurance Company AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy YES

Policy Number 999995145

Cover Note Number

Driver $
Name of Driver KHO LOK HUI

NRIC No S1150191E

Date Of Birth 04/01/1957

Occupation OUTDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 14/09/1982

Driving Experience 35 YEARS AND 11 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-92394128

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 10



Address 249 JALAN BOON LAY
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OTHER - HIRER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle =

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO

soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

Passonger 1 NAME: . UNKNOWN

GENDER: : FEMALE
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO ATTACHMENT

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

e
o
o

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number PC48532

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category BUS
Name of Driver

NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 10



Accident Sketch Plan Pg. 1

I ANT N

1 Pmmmmmaimmwwupmdmpm
2. This Form must be completed b

3. Information provided must be as W Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow Insurance companies to repudiate policy Babliity,

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies fs not an admission of palicy iabllity an the part of the insurance -
companies,

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the wmm:mmmm by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GLA) for archiving and that coples of this report will for a fee be made avafiable upon spplication by
Interested parties.

7. thmlcdmumnhhlsupartmmimum,wuhmhymnmwﬁamhmldmnmnﬁzmmmdwmpiunf
the report being made avallable aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My Insurer, my workshop and the General insurance Association of Singapore (*GIA™) may/aze permitted to collect, use,
dhdnnmdfcrprmmmmmunbmﬂonmmmﬁm[!wm]mmmmﬂm
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the *Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
PmumlrnfumaﬁunmallImmm“imwnlmwhmllmlaﬂhm@wwlm
vehicle{s] involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the "1 "), the Insurers’ |awyers/law firms, the

Monetary Autharity of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the palice], for the purpose(s)
of :

] processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
Imvestigations relating to the claims;

(i) investigating the accident and/or my cialms;
(m]nnﬂngmand[ordaﬁmmwinmmumnrmln;mmmiﬁnhym;
(iv} administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoicas, reports or notices to me,

‘which could involve disch of carmin p | data about me to bring about delivery of the same-as well as an the
| cover of lopes/mall packages); and/or
{v} complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.{collectively the
“Purposes™) .

b) nllImurr(s}mmMMWInMHM:M:MWWMm[wW
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

{c}  my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
wmmmwmmmummdﬂmmwmumnamaﬁmm

{d] my Persenal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detaction,
investigation and management in present and all future czims.

(e} the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosad:

0] wnlllnsumandjann\rmwumummmmmmﬁn@wmwmmm
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as r ¥ reg for the purp stated, or

(i) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

PT.

) HR Jabus

Polieyholder's Signature__/ Driver's Signature Reporting Centre Persanne!’s Signati
Date & Time: {If driver is not the palicyhalder) Name:
Date & Tima: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 3 of 10
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Policyholder's Signature
Date & Time:

ﬂ"l e foregaing particulars are true in respect,

Driver's
{if driver is not the policyholder)
Date & Time:

Deaidy & stun~y MWiksuprga WG Wi nonber LG Qo U
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10 - FAX NO:

ESTIMATE REPORT 1ST Quotation 04/09/2018 14:34
OWNER'S PARTICULARS JORENG;,  BBdDa0e]
NAME: LIONCITY RENTALS PTELTD CONTACT: Page 1 of 2
ADDRESS: 60 ANSON ROAD
MAPLETREE ANSON NOEMAIL@GMAIL.COM
LEVEL 11 SINGAPORE
079914
VEHICLE DETAILS
LICENSE NO: SLG8003uU TRANS: AUTO CHASSIS: MMBSTA13AHH002788
MAKE / MODEL: MITSUBISH Others ENGINE: 3A92UDL1297
OWNER'S INSURER: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
JOB-CODE: TP SA: Ding Auto User 1
LAIM D
QUOTED DISCOUNT DISC PRICE REV
DESCRIPTION Qry  COsTs IND SURDISP  price
LABOUR ~
1 TO REMOVE & REPLACED DAMAGED BODY 1.00  800.00 0.00 800.00 y 5o’
PARTS REPAIR & REALIGN BODY WORK &
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT AREAS
2 TO SPRAY REAR BUMPER 100 250.00 0.00 250.00 y 2o~
3 TO SPRAY REAR END PANEL 1.00  250.00 0.00 250.00 y 200
4 TO SPRAY REAR BOOTLID 100 250,00 0.00 250,00 y 259
5 TO ADJUST TAIL LAMP & CHECK WIRING 100 12000 0.00 120,00 y %0
& RUST PROOFING 100 120,00 0.00 120,00 Yy %o
7 TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR SPARE TYRE 1.00 130,00 0.00 130.00 Y 40
PANEL.REAR FENDER TRIM LHS &
RHS,SPARE TYRE BOARD,CUSHION AND
ETC
8 REMOVE & REFIT REAR REVERSE SENSOR 1.00  130.00 0.00 130.00 y %o
& SPRAY
9 R&RBOOTLID COMPONENTS 1.00  120.00 0.00 120.00 Yy (o
TOTAL: 2,170.00 0.00 2,170.00
ATERIALS
1 REAR BUMPER 100 708.00 70.80 637.20 L y M~
2 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LHS 1.00 26.00 260 23.40 L Yy
3 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RHS 1.00 26,00 260 23.40 L y  ab—"
4 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LHS 100 20,00 2.00 18.00 L Y X NKX
5 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RHS 1.00 20.00 2.00 18.00 L Y X WNK
8 BOOTLID 100 828.00 82.80 745.20 L Yy bt
7 BOOTLID "ATTRAGE" EMBLEM 1.00 38.00 3.80 34.20 L vy AU
8 BOOQTLID "MIT" LOGO EMBLEM 1.00 41.00 4.10 36.90 L y AM T
9 BOOTLID OUTER CHROME GARNISH 100 318.00 31.80 286.20 L Y ¥ NNA
10 BOOTLID HINGE LHS 100  192.00 19.20 172.80 L Y W
11 BOOTLID HINGE RHS 100 192.00 19.20 172.80 L Y ﬂ A\l
12 BOOTLID LOCK 100  206.00 20.60 185.40 L Y Py sl
13 REAR END PANEL 100  402.00 40.20 361.80 L vy Ky Rx
14 REAR END PANEL WEATHERSTRIP 1.00  148.00 14.80 133.20 L y 7 X Suck
15 REAR FENDER MUDFLAP LHS 1.00 39.00 3.90 35.10 L Y R SULN
16 REAR FENDER MUDFLAP RHS 1.00 39.00 3.90 35.10 L Y X S
17 REAR END PANEL AIR DUCT 1.00 27.00 2.70 2430 L Y ‘ =Y
18 REAR END PANEL AIR DUCT COVER TRIM 1.00 36.00 3.60 32.40 L Y X Such
19 REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL 100  906.00 90.60 815.40 L Y _of RX

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Rev00




*  CLAIM DETAILS

QUOTED DISCOUNT DISC PRICE | SURDIER REV
*  DESCRIPTION ary COSTS ND : PRICE
20 TAIL LAMP LHS 100 276.00 27.60 248.40 L Y _ 7 XNKX
21 TAIL LAMP RHS 100  276.00 27.60 248.40 L Yy X KNNA
22 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH 1.00 85.00 6.50 58.50 L v K oy
23 REAR BUMPER CLIP 1.00 35.00 0.00 35.00 s Y AT
24 REAR REVERSE SENSOR 100 260.00 0.00 260.00 s Y © e _-
25 REAR NUMBER PLATE & CASING 1.00 60,00 0.00 60.00 s v Kl X
26 REAR END PANEL SEALANT 1.00 30,00 0.00 30.00 s Y KX
27 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP 1.00 35.00 0.00 35.00 s vy & [Inx
TOTAL: 5.249.00 482.90 4766.10
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR 7,419.00 482.90 6,936.10
EXCESS/LOADING:'S§  0.00
No. Of Day: 6 L(' - S )
RE-SURVEY: BEFORE/A P@NXT]NG . J
PART-BY-PART OR LUMP SUM: S$ \MF
paTEOFsuRvey: _ © 0, (8 :
) v .
SURVEYED BY: TadA us-Q Muardo
o~

v
CONTACT NO: 194 WQ‘(D’\ FAX NO:

NOTE: LUMP SUM AMOUNT WOULD BE REVISED IF SUPPLEMENT REPAIR IS REQUIRED

DAuto001 c:-\Q?
/k

Ding Auto User 1

ESTIMATOR
STA AUTOCENTRE
TEL: FAX:

lhKK Aut  Lonsultants hence notify
& Repairer of the following;

. Io rgsuwey before/after Spray painting
: po dasplgy damaged part(s) during resurvey

Taru prices are subject g confirmation
* Third party survey s on a "wi i

. Without Prejudica*

* No illegal modification(s) is allowed N o

-":‘;upni‘emen!ary item(s) must be fesurveyed ang
Subgect to final approval from Insurance Company

Achncwfedgea by Repairer
Signature:

L Dale:

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Rev00




TO : FAX NO:

ESTIMATE REPORT ~ 1ST Quotation 04/09/2018 14:34
JOB-NO: 85008591
OWNER'S PARTICULARS
NAME: LION CITY RENTALS PTELTD CONTACT: Page 10of 2
ADDRESS: 60 ANSON ROAD
MAPLETREE ANSON NOEMAIL@GMAIL.COM
LEVEL 11 SINGAPORE
079914
LICENSE NO:  SLG800SU TRANS: AUTO CHASSIS: MMBSTA13AHH002788
MAKE /MODEL:  MITSUBISH Others ENGINE:  3A92UDL1297
OWNER'S INSURER: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
JOB-CODE: TP SA: Ding Auto User 1
CLAIM DETAILS
QUOTED DISCOUNT DISC PRICE REV
DESCRIPTION Qary cosTs D SREEP  pics
LABOUR
! TOREMOVE & REPLACED DAMAGED BODY ~ 1.00  800.00 0.00 800.00 y 5oz
PARTS,REPAIR & REALIGN BODY WORK &
CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT AREAS
2 TOSPRAY REAR BUMPER 100 250,00 0.00 250.00 y Zov
3 TOSPRAY REAR END PANEL 1.00  250.00 0.00 250.00 Y o7
4 TOSPRAY REAR BOOTLID 1.00 250,00 0.00 250.00 y 290
5 TOADJUST TAIL LAMP & CHECK WIRING 1.00 120.00 0.00 120.00 Y '20
8 RUST PROOFING 1.00  120.00 0.00 120.00 y _3e
7 TOREMOVE & REFIT REAR SPARE TYRE 1.00 130,00 0.00 130.00 Y _40
PANEL,REAR FENDER TRIM LHS &
RHS,SPARE TYRE BOARD,CUSHION AND
ETC
8 REMOVE & REFIT REAR REVERSE SENSOR 1.00  130.00 0.00 130.00 Y '3‘9
& SPRAY i
9 R&RBOOTLID COMPONENTS 1.00 12000 0.00 120.00 Y §go
TOTAL: 2.170.00 0.00 2,170.00
MATERIALS
1 REAR BUMPER 100  708.00 70.80 637.20 L y MH—
2 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LHS 1.00 26.00 260 23.40 L Y s
3 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RHS 1.00 26.00 2580 23.40 L Yy ab—
4 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LHS 1.00 20.00 2.00 18.00 12 vy R
5 REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RHS 1.00 20.00 2.00 18.00 . Y
8 BOOTLID 100  828.00 8280 745.20 L y jg
7 BOOTLID "ATTRAGE" EMBLEM 1.00 38.00 3.80 34.20 L %
8 BOOTLID "MIT" LOGO EMBLEM 1.00 41.00 4.10 36.90 L Yy akM/
$ BOOTLID OUTER CHROME GARNISH 100  318.00 31.80 286.20 £ y ¥
10 BOOTLID HINGE LHS 100 192.00 18.20 172.80 L ¥
11 BOOTLID HINGE RHS 1.00 182.00 18.20 172.80 L Y
12 BOOTLID LOCK 1.00  206.00 20.60 185.40 L Y
13 REAR END PANEL 1.00 402,00 40.20 361.80 L Y i Y
14 REAR END PANEL WEATHERSTRIP 1.00 148.00 14.80 133.20 L Y 7
15 REAR FENDER MUDFLAP LHS 1.00 39.00 3.0 35.10 L ) g
16 REAR FENDER MUDFLAP RHS 1.00 39.00 3.90 35.10 L Y X
17 REAR END PANEL AIR DUCT 1.00 27.00 270 2430 L AL
18 REAR END PANEL AIR DUCT COVER TRIM 1.00 36.00 3.60 32.40 L Yy _X
19 REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL 1.00  906.00 80.60 815.40 L ¥ 33

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Rev00




DISCOUNT  DISC PRICE
LD IND SUR.DISP REV

DESCRIPTION Qary CosTs PRICE
20 TAIL LAMP LHS 1.00  276.00 27.60 248.40 G ¥ )
21 TAIL LAMP RHS 1.00 276.00 27.60 248.40 L Y X
22 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH 1.00 65.00 .50 58.50 L y X
23 REAR BUMPER CLIP 1.00 35.00 0.00 35.00 s Y AR
24 REAR REVERSE SENSOR 1.00  260.00 0.00 260.00 s Y 200 na -
25 REAR NUMBER PLATE & CASING 1.00 60.00 0.00 60.00 s G
26 REAR END PANEL SEALANT 1.00 30.00 0.00 30.00 s Y 5
27 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLUP 1.00) (> 35.00 0.00 35.00 s y - X

TOTAL: hildqg| Yo 5,249.00 482.90 4,768.10
TOTAL PARTS & LABOUR : 7.419.00 482.90 6,936.10
EXCESS/LOADING:S$ 0.00
No. Of Day: 6 L{' ' S 0(.1:)(_3
RE-SURVEY: BEFORE/, P@WING ~ 3
PART-BY-PART OR LUMR SUM: S$ wl?
DATE OF SURVEY: b / “ / l 3 .
SURVEYED BY: Tapr susQl Mito.

v

CONTACT NO: IMIDY Faxno:

NOTE: LUMP SUM AMOUNT WOULD BE REVISED IF SUPPLEMENT REPAIR IS REQUIRED

DAuto001
Ding Auto User 1

ESTIMATOR
STA AUTOCENTRE
TEL:

FAX:

G-STAR-WI-ET-001-02-Rev00



' y_eron Chen (LI(I(iuto)

= —— e e e e —
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 3:26 PM
To: Duan Hongbo; SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Cc: CS A Team; Kenneth Ding; You jingfeng; Dd hashim; Accounts Ding Auto; Ding Auto
Admin; Carlor Chan
Subject: RE: 85008591/SLG8009U- FINALIZE AMOUNT AND AFTER PAINT PHOTO
Dear Hong Bo,
Noted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to ALLIED WORLD

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Duan Hongbo <duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 September 2018 3:20 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
<Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng
<JINGFENG@dingauto.sg>; Dd hashim <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg>;
Ding Auto Admin <admin@dingauto.sg>; Carlor Chan <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: 85008591/SLG8009U- FINALIZE AMOUNT AND AFTER PAINT PHOTO

Dear Veron,
We confirm the finalize amount.

Many thanks.

BEST REGARDS

DING AUTO PTE LTD
DUAN HONG BO

TEL Office : 92394128
FAX :62652690

*ALI, MAILL LETTER AND CHEQUE PAYMENT IS TO BE MAILED TO OUR MAIN OFFICE AS BELOW*
- BLOCK 10 #01-20 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST.SEC C SINGAPORE 5756

On Mon, Sep 10, 2018 at 3:13 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Hong Bo,



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $2400 @ 4 working days.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Duan Hongbo <duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 8 September 2018 12:40 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng
<JINGFENG@dingauto.sg>; Dd hashim <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; Accounts Ding Auto <accounts@dingauto.sg>;
Ding Auto Admin <admin@dingauto.sg>; Carlor Chan <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>

Subject: 85008591/SLG8009U- FINALIZE AMOUNT AND AFTER PAINT PHOTO

Dear Taufikh,
Please see attach file for the finalize according to our conversion to finalize for
SLG8BesU

Total Repair - 04 Days

L/S

Labour - $1290.00

Special Netts - $-235.00

Parts after 25% Discount - $1500.30
Total ( Labour + S.N + Part) :$3025.30



L/S Repair after 20% discount :$2420.24

Thanks You And Please Help To Close The File

BEST REGARDS

| DING AUTO PTE LTD

DUAN HONG BO
TEL Office : 92394128
FAX :62652690

*ALL MAILL LETTER AND CHEQUE PAYMENT IS TO BE MAILED TO OUR MAIN OFFICE AS BELOW*
- BLOCK 10 #01-20 SIN MING INDUSTRIAL EST.SEC C SINGAPORE 5756
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ALLIED WORLD ASSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CS/AWA18016217/T1vbe2
S ARonmonD H0 I
SINGAPORE 079914
Code: AWA
e Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PC 48532 Veh. Inspected SLG 8009V
Policy No. BVBPSB0005921800 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. NSV1800500/KW Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  KINWONG Assign Date 05/09/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI ATTRAGE c.c 1193
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. MMBSTA13AHH002788 Colour BLACK
Odometer 43180 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/55R16 ROADSTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/55R16 ROADSTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/55R16 ROADSTONE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 185/55 R16 ROADSTONE 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  31/08/2018 llnSpection Date 06/09/2018
Survey held at 249 JLN BOON LAY
Repairer DING AUTO PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 8009U
. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition mmmp% (sl)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 708.00 708.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LHS NECESSARY 26.00 26.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RHS NECESSARY 26.00 26.00
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR LHS NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER REFLECTOR RHS NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
1|BOOTLID BENT 828.00 828.00
1|BOOTLID "ATTRAGE" EMBLEM NECESSARY 38.00 38.00
1|BOOTLID "MIT" LOGO EMBLEM NECESSARY 41.00 41.00
1|BOOTLID OQUTER CHROME GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 318.00 -
1|BOOTLID HINGE LHS SERVICEABLE 192.00 -
1|BOOTLID HINGE RHS SERVICEABLE 192.00 -
1|BOOTLID LOCK SERVICEABLE 206.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 402.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL WEATHERSTRIP SERVICEABLE 148.00
1|REAR FENDER MUDFLAP LHS SERVICEABLE 39.00
1|REAR FENDER MUDFLAP RHS SERVICEABLE 39.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL AIR DUCT SERVICEABLE 27.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL AIR DUCT COVER TRIM SERVICEABLE 36.00 -
1|REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 906.00 -
LABOUR
1|TAIL LAMP LHS NOT NECESSARY 276.00 -
1|TAIL LAMP RHS NOT NECESSARY 276.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH SERVICEABLE 65.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -482.90 -166.70
4 346.10 1,500.30
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|REAR REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT WORKING 260.00 200.00
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE & CASING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 60.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 35.00
420.00 235.00

Report Ref No. CS/AWA18016217/T1vbe2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition A .
P Workshop ($) ($)
LABOUR
TO REMOVE & REPLACED DAMAGED BODY PARTS, 800.00 500.00
REPAIR & REALIGN BODY WORK & CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT AREAS. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
END PANEL AND REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL.
TO SPRAY REAR BUMPER. 250.00 200.00
TO SPRAY REAR END PANEL. 250.00 200.00
TO SPRAY REAR BOOTLID. 250.00 200.00
TO ADJUST TAIL LAMP & CHECK WIRING. 120.00 30.00
RUST PROOFING 120.00 30.00
TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL, REAR 130.00 40.00
FENDER TRIM LHS & RHS, SPARE TYRE BOARD,
CUSHION AND ETC.
REMOVE & REFIT REAR REVERSE SENSOR & SPRAY. 130.00 30.00
R & R BOOTLID COMPONENTS. 120.00 60.00
2,170.00 1,290.00

GRAND TOTAL 6,936.10 3,025.30
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,400.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/AWA18016217/T1vbe2

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH ADRIAN LING WAI PING

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




