Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 11:30 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Wong, Kin

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: AW REF: NSV1800500 _ Your Ref: SLG 8009U (Ding Auto)
Attachments: LKKAdjustment1a.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf; photo.pdf
Dear Kin,

Enclosed herewith survey report (soft copy).

Hard copy will send to your good office shortly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 9:52 AM

To: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: AW REF: NSV1800500 _ Your Ref: SLG 8009U (Ding Auto)

Dear Kin,

Thank you for your email.

Dear Veron,
CS/AWA18016217/T1vbe2

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 9:46 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: AW REF: NSV1800500 _ Your Ref: SLG 8009U (Ding Auto)




Hi Denise
Is the Survey Report ready?

Thank you.

Regards,

Kin WM«& (Mr.)

Asia-Pacific Claims Group

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd.
60 Anson Road #08-o1

Singapore 079914

T: +65 6423 0894

F: +65 6423 0864

E: kin.wong(@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments hereto is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate any of this information. If you have received this e-mail in error, please
immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete the original e-mail (and any attachments
hereto) and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this e-mail and any attachments hereto are believed to be
free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by Allied World
Assurance Company Holdings, GmbH or its subsidiaries or affiliates, either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage
arising in any way from its use.



